

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

ITEM NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL #	FEATURES	DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH)	QTY	United Ag & Turf TOTAL PRICE	JT Homes LLC TOTAL PRICE	Hillyard Inc. TOTAL PRICE	W.B.MASON TOTAL PRICE
CSD-1	Ride-on Floor Scrubber	Tenant	T7AMR	Battery powered, 26" cleaning path, 29 gallon capacity		1		\$36,716.00	\$99,586.55	\$15,885.00 (SUBSTITUTION NACECARE TTV678)
CSD-2	Ride-on Burnisher	Tenant	B10	Battery powered, 24" / 27" head	30" x 55" x 58.5"	1		\$41,917.00	\$26,926.43	NO BID
CSD-3	Carpet Extractor	Tenant	R3	Walk behind corded carpet extractor	19" x 28" x 30"	1		\$8,699.00	\$5,266.49	NO BID
CSD-4	Upright Vacuum	Tenant	V-HDU-14	Heavy duty corded upright vacuum with dual motors		3		\$2,907.00	\$2,016.75	\$1,489.88 (SUBSTITUTION PROTEAM PROGEN12))
CSD-5	Backpack Vacuum	Tenant	V-BP-6	Commercial backpack vacuum with 50' power cord		3		\$8,565.00	\$2,228.91	\$1,419.99 (SUBSTITUTION PROTEAM GOFIT6)
CSD-5a	Backpack Vacuum Attachment	Tenant	N/A	Straight two-piece wand with two hard surface vacuum heads		3		\$720.00	Kits included with Item# CSD 5	
CSD-5b	Backpack Vacuum Attachment	Tenant	N/A	Curved two-piece wand with two vacuum heads		3		\$798.00	Kits included with Item# CSD 5	
CSD-5c	Backpack Vacuum Attachment	Tenant	N/A	One-piece extendable curve wand with two vacuum heads		3		\$798.00	Kits included with Item# CSD 5	
CSD-6	Powered walk-behind scrubber	Tenant	i-mop XL Plus	Powered walk behind scrubber with cart and accessories		1		\$13,126.00	\$5,457.57	

**WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT**

ITEM NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL #	FEATURES	DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH)	QTY	United Ag & Turf TOTAL PRICE	JT Homes LLC TOTAL PRICE	Hillyard Inc. TOTAL PRICE	W.B.MASON TOTAL PRICE
CSD-7	Shop Vacuum	Tenant	V-WD-24P	24 gallon wet / dry vacuum with 40' cord, HEPA filtration, and accessories	36" x 23" x 36"	1		\$1,260.00	\$1,019.07	\$242.79
CSD-8	Air Mover	Tenant	9014819	Corded 120 volt, 3 speed portable air mover		1		\$630.00	\$348.61	
CSD-9	Sub-compact tractor	John Deere	1025R	Gasoline fueled ride-on tractor with cab, snow plow, snow blower, and drop spreader		1	\$35,012.02	\$51,669.00		
CSD-10	Large area mower	John Deere	Z370R Electric Ztrak	Electric battery powered ride-on zero turn mower	3.2 kWh battery, 48" wide mower deck	1	\$6,799.00	\$9,411.00		
CSD-11	Push Mower	Stihl	RMA 510V	Battery powered self-propelled lawn mower	21" mowing deck	1	\$674.99	\$370.00		
CSD-12	Backpack Blower	Stihl	BR 800 C-E Magnum	Gas fueled backpack leaf blower		1	\$629.99	\$877.00		
CSD-13	Pressure Washer	Stihl	RE 100 Plus	Electric corded power washer	2,000 psi @ 1.2 gpm	1	\$269.99	\$487.00		
CSD-14	Cordless multitask tool	Stihl	KMA 135 R KombiMotor	Battery powered motor and drive unit to power various tool attachments		1	\$314.99	\$448.00		
CSD-14a	Edger for Multitask tool	Stihl	FCS	Straight shaft lawn edger attachment	Fits multitask tool	1	\$199.99	\$266.00		

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

ITEM NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL #	FEATURES	DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH)	QTY	United Ag & Turf TOTAL PRICE	JT Homes LLC TOTAL PRICE	Hillyard Inc. TOTAL PRICE	W.B.MASON TOTAL PRICE
CSD-14b	String trimmer for Multitask tool	Stihl	FS-KM	Straight Shaft string line trimmer attachment	Fits multitask tool	1	\$109.99	\$175.00		
CSD-14c	Bristle Brush for Multitask tool	Stihl	KB-KM	Straight Shaft bristle brush attachment	Fits multitask tool	1	\$299.99	\$383.00		
CSD-14d	Battery for Multitask tool	Stihl	AP 500S	Rechargeable battery	Fits multitask tool	2	\$683.98	\$948.00		
CSD-14e	Battery charger for battery for Multitask tool	Stihl	AL 500	Battery charger	Fits multitask tool	2	\$359.98	\$480.00		
CSD-15	Cordless Hedge Trimmer	Stihl	HAS-100	Battery powered hedge trimmer		1	\$305.99	\$435.00		
CSD-16	Gas fueled snow blower	Ariens	ST28DLE	Gas fueled self-propelled two-stage snow blower	28" clearing dimension	2	\$3,258.00	\$6,100.00		
CSD-17	Recycle bin for offices	Rubbermaid		Blue resin plastic bin with recycle emblem, no cover.	10.38 gallons	29		\$1,131.00	\$329.49 <small>(28 1/8 QT= 7 Gallon instead of 10 gallon 12/case, total=3 cases=36 instead on 29)</small>	\$206.48
CSD-18	Recycle bin for classrooms	Rubbermaid		Black resin plastic bin with recycle emblem, cover with top hinged flap door.	18 gallons	58		\$3,770.00	NO BID	NO BID
CSD-19	Refuse bin for offices	Rubbermaid		Black resin plastic bin, no cover.	10.25 gallons	29		\$1,131.00	\$254.04 <small>(28 1/8 QT= 7 Gallon instead of 10.25 gallons)</small>	\$228.23

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

ITEM NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL #	FEATURES	DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH)	QTY	United Ag & Turf TOTAL PRICE	JT Homes LLC TOTAL PRICE	Hillyard Inc. TOTAL PRICE	W.B.MASON TOTAL PRICE
CSD-20	Refuse bin for classrooms	Rubbermaid		Gray resin plastic bin; round, with no cover.	11 gallons	58		\$2,262.00	\$1533.00 <small>(44 3/8 QT = 11 gallon same size as specified 6/case, total=10 cases=60 instead on 58)</small>	\$1,455.22
CSD-21	Refuse bin for Custodial use	Rubbermaid	2655	Gray resin plastic bin; round, with snap-on lid.	55 gallons	5		\$905.00	\$746.60	\$366.25
CSD-22	Dolly for refuse bin for custodial use	Rubbermaid	2650	Gray resin plastic dolly; round, with four (4) swivel casters.	Holds up to a 55 gallon drum or bin	10		\$2,200.00	\$1,516.85	\$925.80
CSD-23	Refuse bin for Custodial use	Rubbermaid	2643-60	Gray resin plastic waste container; round, no lid.	44 gallons	10		\$1,230.00	\$707.70	\$475.60
CSD-24	Dolly for refuse bin for custodial use	Rubbermaid	2646	Center wheels with swivel casters at each end	Max capacity of 200 lbs	10		\$3,180.00	\$2,292.50	\$1,429.30
CSD-25	Tilt truck for custodial use	Rubbermaid	9T13	Molded foam with two main wheels and two swivel casters. Non-marking wheels and casters	450 lbs capacity; fits through 36" door.	2		\$1,754.00	\$1,125.76	\$924.20
CSD-26	Janitorial Cart	Rubbermaid	FG9T7200BL A	High capacity janitorial cleaning cart with two main wheels and two swivel casters. Non-marking wheels and casters.		4		\$2,312.00	\$1,729.16	\$1,084.24
CSD-27a	Open back steel shelving	Lyon 8000 Series	8560	Heavy duty open metal storage shelving with diagonal cross bracing and clip fasteners. Anchored to walls to prevent tipping.	36" X 84" X 12"	13		\$8,671.00		\$3,679.00
CSD-27b	Open back steel shelving	Lyon 8000 Series	8561	Heavy duty open metal storage shelving with diagonal cross bracing and clip fasteners. Anchored to walls to prevent tipping.	36" X 84" X 18"	5		\$3,335.00		\$1,785.00
CSD-27c	Open back steel shelving	Lyon 8000 Series	8562	Heavy duty open metal storage shelving with diagonal cross bracing and clip fasteners. Anchored to walls to prevent tipping.	36" X 84" X 24"	12		\$8,472.00		\$3,876.00

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

ITEM NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER	MODEL #	FEATURES	DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH)	QTY	United Ag & Turf TOTAL PRICE	JT Homes LLC TOTAL PRICE	Hillyard Inc. TOTAL PRICE	W.B.MASON TOTAL PRICE
CSD-28a	Open back steel shelving	Lyon 8000 Series	8300	Heavy duty open metal storage shelving with diagonal cross bracing and clip fasteners. Anchored to walls to prevent tipping.	48" X 84" X 12"	1		\$680.00		\$341.00
CSD-28b	Open back steel shelving	Lyon 8000 Series	8301	Heavy duty open metal storage shelving with diagonal cross bracing and clip fasteners. Anchored to walls to prevent tipping.	48" X 84" X 18"	6		\$4,080.00		\$2,004.00
CSD-28c	Open back steel shelving	Lyon 8000 Series	8302	Heavy duty open metal storage shelving with diagonal cross bracing and clip fasteners. Anchored to walls to prevent tipping.	48" X 84" X 24"	33		No bid		\$12,276.00
CSD-29	Pencil Sharpener for Classrooms	Xacto School Pro	Classroom	Desk-top corded electric pencil sharpener with six (6) different size sharpening options.		58		\$5,104.00		\$2,475.44
CSD-30	Pencil Sharpener for Offices	Xacto School Pro	Office	Desk-top corded electric pencil sharpener with one size sharpening option.		29		\$3,190.00		\$1,811.92
CSD-31	American flag and wall bracket	50 Star American flag	American	Polyester flag on wood shaft; aluminum mounting bracket to hold flag at 45 degree angle from wall.	16" x 24"	59		\$5,074.00		NO BID
T18	Uline Welded Steel Workbench 72"x36"	Uline	H-3079		72"wx36"dx34"h	1		\$1,605.00		NO BID