

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

**NOTE: ALL STATE CONTRACT REQUEST FORMS SHALL BE SUBMITTED IN DUPLICATE
SUBMIT SEPARATE ENVELOPES FOR EACH SECTION**

SECTION 101 - FURNITURE & EQUIPMENT

STATE CONTRACT FORM #16PSX0190.

TO: Town of Ellington
Ms. Tiffany Pignataro, CPA, MBA, Finance Officer, Treasurer
Ellington Town Hall
152 Elm Street
Ellington, CT 06029

The undersigned Bidder shall furnish all labor and materials required for **Section 101**, entitled **Miscellaneous Furniture & Equipment**, for the Windermere Elementary School, Ellington, CT, in accordance with Equipment Specifications prepared by Drummey Rosane Anderson Architects, 225 Oakland Road, Studio 205, South Windsor, CT 06074.

NOTE: PRICING, AS PART OF THIS STATE CONTRACT QUOTE, SHALL BE VALID FOR 180 DAY FROM DATE OF RECEIPT.

The Itemized State Contract Prices shall be as follows:

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|--|--------------|-------------------------|---|--|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|-------------|
| D01a | 20x27 Adjustable height single student desk | Smith System | Silhouette Student Desk | 1650 | 20dX27wX19-31ht. Set to 27" Height. | 184 | \$355.00 | \$241.40 | \$44,417.60 |
| D01b | 20x27 Adjustable height single student desk | Smith System | Silhouette Student Desk | 1650 | 20dX27wX19-31ht. Set to 29" Height. | 80 | \$355.00 | \$241.40 | \$19,312.00 |
| D02a | 20x54Adjustable height two student desk | Smith System | Silhouette Student Desk | 1661 | 20dX54wX19-31ht. Set to 27" Height. ADA Compliant | 19 | \$408.00 | \$277.44 | \$5,271.36 |
| D02b | 20x54Adjustable height two student desk | Smith System | Silhouette Student Desk | 1661 | 20dX54wX19-31ht. Set to 29" Height. ADA Compliant | 8 | \$408.00 | \$277.44 | \$2,219.52 |
| D03 | Teacher's Desk; Single Pedestal; Rectangle Top | Smith System | Cascade | 26158 | 54" w x24" d x30.38" h | 42 | \$1,185.00 | \$805.80 | \$33,843.60 |
| D04 | Teacher's Desk; Single Pedestal Single Bullet ; Shaped Top | Smith System | Cascade | 26161 | 60"w x24" w x30.25" h | 21 | \$1,221.00 | \$830.28 | \$17,435.88 |
| D05 | Teacher Sit+Stand Desk , Teacher's Lectern | Smith System | Silhouette | 1633 | 36" w x 28" d x26.5" - 41.5" h | 21 | \$797.00 | \$541.96 | \$11,381.16 |
| D06a | L-Shaped Desk Right Hand Return | Artopex | | DiS3072 & REW2448 | 30 x 72 | 3 | \$2,747.00 | \$1,428.44 | \$4,285.32 |
| D06b | L-Shaped Desk Left Hand Return | Artopex | | DiT3072 & REDW2448 | 30 x 72 | 1 | \$2,747.00 | \$1,428.44 | \$1,428.44 |
| D07a | L-Shaped Desk, Right Hand | Artopex | | T3CORA23 295870 / TLCAS4 / PPUNL662 3 | 29" x 79" x 23" x 58" 90-degree corner height adj. | 1 | \$3,926.00 | \$2,041.52 | \$2,041.52 |
| D07b | L-Shaped Desk, Left Hand | Artopex | | T3COLA23 295870 / TLCAS4 / PPUNL662 3 | 29" x 79" x 23" x 58" 90-degree corner height adj. | 2 | \$3,926.00 | \$2,041.52 | \$4,083.04 |
| F01 | Mobile Drawer Pedestal, File/File | Smith System | | 19172 | 15.50"w x 21.63"d x 25.3"h GLIDES = 25.25" HEIGHT CASTERS = 27" HEIGHT | 82 | \$472.00 | \$320.96 | \$26,318.72 |
| F04a | 2-High Bookcase (Cabinet) | Artopex | Metal Storage | 70-20-036-Y | 36"w x 18"d x 27-15/16"h | 11 | \$842.00 | \$437.84 | \$4,816.24 |
| L01 | Mien Kio Starter Adder 42x12x66 | Mien | Mien Kio | | 42x12 x66 | 9 | \$2,750.00 | \$1,787.50 | \$16,087.50 |
| L02 | Mien Kio Starter Adder (Stand alone starter unit) 42x12x66 | Mien | Kio | | 42 x12 x66 | 1 | \$2,826.00 | \$1,836.90 | \$1,836.90 |
| L03 | Mien Kio Starter Adder 42x12x42 | Mien | Kio | | 42x12x42 | 9 | \$2,148.00 | \$1,396.20 | \$12,565.80 |
| L04 | Mien Kio Starter Adder (Stand alone starter unit) 42x12x42 | Mien | Kio | | 42x12x42 | 10 | \$2,198.00 | \$1,428.70 | \$14,287.00 |

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|---|----------------------|-----------------------|--|--|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|-------------|
| L05 | Mien Kio Starter Adder 42x12x29 | Mien | Kio | | 42x12x29 | 11 | \$1,911.00 | \$1,242.15 | \$13,663.65 |
| L06 | Mien Kio Starter Adder (Stand alone starter unit) 42x12x29 | Mien | Kio | | 42x12x29 | 5 | \$1,946.00 | \$1,264.90 | \$6,324.50 |
| L07 | Mien Kio curved mobile bookcase 60 degree (Double sided) | Mien | Kio | | 72.4x24x42 60 degree curve | 11 | \$5,914.00 | \$3,844.10 | \$42,285.10 |
| L08 | Mien Kio book browsing bin | Mien | Kio | | 48x22x36 | 6 | \$5,124.00 | \$3,330.60 | \$19,983.60 |
| L09 | Mien Kio rounded end mobile bookcase | Mien | Kio | | 68x24x 42 | 1 | \$6,094.00 | \$3,961.10 | \$3,961.10 |
| M01 | Lakeshore Hardwood Mobile Teaching Easel | Lakeshore | | | 30wx30dx58h | 11 | NO BID | | |
| M02 | Lakeshore Flex-Space Double sided Mobile Teaching Easel | Lakeshore | | | 30wx341/2dx62h | 26 | NO BID | | |
| M03 | VS Series 800-Mobil Mobile shelf units | VS | | 47474 | 16 3/4dx47 1/4wx34 3/4h | 52 | \$973.00 | \$758.94 | \$39,464.88 |
| M04 | VS Shift + Transfer Mobile Cabinet Elements with doors. | VS | | 45322 | 41 5/8 x16 3/4 x38 1/8 | 4 | \$2,300.00 | \$1,794.00 | \$7,176.00 |
| M05 | VS Shift + Transfer Mobile Cabinet Elements with doors. | VS | | 45322 | 41 5/8 x16 3/4 x38 1/8 | 6 | \$2,300.00 | \$1,794.00 | \$10,764.00 |
| M06 | Smith System Book truck, Six sloping Shelf Truck /6 book supports | Smith System | | 21004 | 36 x18 x43 | 11 | \$746.00 | \$507.28 | \$5,580.08 |
| M07 | Smith System Everything Cart | Smith System | | 21088 | 36 x18 x36 | 1 | \$692.00 | \$470.56 | \$470.56 |
| M08 | Lakeshore Flex Space Cornfy Nesting Benches | Lakeshore Flex Space | Lakeshore Flex Space | LK119 | 72X14X18, 60X14X14 , 48X14X10, 36X14X6 | 1 | NO BID | | |
| M09 | VS Shift + Transfer Mobile Cabinet Elements with doors. | VS | | 45340 | 41 5/8 x16 3/4 x53 | 11 | \$1,805.00 | \$1,407.90 | \$15,486.90 |
| M10 | VS Top Mobil-Circle Framed board with two writing surfaces. (One side cork pin board other side writing surface.) | VS | TopMobil-Circle_TY_US | 66552 | 78 3/4"X47 1/4"X81 7/8"H | 1 | \$1,686.00 | \$1,315.08 | \$1,315.08 |
| M11 | Wenger Platinum Reversible Markerboard w/Music Staves | Wenger | Platinum | PLATINUM REVERSIBLE MARKERBOARD 174A300.62 | 72"wx48" h | 2 | \$1,793.60 | \$2,206.13 | \$4,412.26 |

80" long instead on 68" as the product is not available with two rounded ends in 68" long size.

Both sides marker board writing surface as change of surface on one side will make it as a special product and will cost more.

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|--|--------------|----------------------------------|----------------------------------|---|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|-------------|
| M13 | Wenger Student Chair | Wenger | | 0930000 Black Finish Frame | 19 3/4"wx21 1/4"x15 1/2" h | 123 | \$74.10 | \$91.14 | \$11,210.22 |
| M15 | Wenger Music Chair Move & Store Cart | Wenger | | 127A261 | 24 1/2"wx38 1/4"dx42"h | 7 | \$443.20 | \$545.14 | \$3,815.98 |
| M16a | KI All Terrain Screens 48" Four point Full Height | KI | All Terrain Screens 4-Point Base | ATS44866F HC/FB | 48"wx16"dx66"h | 2 | \$1,385.00 | \$747.90 | \$1,495.80 |
| M16b | KI All Terrain Screens 36" Four point Full Height | KI | All Terrain Screens 4-Point Base | | 36"wx16"dx66"h | 4 | \$1,315.00 | \$710.10 | \$2,840.40 |
| M17a | KI All Terrain Screens 30" Three point Full Height | KI | All Terrain Screens 3-Point Base | | 30"wx16"dx66"h | 3 | \$1,164.00 | \$628.56 | \$1,885.68 |
| M17b | KI All Terrain Screens 24" Three point Full Height | KI | All Terrain Screens 3-Point Base | | 24"wx16"dx66"h | 4 | \$1,086.00 | \$586.44 | \$2,345.76 |
| M20 | Wenger Conductor's Podium | Wenger | Wenger Flex Conductor's Sytem | Wenger Flex Conductor's Sytem | Base podium: 43"w x 38"d x 6"h Upper podium: 32"w x 38"d x 6"h | 1 | \$1,312.90 | \$1,614.87 | \$1,614.87 |
| M21 | Wenger Conductor's Stand | Wenger | Wenger Flex Conductor's Sytem | Wenger Flex Conductor's Sytem | Desk 20"x27"Height adjustment range from 36" – 52.5" | 1 | \$751.45 | \$924.28 | \$924.28 |
| M22 | Wenger Conductor's Chair | Wenger | Wenger Flex Conductor's Sytem | Wenger Flex Conductor's Sytem | 26.5"-36.5" height adjustable | 1 | \$849.30 | \$1,044.64 | \$1,044.64 |
| P01 | Jonti-Craft® Flushback Wide Pick-a-Book Stand | Jonti-Craft | | 3517JC | 27.50" High x 36.00" Wide x 13.50" Deep | 6 | \$380.20 | \$399.21 | \$2,395.26 |
| P02 | Jonti-Craft® 2 Station Art Center | Jonti-Craft | | 0289JC | 45.00" High x 25.50" Wide x 20.00" Deep | 6 | \$624.30 | \$655.52 | \$3,933.12 |
| P03 | Jonti-Craft® Culinary Creations Play Kitchen 4 Piece Set | Jonti-Craft | | 2411JC | 35.00" High x 80.00" Wide x 15.00" Deep | 6 | \$1,777.80 | \$1,866.69 | \$11,200.14 |
| P04 | Jonti-Craft® Super-Sized Double-Sided Island | Jonti-Craft | | 3291JC | 24.50" High x 48.00" Wide x 28.50" Deep | 6 | \$969.80 | \$1,018.29 | \$6,109.74 |
| P05 | Jonti-Craft® Low Double-Sided Island | Jonti-Craft | | 3920JC | 24.50" High x 48.00" Wide x 28.50" Deep | 18 | \$845.30 | \$887.57 | \$15,976.26 |
| P06 | Heavy-Duty Space-Saver Writing Center | Lakeshore | | DG437 | 39 1/2"w x 25 1/2"d x 38 1/4". Fits chairs 11 1/2"-13 1/2" high. | 6 | NO BID | | |

↑
NO BIDS FOR THESE ITEMS FROM R.H.LORD

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|--|-------------------------|----------------|---------|---|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|-------------|
| P06a | Heavy-Duty Stacking Chairs | Lakeshore | | DG511 | 11 1/2" Height | 12 | NO BID | | |
| P07 | Jonti-Craft® Literacy Couch - Blue | Jonti-Craft | | 37460JC | 42"X18.5"X23.5" | 6 | \$834.50 | \$876.23 | \$5,257.38 |
| P08 | Jonti-Craft® Toddler Sensory Table with Shelf - Toddler Height 20" | Jonti-Craft | | 2866JC | 42"X23"X20.5" | 6 | \$705.80 | \$741.09 | \$4,446.54 |
| P09 | Jonti-Craft® See-Thru Sensory Table Toddler Height 20" | Jonti-Craft | | 2872JC | 37.5"X23"X19.5" | 6 | \$785.70 | \$824.99 | \$4,949.94 |
| P10 | Jonti-Craft® Science Activity Table | Jonti-Craft | | 6760JC | 30"X25.5"X21" | 6 | \$557.50 | \$585.38 | \$3,512.28 |
| P11 | Pretend & Play Table and Chair Set | Lakeshore | | LC924 | Table measures 24"w x 24"d x 23"h. Seats measure 13 1/2" high. | 6 | NO BID | | |
| P12 | Jonti-Craft® 9 Tub Changing Table with Pad | Jonti-Craft | | 5121JC | 44"X20"X44" | 6 | \$1,060.00 | \$1,113.00 | \$6,678.00 |
| P13 | Butcher-Block Table and Chair Set | Lakeshore | | JJ845 | Table measures 28"w x 21"h. Chairs have 12" seat heights. | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P15 | Flex-Space Mobile 36-Tray Storage Center - Modern Maple | Lakeshore Flex-Space | Flex-Space | LK428 | 55 1/2"w x 17"d x 39 1/2"h Trays: 12 1/4"w x 14 3/4"l x 3"h; | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P16 | Space-Saver Mobile Art Center | Lakeshore | | EE365 | Center measures 26"w x 19 1/2"d x 48"h. Write & wipe surfaces measure 24". | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P17 | Giant Economy Sand & Water Table | Lakeshore | | LA308 | Table measures 34 1/4"l x 22 1/4"w. Adjusts from 18" to 21" to 24" high. Tub 7" d | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P18 | Top for Giant Economy Sand & Water Table | Lakeshore | | LA314 | 22 1/4" x 34 1/4" | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P20 | Play-All-Around Dollhouse | Lakeshore | | DD546 | 21 1/2"w x 24 1/2"d x 22 3/4"h | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P21 | See-Inside Cubby Bins - Set of 10 5 sets (10 in each set) | Lakeshore | | LM130 | 9 1/8" x 11" x 6 3/4" | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P22 | Classic Birch 20-Cubby Storage Unit | Lakeshore Classic Birch | | JJ166 | 47"w x 14"d x 30"h | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P23 | Flex-space Book Bins (Set of 12) 10 sets (Each set is of 12) | Lakeshore Flex-Space | Flex-Space | TT836 | Bins measure 5" high; tops 7" x 14" and bottoms measure 5 3/4" x 11 1/2" | 10 | NO BID | | |

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|--|----------------------|-----------------------|------------------------|--|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|-------------|
| P24 | Help-Yourself Bookstand with Storage | Lakeshore | | JJ853 | 30 1/2"w x 12"d x 30"h | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P25 | Dishwasher-Safe Plastic Baskets - Set of 2 5 sets(Each set is of 2) | Lakeshore | | LL356 | 13 1/2"l x 8 1/2"w x 6"h | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P26 | Read & Relax Comfy Couch | Lakeshore | | RR364 | 49 3/4"w x 21 1/2"d x 29 1/2"h | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P27 | Plastic Book Baskets - Set of 3 5 sets(Each set is of 3) | Lakeshore | | RR371 | 14 1/4"l x 11 3/4"w x 7 1/2"h. | 5 | NO BID | | |
| P28 | Lakeshore Clear-View Storage Box | Lakeshore | | LC91 | 13 1/2"l x 8"w x 5"h. | 100 | NO BID | | |
| R01 | Flex-Space A Spot for Everyone Classroom Carpet 9'x12' | Lakeshore | Lakeshore -Flex-Space | LC283 | 9'0"l x 12'0"w | 11 | NO BID | | |
| R02 | Flex-Space Designer Accents Classroom Carpets 9'x12' | Lakeshore | Lakeshore -Flex-Space | LC746 | 9'0"l x 12'0"w | 29 | NO BID | | |
| R03 | Flex-Space A Place for Everyone Carpets 9'x12' | Lakeshore Flex-Space | Lakeshore -Flex-Space | LC698 | 12'0" X 9'0" | 1 | NO BID | | |
| S01a | VS JUMPER Air Four - legged student chair | VS | | 33300 (12 1/4" height) | 12 1/4" height | 144 | \$180.00 | \$140.40 | \$20,217.60 |
| S01b | VS JUMPER Air Four - legged student chair | VS | | 33300 (13 3/4" height) | 13 3/4" height | 172 | \$180.00 | \$140.40 | \$24,148.80 |
| S02a | VS Panto Swing-LuPo Forward-flexing cantilever chair | VS | | 31400 (13 3/8" Height) | 13 3/8" height | 106 | \$155.00 | \$120.90 | \$12,815.40 |
| S02b | VS Panto Swing-LuPo Forward-flexing cantilever chair | VS | | 31400 (15 1/4" Height) | 15 1/4" height | 253 | \$155.00 | \$120.90 | \$30,587.70 |
| S03a | KI Intellect Wave Cantilever Leg Chair Medium | KI | | IWC15 | Medium W171/4" D161/4" H261/2" Seat: W14 3/10" D14" H15 15" height | 108 | \$186.00 | \$108.81 | \$11,751.48 |
| S03b | KI Intellect Wave Cantilever Leg Chair Large | KI | | IWC18 | Large W201/4" D191/2" H32" Seat: W171/2" D17" H18 18" height | 316 | \$188.00 | \$109.98 | \$34,753.68 |
| S04a | VS Hokki Wobble Stool | VS | | | 15" height | 48 | \$120.00 | \$93.60 | \$4,492.80 |
| S04b | VS Hokki Wobble Stool | VS | | | 17" height 18 1/8" priced | 132 | \$125.00 | \$97.50 | \$12,870.00 |
| S04c | VS Hokki Wobble Stool | VS | | | 18 1/8" height | 88 | \$125.00 | \$97.50 | \$8,580.00 |
| S05 | Smith System Oodle Stack of three with one movement disk | Smith System | | OODLE31 | 17" dia. 6.5-19.5" height | 26 | \$262.00 | \$178.16 | \$4,632.16 |

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|--|--------------|--------------------|-----------|--|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|-------------|
| S08a | VS JUMPER air Move Height adjustable Swivel Chair | VS | Jumper Air Move HS | 33526 | 16 3/4"dx173/8"wx197/8"- 295/8"h | 35 | \$525.00 | \$409.50 | \$14,332.50 |
| S08b | VS Jumper Air move HS Star-foot chair with foot ring | VS | Jumper Air Move HS | 33503 | 161/2"-21 1/2" Height | 72 | \$385.00 | \$300.30 | \$21,621.60 |
| S10 | VS Jumper Air Four Four-legged Teacher chair | VS | | 33316 | 16 3/4dx17 3/8wx181/8h | 36 | \$223.00 | \$173.94 | \$6,261.84 |
| S11a | Smith System Flow form Soft Rocker | Smith System | Soft Rocker | 55000 | 20.5x26.25x25.25 | 6 | \$885.00 | \$601.80 | \$3,610.80 |
| T01 a | Lakeshore Natural Adjustable Rectangular Tables | Lakeshore | | CN795 | 60wx30dx21-30 ht. Set to 22" height. | 18 | NO BID | | |
| T01 b | Lakeshore Natural Adjustable Rectangular Tables | Lakeshore | | CN795 | 60wx30dx21-30 ht. Set to 24" height. | 20 | NO BID | | |
| T02 | Smith System Interchange 36"DeepRectangle activity table | Smith System | Interchange | 4113 | 36dx72wx22-34 ht. Set to 24" height. ADA Compliant | 16 | \$843.00 | \$573.24 | \$9,171.84 |
| T03a | Smith System Interchange 42"DeepRectangle activity table | Smith System | Interchange | 4117 | 42dx72wx22-34 ht. Set to 27" height. ADA Compliant | 16 | \$1,053.00 | \$716.04 | \$11,456.64 |
| T03b | Smith System Interchange 42"DeepRectangle activity table | Smith System | Interchange | 4118 | 42dx90wx22-34 ht. Set to 27" height. ADA Compliant | 4 | \$1,228.00 | \$835.04 | \$3,340.16 |
| T03c | Smith System Interchange 42"DeepRectangle activity table | Smith System | Interchange | 4118 | 42dx90wx22-34 ht. Set to 29" height. ADA Compliant | 20 | \$1,228.00 | \$835.04 | \$16,700.80 |
| T04a | Smith System Planner half moon activity table | Smith System | Planner | 25650 | 36dx72wx22-34 ht. Set to 24" height. ADA Compliant | 4 | \$800.00 | \$544.00 | \$2,176.00 |
| T04b | Smith System Planner half moon activity table | Smith System | Planner | 25650 | 36dx72wx22-34 ht. Set to 27" height. ADA Compliant | 15 | \$800.00 | \$544.00 | \$8,160.00 |
| T04c | Smith System Planner half moon activity table | Smith System | Planner | 25650 | 36dx72wx22-34 ht. Set to 29" height. ADA Compliant | 9 | \$800.00 | \$544.00 | \$4,896.00 |
| T05 | Smith System Interchange Rectangular table 30"Deep | Smith System | Interchange | 4107 | 30dx60wx22-34 ht. Set to 29" height. ADA Compliant | 7 | \$712.00 | \$484.16 | \$3,389.12 |
| T06a | Smith System Elemental Horse shoe Table | Smith System | Elemental | ELHOSH-EA | 66wx57dx19-33 ht. Set to 24" height. ADA Compliant | 5 | \$1,146.00 | \$779.28 | \$3,896.40 |
| T06c | Smith System Elemental Horse shoe Table | Smith System | Elemental | ELHOSH-EA | 66wx57dx19-33 ht. Set to 29" height. ADA Compliant | 1 | \$1,146.00 | \$779.28 | \$779.28 |
| T07a | Smith System Elemental Trapezoidal Table | Smith System | Elemental | EL60TR-EA | 60wx30dx19-33 ht. Set to 24" height. ADA Compliant | 12 | \$563.00 | \$382.84 | \$4,594.08 |

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|---|--------------|---|-----------|--|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|-------------|
| T07b | Smith System Elemental Trapezoidal Table | Smith System | Elemental | EL60TR-EA | 60wx30dx19-33 ht. Set to 27" height. ADA Compliant | 15 | \$563.00 | \$382.84 | \$5,742.60 |
| T07c | Smith System Elemental Trapezoidal Table | Smith System | Elemental | EL60TR-EA | 60wx30dx19-33 ht. Set to 27" height. ADA Compliant | 6 | \$563.00 | \$382.84 | \$2,297.04 |
| T08a | Smith System Planner Round Activity Table | Smith System | Planner | 25620 | 42x42x24-34 Set to 24" height | 2 | \$705.00 | \$479.40 | \$958.80 |
| T08b | Smith System Planner Round Activity Table | Smith System | Planner | 25620 | 42x42x24-34 Set to 29" height | 1 | \$705.00 | \$479.40 | \$479.40 |
| T09 | Smith System Planner Studio 42" Deep Table | Smith System | Planner Studio | 25230 | 72x42x29 ADA Compliant | 6 | \$1,394.00 | \$947.92 | \$5,687.52 |
| T10a | VS Cross-R Group table with round tubular legs | VS | CROSS-R Group table | 1801 | 47 1/4x23 5/8 x 28 | 1 | \$642.00 | \$500.76 | \$500.76 |
| T10b | VS Cross-R Group table with round tubular legs | VS | CROSS-R Group table | 1822 | 55 1/8x31 1/2 x 28 | 1 | \$857.00 | \$668.46 | \$668.46 |
| T11 | VS Flip Table -TR | VS | Flip Table -TR | 22132 | 70 7/8x31 1/2x28 | 1 | \$1,265.00 | \$986.70 | \$986.70 |
| T14 | VS Lite Table - AL Stackable lightweight table | VS | VS Lite Table - AL | 21019 | 65x323/4x28 | 6 | \$645.00 | \$503.10 | \$3,018.60 |
| T15a | VS Rondo Lift-R height adjustable sitting/standing table with round tube column and base. | VS | VS Rondo Lift-R | 22236 | 35 1/2" dia. Height = 28 5/8-45 3/4" Set to 28 5/8" height. | 7 | \$1,985.00 | \$1,548.30 | \$10,838.10 |
| T15b | VS Rondo Lift-R height adjustable sitting/standing table with round tube column and base. | VS | VS Rondo Lift-R | 22237 | 39 3/8" dia. Height = 28 5/8-45 3/4" Set to 28 5/8" height. | 3 | \$2,150.00 | \$1,677.00 | \$5,031.00 |
| T15c | VS Rondo Lift-R height adjustable sitting/standing table with round tube column and base. | VS | VS Rondo Lift-R | 22238 | 47 1/4" dia. Height = 28 5/8-45 3/4" Set to 28 5/8" height. | 2 | \$2,390.00 | \$1,864.20 | \$3,728.40 |
| T16 | Rondo Lift-Q Height adjustable sitting/standing table with square tube column and base. | VS | VS Rondo Lift-Q | 22232 | 35 1/2 X 35 1/2 X ht.28 5/8-45 3/4 | 1 | \$2,075.00 | \$1,618.50 | \$1,618.50 |
| T17a | Scio Communicator table with Comfort Stools | Sico | Seating Capacity: 12 stools (14 tables in total) | TC-65 | Capacity: 12 stools Top L: 10' Top W: 42" H: 27" 30". Storage Dim: 71" L x 45" W | 14 | \$6,261.00 | \$4,257.48 | \$59,604.72 |
| T17b | Scio Communicator table with Comfort Stools ADA | Sico | ADA Option Seating Capacity: 8 stools & 4 wheelchairs (2 Tables = total of 8 seats in 2 tables) | TC-65 ADA | ADA : cap: 8 stools & 4 wheelchairs. Top L:10' Top W:42" Ht:30" Storage Dim: 71"LX45"W | 2 | \$5,960.00 | \$4,052.80 | \$8,105.60 |
| U1 | Outdoor Bean Bench - Large | Smith System | Flowform | 55203 | 60" w x 25" d x 18.5" h | 13 | \$2,890.00 | \$1,965.20 | \$25,547.60 |

T10a is replaced with VS Eco Table -R Model #23007 47 1/4"wx23 5/8"dx28"h as the specified product is no longer available.

T10b is replaced with VS Eco Table -R, Model #23084 55 1/8"wx31 1/2"dx28"h as the specified product is no longer available.

T14 is replaced with Lite Table-ST Model# 21083 Size = 63"wx31 1/2"dx 28"h as the specified product is no longer available.

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|------------------------|--------------|----------------|---------|-----------------------------|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|--------------|
| U2 | Outdoor Straight Bench | Smith System | Flowform | 55204 | 61" w x 19" d x 18.5" h | 15 | \$2,688.00 | \$1,827.84 | \$27,417.60 |
| U3 | Outdoor Round Ottoman | Smith System | Flowform | 55201 | 25.5" w x 25.5" d x 15.5" h | 10 | \$1,455.00 | \$989.40 | \$9,894.00 |
| | | | | | | | | TOTAL | \$935,517.68 |

**WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT**

The undersigned agrees that if, within thirty (30) days after the date of receiving the equipment quote (Saturdays, Sundays and legal holidays excluded), the undersigned is selected, he will enter into a contract with the Owner.

The undersigned further agrees that, if selected, he will within five (5) days, Saturday, Sundays, and legal holidays excluded, after presentation of a Purchase Contract by the Owner, within the thirty (30) days stipulated above, execute with the Owner a Purchase Contract in accordance with the terms of the Equipment Quote Form and the contract documents

The undersigned certifies under penalties of perjury that this quote has been made and submitted in good faith and without collusion or fraud with any other person. As used in this certification, the word "person" shall mean any natural person, business, partnership, corporation, union, committee, club, or other organization, entity, or group of individuals.

Vendor attention is called to the fact that this project is required to comply with in addition to all other requirements of the Specification; Equal Employment Opportunity, Anti-Discrimination, Minority, and Affirmative Action regulations of the State of Connecticut.

**WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT**

Delivery: Each Vendor shall indicate his ability or inability to conform to the proposed Delivery and Completion Schedule indicated on the "Invitation for Bids". Refer to General Conditions regarding specific delivery and billing information.

The name of manufacturer of the equipment is Artopex, Smith System, Mien, V/S, Kl, Wenger, Jonți-Craft, Sico, Lakeshore

The equipment is as specified Yes, No

06-0858289

Social Security Number, or Federal I.D. Number of Vendor

Robert H. Lord Company, Inc.

Name of

Vendor By Robert Romay, Vice President

Title

220 Chapel Road

Business Address

Manchester, CT 06042

City/State/Zip

860-512-2126

860-645-9100

Telephone

FAX

robromay@rhlco.com

E-Mail

7/9/2024

Date

STATE CONTRACT QUOTE FORMS SHALL BE SUBMITTED IN DUPLICATE. PLEASE FILL-IN ALL BLANKS ON THIS FORM. STATE CONTRACT QUOTE SHALL BE CLEARLY MARKED ON THE ENVELOPE WITH SECTION NUMBER, SECTION TITLE, TIME SPECIFIED FOR RECEIPT, AND THE VENDOR'S NAME AND ADDRESS.

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

**NOTE: ALL STATE CONTRACT REQUEST FORMS SHALL BE SUBMITTED IN DUPLICATE
SUBMIT SEPARATE ENVELOPES FOR EACH SECTION**

SECTION 102 - FURNITURE & EQUIPMENT

STATE CONTRACT FORM # 15PSX0041.

TO: Town of Ellington
Ms. Tiffany Pignataro, CPA, MBA, Finance Officer, Treasurer
Ellington Town Hall
152 Elm Street
Ellington, CT 06029

The undersigned Bidder shall furnish all labor and materials required for **Section 102**, entitled **Miscellaneous Furniture & Equipment**, for the Windermere Elementary School, Ellington, CT, in accordance with Equipment Specifications prepared by Drummey Rosane Anderson Architects, 225 Oakland Road, Studio 205, South Windsor, CT 06074.

NOTE: PRICING, AS PART OF THIS STATE CONTRACT QUOTE, SHALL BE VALID FOR 180 DAY FROM DATE OF RECEIPT.

The Itemized State Contract Prices shall be as follows:

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

| ITEM NUMBER | DESCRIPTION | MANUFACTURER | PRODUCT SERIES | MODEL # | DIMENSIONS (W x D x H x SH) | QTY | CONTRACT LIST PRICE | CONTRACT DISCOUNTED NET PRICE | TOTAL PRICE |
|-------------|--|--------------|--------------------|---|---|-----|---------------------|-------------------------------|--------------|
| F03a | 2-Drawer Lateral File | Artopex | | 57-21-036-13 | 36"w x 18"d x 27-15/16"h | 18 | \$2,014.00 | \$1,047.28 | \$18,851.04 |
| F03b | 5-Drawer Lateral File Admin | Artopex | | 57-51-036-13333 | 36"w x 18"d x 65-1/2"h | 3 | \$3,440.00 | \$1,788.80 | \$5,366.40 |
| F04b | Bookcase with 3 adjustable Shelves | Artopex | | 70-50-030-YYY | 30"w x 18"d x 65 1/2"h | 1 | \$1,344.00 | \$698.88 | \$698.88 |
| F05 | File Cabinet | Artopex | | TZ-PFTUUF241627 | 24"d x 15 5/8"w | 7 | \$975.00 | \$507.00 | \$3,549.00 |
| M18 | NPS® AirFlex Series Premium Polypropylene Folding Chair, Black (Pack of 4) 125 Packs Total =500chairs | NPS | | 1410 | 32" H x 21.5" W x 20.75" D Seat Dims: 17W x 17.25H x 18L | 125 | \$372.00 | \$232.96 | \$29,120.00 |
| M23 | 4 Series NPS Double-Tiered Hanging Chair Dolly | NPS | Series 4 | 84 | 67" W x 33 1/4"D x 70"H | 6 | \$910.00 | \$618.80 | \$3,712.80 |
| S13 | KI Signia Task Chair | KI | 4D Arm | Advanced Synchrotilt Task Chair, Fabric Back, 4D Arms (KISN88FC2) Advanced Synchrotilt Task Chair, Mesh Back, 4D Arms (KISN88MC2) | 26x26x38.5-43 Seat 18.25x17-20x17.5-22 | 14 | \$1,276.00 | \$714.56 | \$10,003.84 |
| T12a | KI Ruckus Worktable Double Face Cubby storage w/Doors or Tote & cubby storage w/Doors | KI | KI Ruckus | RCWT6054TDR (for totes with door) RCWT6054CDR (for cubby with door) | 60x54x36 | 10 | \$5,248.00 | \$2,833.92 | \$28,339.20 |
| T12b | KI Ruckus Worktable Double Face Cubby storage w/Doors or Tote & cubby storage w/Doors (ADA Accessible) | KI | KI Ruckus | | 60x54 | 2 | \$4,971.00 | \$2,684.34 | \$5,368.68 |
| T13 | Haworth- Jive Table -Bridge Base- Rectangle | Haworth | Haworth Jive Table | TCRA-54J0- S GK4 | 180"x54"x29" | 1 | \$6,742.53 | \$3,640.97 | \$3,640.97 |
| | | | | | | | | TOTAL | \$108,650.81 |

↑
Model revised to have power ready base for the table.

WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT

The undersigned agrees that if, within thirty (30) days after the date of receiving the equipment quote (Saturdays, Sundays and legal holidays excluded), the undersigned is selected, he will enter into a contract with the Owner.

The undersigned further agrees that, if selected, he will within five (5) days, Saturday, Sundays, and legal holidays excluded, after presentation of a Purchase Contract by the Owner, within the thirty (30) days stipulated above, execute with the Owner a Purchase Contract in accordance with the terms of the Equipment Quote Form and the contract documents

The undersigned certifies under penalties of perjury that this quote has been made and submitted in good faith and without collusion or fraud with any other person. As used in this certification, the word "person" shall mean any natural person, business, partnership, corporation, union, committee, club, or other organization, entity, or group of individuals.

Vendor attention is called to the fact that this project is required to comply with in addition to all other requirements of the Specification; Equal Employment Opportunity, Anti-Discrimination, Minority, and Affirmative Action regulations of the State of Connecticut.

**WINDERMERE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
ELLINGTON, CT**

Delivery: Each Vendor shall indicate his ability or inability to conform to the proposed Delivery and Completion Schedule indicated on the "Invitation for Bids". Refer to General Conditions regarding specific delivery and billing information.

The name of manufacturer of the equipment is Artopex, National Public Seating, KI & Haworth.

The equipment is as specified Yes, xx No _____

06-0858289

Social Security Number, or Federal I.D. Number of Vendor

Robert H. Lord Company, Inc.

Name of

Vendor By Robert Romay, Vice President

Title

220 Chapel Road

Business Address

Manchester, CT 06042

City/State/Zip

860-512-2126

860-645-9100

Telephone

FAX

robromay@rhlco.com

E-Mail

7/9/2024

Date

STATE CONTRACT QUOTE FORMS SHALL BE SUBMITTED IN DUPLICATE. PLEASE FILL-IN ALL BLANKS ON THIS FORM. STATE CONTRACT QUOTE SHALL BE CLEARLY MARKED ON THE ENVELOPE WITH SECTION NUMBER, SECTION TITLE, TIME SPECIFIED FOR RECEIPT, AND THE VENDOR'S NAME AND ADDRESS.