

ORANGE COUNTY  
BOARD OF EDUCATION

AGENDA ITEM ABSTRACT

Meeting Date: June 10, 2013

AGENDA ITEM No. 13-06-13

ACTION ITEM (Y/N) Y

SUBJECT: Child Nutrition Commodities FY 2014 Bid Approval

INFO. CONTACT: Pam Jones/Valerie Green PHONE: 732-6133, ext. 16501

**ATTACHMENTS:**

1. Child Nutrition Services 2013-2014 Bid Tabulation Re-Cap Sheet
- 

**PURPOSE:** To consider approving the bids and awarding the contracts for Child Nutrition milk/dairy products, bread, food, supplies, chemicals, ice cream, snacks, beverages and vending.

**BACKGROUND:** NC General Statute 143-129 governs the bidding process. All proposals shall be opened in public, the board shall award the contract to the lowest responsible bidder, taking into consideration quality, performance, and the time specified in the proposals for the performance of the contract.

Sealed bids from participating vendors were opened on May 13, 2013 in Raleigh. Eighty-seven(87) North Carolina LEAs formed a cooperative, the North Carolina Procurement Alliance, in order to take advantage of economies of scale and drive down the price of the child nutrition commodities (food, supplies, snacks, beverages, commodity storage, ice cream, and produce). The apparent low bidders, which were reviewed and met specifications as outlined in the respective RFP's, are listed below:

Food/Snacks, Supplies and Chemicals/ Commodities Storage- Sysco Raleigh (Renewal)  
Ice Cream and Frozen Fruit Products- Countryside Dairy Inc.  
Milk/Dairy Products- Maola Dairy (Renewal)  
Snack/Drink Vending- Canteen Vending Services (Renewal)  
Beverage Vending- Canteen Vending Services (Renewal)  
Beverages- Sysco Raleigh, Coca Cola and Pepsi Bottling of Roxboro  
Produce- Layton's Produce (Renewal)

**FINANCIAL IMPACT:** Costs are shown on the respective bid tabulation sheet.

**RECOMMENDATION:** The Superintendent recommends the Board approve the bids and award the contracts to the apparent low bidders for the commodities as noted on the Bid Tabulation Sheet.

Orange County Schools  
 Child Nutrition Services  
 2013-2014 Bid Tabulation Sheet  
 June 3, 2013

		Brand	Pack Sizes	Case Cost	Total Cost
Groceries and Commodities	Sysco Raleigh				Renewal
Supplies	Sysco Raleigh				Renewal
Fresh Produce	Layton's Produce				Renewal
Ice Cream	Countryside Dairy Inc.				\$ 16,312.00
	Sysco Raleigh				\$ 29,600.00
	Pet Dairy				No Bid
Beverages					
W1A (water, 16.9 oz)	Sysco Raleigh	Crystal Geysler	35/16.9oz	5.95 cs.	\$ 595.00
	Coca Cola				No Bid
	Pepsi Cola				No bid
W2A (water, 8 oz)	Sysco Raleigh	Deer Park	28/8oz.	10.05 cs	\$ 1,005.00
	Coca Cola				No Bid
	Pepsi Cola				No Bid
W3A (water 20 oz)	Pepsi Bottling Roxboro	LeBleu	24/20oz.	6.50 cs	\$ 3,250.00
	Coca Cola				\$ 3,675.00
	Sysco Raleigh				\$ 4,000.00
W7 (flavored water)	Coca Cola	Dasani	24/20oz	7.85 cs.	\$ 785.00
	Sysco Raleigh				\$ 825.00
	Pepsi Bottling Roxboro				\$ 990.00
JU1 (100%, 10 oz)	Coca Cola	Minute Maid	24/10oz.	12.10 cs.	\$ 4,840.00
	Sysco Raleigh				\$ 5,400.00
	Pepsi Bottling Roxboro				\$ 5,360.00
Bev2 (G2, 12 oz)	Sysco Raleigh	G2	24/12oz	11.50 cs	\$ 5,750.00
	Coca Cola				\$ 5,775.00
	Pepsi Cola				\$ 6,000.00
Bev6 (Yoo-hoo)	Sysco Raleigh		24/11oz	11.25 cs	\$ 4,500.00
	Coca Cola				No Bid
	Pepsi Cola				No Bid
Bev8 (Switch)	Sysco Raleigh		24/8.3oz	13.00 cs	\$ 6,500.00
	Coca Cola				No Bid
	Pepsi Cola				No Bid
Milk	Maola Dairy Company				Renewal
Vending Snacks	Canteen Vending Services				Renewal
Vending Beverages	Canteen Vending Services				Renewal