TABULATION OF BIDS ORANGE COUNTY SCHOOLS
IFB# 24-7-100 ECGES CLASSROOM FURNITURE
Bid Date: Thursday, June 22, 2023
Time: 2:00 PM
Lakeshore Learning Materials
HCONE International Impex LLC|* Duplicate bid received Learning LLC A iates Inc. School Specialty Virco Wilcox Office Mart
UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
QTY DESCRIPTION ADDITIONAL INFO (EA) TOTAL PRICE (EA) TOTAL PRICE (EA) TOTAL PRICE (EA) TOTAL PRICE (EA) TOTAL PRICE (EA) TOTAL PRICE (EA) TOTAL PRICE
18" x 24" Adjustable Student Desk
with single open book box'with
minimum height adjustable
22"-29"in 1-inch increments;
chrome legs, swivel glides, no
560 Each |casters Top color — light oak $105.99 $59,354.40 $464.55 $260,148.00 $116.53 $65,256.80 $94.00 $52,640.00 | No Bid No Bid Not Listed Not Listed $150.50 $84,280.00
chair, stackable student 14"
110 Each |wi/nylon floor guides chrome legs | Seat color — navy blue $39.99 $4,398.90 $61.74 $6,791.40 $39.86 $4,384.60 $34.75 $3,822.50 | No Bid No Bid Not Listed Not Listed $77.50 $8,525.00
chair, stackable student 15"
50 Each  |w/nylon floor guides chrome legs | Seat color — navy blue $42.99 $2,149.50 $75.99 $3,799.50 $42.17 $2,108.50 $43.50 $2,175.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.50 $4,925.00
chair, stackable student 16"
250 Each |w/nylon floor guides chrome legs | Seat color — navy blue $45.99 $11,497.50 $75.99 $18,997.50 $42.17 $10,542.50 $43.50 $10,875.00 | No Bid No Bid Not Listed Not Listed $98.50 $24,625.00
chair, stackable student 18"
220 Each |w/nylon floor guides chrome legs | Seat color — navy blue $47.99 $10,557.80 $90.24 $19,852.80 $42.33 $9,312.60 $43.50 $9,570.00 | No Bid No Bid Not Listed Not Listed $100.00 $22,000.00
Desk color, black
teacher single pedestal 3 drawer |top-light oak;
10 desk, locking; 48" wide substitution allowed $475.99 $4,759.90 $1,139.05 $11,390.50 $579.69 $5,796.90 $670.00 $6,700.00 | No Bid No Bid Not Listed Not Listed $1,391.50 $13,915.00
wardrobe storage, 2 door with lock |color: light oak
Sizes permitted 36"- 48" wide x Specify size for bid: $1,599.99 $958.50 $1,092.00 $866.50
20 60"-84" tall on casters. 36x48x78 $31,999.80 | No Bid No Bid 36x24x72 $19,170.00 | 36x72x24 $21,840.00 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 35.5x22x65.5 $17,330.00
color: light oak
lateral file storage 36" wide x Specify size for bid: $1,895.99 $819.82 $922.26 $624.00
20 30"-36" high, with lock on casters. 36" $37,919.80 | No Bid No Bid 36x22x29 $16,396.40 | 30x27x18 $18,445.20 | No Bid No Bid Not Listed Not Listed 35.5x22x29.5 $12,480.00
Total: $173,615.64 $345,053.18 $162,992.14 $140,252.78 No Bid $167,590.67 $203,977.90

*Apparent lowest responsible responsive bidder: Blankenship Associates, Inc.

| (We) hereby certify gat this is a true and ;ccurate tabulation of bids received this day for the above project.
vate__&[22/2023
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