
KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION  
PLAYGROUND MULCH BID 2024

Estimated Quantity in 

Yard3

Unit Price Delivered 

per Yard3 Including 

Freight

Unit Price to Blow in 

Place per Yard3 

Including Freight

Total to Deliver and 

Blow in Place per Yard3 

Including Freight

Wood Chip Mulch

1 yd3 –    50 yd3
35.00$                              36.00 71.00

51 yd3 – 100 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

101 yd3 – 150 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

151 yd
3
 – 200 yd

3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

201 yd3 – 250 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

251 yd3 – 300 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

301 yd3 – 350 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

351 yd3 – 400 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

401 yd3 – 450 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

451 yd3 – 500 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

501 yd3 – 550 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

551 yd3 – 600 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

601 yd3 – 650 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

651 yd3 – 700 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

701 yd
3
 – 750 yd

3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

751 yd3 – 1,000 yd3
25.00$                              36.00 61.00

Lead Time

Irvine Wood Recovery

2-3 DAYS
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KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION  
PLAYGROUND MULCH BID 2024

Estimated Quantity in 

Yard3

Unit Price Delivered 

per Yard3 Including 

Freight

Unit Price to Blow in 

Place per Yard3 

Including Freight

Total to Deliver and 

Blow in Place per Yard3 

Including Freight

Rubber Mulch

1 yd3 –    50 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

51 yd3 – 100 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

101 yd3 – 150 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

151 yd
3
 – 200 yd

3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

201 yd3 – 250 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

251 yd3 – 300 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

301 yd3 – 350 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

351 yd3 – 400 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

401 yd3 – 450 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

451 yd3 – 500 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

501 yd3 – 550 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

551 yd3 – 600 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

601 yd3 – 650 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

651 yd3 – 700 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

701 yd
3
 – 750 yd

3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

751 yd3 – 1,000 yd3
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lead Time

 - Recommended as the lowest and/or best evaluated bid.

Irvine Wood Recovery
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