




*The Hawthorne Way:
Every student, every day.*

Regular Board Meeting
06/26/2024 06:00 PM
Hawthorne School District
14120 South Hawthorne Blvd.
Hawthorne, CA 90250

Printed : 6/27/2024 9:53 AM PT

ITEM : IV.i. Request for Proposal (“RFP”) No. FS24-25-1 Distribution of Frozen, Refrigerated, Processed USDA Foods (Commodities), Miscellaneous Food Products, and Supplies 

Recommended Motion:

Approve and award Request for Proposal (“RFP”) No. FS24-25-1 Distribution of Frozen, Refrigerated, Processed USDA Foods (Commodities), Miscellaneous Food Products, and Supplies.

Rationale:

It is requested that the Board of Trustees approve and award RFP No. FS24-25-1 Distribution of Frozen, Refrigerated, Processed USDA Foods (Commodities), Miscellaneous Food Products, and Supplies. For optimal procurement, it is recommended to award multiple contracts to the lowest responsive and responsible Bidders for Schedules A through C, as per the attached yellow highlighted bid line items.

Pursuant to Education Code Section 17596, the contract may be extended for one-year periods based on mutual consent, not to exceed two (2) renewal periods.

Pursuant to Public Contract Code Section 20118, this bid proposal may be used by other school districts and community college districts, including county, city, town, or public corporation or agency within the State of California by virtue of its Piggyback Clause. The District waives its right to require such other districts or agencies to draw their warrants in favor of the District.

Goals

Fiscal Responsibility: Efficiently allocate resources (i.e. facilities, equipment, supplies, etc.) to support student learning

Recommended By:

Mara Pagniano, Associate Superintendent - Business Services

Financial Impact:

Funding Source: 13.0-53100.0-00000-37000-4710-XXXXXXX

Supporting Documents

[ex a rfp fs24-25-1 summary results/Jun 26, 2024](#)



*The Hawthorne Way:
Every student, every day.*

Regular Board Meeting

6/26/2024 06:00 PM

Hawthorne School District
14120 South Hawthorne Blvd.
Hawthorne, CA 90250

Meeting Minutes

IV. Consent Items

- i. Request for Proposal (“RFP”) No. FS24-25-1 Distribution of Frozen, Refrigerated, Processed USDA Foods (Commodities), Miscellaneous Food Products, and Supplies**

Approve and award Request for Proposal (“RFP”) No. FS24-25-1 Distribution of Frozen, Refrigerated, Processed USDA Foods (Commodities), Miscellaneous Food Products, and Supplies.

Motion made by: Cristina Chiappe

Motion seconded by: Sergio Mortara

Voting:

Cristina Chiappe - Yes

Sergio Mortara - Yes

Luciano Aguilar - Yes

Dr. Eugene Krank – Yes

BLI #	Name (Common Name)*	DRIFTWOOD					CLEARBROOK FARMS					GOLD STAR					VICTOR'S MARKET					KB FOODS					IMPERIAL DADE(P & R PAPER)				
		Qty per Case	Unit Cost per Case	Extended cost	Substitute MFR Yes/No?	Substitute MFR Name?	Qty per Case	Unit Cost per Case	Extended cost	Substitute MFR Yes/No?	Substitute MFR Name?	Qty per Case	Unit Cost per Case	Extended cost	Substitute MFR Yes/No?	Substitute MFR Name?	Qty per Case	Unit Cost per Case	Extended cost	Substitute MFR Yes/No?	Substitute MFR Name?	Qty per Case	Unit Cost per Case	Extended cost	Substitute MFR Yes/No?	Substitute MFR Name?	Qty per Case	Unit Cost per Case	Extended cost	Substitute MFR Yes/No?	Substitute MFR Name?
316	Lid for 8-oz parfait containers	10	NO BID	NO BID			10	NO BID	NO BID			750	\$ 0.05	\$ 40.11	YES	PACTIV	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			500	\$ 0.03	\$ 15.00		
317	Lunch kit - fork/napkin/straw	1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.02	\$ 18.86	YES	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.01	\$ 10.75		
318	Medium duty scouring pad	6	NO BID	NO BID			6	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			20	\$ 0.19	\$ 3.80	Yes	Victoria Bay	
319	Micro Pail, 1 pint	9	NO BID	NO BID			9	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			450	\$ 0.06	\$ 28.90			
320	Nitrile Dishwashing gloves, LARGE	12	NO BID	NO BID			12	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.04	\$ 36.66	YES	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			12	\$ 1.08	\$ 13.00		
321	Nitrile Dishwashing gloves, MEDIUM	12	NO BID	NO BID			12	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.04	\$ 36.66	YES	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			12	\$ 1.08	\$ 13.00		
322	Nitrile Dishwashing gloves, SMALL	12	NO BID	NO BID			12	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.04	\$ 36.66	YES	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			12	\$ 1.08	\$ 13.00		
323	Pan Liner, 16-3/8" x 24-3/8"	1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.05	\$ 47.22	YES	HOT PACK	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.04	\$ 37.20	Yes	Paterson Pacific Parchment
324	Pan Saver - 6" Deep, Full Pan, Oven safe (400°F)	50	NO BID	NO BID			50	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			50	\$ 0.58	\$ 28.90			
325	Pizza box, for slices	400	NO BID	NO BID			400	NO BID	NO BID			400	\$ 0.17	\$ 67.46	YES	PACTIV	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			400	\$ 0.08	\$ 32.30	Yes	
326	Rack cover, 52"x80"	50	NO BID	NO BID			50	NO BID	NO BID			50	\$ 0.57	\$ 28.27	YES	LK PLASTICS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			50	\$ 0.24	\$ 11.85		
327	Saran wrap, 18"x2000"	1	NO BID	NO BID			1	NO BID	NO BID			1	\$ 34.56	\$ 34.56	YES	DURABLE PACKAGING	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1	\$ 12.50	\$ 12.50		
328	Spiked Straw, white, 5.75"	80	NO BID	NO BID			80	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			12000	\$ 0.00	\$ 35.00			
329	Spoon, Heavy duty, black	20	NO BID	NO BID			20	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.02	\$ 16.04	YES	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.01	\$ 12.70		
330	Spork kit	1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.02	\$ 20.31	YES	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.01	\$ 9.80		
331	Spork with Spiked Straw Kit	1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.02	\$ 20.70	YES	PACTIV	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.01	\$ 9.80		
332	Tallfold napkin	20	NO BID	NO BID			20	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			10000	\$ 0.00	\$ 23.90			
333	Teflon Oven Mitten	1	NO BID	NO BID			1	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1	\$ 8.50	\$ 8.50			
334	Towelette wetnaps, 5x9	1000	NO BID	NO BID			1000	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.01	\$ 10.25			
335	Vinyl Gloves, LARGE	10	NO BID	NO BID			10	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.02	\$ 24.06	YES	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.01	\$ 14.65		
336	Vinyl Gloves, MEDIUM	10	NO BID	NO BID			10	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.02	\$ 24.06	YES	GOLDMAX INDUSTRIES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.01	\$ 14.65		
337	White sanitizing towel	150	NO BID	NO BID			150	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			150	\$ 0.16	\$ 23.50			
338	Wipes for thermometer probes	200	NO BID	NO BID			200	NO BID	NO BID			100	\$ 0.55	\$ 55.03	YES	TAYLOR INSTRUMENTS	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			1000	\$ 0.02	\$ 17.70	Yes	
Non-responsive																Non-responsive															