

KENTON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
BUS FLUIDS 2024-2025

COMMODITY CODE	ITEM	APOLLO OIL			CLARKE POWER SERVICES			KEY OIL			MANSFIELD			SAFETY-CLEAN SYSTEMS-CLEAN HARBOR			VALOR OIL			WOODFORD OIL			NOTES
		BRAND	COST	UOM	BRAND	COST	UOM	BRAND	COST	UOM	BRAND	COST	UOM	BRAND	COST	UOM	BRAND	COST	UOM	BRAND	COST	UOM	
FLU-10000	Engine Oil – 15W-40	SHELL	\$9.19	GALLON	PHILLIPS	\$ 12.94	GALLON	HALLMARK CK-4	\$ 9.40	GALLON	EMERALD	\$ 10.65	GALLON	PERFORMANCE PLUS	\$ 9.75	GALLON	DURAFLOW	\$ 10.67	GALLON	CITGO	\$ 10.25	GALLON	
FLU-10025	Automatic Transmission Fluid Allison TES-295	NO BID		GALLON	ALLISON	\$ 34.61	GALLON	MOBIL DELVAC 1 ATF	\$ 22.90	GALLON	VALVOLINE	\$ 25.50	GALLON	NO BID		GALLON	CHEVRON	\$ 26.00	GALLON	CITGO SYNDURANCE 668 ATF	\$ 32.70	BULK	MULTIPLE AWARD-668 is fully back to TES 295
FLU-10020	Automatic Transmission Fluid Allison TES-389-SPEC	NO BID		GALLON	PHILLIPS	\$ 12.76	GALLON	HALLMARK ATF	\$ 8.95	GALLON	VALVOLINE	\$ 18.82	GALLON	NO BID		GALLON	NO BID	\$ 14.52	GALLON	CITGO SYNDURANCE 668 ATF	\$ 32.70	BULK	MULTIPLE AWARD-668 is fully back to TES 389
FLU-10030	Power Steering Fluid	NO BID		QUART	VALVOLINE	\$ 10.59	QUART	NO BID		QUART	VALVOLINE	\$ 6.49	QUART	PERFORMANCE PLUS	\$ 567.00	QUART	NO BID		QUART	STARFIRE	\$ 3.56	QUART	
FLU-10110	Antifreeze – Fully Formulated Glycol Base Engine Coolant – PURPLE ONLY	NO BID		QUART	VALVOLINE	\$ 10.59	QUART	NO BID		QUART	VALVOLINE	\$ 6.49	QUART	PERFORMANCE PLUS	\$ 567.00	QUART	NO BID		QUART	STARFIRE	\$ 8.75	GALLON	
FLU-10110	Antifreeze – Fully Formulated Glycol Base Engine Coolant – PURPLE ONLY	SHELL	\$399.99	55 GALLON	VALVOLINE	\$ 526.43	55 GALLON	KOST HD PRE-CHARGE 50/50	\$ 374.00	55 GALLON	KOST	\$ 357.55	55 GALLON	NO BID		55 GALLON	NO BID		55 GALLON	CHEVRON HD 50/50	\$481.25	55 GALLON	AWARDED CONTRACT VOIDED PER MANSFIELD OIL REQUEST
FLU-10065	Gear Oil – Synthetic 75W-140	NO BID		120 POUND	PHILLIPS	\$ 5,445.56	258 GALLON DRUM	MOBIL 1SYN LS	\$ 942.40	KEG	VALVOLINE	\$ 186.20	35 LB PAIL	NO BID		120 POUND	NO BID		120 POUND	STARFIRE SYN	\$ 355.75	120 POUND	
FLU-10060	Gear Oil – 85W-140	NO BID		120 POUND	PHILLIPS	\$ 305.14	120 POUND	HALLMARK GO 85W-140	\$ 288.00	KEG	VALVOLINE	\$ 638.40	120 POUND	NO BID		120 POUND	NO BID		120 POUND	STARFIRE SYN	\$ 287.50	120 POUND	
FLU-10070	Chassis Grease	NO BID		400 POUND	NO BID		400 POUND	HALLMARK GO 85W-140	\$ 288.00	120 POUND	VALVOLINE	\$ 324.80	120 POUND	NO BID		120 POUND	NO BID		120 POUND	CHEVRON STARPLEX EP2	\$ 1,525.00	400 POUND	
FLU-10085	Windshield Washer Solvent Pre-mix	NO BID		55 GALLON	NO BID		55 GALLON	KOST WASHER-22	\$ 110.00	DRUM	VALVOLINE	\$ 1,620.00	400 POUND	NO BID		400 POUND	PETRO CANADA	\$ 1,858.75	400 POUND	CHEVRON STARPLEX EP2	\$ 1,525.00	400 POUND	
FLU-10085	Windshield Washer Solvent Pre-mix	NO BID		55 GALLON	NO BID		55 GALLON	KOST WASHER-22	\$ 110.00	55 GALLON	EMERALD	\$ 140.55	55 GALLON	NO BID		55 GALLON	DURA FLOW	\$ 125.00	55 GALLON	WINDSHIELD FLUID	\$ 159.50	55 GALLON	
FLU-10100	Diesel Exhaust Fluid	MUSKET	\$ 1.99	GALLON	O'REILLY	\$ 5.84	GALLON	A-1 DEF	\$ 1.87	GALLON	BLUE LEAF	\$ 2.00	GALLON	NO BID		GALLON	BLUE SKY	\$ 1.64	GALLON	BLUE SKY	\$ 2.30	GALLON	
STORE DISCOUNT:		0%			0%			0%			0%			0%			0%			0%			

*NOTES: Late Bid-Reladyne is not included in the tabulation. Pink Highlighted cells represent units of measure differing from requested UOM.

Recommendation: Award the Bus Fluids Bid as indicated in the YELLOW highlighted sections.