

BAKERSFIELD CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT Award Sheet		School Health Corp.	School Specialty	Lakeshore	BSN Sports
Sports Equipment Bid #24-04-10					
Line Item	Description	Total Unit Cost			
1	Air Hockey - Table Atomic Indigo #2125421 90"L x 45"W x 32½"H table	-	\$ 1,065.67	-	\$ 1,099.98
2	Badminton Set - #015623 Includes: UltraNet Max Portable Net Systems, 4 Ea. Steel Racquets (24"L), 16 Ea. Gopher S1 Recreational Shuttlecocks, 60 Ea. Deluxe Vinyl Floor Tape (Black), Set of 6 Rolls Badminton Storage Bag, 1 Ea.	-	\$ 1,291.00	-	-
3	Badminton - Shuttlecocks #T800WHBL Pack of 6	\$ 13.41	\$ 11.12	-	\$ 8.98
4	Ball Cart - Medicine Ball No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Gopher Sport UltraFit Medicine Ball Cart	-	-	-	-
5	Balls - Sensory Nub #10044PS to foster sensory development. Set of 6 multicolored balls.	\$ 18.00	\$ 20.36	-	-
6	Baseball - Big Hitter Game Pack No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports 2 each: Oversized baseball bat 30"L x 6-1/2" diameter, 6 each: 18" inflatable balls, 1 set of bases 1 storage bag Gopher Sport BITHitter Game Pack	-	-	-	-
7	Basketball - Rebounder Flaghouse #2120372 39-1/2"L x 39-1/2"W steel frame, webbed rebounder	\$ 140.43	\$ 111.00	-	-
8	Basketball Hoops - Portable 4' H Flaghouse #2119860	-	\$ 94.87	\$ 281.06	-
9	Board Games - Game Pack No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports or S&S Worldwide Battleship, 2 Ea., Jenga, 2 Ea., Monopoly, 2 Ea., Scrabble, 2 Ea., Sorry, 2 Ea., Trouble, 2 , a, Yahtzee, 2 Ea., Checkers, 4 Ea., Chess, 4 Ea., Connect Four, 4 Ea., Dominoes, 4 Ea., Playing Cards, 12 Ea., Cabinet, 1 Ea., Gopher Sport ClassPlus Game Pack	-	-	-	-
10	Board Games - Giant Chess Set No Bid, Recommend S&S Worldwide 25"H high quality molded plastic pieces, 9' square chess mat. Comes with 32 pieces (half white and half black): 2 Kings, 2 Queens, 4 Bishops, 4 Knights, 4 Rooks, and 16 Pawns. S&S WorldWide Ginormous Chess Set with 25" King and 9' Fabric Board Item #: W14430	-	-	-	-

11	Bonkerzball Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Each target consists of a 45 cm burst-resistant stability ball on a mobile base. Base (19-1/4"L x 19-1/4"W x 9-1/2"H; 11 lb.) is made of durable powder-coated steel tubing that's welded for long-lasting use. Four 2-1/2" dia. inline casters roll smoothly across the gym floor. Complete Set includes 2 targets, 24 coated-foam balls (6.3" dia.; 12 ea. red, blue), 2 rolls of floor tape Gopher Sport Bozonkerzball Set	-	-	-	-
12	Bosu Ball Trainer Set of 24 No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports 24 each balance balls, with steel mobile storage cart. Gopher Sport Bosu NexGenPro pack of 24 65-908	-	-	-	-
13	BounceBlast Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports This set includes 1 BounceBlast rebounder, 48 BounceBlast balls (24 ea. 3", 6" dia.), a VersaBag Mesh Bag Gopher Sport Action BounceBlast Set	-	-	-	-
14	Broomball Set #1399506 12-Player Set. Includes 12 sticks (6 ea. Red, Blue) and 2 foam balls.	\$ 134.15	-	-	\$ 124.97
15	Canopy - 10'x10 No Bid, Research Vendors Steel frame portable easy up canopy Uline Canopy H-2674, or equal	-	-	-	-
16	Cart - Activity Cart #WE130 Lakeshore Indoor/Outdoor Equipment Cart, Swing and Catch Cups - Set of 6 Colors, 6 Swivel-Handle Jump Ropes, 2 Playground Jump Ropes, Let's Get Moving! Activity Mats, Soft & Safe Comet Balls, 2 Mini Bowling Sets, Best-Buy Color Cones, Activity Beanbags, 4 Soccer Balls, 4 Basketballs, 2 Lakeshore 10" Playground Balls, 4 Lakeshore 8 1/2" Playground Balls, Game Hoops	-	-	\$ 863.86	-
17	Cornhole Game #15579PS Set includes 2 boards (33-1/2"L x 20"W), 8 beanbags (4 Ea. Red, Blue), a 20'L measuring cord, and a wall mount.	\$ 93.98	\$ 135.00	-	\$ 124.98
18	Disc Golf - Portable Target Mesh #5010945 Aluminum foldable disc golf target. Target is 31" dia x 68"H; 15 lb. Canopy varies in color.	\$ 163.39	\$ 133.33	-	-
19	Disc Golf - Portable Target Steel No Bid, Research Vendors Portable disc golf target includes 52"H target, 2 putters, 2 mid range, 2 drivers, and carry bag. SGSPORT ASIN#B094DS26Q6	-	-	-	-
20	Disc Golf - Starter Set #025122 Set of three disc golf disc: All discs are 21 cm dia.; 165-185 g.	-	\$ 13.70	-	-
21	Exercise Spot Instruction Signs	-	-	-	-
22	Foosball - Balls #1481445 Set of 6 replacement foosball balls	-	\$ 11.06	-	-
23	Foosball Table	-	\$ 893.13	-	\$ 699.98
24	Football - Field Marking Set	-	-	-	\$ 368.98
25	Futsal - Wall Board Kit	-	-	-	-

26	Gaga Ball Pit - 15' Dia. Kit #1581874 15' dia. pit includes 72"L panels, Constructed of 6" thick walls.	\$ 2,006.37	\$ 1,763.33	-	-
27	Goal Set - Rainbow Round No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports #58-383 Set includes 6 goals, 60 Rainbow Itty Balls, 6 Rainbow Squeeze Coated-Foam Balls (6.3" dia.), a VersaBag mesh storage bag	-	-	-	-
28	Goals - Rebound No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports #59-615 Two-sided goal adjustable from 50" to 70-1/2"H in 6-3/4" increments. Net attaches via sleeves with hook-and-look fasteners. Set includes 12 rebounders (6 ea. red, blue), 12 vinyl balls (6" dia.), 1 goal, a mesh storage bag,	-	-	-	-
29	Golf - Ball Basket No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Metal golf ball basket, 100 ball capacity, set of two baskets Tandeifo 2 pcs metal golf ball basket B0CCVJY6VK	-	-	-	-
30	Golf - Balls Various Colors No Bid, Choose a Vendor Set of 50 foam 1.65 inch golf practice balls in various colors: yellow, orange, red, green, and blue (10 each). Yunsailing B0BGKK6ZSV, or equal	-	-	-	-
31	Golf - Golf Simulator No Bid, Choose a Vendor Includes projector, putting green, and 9'4"x12'3"x5' enclosure OptiShot 2 Golf Simulator for Home Golf in A Box Series B08LP6MHPV, or equal	-	-	-	-
32	Golf - Golf Tees No Bid, Choose a Vendor Set of 1,000 wood 3-1/4" tall white golf tees.	-	-	-	-
33	Golf - Men's Golf Club Set Right Hand No Bid, Choose a Vendor 9/10 Pieces Men's Complete Golf Clubs Set Right Hand, Includes 460cc Alloy #1 Driver & #3 Fairway Wood & #4 Hybrid & #6/#7/#8/#9/#P Irons & Putter, Golf Club Set Tangkula 9/10 Pieces Set B0CBF691YT	-	-	-	-
34	Golf - Putting System No Bid, Choose a Vendor Club Champ 7' gravity feed putting system B000KGDYQG	-	-	-	-
35	Golf Clubs - Female Set Left Hand No Bid, Choose a Vendor This set, for left handed female golfers, includes a driver, a 3 wood, a hybrids, 6-7-8-9-PW irons, a putter and a stand bag.	-	-	-	-
36	Golf Clubs - Men's Set Left Hand No Bid, Choose a Vendor Left handed male golfers, includes a driver, a 3 wood, a hybrids, 6-7-8-9-PW irons, a putter and a stand bag.	-	-	-	-

37	High Jump Pit #42111PS 2" thick top pad. Pit is 16'6"W x 8'D x 26"H, 264 lb., Environmentally-friendly polyurethane foam is covered in 18 oz vinyl that is weather/fade resistant, Meets NCAA, IAAF, and NFHS specifications. Includes International High Jump Pit, All-Weather Cover, Aluminum Roll-Away High Jump Standards, 2 Ea., Fiberglass Crossbar (13'1½"), 1 Ea.	\$ 6,772.99	-	-	\$ 7,050.00
38	High Jump Pit - Inflatable No Bid, Choose a Vendor 21oz coated vinyl with ripple stitched seams and hems, 1-1/2" foam top cover with spike resistant mesh and heat sealed seams, meets NCAA, NFHS, and IAAF rules. Inflate & Go High Jump Inflatable Landing Systems	-	-	-	-
39	Hockey - Floor Pucks #2002868 3" dia. Set of 12	-	\$ 54.12	-	\$ 54.98
40	Hockey - Floor Set #009277 Adaptive-Inclusive 10-Player Set includes 10 sticks, 2 balls, and 2 pucks. Polyethylene shaft, Foam blade, Indoor use only, Sticks are 36"L.	\$ 209.19	\$ 188.00	-	-
41	Hockey - Floor Sticks 36"L #1321033 Set of 12: 36"L Elementary Stick. Extra-thick, high-impact, hollow ABS plastic shaft, Plastic blade, outdoor set.	\$ 141.89	\$ 121.60	-	-
42	Hockey - Floor Sticks 50"L #1321036 Set of 12: 50"L Elementary Stick. Extra-thick, high-impact, hollow ABS plastic shaft, Plastic blade, outdoor set.	\$ 255.41	\$ 225.07	-	-
43	Hockey - Goal Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports 4'6"W x 3'6"H, 13 lb. Gopher Sport Bownet Street Hockey Pop-Up Goal #04-506	-	-	-	-
44	Hockey - Goalie Gear #66557PS Junior Set Ultra Pro II Goalie Helmet with Mask, 1 Ea., Blocker Glove (13-1/2"L x 7-1/2"W), 1 Ea., Catch Glove (19"L x 13"W), 1 Ea., Goalie Leg Pads (27"L), 1 Ea.	\$ 335.39	-	-	-
45	Hockey Pack - Floor Hockey No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Set includes: 42"L Sticks, 20 Ea., Goalie Sticks, 4 Ea., RinkPro Folding Goals , 4 Ea., PowerPlay PVC Pucks, 18 Ea., PowerPlay PVC Balls, 6 Ea., Goggles, 4 Ea., RinkKing , Steel Cart, 1 Ea. Gopher Sport ClassPlus PowerPlay Deluxe Floor Hockey Pack	-	-	-	-
46	Inflatable Connect Four Basketball game. No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports (76"W x 74"H x 40"D; 32 lb.), net, 42 vinyl basketballs. Gopher Sport 4 Point Play Set or equal	-	-	-	-
47	Inflator - Standard #MSECOLEY Electric ball inflator with ball needle	\$ 92.91	\$ 121.02	\$ 75.19	\$ 68.98

48	Invader Ball Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Set includes 24 balls (sixteen 3" dia., eight 2.5" dia.), 2 targets (81"H), 24 pinnies, carrying bag, and activity instructions. Gopher Sport ACTION! InvaderBall Set 58-598	-	-	-	-
49	Jump Ropes - Quick Turn No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Rainbow Rack Pack includes 30 jump ropes (1 set ea. 6'-16'L) and a Magnus Jump Rope Rack. Gopher Sport QuickTurn Speed Jump Rope Pack 41-438	-	-	-	-
50	Nitro Ball - Pack No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Includes 2 balls (9" dia.), 1 net (32'W x 36"H), a storage bag, and activity instructions. Gopher Sport NitroBall Packs 58-142	-	-	-	-
51	Outdoor Jenga #16810PS	\$ 92.13	\$ 363.00	-	\$ 182.98
52	Pedometers - 36 pack No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports FITstep Stream Pedometers, 36 Ea., Gopher HUB with Software, 1 Ea., FITstep Case with Foam Inserts, 1 Ea., FITstep Stream Training Charts, Set of 7, Replacement Batteries, 40 Ea., PC Laptop, Laptop carrying case Gopher Sport FITstep Stream PowerPlus Pedometer Packs 76-115	-	-	-	-
53	Pickleball - Semi-Permanent Net System No Bid, Choose a Vendor	-	-	-	-
54	Pickleball - Ball Hopper No Bid, Choose a Vendor 50 ball capacity Gamma Ball Hopper Pickleball 50 21082572	-	-	-	-
55	Pickleball - Balls Outdoor No Bid, Choose a Vendor	-	-	-	-
56	Pickleball - Cross Net #2127445 "Four Square" pickleball net set, includes poles, nets, and stand. Portable.	\$ 163.39	\$ 110.93	-	\$ 143.48
57	Pickleball - Elementary Bundle No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Nets, 4 Ea., Paddles, 16 Ea., , Balls, 24 Ea., Rolls of Floor Tape, 6 Ea. Gopher Sport ClassPlus PaddlePro Pickleball Packs Premium 4 court 56-395	-	-	-	-
58	Pickleball - Four Paddle System No Bid, Choose a Vendor four Rally Tyro 2 Pro Paddles, four outdoor balls, a Classic Picklenet Net System, and a Game On Duffle Bag	-	-	-	-
59	Pickleball - Middle School Bundle No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports 6 court pack: PaddlePro Portable Net Systems, 6 Ea., Paddles, 24 Ea., PaddlePro Balls, 24 Ea., Rolls of Floor Tape, 8 Ea., Gopher Sport ClassPlus PaddlePro Pickleball Packs 56-010	-	-	-	-
60	Pickleball - Outdoor balls #2121086 Pack of 12 orange perforated balls	-	\$ 35.00	-	-

61	Pickleball - Paddles No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Gopher Sport Onix Z5 Graphite Pickleball Paddle 07-704	-	-	-	-
62	Pickleball - Portable Net System #1363633	\$ 193.64	\$ 168.99	-	\$ 159.98
63	Pickleball - Rainbow Paddles No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Class Sets include 24 paddles and 12 balls. Gopher Sport Rainbow PerfectPaddle Paddles 56-046	-	-	-	-
64	Pool Table - Bumper Pool #1375121 s 1 set of bumper pool balls (5 red, 5 white), two 48"L cues, 2 chalk, and 1 brush.	-	-	-	\$ 874.98
65	Pool Table - Standard #1276503 (Will require Professional Installation) The 99"L x 55"W x 31-1/4"H table includes 2 cues, 1 set of balls, 1 racking triangle, 1 brush, and 2 pieces of chalk. It weighs 331 lb. Assembly required.	-	-	-	\$ 1,799.98
66	Scooter - Safety Roller Three Wheel #1499056	-	\$ 152.19	\$ 215.26	-
67	Scooter - Three Wheel #LA152	-	-	\$ 215.26	-
68	Scooters - Pack of 24 #1257564 Indoor/Outdoor scooters, 16" scooter base, 4" dia. urethane inline skate wheels, includes storage cart.	-	-	-	\$ 1,406.98
69	Scoreboard - Electronic #SK2229R Use for basketball, wrestling, karate, team handball, badminton, table tennis, tennis, judo, and boxing, tabletop or freestanding, includes back control panel, key-fob remote, and 15'L power cord, 4"H Numbers, 110V AC operation, 24"W x 16"H x 10"D; 22 lb.	\$ 579.29	-	-	\$ 396.91
70	Shuffleboard - Set #1574433 (Will Require Professional Installation) table includes 2 paddles, 8 pucks (4 ea. red, blue), and shuffleboard wax. Weighs 140 lb.	-	\$ 800.17	-	-
71	Soccer - 24' x 8' x 10' Goal #SBA400 (Will Require Professional Installation) 24'W x 8'H x 10'D; 407 lb. Goal	-	\$ 3,814.19	-	\$ 3,699.98
72	Soccer - Folding Goal #1248807 1-5/8" OD ABS tubing, 6'L x 4'H x 4'D; 17 lb. per goal, Each goal includes net.	\$ 279.91	\$ 582.36	-	\$ 266.98
73	Soccer - Portable Goals #SGZ303 12'W x 6'H x 6'D; 259 lb., Gopher GARED Match Play Soccer Goals, or equal	-	-	-	\$ 2,599.98
74	Soccer - Portable Net No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports 12'W x 8'H x 4'D, 2" OD steel tubing, includes net, Gopher Sport The Keeper Steel Soccer Goals 73-059	-	-	-	-
75	Soccer - Soccer Net Collapsible No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports 12'W x 6'H x 40"D; 18 lb., Portable, Fiberglass poles, steel ground stakes, Gopher Sport Quickster Goals	-	-	-	-

76	Softball - Class Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports AllStar Gloves (11"L and 12"L), 24 Ea. (20 Right Throw, 4 Left Throw), Easton Softball Bats (32"L/25 oz), 6 Ea., Gopher VersaBall Softballs (11" dia.), Yellow, 18 Ea., Rubber Sponge-Core Softballs (11" dia), White, 18 Ea. Gopher Sport ClassPlus DiamondKing Softball Packs 42-308	-	-	-	-
77	Softball - Tees #1336412 Adjust the tee from 20" to 36"H, Tee base measures 17"L x 17"W; 11 lb.	\$ 209.95	-	-	\$ 174.98
78	Spikeball - Pro Set #2120735	\$ 88.04	\$ 80.00	-	-
79	Step and Cart Set No Bid, Choose a Vendor Pack of 24 steps and one mobile steel stacking cart. Each step is 32"L x 22"W x 6"H, 7 lb. Cart is 63"L x 19-1/2"W x 52"H, 29 lb. UltraFit ClassStep Fitness Step Pack 69-568	-	-	-	-
80	StompShot Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Complete Set includes 6 launchers (3 ea. red, blue), 24 vinyl balls (12 ea. red, blue), 20 foam targets (14-1/4"H x 3-3/4" dia.; 6.8 oz), a VersaBag mesh storage bag Gopher Sport ACTION! StompShot Set 59-595	-	-	-	-
81	SturTree - Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Set includes 6 Rainbow SturTee ball holders, 6 Rainbow SturTee Beach Balls (18" dia.), 24 foam balls, 1 VersaBag mesh storage bag, and activity instructions. Gopher Sport ACTION!SturTree Set 58-207	-	-	-	-
82	Table Tennis - Indoor Table #2120083 Table is 9'L x 60"W x 30"H; 211 lb.; Assembly required. For indoor use only	\$ 682.86	\$ 376.37	-	\$ 459.98
83	Table Tennis - Outdoor table No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Table is 9'L x 60"W x 30"H; 179 lb., Gopher Sport Stiga XTR Outdoor Table Tennis Table 08-408	-	-	-	-
84	Table Tennis - Paddles No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Set of 6 paddlesp. Gopher Sport Rainbow RallyPoint Table Tennis Paddles 16-860	-	-	-	-
85	Table Tennis - Paddles and Ball Pack #2123774 12 Player pack Include 12 paddles, 144 table tennis balls, and a nylon ball storage bag.	-	\$ 85.08	-	-
86	Team Toss Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Set includes 12 tees (6 ea. red, blue), 12 inflatable balls (6 ea. red, blue), a VersaBag mesh storage bag. Gopher Sport ACTION! TeemToss Set 59-610	-	-	-	-
87	Tennis - Rackets #1042109PS Set of 6: Midsize Head, Wide Body, Aluminum	\$ 92.87	-	-	-

88	Timer - Multipurpose LED No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Gopher Sport Ultrak SG-10 Multipurpose Timer 11-060	-	-	-	-
89	Timer - Outdoor LED #48147PS Single sided 6 digit race clock has highly visible 8" digits, Comes with 5 different levels or brightness, Displays running time as well as having countdown timer capability, Records in hours, minutes, seconds and hundredths, Operated by the remote control unit provided, Water Resistant, Powered by 120V AC or external battery pack. 44"L x 12"H	\$ 1,995.19	-	-	-
90	Topple Tubes - Set No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Gopher Sport ACTION! Rainbow ToppleTubes Set 85-922	-	-	-	-
91	Track - Starting Blocks #ASB3000	\$ 110.07	\$ 108.35	-	\$ 74.98
92	Tricycle - Adult Size. #2124878	-	\$ 352.00	-	-
93	Tricycle - Student Large No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Accommodates students up to 100 lb. and designed for ages 4-8. . Gopher Sport Angeles Trike - Large	-	-	-	-
94	Tricycle - Student Medium. No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Supports students up to 90 lb. and is great for ages 3-5 Gopher Sport Angeles Trike - Medium	-	-	-	-
95	Volleyball - Ball Cart #MVCBCARTY Non-marking 5" dia. wheels 360° swivel, Cart is 25"L x 25"W x 44"H; 11 lb., 24 inflated volleyball capacity	\$ 166.56	-	-	\$ 69.98
96	Volleyball - Cross Net #1041328PS Adjustable "four square" volleyball net, 7'4" to 7'11" height adjustable, net is 13'x13', includes one volleyball	\$ 94.59	-	-	-
97	Volleyball - Net Keeper #1238815	\$ 298.41	-	-	\$ 219.98
98	Volleyball - Outdoor Net System #60790XXX Set includes 2 telescoping poles, net, boundary marker, 6 boundary stakes, 4 anchor ropes, 2 carabiners, and an upgraded storage bag. Net is 32'L x 36"H and features 3" sleeves for easy installation	-	-	-	\$ 299.98
99	Volleyball - Portable Court System No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports Two court system, 175 lb., Gopher Comp 1000 Volleyballs, 4 Ea., School/Recreation Volleyball Net (32' x 36"), 2 Ea., QwikClamp Net Attachments, 6 Ea., EZStand Standard Bases, 3 Ea., EZStand Standard Poles, 3 Ea., Gopher Sport EZStand Complete Court Portable Volleyball Systems 85-981	-	-	-	-
100	Volleyball - Standards #ST240S/P Pair of two standards. Each standard includes a 150 lb. base, 10'H upright, 2 QwikFlik collars, and hardware.	-	-	-	\$ 994.98

101	Volleyball - Upright Pads No Bid, Recommend Gopher Sports	-	-	-	-
102	Weight Machine - Biceps Curl #1459457 Requires Professional Installation Machine Weight: 403 LB, Weight Stack: , 72.5 LB, Max User Weight: 300 LB, 11-gauge steel frames Cybex Ion Series Biceps Curl CI-BC, or equal	-	-	-	\$ 3,699.98
103	Weight Machine - Chest Press #1459453 Requires Professional Installation Machine Weight: 403 LB, Weight Stack: , 72.5 LB,	-	-	-	\$ 3,699.98
104	Weight Machine - Pulldown #1459454 Requires Professional Installation Machine Weight: 459 LB, Weight Stack: 202.5 LB, Max User Weight: 300 LB, 11-gauge steel frames	-	-	-	\$ 3,699.98
105	Weight Machine - Seated Row #1459455 Requires Professional Installation Machine Weight: 459 LB, , Weight Stack: 202.5 LB, Max User Weight: 300 LB, 11-gauge steel frames	-	-	-	\$ 3,699.98
106	Weight Machine - Shoulder Press #1459456 Requires Professional Installation Machine Weight: 484 LB, Weight Stack: 172.5 LB, Max User Weight: 300 LB, 11-gauge steel frames Cybex Ion Series Should Press CI-SP, or equal	-	-	-	\$ 3,699.98
107	Weight Machine - Triceps Extension #1459458 Requires Professional Installation Machine Weight: 379 LB, Weight Stack: 142.5 LB, Max User Weight: 300 LB, 11-gauge steel frames.	-	-	-	\$ 3,699.98
108	Workout Mats - Set of Six #GCMAT261 Set of six Urethane foam interior is soft yet supportive and is protected by a durable antimicrobial vinyl cover. 5'L x 2'W, 1" thick	-	-	-	\$ 44.98
109	Weight Machine - Abdominal/Back Extension #9-IPAC5-60BZS Requires Professional Installation Machine Weight: 379 LB, Weight Stack: 142.5 LB, Max User Weight: 300 LB, 11-gauge steel frames	-	-	-	\$ 4,999.98

Notes:

No Vendor Bid

Awarded