
METRO RESA
EMPOWERING EDUCATORS:
Mastering Essential Classroom Practices

Tuesday, July 30, 2024 
Teachers

Thursday, September 12, 2024
Instructional Coaches

Tuesday, January 14, 2025
Teachers

This full-day workshop is designed to
equip novice-level teachers or
instructional coaches with effective
strategies centered around five
essential classroom practices:
building relationships, classroom
structure and teaching, active
engagement, responding to
appropriate behavior, and responding
to inappropriate behavior.
Throughout the workshop,
participants will engage in hands-on
activities and collaborative
discussions to solidify their
understanding and application of
these practices. Please join us in
taking the first step towards
transforming your classroom
environment!

8:30AM - 3:30PM
Metro RESA
1870 Teasley Drive SE
Smyrna, GA 30080
www.mresa.org

https://mresa.geniussis.com/Registration.aspx?aid=989
https://mresa.geniussis.com/Registration.aspx?aid=990
https://mresa.geniussis.com/Registration.aspx?aid=991
https://www.mresa.org/resourcescontent-areas/whole-child-supports/home
https://www.mresa.org/resourcescontent-areas/whole-child-supports/home
https://www.mresa.org/resourcescontent-areas/whole-child-supports/home



