COMMERCIAL PRINTING OF 2024-25 DISTRICT ENVELOPES, FORMS, SPECIALTY PAPER & OTHER MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

2024-25-14
21 Mailed / 8 Responses
Keller
G&M Bros & RMF Print
Concept Enterprise  Miller Managemen The Copy Zenger
Awarded to: ITEM QTY Print Inc. Orffeo Print Plus t Group Store Group
1 Orffeo #10 Regular Envelope 500 $135.00 No Bid No Bid $74.00 $113.00 $40.63 $95.00 $62.00
1,000 $161.00 No Bid No Bid $92.00 $141.00 $68.60 $120.00|  $125.00 Lowest
1,500 $198.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 $163.00 $92.65 $150.00|  $172.00 Awarded
2,000 $235.00 No Bid No Bid $123.00 $183.00 $145.75 $185.00|  $210.00
2,500 $263.00 No Bid No Bid $145.00 $201.00 $188.50 $220.00|  $263.00 Info for Don's Recommendation
3,000 $297.00 No Bid No Bid $166.00 $225.00 $215.50 $245.00|  $178.00 Tabulations:
4,000 $378.00 No Bid No Bid $229.00 $272.00 $245.65 $295.00|  $334.00 Vendor # of Items Bid_| _ Total Bid Amount
5,000 $438.00 No Bid No Bid $243.00 $316.00 $274.90 $350.00 $392.00 Concept Print 24 $16,376.00
25,000 $1,175.00 No Bid No Bid $895.00 $1,232.00 $1,160.50|  $1,350.00| $1,197.00 G&M Enterprises 0 $0.00
X Keller Bros &
2 RMF #10 Window Envelope 500 $145.00 No Bid No Bid $82.00 $116.00 $45.40 $130.00 $67.00 Miller Inc 4 $2,749.00
1,000 $170.00 No Bid No Bid $100.00 $146.00 $72.40 $185.00|  $135.00 Orffeo 29 $11,818.00
2,000 $256.00 No Bid No Bid $130.00 $193.00 $112.90 $295.00|  $235.00 Print Plus 18 $11,689.00
RMF Print
#10 Security Envelope 500 Management 30 $16,573.10
3 RMF $140.00 No Bid No Bid $95.00 No Bid $49.45 $110.00 $72.00 Group
1,000 $165.00 No Bid No Bid $112.00 No Bid $88.60 $130.00|  $141.00 The Copy Store 28 $26,045.00
4 Orffeo #10 Window Security Envelope (also reverse flap envelope - payroll) 500 $147.00 No Bid No Bid $130.00 No Bid $55.75 $115.00 $74.00 Zenger Group 27 $13,620.00
1,000 $176.00 No Bid No Bid $156.00 No Bid $97.60 $140.00|  $138.00
2,500 $298.00 No Bid No Bid $188.00 No Bid $179.50 $250.00|  $207.00 Vendor # of Items Bid_| Total Bid Amount
Orffeo Printing &
5,000 $446.00 No Bid No Bid $310.00 No Bid $299.20 $410.00|  $334.00 Publishing ¢ 17 $8,915.00
7,500 $574.00 No Bid No Bid $395.00 No Bid $375.70 $560.00|  $461.00 RMF Printing 11 $2,238.20
25,000 $1,339.00 No Bid NoBid|  $1,280.00 No Bid $1,168.80|  $1,575.00| $1,369.00 Zenger Group 2 $692.00
25,000 (reverse flap high window w/tint) $1,856.00 No Bid No Bid|  $1,540.00 No Bid $1,810.00|  $1,875.00| $1,800.00 TOTAL Award 30 $11,845.20
5 RMF #10 Regular Postage Paid Envelope 2,500 $263.00 No Bid No Bid $177.00 $201.00 $139.45 $220.00 $259.00
6 RMF 9x12 Manila Progress Report Envelope 500 $414.00 No Bid No Bid $290.00 No Bid $169.60 $395.00[  $390.00
1,000 $495.00 No Bid No Bid $336.00 No Bid $279.40 $625.00|  $495.00
1,500 $627.00 No Bid No Bid $440.00 No Bid $379.30 $825.00|  $601.00
7 Zenger Corridor Pass Pads 500 $848.00 No Bid No Bid $275.00 $420.00 $355.00 $850.00]  $235.00
8 RMF Field Trip Form 500 $215.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 $421.00 $90.40 $295.00]  $304.00
1000 $335.00 No Bid No Bid $165.00 $726.00 $138.55 $495.00|  $506.00
9 RMF Fund Raising Request Form 500 $205.00 No Bid No Bid $110.00 $421.00 $90.40 $295.00[  $304.00
10 RMF Payroll Adj Form i T ion Dept. 5,000 $368.00 No Bid No Bid $300.00 $1,034.00 $244.75 $750.00]  $498.00
10,000 $689.00 No Bid No Bid $495.00 $1,919.00 $398.20|  $1,250.00|  $733.00
11 RMF Payroll Adjustment Form (not normal hours) - Transportation Dept. 5,000 $368.00 No Bid No Bid $265.00 $1,034.00 $244.75 $750.00]  $498.00
10,000 689.00 No Bid No Bid $490.00 $1,919.00 $398.20  $1,250.00 733.00
12 RMF Request for College icati ing Form 1,000 233.00 No Bid No Bid $115.00 $485.00 98.50 $325.00 318.00
13 RMF Request for T ipt Form 1,000 233.00 No Bid No Bid $115.00 $485.00 98.50 $325.00 318.00
14 Orffeo Student Deposit iliation Form form) 500 189.00 No Bid No Bid $98.00 No Bid 98.50 $225.00 221.00
1,000 $249.00 No Bid No Bid $137.00 No Bid $139.90 $375.00|  $351.00
15 Orffeo Student Activity Pay Order Form 500 $152.00 No Bid No Bid $45.00 $188.00 $65.65 $130.00]  $159.00
1,000 $198.00 No Bid No Bid $92.00 $297.00 $99.40 $210.00|  $223.00
16 Orffeo Student Activity Transfer Order Form 100 $149.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $92.00 $39.55 $75.00]  $105.00
17 Orffeo Teacher Personal Leave Request Form 500 $385.00 No Bid No Bid $145.00 No Bid $298.30 $375.00]  $252.00
1,000 $596.00 No Bid No Bid $224.00 No Bid $322.60 $675.00|  $504.00
18 Orffeo Sweet Home High School Report Card Paper 1,500 $279.00 No Bid No Bid $168.00 $238.00 $212.80 NoBid|  $284.00
19 Orffeo Exam Booklet Paper 5,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid $425.00 No Bid $598.00  $1,495.00[  $739.00
20 Orffeo Buildings & Grounds Time Cards 500 $199.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 No Bid 70.60 $60.00 $86.00
1,000 $248.00 No Bid No Bid $69.00 No Bid $95.80 $85.00|  $143.00
2000 $356.00 No Bid No Bid $124.00 No Bid $175.90 $135.00|  $179.00
21 Orffeo Hourly Employee Time Cards 500 $195.00 No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid $82.75 $60.00] _ $176.00
22 Zenger Administrative Note Cards & Envelopes 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $359.50 No Bid[  $259.00
200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $379.30 No Bid | $301.00
500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $565.60 NoBid|  $457.00
23 RMF Brochures (reflex blue ink on ivory paper) 500 $205.00 No Bid No Bid $150.00 $210.00 $98.50 $235.00]  $175.00
1000 $285.00 No Bid No Bid $170.00 $272.00 $135.60 $335.00|  $280.00
2500 $379.00 No Bid No Bid $279.00 $406.00 $295.60 $690.00|  $560.00
24 Orffeo Pocket folders - Black & White 500 $733.00 No Bid No Bid $745.00 No Bid $1,830.55|  $1,295.00 No Bid
1000 $1,057.00 No Bid No Bid $960.00 No Bid $1,993.00|  $1,995.00 No Bid
1500 $1,377.00 No Bid NoBid|  $1,140.00 No Bid $2,120.90|  $2,595.00 No Bid
25 Orffeo Pocket folders - Full Color - Navy folder (Pantone 276C) 500 $1,448.00 No Bid No Bid $945.00 No Bid $1,830.55|  $1,695.00 No Bid
1000 $1,929.00 No Bid No Bid|  $1,160.00 No Bid $1,993.00|  $2,490.00 No Bid
1500 $2,512.00 No Bid NoBid|  $1,340.00 No Bid $2,120.90|  $2,900.00 No Bid
26 Orffeo Pocket folders — Full Color - Gold folder (Pantone 872C) 500 $1,448.00 No Bid No Bid $945.00 No Bid $1,830.55|  $1,695.00 No Bid
1000 $1,929.00 No Bid No Bid|  $1,160.00 No Bid $1,993.00|  $2,490.00 No Bid
1500 $2,512.00 o NoBid|  $1,340.00 No Bid $2,120.90|  $2,900.00 No Bid
27 Orffeo Budget 13,500 0 Bid o $891.00 445.00 $714.00 29.50 $885.00 729.00
Cost of mail ion for i 13,420 Budget o Bid o $184.00 210.00]_Included above 00.00 $975.00 465.00
28 Orffeo Megan’s Law Mailers 13500 o Bid o $1,026.00 542.00 $1,941.00 80.70| _ $1,190.00 892.00
Cost of mail ion for 13,420 Megan’s Law Mailers o Bid o $648.00 210.00] _Included above 00.00[  $1,400.00 576.00
“Does not
*No postage include
“Brown Kraft Env included  * Plus postage *9x12 Quoted ~ postage
Total Bid $16,376.00 $0.00  $2,749.00 $11,818.00 $11,689.00 $16,573.10  $26,045.00 $13,620.00
Total Items Bid 24 0 2 6 25
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