
Athletic/Phys Ed. Supply Bid #2024-25-8

BID # of Items Bid Bid Total Awarded # of Items Awarded Total Awarded
Information: ADA 2 $1,100.00 ADA 1 $840.00
Mailed to 20 BSN 118 $60,259.12 BSN 40 $24,953.35
Responded 13 GOPHER 52 $13,043.22 GOPHER 22 $5,455.09
Late Response 1 LAUX 126 $41,497.14 LAUX 39 $16,687.36
Total Items to bid on 208 LONGSTRETH 7 $610.22 LONGSTRETH 7 $610.22
Total Items awarded 181 MFAC 24 $9,979.00 MFAC 7 $2,869.00
Total No Bid 27 Pyramid 72 $21,392.98 Pyramid 17 $3,863.69

RIDDELL 18 $12,093.20 S&S 13 $1,013.48
S&S 19 $4,724.40 SCHOOL HEALTH 10 $764.19
SCHOOL HEALTH 54 $11,944.30 SCHOOL SPECIALTY 6 $716.26
SCHOOL SPECIALTY 56 $14,339.97 SPORTS IMPORTS 1 $109.00
SPORTS IMPORTS 1 $109.00 SPORTSMAN 18 $8,224.39
SPORTSMAN 92 $39,442.43 Grand Total Awarded 181 $66,106.03

COMPANY No. Category Item Description Catalog # Maker/Vendor Unit Use Quantity Substitutions Price Total
ADA 14 Badminton Smack Excel Badminton Racquet 76 ADA Tennis Each 60 14.00               840.00       

Total Awarded 840.00       
Total # of Items Awarded 1

BSN 3 Archery Ethafoam Target, 48" Dia, 35lb 72-169 Gopher Each 1 1375657 217.27             217.27       
BSN 8 Archery Target Faces (covers) Round Standard 48' 72-173 Gopher Each 2 1282566 19.44               38.88         
BSN 18 Balls DuraCoat Balls Itty 3.5" Low Bounce.  VOIT FOAN SUPER 90 72-060 Gopher Set of 12 1 1369509 21.88               21.88         
BSN 22 Balls Spectrum Classic Playground Balls 8-1/2".  VOIT 8.50" SET OF W11666 S&S Set of 6 2 1033472 21.78               43.56         
BSN 30 Baseball

       
PRATICE # MP2001 On deck sports.com each 1 MP2031 1,242.07          1,242.07    

BSN 63 Equipment Jumbo Poly Arrows Straight (Blue/Gold).  RAINBOW COLOR GE486P Wolverine Sports Each 5 1245585 6.19                 30.95         
BSN 64 Equipment Junior Size Multi Domes 1375104 US Games Set 2 no 57.93               115.86       
BSN 65 Equipment Mesh Vest (Blue) C46 BSN Each 66 AS SPEC 1.12                 73.92         
BSN 66 Equipment Mesh Vest (Green) C46 BSN Each 60 AS SPEC 1.12                 67.20         
BSN 67 Equipment Mesh Vest (Red) C46 BSN Each 60 AS SPEC 1.12                 67.20         
BSN 68 Equipment Mesh Vest (Yellow) C46 BSN Each 66 AS SPEC 1.12                 73.92         
BSN 80 Equipment Track Wagon MF Track SKU 6638-01 each 1 1291766 231.09             231.09       
BSN 81 Equipment Wooden Cornhole and Ladder Toss Game. TRIUMPH PRO LA  W13913 S&S Each 1 1469771 60.39               60.39         
BSN 91 Fitness 8' handleless jump ropes _nylon braided 1172539 US Games Set 2 1172539 6.90                 13.80         
BSN 92 Fitness BOSU Sport Balance Trainer 70-485 Gopher Each 1 1388422 91.34               91.34         
BSN 96 Football 8 1/2" Tuff coated foam football 1243864 US Games Set 1 AS SPEC 66.72               66.72         
BSN 111 Games Spikeball - Rookie 58-790 Gopher Set 1 1453529 48.11               48.11         
BSN 121 Lacrosse Cascade CPV-R lacrosse helmet navy/white med/large cascade-lh-cpv-r Lacrosse Monkey Each 15 1455244 133.44             2,001.60    
BSN 122 Lacrosse

         
Chin, White Mask 1460282 BSN Each 25 1469209 246.69             6,167.25    

BSN 124 Lacrosse Maverick lacrosse maverick m6 lac goalie glove white L BSN SKU 1468971 each 2 AS SPEC 105.35             210.70       
BSN 125 Lacrosse Maverick Lacrosse Maverik m6 lacrosse goalie glove white M BSN SKU 1468971 each 1 AS SPEC 105.35             105.35       
BSN 130 Lacrosse Shield 200 chest protector  STX 1457105 each 3 AS SPEC 55.24               165.72       
BSN 132 Lacrosse STX 4sight + S women's Lacrosse Goggles stx-wle-as-gl4-sr-s Lacrosse Monkey Each 10 1454254 42.96               429.60       
BSN 133 Lacrosse STX breaker lacrosse goalie pants STX 1390909 each 1 AS SPEC 64.47               64.47         
BSN 135 Lacrosse STX lacrosse practice goal STX Jul-89 each 1 LACPRAGL 88.54               88.54         
BSN 136 Lacrosse TP-S Goalie Throat Piece 1454506 BSN Each 1 AS SPEC 23.90               23.90         
BSN 137 Lacrosse TP-S goalie throat piece US Games 1454505 each 1 AS SPEC 23.90               23.90         
BSN 140 Lacrosse Womens Sultra Goalie Gloves Medium 1390882 BSN Pair 1 AS SPEC 82.46               82.46         
BSN 151 Soccer Low profile cones orange BSN 1255706 Doz 2 AS SPEC 3.77                 7.54           exact
BSN 152 Soccer Low profile cones yellow BSN 1276558 Doz 2 AS SPEC 3.77                 7.54           exact
BSN 157 Soccer Soccer Oversized Scorebook MSSOCBOK BSN Each 3 AS SPEC 5.27                 15.81         
BSN 159 Soccer Nike Aerow Soccer Balls #5. NIKE CLUB ELITE #5 Nike Each 34 NKCU8057100 35.21               1,197.14    
BSN 181 Track Economy closed reel fiberglass measuring tape, 165" 7011-165 MF Athletic Each 1 MSTAP165 9.82                 9.82           
BSN 183 Track First Place Blue Discus 1.0kg. PORT APIT CHALLENGER 6008-1.0 MF Athletics Each 2 1101393 12.80               25.60         
BSN 185 Track Gym Chalk MF Track SKU 4115-01 each 1 PGE4360X 13.84               13.84         
BSN 189 Track Shot Put first place turned steel shot 12lb die 117mm SKU 6033-12-117 MF Track each 1 AFSHOT12 25.27               25.27         
BSN 190 Track Shot Put first place turned steel shot 4kg 95mm SKU 603304.00-95 MF Track each 1 AFSHOT4K 19.61               19.61         
BSN 195 Track Elite High Jump Standards 1378710 BSN Set 1 1378710 425.06             425.06       
BSN 200 Volleyball Portable manual scorekeeper 1196177 BSN Each 12 AS SPEC 29.90               358.80       
BSN 208 Wrestling Wrestling Matt System 42' x 42' x 2' 1393104 BSN Each 1 AS SPEC 10,979.67        10,979.67  

Awarded BidsResults from Bid Opening
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Total Awarded 24,953.35  
Total # of Items Awarded 40

GOPHER 12 Badminton Rainbow SpringSwing Paddles 56-170 Gopher Set 2 43.60               87.20         
GOPHER 19 Balls Fleece Balls Bonanza Pack 71-588 Gopher Pack of 72 1 488.61             488.61       
GOPHER 37 Basketball Titan 20 ball rack GL89-805 Gopher Each 1 NO 319.13             319.13       
GOPHER 46 Equipment Beach Balls 24" 72-250 Gopher Set of 6 2 57.81               115.62       exact
GOPHER 56 Equipment Floor Tape-White-180'x2" 77-853 Gopher Each 14 7.08                 99.12         
GOPHER 57 Equipment FloormarX Floor Marker Set 93-087 Gopher Set 2 35.56               71.12         
GOPHER 69 Equipment Plastic Number Cones 93-048 Gopher Set of 10 5 40.01               200.05       exact
GOPHER 71 Equipment Rainbow Plastic Cones--18" 86-110 Gopher Set 8 31.11               248.88       
GOPHER 74 Equipment Rubbermaid Brute Containers - 44 Gallon 82-752 Gopher Each 2 141.51             283.02       
GOPHER 106 Games Cooperative Maze Game 34-545 Gopher Set 6 159.31             955.86       
GOPHER 107 Games GamePlay Teeter Toss GL58-571 Gopher Set 2 154.23             308.46       
GOPHER 109 Games Rainbow BeanBag Bocce Set 58-066 Gopher Set 1 221.61             221.61       exact
GOPHER 110 Games Rainbow Toss N Chip Nets GL95-498 Gopher Set of 6 1 146.85             146.85       
GOPHER 112 Games TuffRoll SoftStix Bocce Set 58-680 Gopher Set 4 193.03             772.12       exact
GOPHER 115 Golf Left handed clubs GL15-121 Gopher 8-club set 1 NO 230.51             230.51       
GOPHER 116 Golf Putt O Cups GL31-158 Gopher Set of 6 2 NO 71.16               142.32       
GOPHER 142 Pickleball PaddlePro Select Pickleball Paddles 56-053 Gopher Each 5 53.30               266.50       
GOPHER 149 Soccer Gopher Goalie Gloves No: 62-410 Gopher Each 3 25.77               77.31         
GOPHER 156 Soccer Size 4 SofStriker Soccer Ball 62-200 Gopher Set 1 154.23             154.23       exact
GOPHER 175 Swim Wacky Noodles 86-638 Gopher Set of 28 1 87.25               87.25         
GOPHER 197 Volleyball 15" Dia Classic Play Beach Balls 72-249 Gopher Set 2 26.66               53.32         
GOPHER 201 Volleyball Rainbow Gopher Biggie 16" 61-265 Gopher Each 2 63.00               126.00       exact

Total Awarded 5,455.09    
Total # of Items Awarded 22

LAUX 13 Badminton Rally Net Competition Net GL56-501 Gopher Each 3 NO 27.89               83.67         
LAUX 15 Badminton UltraNet Elite Portable Net System 51-153 Gopher Each 4 CHAMPION PA20SET 132.62             530.48       
LAUX 28 Baseball Hack Attack Pitching Machine 1281-3288-1 Anytime Baseball each 1 3,278.63          3,278.63    
LAUX 33 Basketball Boys Game, 1000 Bsktball-Spldg. LBTF 1000 - LEGACY 1454562 LAUX Each 23 59.90               1,377.70    
LAUX 34 Basketball Girls Game, 101 Bsktball-Spldg. LBTF 1000 - LEGACY 1454563 LAUX Each 16 59.90               958.40       
LAUX 36 Basketball Slip nott Traction mat Laux SKU 622686 each 3 75.47               226.41       exact
LAUX 48 Equipment Electronic Whistles (3-Tone) 66-526 Gopher Each 10 15.41               154.10       
LAUX 58 Equipment Fox 40 Pealess Whistle (Black) 66-603 Gopher Each 20 3.64                 72.80         
LAUX 70 Equipment Porta-score Porta-score Tachikara Each 24 24.71               593.04       
LAUX 75 Equipment Shield Corrugated Large Storage Bin Set 1507398 School Specialty Set of 4 2 133.82             267.64       
LAUX 76 Equipment Shield Corrugated Medium Storage Bin Set 1507397 School Specialty Set of 4 2 123.74             247.48       
LAUX 77 Equipment Shield Corrugated Small Storage Bin Set 1507396 School Specialty Set of 4 2 82.65               165.30       
LAUX 98 Football Helmet caps - green HC1 Sportsmans Each 20 2.79                 55.80         
LAUX 99 Football Knee Pads E15.TL800 Sportsmans Pair 40 MARTIN KDP 2.80                 112.00       
LAUX 100 Football Kombine LN - L/XL - Shoulder Pads R48311 Riddell Each 15 DOUGLAS PLDD 162.93             2,443.95    
LAUX 103 Football Wrestbands - 3 pocket adult, navy fbswbbkx BSN Each 20 3.69                 73.80         
LAUX 105 Games Bean Bags, Nylon 5"  (Assorted) 20-536 Gopher Set of 6 2 5.58                 11.16         
LAUX 120 Lacrosse Bownet Portable Lacrosse Goal 1344073 bownet.net each 1 239.40             239.40       
LAUX 123 Lacrosse Lax Goals 1 pair Laux Lacoffgl Pair 1 379.72             379.72       
LAUX 126 Lacrosse Maverick speed ball bag Lacrosse monkey SKU ms1276024 each 2 CHAMPION XLB 17.88               35.76         
LAUX 128 Lacrosse NOCSAE Lacrosse Ball Yellow LXBY BSN Dozen 6 NO 17.48               104.88       
LAUX 129 Lacrosse Official NOCSAE approved lacrosse balls Gopher 38-634 Doz 6 17.48               104.88       
LAUX 134 Lacrosse STX eclipse 3 complete stick color white platinum tin BSN SKU 1469588 each 2 159.39             318.78       
LAUX 138 Lacrosse White NOCSAE Lacrosse Balls 38-633 Gopher Dozen 6 17.48               104.88       
LAUX 139 Lacrosse Women's lacrosse arc 1388426 BSN Each 1 369.90             369.90       
LAUX 145 Soccer 4mm Soccer Nets 24x8x4.5x10 - Black & White 1248876 Laux Pair 1 129.94             129.94       
LAUX 155 Soccer Select Mesh bouble ball bag 1369578 BSN Each 2 22.96               45.92         
LAUX 160 Softball Bownet Promag Batting Tee Bownet SKU 1457697 each 4 79.80               319.20       
LAUX 163 Softball Easton Ghost 33" eaa113598 BSN Each 1 302.84             302.84       
LAUX 167 Softball Screamin yellow soft fly 43-060 gopher Each 10 CHAMPION PMB12-DZ 28.42               284.20       
LAUX 168 Softball Single wheel bb/sb pitching machine Jugs M1501 each 1 1,836.71          1,836.71    
LAUX 169 Softball Easton Ghost Solid FP Batting Helmet - Color: White EAA168553 Size: M/L each 4 47.97               191.88       
LAUX 172 Swim Sport swim parachute, size 10 navy blue SKU SSG034 SwimOutlet Each 5 28.35               141.75       
LAUX 177 Tennis Dunlap tennis ball Mtduncan BSN Case 1 78.90               78.90         exact
LAUX 178 Tennis Dunlop Championship All Court Tennis Balls T947332 Each 56 3.37                 188.72       
LAUX 180 Track Cantabrian New wide blocks Eastern Atlantic B09GL2FXG6 each 2 199.91             399.82       
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LAUX 193 Track Cross bar high jump 5882-02 M-F Athletics Each 1 149.73             149.73       
LAUX 194 Track Cross bar pole vault 5882-01 M-F Athletics Each 1 149.73             149.73       
LAUX 198 Volleyball Colossel Cart 1274417 BSN Each 1 157.46             157.46       

Total Awarded 16,687.36  
Total # of Items Awarded 39

LONGSTRETH 83 Field Hockey Dozen Field Hockey Balls Yellow HB4D longstrength Dozen 1 NO 22.88               22.88         
LONGSTRETH 84 Field Hockey OBO Robo Goalkeeping replacement kicker straps Longstreth OBORKS each 1 NO 32.94               32.94         
LONGSTRETH 85 Field Hockey OBO Robo Goalkeeping replacement legguard straps Longstreth OBORLS each 1 NO 24.94               24.94         
LONGSTRETH 86 Field Hockey OBO Robo Hi-control goalkeeping hand protection right hand b  Longstreth OBORK black L each 1 NO 89.94               89.94         
LONGSTRETH 87 Field Hockey OBO Yahoo Goalkeeping Kickers - Medium Black OBORK Longstreth Pair 2 149.94             299.88       
LONGSTRETH 88 Field Hockey OBO Yahoo Left Hand GK blocker OBO478 longstrength Each 1 99.94               99.94         
LONGSTRETH 90 Field Hockey TK Hi-Soft Field Hockey grip HO611 Longstreth Each 5 7.94                 39.70         

Total Awarded 610.22       
Total # of Items Awarded 7

MFAC 49 Equipment Ez Up Eclipse Tent MF Track SKU 7601 each 1 1,985.00          1,985.00    7635-10
MFAC 94 Fitness Medicine Ball Perform Better Sku 3201-99 Set 1 250.00             250.00       
MFAC 95 Fitness Troy Dumbells CH69-739 Gopher Each 8 4057-15 Single 28.50               228.00       
MFAC 179 Track Ate olympian light blue steel 83% rim SKU 700 5100 4Throws.com each 1 6120-1.0 79.00               79.00         
MFAC 182 Track Fibersport low pins twister 75% rim 4Throws.com SKU ft1175k each 1 6120-1.75 95.00               95.00         
MFAC 188 Track Polanik carbon fiberglass discus 80%rim Sku cpd11-1-6 4Throws.com each 1 88.00               88.00         6015-1.6
MFAC 192 Track X-Plosive speed training kit/overload run resist & release 43500085 XCELER8 Athletics each 2 3621-02 72.00               144.00       

Total Awarded 2,869.00    
Total # of Items Awarded 7

Pyramid 10 Badminton Carlton Shuttlecocks Carlton ADA Tennis Can of 6 20 SHN25 CHAMPION 6.98                 139.60       
Pyramid 73 Equipment Rainbow Versa Mesh Bags (Small) MA23812 Morley Set 6 MB18 SET CHAMPION 12.80               76.80         
Pyramid 78 Equipment Standard 10" Poly Spots Team 48-T48MSP Sportsman's Each 36 MSP CHAMPION 1.80                 64.80         
Pyramid 79 Equipment Standard 10" Poly Spots - Orange EPS 10 Toledo Each 36 MSPOR CHAMPION 1.80                 64.80         
Pyramid 93 Fitness Jump Ropes - 16' 41-413 Gopher Set of 6 12 SPR 16(X6) CHAMPION 13.84               166.08       
Pyramid 97 Football Belts - Nylon Web (Navy) 71-259-1 Sportsmans Each 35 FFB32NY CHAMPION 0.88                 30.80         
Pyramid 141 Pickleball Indoor Pickleball Balls 07-710 Gopher Set of 6 16 PB6INDSET CHAMPION 5.95                 95.20         
Pyramid 144 Safety Protective Goggles PAA728XX BSN Each 50 GI10 CORDOVA 2.95                 147.50       
Pyramid 158 Soccer Spaulding Soccerballs (TF-5000) Size 5 WC649548 BSN Each 10 649548 SPAULDING AS SPECIFIED 38.39               383.90       
Pyramid 161 Softball Champion Sports Plastic Softball Set 1503872 School Specialty Set 4 PLSB SET CHAMPION 4.99                 19.96         
Pyramid 164 Softball Easton Incrediball "soft" softballs 12" leather 41-873 Gopher Each 5 RIB12ST EASTPM 6.35                 31.75         
Pyramid 165 Softball Plastic training ball 1033618 BSN Set 8 PLSB CHAMPION 4.98                 39.84         
Pyramid 176 Table Tennis Table Tennis Racquets (3 Star) GK16-832 Gopher Each 10 PNG CHAMPION 4.89                 48.90         
Pyramid 186 Track Micro Lithium Cell Battery (CR2032) EVEECR2032BP Eaton Each 4 KECR2032-1G RAYOVAC 1.99                 7.96           
Pyramid 203 Volleyball Spaulding Volleyball VB5 WCVB5 BSN Each 36 SPAULDING AS SPEC 49.70               1,789.20    
Pyramid 204 Volleyball Volleyball Tachikara SV-5W   Navy Blue 62-523 Gopher Each 12 NO 27.80               333.60       SV5WSC TACHIKARA
Pyramid 205 Volleyball Volleylite  (Blue/White) 62-531 Gopher Each 18 SVMNC TACHIKARA 23.50               423.00       

Total Awarded 3,863.69    
Total # of Items Awarded 17

S&S 41 Equipment 36" Standard Hoops 1274646 US Games Set 1 W9759003 38.34               38.34         
S&S 21 Balls Rainbow Set Rhino Special Ball 8.5" MA12221 Morley Set of 6 5 GATOR SKIN 8" W4792 90.00               450.00       
S&S 43 Equipment AA Batteries SL2642 S&S Pack of 8 20 SL2642 3.16                 63.20         
S&S 44 Equipment AAA Batteries SL2641 S&S Worldwide Pack of 8 10 SL2641 3.16                 31.60         
S&S 50 Equipment Floor Tape - Black - 180' x 2" 77-863 Gopher Each 2 W4540BK 6.13                 12.26         
S&S 51 Equipment Floor Tape - Blue - 180' x 2" 77-857 Gopher Each 3 W4540BL 6.13                 18.39         
S&S 52 Equipment Floor Tape - Green - 180' x 2" 77-858 Gopher Each 2 W4540GR 6.13                 12.26         
S&S 53 Equipment Floor Tape - Red - 180' x 2" 77-856 Gopher Each 2 W4539RE 6.13                 12.26         
S&S 54 Equipment Floor Tape - Yellow - 180' x 2" 77-859 Gopher Each 3 W4540YE 6.13                 18.39         
S&S 55 Equipment Floor Tape 2" - Green, Red, White, Blue, Yellow FTAP26 BSN Each 2 W4540 6.13                 12.26         
S&S 72 Equipment Rainbow Versa Mesh Bags - Large 89-972 Gopher Set of 6 6 W5941 S&S 24"x36" 12.33               73.98         
S&S 104 Games 5" Numbered Poly Spots Set of 30 MA31742 Morley Set 1 W10613 Set of 36 18.90               18.90         
S&S 199 Volleyball Flip Scoreboard W2997 S&S Each 12 W2997 20.97               251.64       

Total Awarded 1,013.48    
Total # of Items Awarded 13

SCHOOL HEALTH 16 Balls Coated Foam Balls 71-765 Gopher Set of 6 1 77.94               77.94         61848
SCHOOL HEALTH 17 Balls DuraCoat Balls 6.3" 71-567 Gopher Set of 6 1 15.84               15.84         10487-PS
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SCHOOL HEALTH 45 Equipment Batteries - CR2025  3V 273169 Staples Each 5 1.47                 7.35           90406
SCHOOL HEALTH 47 Equipment Deluxe SidelineChair 1307252 BSN Set 1 176.99             176.99       49077PS
SCHOOL HEALTH 82 Equipment Cannon Launcher 16178-PS Palos Sports Set of 6 1 135.50             135.50       16178-PS
SCHOOL HEALTH 101 Football PALOS RUFFSKIN Footballs 10492-PS PalosSports Set of 6 2 66.11               132.22       10492-PS
SCHOOL HEALTH 108 Games High Density Fleece Balls GL41-518 Gopher Set of 6 7 9.91                 69.37         10178PS
SCHOOL HEALTH 146 Soccer Corner Flag Kwik 1379302 BSN Set 3 41.40               124.20       50017PS
SCHOOL HEALTH 147 Soccer Disc Cones (Small Orange) 6A10 Kwik Goal Each 100 0.21                 21.00         21037-PS
SCHOOL HEALTH 150 Soccer Low profile cone carrier 930995XXX BSN Each 3 1.26                 3.78           21036-PS

Total Awarded 764.19       
Total # of Items Awarded 10

SCHOOL SPECIALTY 11 Badminton Carlton UltraBlade 200 Badminton Racket 200L Badminton Alley Each 45 7.34                 330.30       2120952
SCHOOL SPECIALTY 26 Baseball Batting Tee - Tanner, 26"-43" 1384015 BSN Each 4 27.52               110.08       2119867
SCHOOL SPECIALTY 143 Safety Goggles - Chemistry Style 10-771 Gopher Each 50 2.79                 139.50       190-0029
SCHOOL SPECIALTY 153 Soccer Manual Inflator 66-672 Gopher Each 1 2.40                 2.40           2120274
SCHOOL SPECIALTY 162 Softball Dudley wt12y-FP 12" BBDNHFSY BSN Each 1 8.96                 8.96           1404008
SCHOOL SPECIALTY 187 Track Newton Elite Better Starting Block T1007 Stackhouse Each 1 125.02             125.02       025763

Total Awarded 716.26       
Total # of Items Awarded 6

SPORTS IMPORTS 202 Volleyball Senoh Volleyball Crank Handle CH2 for Ratchet N-52 Just Volleyball Each 4 27.25               109.00       
Total Awarded 109.00       

Total # of Items Awarded 1

SPORTSMAN 23 Baseball 500 PRO SERIES NFHS APPROVED BS WC41101HS BSN Dozen 8 NO 73.90               591.20       
SPORTSMAN 24 Baseball 6’ x 12’ residential batters box

 
hp-rg-gx1L battingcagesinc.com each 1 368.75             368.75       

SPORTSMAN 25 Baseball Baseballs - Pro NFHS BSB WC41100HS BSN Dozen 20 NO 83.90               1,678.00    
SPORTSMAN 31 Baseball Spalding 41106HS NFHS Baseball 41-106HS BSN Dozen 8 53.90               431.20       
SPORTSMAN 35 Basketball Slip Nott - Large  Laux SKU: 622694-01 each 1 42.50               42.50         
SPORTSMAN 42 Equipment 9" Deluxe Poly Spots (Red) GE084P Wolverine Sports Doz 4 14.46               57.84         
SPORTSMAN 102 Football Spaulding Alpha KHSAA Official Ball WC727148 BSN Each 20 NO 83.30               1,666.00    
SPORTSMAN 113 Golf Golf Balls Prov-1 Titlelist Dozen 18 51.60               928.80       
SPORTSMAN 119 Ice Hockey Mouth Guards, Adult with Strap - Black MSMOUT BSN Set of 25 4 8.50                 34.00         
SPORTSMAN 127 Lacrosse Maverik Max Ekg Goalie Lacrosse Chest Pad 1457019 BSN Each 2 87.80               175.60       
SPORTSMAN 148 Soccer European Captain Armband 1371625 BSN Each 5 1.90                 9.50           
SPORTSMAN 154 Soccer Pugg Gold 72" wide goal 1063936 BSN Pair 3 63.50               190.50       
SPORTSMAN 166 Softball SB 12 4h-311Y Spaulding Dozen 4 79.90               319.60       
SPORTSMAN 184 Track First Place Red Discus 1.0kg 6007-1.0 MF Athletics Each 1 41.50               41.50         
SPORTSMAN 191 Track Stopwatch  - Accusplit Eagle 625M3 3239A Pyramid Each 8 21.65               173.20       
SPORTSMAN 196 Track Gill Elite High School Hurdles/Sweet Home logo/navy blue 6667 M-F Athletics Each 10 104.50             1,045.00    
SPORTSMAN 206 Wrestling 3" Wrestling Tape 6411XXXX BSN Each 48 5.50                 264.00       
SPORTSMAN 207 Wrestling Signature E58 Headgear - Navy 1242508 Laux Each 8 25.90               207.20       

Total Awarded 8,224.39    
Total # of Items Awarded 18

NO BID 1 Archery Bearpaw Bowstring (62') 61400200101 Lancaster Archery Supply Each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 2 Archery Bearpaw Bowstring (66') 61400200101 Lancaster Archery Supply Each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 4 Archery Galaxy Aspire Recurve Bow 8160008 Lancaster Archery Supply Each 5 NO no bid -             
NO BID 5 Archery Galaxy Bullseye 54 Takedown Recurve Bow 3880211 Lancaster Archery Supply Each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 6 Archery Hoyt Super Arrow rest 2560125 Lancaster Archery Supply Each 10 NO no bid -             
NO BID 7 Archery Standard Cedar Arrows 28inch 3940001 Lancaster Archery Supply Dozen 16 NO no bid -             
NO BID 9 Badminton Badminton Racket Head Protector Tape PTBHT-01 Amazon Set of 10 5 no bid -             
NO BID 20 Balls Rainbow Set Rhino Micro Play Ball 5" MA12212 Morley Each 10 no bid -             
NO BID 27 Baseball Plyo baseballs set Brand Velou amazon.com Set 2 no bid -             
NO BID 29 Baseball J-Bands Jaeger sports SKU J band Adults each 4 no bid -             
NO BID 32 Baseball VPX baseball harness SKU Harness-B veloprosports.com each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 38 Basketball Ultra Fit Latex Brawn Bands Gopher 64393 each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 39 Cheer Pompoms 6 in 3 Color Metallic Mix SPMET63 Varsity Spirit Fashions Each 40 no bid -             
NO BID 40 Cheer Signs (3) total size 24 (navy, gold, white) 849570 Superior Cheer Each 1 no bid -             
NO BID 59 Equipment Hand-Held Wireless Microphone Shure BLX24R/SM58 #1441207058931 Guitar Center Each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 60 Equipment Instant-Bounds-Poly Boundary Set GE465P Wolverine Sports Set 4 no bid -             
NO BID 61 Equipment JBL Boombox 2 JBLBOOMBOX2BLKJBL Each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 62 Equipment Jumbo Poly Arrows Curved (Blue/Gold) GE488P Wolverine Sports Each 5 no bid -             
NO BID 89 Field Hockey Plastic Field Hockey Sticks 36" Navy No # available USA Field Hockey Each 24 no bid -             
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NO BID 114 Golf Golf Tees 19803153 Golf Galaxy Pack of 100 1 no bid -             
NO BID 117 Ice Hockey Bauer Reactor stick handling trainer Hockey monkey ms151b974 each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 118 Ice Hockey Blue sports triangular hockey passing aid Hockey monkey blue-sports-ac-bi-tpa3 each 1 no bid -             
NO BID 131 Lacrosse Stringking mark 2F stiff unstrung lacrosse head color white Lacrosse monkey SKU stringking-id-itm-004321 each 2 no bid -             
NO BID 170 Swim DragSox, 30 resistance SKU: 101 AquaVolo Each 5 no bid -             
NO BID 171 Swim Long Belt Slider red NZ Manufacturing SKU s11875-RD each 4 no bid -             
NO BID 173 Swim StretchCrodz with paddles green SKU s101-GR nzcords.com each 12 no bid -             
NO BID 174 Swim Touch Pads Daktronics DD1953274 each 2 no bid -             

Total No Bids 27

http://nzcords.com/

	Awarded

