

Athletic Uniform Bid Results 2023-24-18		AdPro Sports		BSN Sports, LLC		Riddell		Awarded to	
Item	Quantity	Cost per item	Total Cost of Bid	Cost per Item	Total Cost of Bid	Cost per Item	Total Cost of Bid		
1	Alleson Athletic Football Jersey - Reversable Navy/White	50	\$92.00	\$4,600.00	\$84.00	\$4,200.00	\$122.00	\$6,100.00	BSN Sports, LLC
2	Girls Volleyball Uniforms Alleson Athletic-W V-Neck - Navy	18	\$39.00	\$702.00	38.00	\$684.00	42.58	\$766.44	BSN Sports, LLC
3	Women's Nike Dri-Fit US SS Strike III Jersey - White	20	\$40.50	\$810.00	30.00	\$600.00	No Bid	\$0.00	BSN Sports, LLC
4	Women's Nike Dri-Fit US SS Strike III Jersey - Navy	20	\$40.50	\$810.00	30.00	\$600.00	No Bid	\$0.00	BSN Sports, LLC
5	Nike Dri-Fit US Woven Laser V Short - White	20	\$31.50	\$630.00	24.10	\$482.00	No Bid	\$0.00	BSN Sports, LLC
6	Nike Dri-Fit US Woven Laser V Short - Navy	20	\$31.50	\$630.00	24.10	\$482.00	No Bid	\$0.00	BSN Sports, LLC
7	Nike Men's Golf Polos - Navy	18	\$35.00	\$630.00	32.50	\$585.00	No Bid	\$0.00	BSN Sports, LLC
8	Men's Nike Custom Vapor Select Baseball Jersey-White	20	\$64.50	\$1,290.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	AdPro Sports
9	Women's Double Ply Reversible Jersey	20	\$46.00	\$920.00	\$44.00	\$880.00	No Bid	\$0.00	BSN Sports, LLC
10	Nike Stock Select V-Neck Jersey - Navy	20	\$71.00	\$1,420.00	\$67.00	\$1,340.00	No Bid	\$0.00	AdPro Sports
11	Women's Nike Stock Vapor Flag Jersey - White	20	\$36.00	\$720.00	46.20	\$924.00	No Bid	\$0.00	AdPro Sports
12	Nike Stock Select V-Neck Jersey - White	20	\$71.00	\$1,420.00	\$43.50	\$870.00	No Bid	\$0.00	BSN Sports, LLC
13	Alleson Chromagear V-Neck Baseball Jersey - Navy	25	\$46.00	\$1,150.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$42.58	\$1,064.50	Riddell
14	PROLOOK Custom Wrestling Singlet	10	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	
15	Alleson Adult Integrated Football Pant	50	\$29.00	\$1,450.00	\$32.25	\$1,612.50	\$35.65	\$1,782.50	AdPro Sports
16	Women's Double Ply Reversible Shorts - Fabric O	20	\$46.00	\$920.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	AdPro Sports
Total Bid				\$18,102.00		\$13,259.50		\$9,713.44	
Total Awarded			6	\$7,220.00	8	\$8,513.00	1	\$1,064.50	\$16,797.50