

Calendar Bid 2023-24-13

Vendor	Design	Printing/Cutting Option 1	Printing/Cutting Option 2	Mail Cost	Total Bid Amount Option 1	Total Bid Amount Option 2
Compu-Mail	1,100.00	17,827.50	17,827.50	968.27	19,895.77	19,895.77
Courier Printing Corporation	1,760.00	8,197.00	8,761.00	748.00	10,705.00	11,269.00
DataMation Printing & Graphics	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
G&M Enterprises	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Orffeo Printing & Imaging Inc.	500.00	9,140.00	9,558.00	510.00	10,150.00	10,568.00
RMF Mgmt Group	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Zenger Group	1,675.00	6,750.00	7,152.00	786.00	9,211.00	9,163.00

*Packets sent to 24 Vendors – Bids received from 7 vendors (and 3 “no bids”)

Award to Zenger Group – **Option 1:** \$9,211.00 **Option 2:** \$9,163.00

Increase over last year’s award:

Option 1	Option 2
2022-2023 \$7,048.00	2022-2023 \$7,396.00
2023-2024 \$9,211.00	2023-2024 \$9,163.00
Difference \$2,163.00	Difference \$1,767.00