

Vendor	One 12 Page Newsletter		Two 20 Page Newsletters		One 36 Page Combined Newsletter		Two 40 Page Combined Newsletter		Total Cost of Design	Mail Preparation for 6 Publications	Printing & Cutting		Four Page Signature Comm Ed	Eight Page Signature Comm Ed	Cost per Author Alternation	Renewal Option	
	Option 1	Option 2	Option 1	Option 2	Option 1	Option 2	Option 1	Option 2			Option 1	Option 2				2024-2025	2025-2026
Compu-Mail	5,662.15	0.00	18,302.74	0.00	16,128.55	0.00	35,745.06	0.00	5,400.00	12,722.43	#####	0.00	2,275.00	4,550.00	150.00	10-15%	10-15%
Courier Printing	3,055.00	2,670.00	8,312.00	7,598.00	6,616.00	6,245.00	14,562.00	13,588.00	4,800.00	713.00	#####	#####	1,122.00	1,791.00	25.00	2%	2%
Data-Mation Printing	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
G&M Enterprises	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Orffeo Printing	1,980.00	1,830.00	6,870.00	6,720.00	5,652.00	5,502.00	11,784.00	11,634.00	2,600.00	2,590.00	#####	#####	1,410.00	2,430.00	65.00	0%	0%
RMF Print Mgmt Group	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Zenger Group	5,243.00	4,639.00	7,031.00	6,967.00	11,309.00	11,244.00	13,644.00	12,498.00	6,168.00	665.00	#####	#####	1,700.00	2,400.00	65.00	2%	2%

* Cost per author alteration is per hour
* Could increase or decrease based on market conditions

*provided paper cost remains the same

This bid has been awarded to: Orffeo Printing

Advertised in both the Amherst and Ken-Ton Bee

Mailed to 24 vendors, bid received from 7 vendors (3 were no-bids)

Change to bid: **Option 1:** Cover: 4/4, Guts 2/2 Black + PMS; **Option 2:** 2/2 Black + PMS

Awarded to Orffeo Printing

Total – **Option 1:** \$31,476.00 (\$9,200.00 increase) **Option 2:** \$30,876.00 (\$8,600.00 increase)