BOARD OF EDUCATION
BALLSTON SPA CENTRAL SCHOOLS
BALLSTON SPA, NEW YORK 12020

BID ANALYSIS
ITEM BID: 2024-2025 Auto, Truck & Bus Part Bid
DATE ADVERTISED: SARATOGIAN 3/26/2024
DAILY GAZETTE 3/26/2024
DATE OF BID OPENING: 4/18/2024
NUMBER OF VENDORS CONTACTED: 19
NUMBER OF BIDS RECEIVED: 9
SOURCE OF FUNDS:
BIDDERS:
Brenntage North America Leonard Bus Sales
Neopart Transit Matthew Buses
Mangino GMC Vehicle Maintenance Program
Bus Parts Warehouse New York Bus Sales
HL Gage

LOW BID: (indicate name and address)

Please See Attached

RECOMMENDATION:

Award by item to the lowest responsible bidder as per attached

BOARD APPROVAL DATE:



Vendor Mail List 2024-2025

Bus Parts Warehouse

PO Box 250

East Syracuse, NY 13057-0250
sales@buspartswarehouse.com

Fleetpride
585 Broadway
Albany, NY 12204

HL Gage Sales Inc
PO Box 5170
Albany, NY 12205

Leonard Bus Sales Inc
63 Duplainville Rd
Saratoga Springs, NY 12866

Matthews Buses Inc
2900 Rte 9
Ballston spa, NY 12020

Morris Ford Inc

PO Box 48

872 Saratoga Road
Burnt Hills, NY 12027

Saratoga Auto Supply
PO Box 196
Ballston Spa, NY 12020

Gorman Enterprises
691 Bullis Rd
Elma, NY 14059

Mangino GMC
1484 Saratoga Road
Ballston Spa, NY 12020

D & W Diesel

1503 Clark St Rd
Auburn, NY 13021
315-253-2324 ext 1108

Vehicle Maintenance Program
3595 N Dixie Bay #7

Boca Raton,FL 33431
561-362-6080

Cynthia

New York Bus Sales
7765 Lakeport Road
Chittenango, NY 13037
315-687-3969

Group 12
74.25% off their price list

No Bid

$12,025.00

Group 11

43% off International price list

$9,066.70

Group 11

35% off their price list
$27,061.70

Group 12

20% of FLC PSM-M 158 price list

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Group 9

40% off their price list

No Bid

$1,812.08

$2,764.34
Group 9 -12
26% off their price list



Advance Auto No Bid
3 Dominic Drive
Ballston Spa, NY 12020

Advance Auto No Bid
4200 Six Forks Road

Raleigh, NC 27609

Bid Dept -

Debra Carey
debra.carey@advance-auto.com

O'Reilly Auto Parts No Bid
806 NY - 50

Burnt Hills, NY 12019

Shawn Archer

sarcherb@oreillyauto.com

DePaula Chevrolet No Bid
785 Central Ave

Albany, NY 12206

518-449-5551 ext 241

Jason Racque

jasonr@depaula.com

Brenntag North America Inc $33,455.22
42 Rumsey Road

East Hartford, CT 08108
binebids@brenntag.com

Neopart Transit $8,566.60
5C Dutch Court

Reading, PA 19608

Kere Frey

kfrey@neoparttransit.com

Ford Fleet Bid Specialist No Bid
North East Market Area

Brent Rossler

201-249-3918

brossler@ford.com

Total Bid $94,751.64



BALLSTON SPA CENTRAL SCHOOL DISTRICT
2024-2025

AUTO, TRUCK & BUS PARTS BID

GROUP 1 - HEAVY DUTY AIR BRAKES AND RELATED ITEMS

BRAKE SHOES:
Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
30 KSMA2124702( MERITOR $2,084.70 Matthews Bus
30 KSMA2124703(MERITOR $4,115.70 Matthews Bus
30 KSMA2124707( MERITOR $2,597.10 Matthews Bus
30 KSMA2124720( MERITOR $3,764.70 Matthews Bus
30 BXK129276 BENDIX $5,055.00 HL Gage
BRAKE DRUMS & ROTORS
Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
30 GUNITE 3600AX $4,361.70 Matthews Bus
20 GUNITE 3774X $4,516.00 Matthews Bus
20 GUNITE 3721X $2,719.20 Leonard
20 2605073C1 INTERNATION/ $4,630.00 HL Gage
BRAKE DRUM
Brake Cans
Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
30 MGM 3232951X $4,259.40 Neopost
30 K132352 Bendix $4,350.00 Matthews Bus
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GROUP 2 - AIR DRYER PARTS

Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
20 BENDIX 5005037 $731.40 Matthews Bus
20 Fleetrite FLT107794 $525.80 Leonard
10 Fleetrite FLT109493 $738.40 Leonard
40 BENDIX #K022105 $4,307.20 Neopart

Purge Valve Kit

GROUP 3 - MIRRORS

Est TOTAL

Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
12 ROSCO 3365IH $586.32 NY Bus
12 ROSCO 3365H $593.16 NY Bus
12 ROSCO 3365TH $722.76 NY Bus

GROUP 4 - WINDSHIELD WIPERS AND RELATED ITEMS

Est TOTAL

Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
100 30-20 ANCO $493.00 Leonard
100 30-22 ANCO $493.00 Leonard
100 30-24 ANCO ‘ $493.00 Leonard

GROUP 5 - FILTERS

TRANSMISSION FILTERS:

Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
60 29539579 Allison $564.60 Leonard
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AIR FILTERS:

Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
10 PB07955 Donaldson $551.70
30 2517298C1 IC Air Filters $2,340.00
OIL FILTERS:
Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
36 LF3970 Fleetguard $248.04
36 7098846C1 Internationa $146.88
FUEL FILTERS:
Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
40 FF5632 Fleetguard $540.40
40 FS1065 Fleetguard $1,147.20
40 FF63009 Fleetguard $1,340.80
40 ABP/N122-R50: Alliance $1,244.40
GROUP 6 - BULBS
Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
30 H6054 Bulb $266.10
30 9007LL Bulb $86.40
30 9006 Bulb $86.40

Leonard

HL Gage

Vehicle Maintenance

Vehicle Maintenance

Matthews Bus
Leonard
Leonard

Vehicle Maintenance

NY Bus
Vehicle Maintenance

Vehicle Maintenance
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GROUP 7 - FLUIDS

Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
200 Windhsield Wash Fluid $596.00
-20° 1 Gallon
200 Windshield Washer Fluid $3,570.00
-30° 1 Gallon
40 DEF Fluid Navi-Guard Blue | $7,498.00
55 Gallon
4 K-100 $9,348.56
55 Galion
Group 8 - OIL/IGREASE/DEGREASER
Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
5 Mobil Delvac 1300 Super SA $74.40
15W-40 Bulk - 250 Gallon
6 Mobil Dexos Super Full $4,636.56
Synthetic 5W-30 (55 Gallon)
6 Mobil Exxon Super Flo SAE $3,174.66
5W-20
55 Gallon
4 Mobile Synthetic Blend Diest $3,570.64
Oil SAE 10W-30 (55 Gallon)
40 WD-40 $296.40
120z Can w/Smart Straw
(Cont'd) Group 8 - OIL/IGREASE/DEGREASER
Est TOTAL
Qnty Description & Part # PRICE
20 Citrus Degreaser $1,286.00
5 Gallon
Group 9
GROUP 9 -GM CAR & L Awarded
Mangino 40%
NY Bus 26%

NY Bus

Brenntag

Brenntag

Brenntag

Brenntag

Brenntag

Brenntag

Brenntag

Brenntag

Brenntag
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Group 10
GROUP 10 - FORD CAR Awarded
NY Bus 26%

Group 11
GROUP 11 - INTERNATI Awarded
HL Gage 43%

Leonard Bus 35%
NY Bus 26%

Group 12
GROUP 12 - FREIGHTLI Awarded
Bus Parts 74.25%

NY Bus 26%
Matthew 20%

Page 5 of 5



