



Summer Floor Refinishing & Carpet Cleaning
Bid #21/22-08
Tab Sheet

Summer Full Service (Floor Refinishing & Carpet Cleaning)			
	Vanguard Cleaning Systems of Alabama	Big BEE Janitorial Services	R&J Janitorial Services
Ashville Elementary	\$12,000.00	\$7,940.00	No Bid
Ashville Middle	\$19,728.00	\$6,084.00	No Bid
Ashville High	\$18,000.00	\$6,084.00	No Bid
Odenville Elementary	\$9,550.00	\$10,900.00	No Bid
Odenville Intermediate	\$11,500.00	\$6,040.00	No Bid
Ragland Elementary & High	No Bid	\$17,100.00	No Bid
Springville Elementary	\$15,300.00	\$9,990.00	No Bid
Springville High	\$11,533.00	\$11,150.00	No Bid

Cafeteria Floor Waxing			
	Vanguard Cleaning Systems of Alabama	Big BEE Janitorial Services	R&J Janitorial Services
Ashville High	\$2,300.00	\$2,500.00	\$1,600.00
Odenville Elementary	\$3,100.00	\$2,900.00	\$2,250.00
Ragland High	No Bid	\$2,500.00	\$1,475.00
Springville High	\$2,900.00	\$2,900.00	\$2,300.00



Summer Floor Refinishing & Carpet Cleaning
Bid #21/22-08
Tab Sheet

Summer Full Service (Floor Refinishing & Carpet Cleaning)			
	Baza Services	Hill's Janitorial Service	
Ashville Elementary	\$31,500.00	\$8,000.00	
Ashville Middle	\$28,000.00	\$6,500.00	
Ashville High	\$31,500.00	\$6,500.00	
Odenville Elementary	\$29,750.00	\$6,000.00	
Odenville Intermediate	\$26,250.00	\$6,000.00	
Ragland Elementary & High	\$48,000.00	\$15,500.00	
Springville Elementary	\$31,920.00	\$10,000.00	
Springville High	\$24,500.00	\$11,500.00	

Cafeteria Floor Waxing			
	Baza Services	Hill's Janitorial Service	
Ashville High	\$2,275.00	\$2,500.00	
Odenville Elementary	\$1,950.00	\$2,500.00	
Ragland High	\$2,000.00	\$3,500.00	
Springville High	\$2,450.00	\$3,000.00	

