



Painting Services
Bid #21/22-05BOE
Tab Sheet

	Coomes Maintenance	C.R. Painting	CertaPro Painters	Southern Painting Decorating
Pressure Washing Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	\$1.50	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid
Stucco Patching Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	\$2.25	X		
Exterior Painting of Stucco, Concrete, Masonry, or Wood Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	\$1.80	\$0.65		
Interior Painting of Plaster, Drywall, or Block Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	\$1.80	\$0.45		
Trim Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	\$1.80	\$2.00		



Door – Single Side (Labor Only)	\$15.00	\$35.00		
Door – Both Sides (Labor Only)	\$25.00	\$70.00		
Hollow Metal Frames (Labor Only)	\$15.00	\$25.00		



Painting Services
Bid #21/22-05BOE
Tab Sheet

	The Painting Company	AAA Environmental	Blue Team Restoration	Construction Journal
Pressure Washing Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Stucco Patching Per Square Foot (Labor Only)				
Exterior Painting of Stucco, Concrete, Masonry, or Wood Per Square Foot (Labor Only)				
Interior Painting of Plaster, Drywall, or Block Per Square Foot (Labor Only)				
Trim Per Square Foot (Labor Only)				



Door – Single Side (Labor Only)				
Door – Both Sides (Labor Only)				
Hollow Metal Frames (Labor Only)				



Painting Services
Bid #21/22-05BOE
Tab Sheet

	Corporate Vision	Mr. Fix It Home Repair	Pegasus Mobile Maintenance	Professional Touch Painting
Pressure Washing Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Stucco Patching Per Square Foot (Labor Only)				
Exterior Painting of Stucco, Concrete, Masonry, or Wood Per Square Foot (Labor Only)				
Interior Painting of Plaster, Drywall, or Block Per Square Foot (Labor Only)				
Trim Per Square Foot (Labor Only)				



Door – Single Side (Labor Only)				
Door – Both Sides (Labor Only)				
Hollow Metal Frames (Labor Only)				



Painting Services
 Bid #21/22-05BOE
 Tab Sheet

	Reeves Cleaning Service
Pressure Washing Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	No Bid
Stucco Patching Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	
Exterior Painting of Stucco, Concrete, Masonry, or Wood Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	
Interior Painting of Plaster, Drywall, or Block Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	
Trim Per Square Foot (Labor Only)	



Door – Single Side (Labor Only)	
Door – Both Sides (Labor Only)	
Hollow Metal Frames (Labor Only)	