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CONESTOGA VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
PROPOSED FINAL BUDGET 

2015 – 2016 BUDGET NARRATIVE 
 
In June 2006, the Taxpayer Relief Act, commonly known as Act 1 was signed into law.  
The Act also was designed to control educational expenditures by limiting real estate tax 
increases.  Under the law, a district’s millage rate cannot be increased by more than the 
index as established annually by the Pennsylvania Department of Education and that 
index for 2015-2016 is 1.9% for Conestoga Valley.  A district may apply for referendum 
exceptions from this limit due to significant increases in costs in specific areas.  The CV 
School Board chose to apply for the PSERS retirement exception and the special 
education exception which would permit the millage rate increase to be above the 2015-
2016 index.  The district has elected to use one half of the PSERS retirement exception 
which provides for a 2.52% millage rate increase. 
 
The district continued to work through a very difficult budgetary process again this year 
given the current economic times.  The School Board reduced expenditure requests by 
over $1,694,693 to reach the goal of a 2.52% millage rate increase.  (Proposed capital 
projects of $895,000 for roof repairs, sewer line work and to replace a chiller were not 
included in the budget and are not included in the $1,694,693 as those projects are being 
funded out of the capital projects fund.)   In addition, the Board has kept our budgetary 
increase as low as possible in light of the economic challenges our residents are facing 
without jeopardizing our programs for students.  The School Board is approaching this 
task through a very transparent process, hosting public forums, posting budgetary updates 
to their public agendas online, so that residents can understand their diligence and 
dedication to both the taxpayers and students of our school community.   
  
The School Board asked the administration to share with them the kinds of reductions it 
would take to reach a 2.52% tax increase for the 2015-2016 budget.  Those scenarios 
included a variety of items while making the commitment not to cut specific programs, 
but rather to reduce expenses across the board.  As a result, specific programs have not 
been prioritized or targeted for reduction or elimination.  Furthermore, the School Board 
has tried to avoid increasing class size, especially at the elementary level.  Finally, the 
School Board has attempted to avoid furloughs or layoffs and to rather gain some 
economies through attrition.  The only way such savings can be realized is through 
retirements or resignations.   
 
At the May 11, 2015 Board meeting, the School Board approved a Proposed Final Budget 
with a tax increase of 2.52%.  For the average single family residential homeowner, that 
translates into a tax increase of approximately $62.  However, the residential properties 
that were approved as Homesteads will continue to receive approximately $97 off their 
tax bill as the district expects to receive $700,553 in State Property Tax Reduction 
revenue, a $1,488 increase over the amount received in the previous year.  That money 
goes to reduce the tax burden of residential taxpayers.  
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With a 2.52% millage rate increase, the 2015-2016 rate will increase by 0.373 mills to 
15.206 mills.  Total revenues for the 2015-16 budget are $61,564,724 which represents a 
4.41% increase revenues over the 2014-2015 budget.  Total expenditures for the 2015-
2016 budget are $63,424,767 which represents a 3.79% increase over the 2014-2015 
budget.  Overall, budgeted expenditures exceed budgeted revenues by $1,860,043 
resulting in a 18.93% fund balance as a percentage of budgeted expenditures.  The district 
has assigned approximately $4,463,000 of the fund balance for future pension costs.  
 
Tax assessment appeals have had a significant impact on the district’s local revenue over 
the previous years and the impact of these assessments compounds each year.  Earned 
income tax revenue and other real estate related taxes are budgeted to increase by 
$382,000.   
 
The 2015-2016 proposed state education budget includes an additional $197,827 for the 
basic education subsidy.  This proposed increase in subsidy replaces the Ready to Learn 
and accountability block grant subsidies received in previous years.  The district also 
receives state subsidy to reimburse 50% of the PSERS retirement costs incurred.  As the 
PSERS retirement rate is increasing in 2015-2016 from 21.4% to 25.84%, the 
reimbursement subsidy is also increasing by $705,500.  
 
The District was awarded a competitive grant beginning in 2012-2013 called the 
Keystone to Opportunities grant.  However, the district must apply for the grant each 
year.  The amount received in 2014-2015 was $802,390 and the anticipated amount for 
2015-2016 is $838,957.  The district’s proposal for the grant was one of four county 
proposals and only thirty-eight districts in Pennsylvania were selected for full funding.  
The grant addresses Early Childhood Education, Elementary English Language Learners, 
Secondary Response to Instruction and Intervention and Transition Programs.  The grant 
was awarded based on the strength of our program and our ability to analyze our needs 
and act on them in a way that ensures literacy success for all students.    
 
The pie graph below shows the percentage of total revenues in the Proposed Final Budget 
derived from the various sources: 
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This chart summarizes the increases or decreases in revenue from the 2014/2015 
projections as follows: 
 

 
 

 
Several major reasons exist as to why the School Board feels a tax increase is justified.  
Salary costs are increasing by $587,000.  The school board and the education association 
negotiated a new four year contract through 2018 – 2019.  The contract provides for 
salary increases of 2.95% for the first two years and 2.9% for the next two years.  The 
contract also includes changes to the existing health insurance plan by offering a 
qualified high deductible plan with a health savings account in addition to a low and 
medium preferred provider plan.     
 
Retirement costs are increasing by $1,381,000 or 23.3% due to the mandated increase in 
the PSERS retirement rate from 21.4% of payroll in 2014-2015 to 25.84% in 2015-2016.  
The retirement rate is established by the Pennsylvania School Employee Retirement 
System (PSERS) and is expected to increase each year to an estimated rate of 32.08% of 
payroll in the 2019-20 fiscal year which will have a tremendous impact on future 
budgets.  The District has established a PSERS Rate Stabilization Fund to offset the 
significant increase that began taking effect in 2011-12. The district does receive state 
subsidy representing 50% of the retirement costs.   
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In November 2013, the district issued General Obligation Bonds, Series of 2014 in the 
amount of $3,605,000.  The proceeds of these bonds were used to finance renovations to 
the district’s athletic stadium.  Moody’s, one of America’s top bond credit rating agencies 
reviewed the district’s financial status and confirmed the existing bond rating of Aa2.  As 
stated in Moody’s report, this rating “reflects the district’s sound financial management 
and satisfactory reserve levels, sizable and economically diverse tax base with a large 
industrial component, and low debt burden with rapid amortization”.    
 
Special education continues to be a financial concern.  As with districts across the 
Commonwealth, the percentage of special education students compared to the total 
student population is increasing at a substantial pace.  For Conestoga Valley, special 
education costs have increased by $223,000 or 3.0% from 2014-2015 to 2015-2016.  The 
district has implemented various cost saving initiatives over the years including providing 
the special education services at the district instead of contracting with the local 
intermediate unit and/or local school districts who provide the necessary services.   
 

 
Conestoga Valley 2015-2016 Proposed Final Budget Expenditures 
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The breakdown of significant increases or decreases from the 2014-2015 projections is as 
follows:   
 

 
 

                  
 
With 4,230 projected students, the 2015-2016 budget cost per student is $15,011, about 
$826 more than last year. 
 
The school district currently has a ten year long range plan for capital repair which goes 
to 2024--2025.  Projects slated for 2015-2016 include repairs to the high school and Fritz 
Elementary and Leola Elementary roofs, repair to the sewer line at Brownstown 
Elementary and replace the chiller at Fritz Elementary.  To prevent a large traumatic tax 
increase in any one year, the district is not planning to do any major renovations or 
additions until 2019-20 when existing debt drops off.   Consequently, taxpayers should 
see no increase in taxation related to debt service.    
 
In the past three years, Conestoga Valley School District has had tax increases of two 
percent or less a year.  Compared to other districts in the county for the same period of 
time, Conestoga Valley has the third lowest increase.  The chart below compares 
Conestoga Valley to the other districts in the county: 
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During the budgetary process, an important focus of the District is to maintain a healthy 
fund balance.  As a general rule, the fund balance should range between 6 – 8% of 
budgeted expenditures.  In projecting future year revenues and expenditures while 
maintaining a fund balance within this range, the District anticipates that the millage rate 
increase for 2016-2017 will be about 2.4%.   The District has, for the most part, kept tax 
increases at or under inflation.  The biggest concern under tax reform, from a 
management standpoint, is an extremely low index in a year that requires a larger tax 
increase just to sustain programs.  Another issue is adopting a preliminary budget in 
January when the district does not have the information to build an accurate budget.  The 
school district has done an excellent job at accurately projecting tax rate needs, keeping 
both tax increases and fund balances from significant swings up and down.  With the 
enactment of Act 1, the budgetary process began in September 2014 with continual 
modifications to current year projections and budget amounts.   
 
As we plan for the future, Conestoga Valley continues to try to provide the best 
educational program for the community, while at the same time attempting to keep the tax 
burden as low as possible.  Over the years, there have been many steps taken to reduce 
costs or increase revenues other than raising taxes. The district will continue to look at 
efficient and effective ways to bring quality educational services to the community. 
 
 
 
 


