

| | | |
|--|--|----------------|
| ADDENDUM TO THE BID DOCUMENTS | Page: 1 | Total Pages: 7 |
| <u>Addendum No:</u> # 1 | <u>Date this Addendum Issued:</u> August 31, 2022 | |
| <u>Issuing Office:</u> Matanuska-Susitna Borough School District (MSBSD) Purchasing Department 690 Cope Industrial Way Palmer, Alaska 99645 Phone: (907) 861-5120 Facsimile: (907) 861-5184 | <u>Previous Addenda Issued:</u> None _____ _____ _____ _____ | |
| <u>Return Acknowledgment To:</u> Issuing Department <u>Bid Title:</u> Petroleum Products for the MSBSD <u>Bid No:</u> B24-01 | <u>Date and Hour of Bid Due Date:</u> September 11, 2023 at 2:00 p.m. <u>As Advertised (Frontiersman):</u> August 18 and 20, 2023 <u>As Advertised (ADN):</u> August 18 and 20, 2023 | |
| <p>The following corrections, changes, additions, deletions, revisions, and/or clarifications are hereby made a part of the contract documents. In case of conflicts between this addendum and previously issued documents, this addendum shall take precedence. The bidder must acknowledge receipt of this addendum in the space provided on Appendix #1. Failure to do so may subject the bidder to disqualification.</p> <p>Attachments: Tabulation Sheet for Bid #B17-02</p> <p>Questions:</p> <p>1. Q: Request for the current pricing paid for fuel through the current vendor on all these location in Bid B24-01 (preferably the OPIS differential over Anchorage OPIS Rack Average)</p> <p>A: The MSBSD is not currently purchasing fuel through a competitive pricing agreement, so current pricing is not relevant to this bid.</p> <p>2. Q: I would like to get a copy of the bid results the last time this was bid.</p> <p>A: The tabulation sheet from Bid #B17-02 is attached to this addendum.</p> <p>3. Q: Related to the additive required for the ULS#1 fuels in the winter: are you providing the additive? If you are not providing the additive then what additive would you like used and are we to include this in our bid price per gallon or can we sell it to you on a separate invoice?</p> <p>A: The contractor is expected to provide an appropriate winter additive to meet the requirements listed. Per-gallon pricing provide on Attachment C: Bid Form should be inclusive of all costs to meet the stated requirements.</p> <p style="text-align: center;">END OF ADDENDUM #1</p> | | |

| | |
|--------------------------|-----------------------|
| APPROVED BY: Beth Munson | DATE: August 31, 2023 |
|--------------------------|-----------------------|

**MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
690 COPE INDUSTRIAL WAY
PALMER, ALASKA 99645**

**PETROLEUM PRODUCTS FOR THE
MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID #B17-02**

TABULATION SHEET

| <u>ULTRA LOW SULPHUR DIESEL (ULSD) #1</u> | | | | Fisher's | CPD | Shoreside |
|--|---|---|------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|
| Item | School/Site | Location | Tank Size | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon |
| 1. | Administration Building Emergency Generator | 501 N. Gulkana Street, Palmer | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 2. | Beryozova School Emergency Generator | 29297 Beryozova Road, Willow | 120 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 3. | Big Lake Elementary Emergency Generator | 3808 S. Big Lake Road, Big Lake | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 4. | Butte Elementary Emergency Generator | 4006 S. Butte Road, Palmer | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 5. | Colony High Emergency Generator | 9550 E. Bogard Road, Palmer | 1,000 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 6. | Colony High Well House Generator | 9550 E. Bogard Road, Palmer | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 7. | Colony Middle School Emergency Generator | 9250 E. Bogard Road, Palmer | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 8. | Cottonwood Creek Elementary Emergency Generator | 800 N. Seward Meridian Parkway, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 9. | Dena'ina Elementary Emergency Generator | 7068 S. Knik Knack Mud Shack Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 10. | Finger Lake Elementary Emergency Generator | 5981 Eek Street, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |

**MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
690 COPE INDUSTRIAL WAY
PALMER, ALASKA 99645**

**PETROLEUM PRODUCTS FOR THE
MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID #B17-02**

TABULATION SHEET

| ULTRA LOW SULPHUR DIESEL (ULSD) #1 (Continued) | | | | Fisher's | CPD | Shoreside |
|---|--|---|------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|
| Item | School/Site | Location | Tank Size | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon |
| 11. | Glacier View School Emergency Generator | 65975 S. Wolverine Circle, Sutton | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 12. | Houston Middle School Emergency Generator | 12801 W. Hawk Lane, Big Lake | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 13. | Iditarod Elementary Emergency Generator | 455 E. Carpenter Circle, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 14. | Joe Redington Sr. Jr/Sr High Emergency Generator | 10015 Redington Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 15. | John Shaw Elementary Emergency Generator | 3750 E. Paradise Lane, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 16. | Knik Elementary Emergency Generator | 6400 Hollywood Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 17. | Machetanz Elementary Emergency Generator | 4961 E. Nelson Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 18. | Mat-Su Career Technical Ed High Emergency Generator | 2472 N. Seward Meridian Parkway, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 19. | Mat-Su Day School Emergency Generator | 2360 N. Tait Drive, Wasilla | 600 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 20. | Nutrition Services Center Emergency Generator | 690 Cope Industrial Way, Palmer | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 21. | Operations & Maintenance Emergency Generator | 3901 E. Bogard Road, Wasilla | 200 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 22. | Palmer High Emergency Generator | 1170 W. Bogard Road, Palmer | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |

**MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
690 COPE INDUSTRIAL WAY
PALMER, ALASKA 99645**

**PETROLEUM PRODUCTS FOR THE
MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID #B17-02**

TABULATION SHEET

| ULTRA LOW SULPHUR DIESEL (ULSD) #1 (Continued) | | | | Fisher's | CPD | Shoreside |
|---|---|---|------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|------------------|
| Item | School/Site | Location | Tank Size | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon | \$3.00 |
| 23. | Palmer Junior Middle Emergency Generator | 1159 S. Chugach Street, Palmer | 1,000 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 24. | Pioneer Peak Elementary Emergency Generator | 1959 N. Trunk Road, Palmer | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 25. | Snowshoe Elementary Emergency Generator | 2001 W. Fairview Loop Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 26. | Su-Valley Jr/Sr High School Emergency Generator | 42728 S. Parks Highway, Talkeetna | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.2258 | \$3.00 |
| 27. | Sutton Elementary Emergency Generator | 11762 N. Wright Way, Sutton | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 28. | Tanaina Elementary Emergency Generator | 2550 Lucille Street, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 29. | Talkeetna Elementary Emergency Generator | 13930 E. Timberwolf Loop, Talkeetna | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.2258 | \$3.00 |
| 30. | Trapper Creek Elementary Emergency Generator | 6742 E. Petersville Road, Trapper Creek | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.2258 | \$3.00 |
| 31. | Valley Pathways School Emergency Generator | 1150 N. France Road, Palmer | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 32. | Wasilla High Emergency Generator | 701 E. Bogard Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 33. | Wasilla Middle School Emergency Generator | 650 E. Bogard Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |
| 34. | Willow Elementary Emergency Generator | 31706 Parks Highway, Willow | 500 | \$3.24 | \$2.1758 | \$3.00 |

**MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
690 COPE INDUSTRIAL WAY
PALMER, ALASKA 99645**

**PETROLEUM PRODUCTS FOR THE
MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID #B17-02**

TABULATION SHEET

| <u>FUEL OIL#1</u> | | | | Fisher's | CPD | Shoreside |
|--|------------------------------|--|------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|
| Item | School/Site | Location | Tank Size | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon |
| 1. | ** Glacier View School | 65975 S. Wolverine Circle, Sutton | 2,000 | \$2.01 | \$1.87 | \$1.935 |
| 2. | ** Glacier View Zamboni Shed | 65975 S. Wolverine Circle, Sutton | 500 | \$2.01 | \$1.87 | \$1.935 |
| 3. | ** Su-Valley High School | 42728 S. Parks Highway, Talkeetna | 5,000 | \$1.95 | \$1.95 | \$1.935 |
| 4. | ** Sutton Elementary | 11762 N. Wright Way, Sutton | 7,500 | \$1.95 | \$1.87 | \$1.935 |
| 5. | ** Talkeetna Elementary | 13930 E. Timberwolf Loop, Talkeetna | 5,000 | \$1.95 | \$1.95 | \$1.935 |
| 6. | ** Trapper Creek Elementary | 6742 E. Petersville Road, Trapper Creek | 5,000 | \$1.95 | \$1.95 | \$1.935 |
| 7. | ** Willow Elementary | 31706 Parks Highway, Willow | 8,000 | \$1.95 | \$1.87 | \$1.935 |
| Average Price Per Gallon for Fuel Oil #1 | | | N/A | \$1.967 | \$1.904 | \$1.935 |

Note: see special instructions in Scope of Services

**MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
690 COPE INDUSTRIAL WAY
PALMER, ALASKA 99645**

**PETROLEUM PRODUCTS FOR THE
MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID #B17-02**

TABULATION SHEET

| <u>ULSD NR (Off-Road Vehicle Fuel)</u> | | | | Fisher's | CPD | Shoreside |
|---|--------------------------|------------------------------|------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|
| Item | School/Site | Location | Tank Size | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon |
| 1. | Operations & Maintenance | 3901 E. Bogard Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$2.09 | \$2.09 | \$2.37 |
| 2. | Operations & Maintenance | 3901 E. Bogard Road, Wasilla | 500 | \$2.09 | \$2.09 | \$2.37 |

| <u>THIS BID ITEM WILL BE AWARDED AS A LUMP SUM, TO OVERALL LOWEST BIDDER</u> | | | | Fisher's | CPD | Shoreside |
|---|---------------------------|--|--|-------------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|
| Item | Description | | | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon | Price per Gallon |
| 1. | Regular Unleaded Gasoline | | | No Bid | \$2.1259 | No Bid |
| 2. | Premium Unleaded Gasoline | | | No Bid | \$2.3506 | No Bid |
| 3. | Diesel Vehicle Fuel #1 | | | No Bid | \$2.0000 | No Bid |
| 4. | Diesel Vehicle Fuel #2 | | | No Bid | \$2.0000 | No Bid |

**MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
690 COPE INDUSTRIAL WAY
PALMER, ALASKA 99645**

**PETROLEUM PRODUCTS FOR THE
MATANUSKA-SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
BID #B17-02**

TABULATION SHEET

| <u>REGULAR UNLEADED GASOLINE TANK AND DISPENSING SYSTEM</u> | | Fisher's | CPD | Shoreside |
|--|---|-----------------|--------------|------------------|
| Item | Description | Price | Price | Price |
| 1a. | 5,000 Gallon Tank, Installation, and Dispensing System | No Bid | No Bid | \$0.00 |
| 1b. | Price of Regular Unleaded Gasoline per gallon | No Bid | \$2.1750 | \$2.24 |
| 1c. | Price of Premium Unleaded Gasoline per gallon | No Bid | \$2.3550 | \$2.34 |

| <u>ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL TANK AND DISPENSING SYSTEM</u> | | Fisher's | CPD | Shoreside |
|--|---|-----------------|--------------|------------------|
| Item | Description | Price | Price | Price |
| 2a. | 1,000 Gallon Tank, Installation, and Dispensing System | No Bid | No Bid | \$0.00 |
| 2b. | Price of Ultra Low Sulphur Diesel Fuel per gallon | No Bid | \$2.0900 | \$2.05 |