

BASEBALL

Item #	Description	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
2	Baseballs Pro, NFHS Game Ball, 12/CS, Diamond			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$58.32	DOL-A HS	12	Yes
3	Diamond D-1 Pro Baseballs, Professional, NFHS			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$81.85	D1-PRO HS	12	Yes
4	Baseball-Safety Ball Official Size, Diamond 1005001			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$56.35	DFX9L	12	Yes
5	Soft Touch Incrediball Baseball, 9 Nylon Cloth Covered w/Poly Core, Easton			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$58.32	6020371(DZ)	12	Yes
6	Spalding Pro Series Baseball, Leather cover, cushion cork center, raised seams, Dozen			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC DOZEN \$74.66 BSN SPORTS LLC 500 PRO SERIES NFHS APPROVED BS WC41101HS	WC41101HS		Yes
7	Jugs Lite-Flite Baseballs, Sponge Like Texture, 1159240			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC DOZEN \$38.26 BSN SPORTS LLC UGS LITE FLITE PRACTICE BASEBALL (DZ)	1159240		Yes
8	Baseball Size Whiffle Ball, BSN 1033601			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC DOZEN \$6.76 BSN SPORTS LLC 9" PLASTIC BALL WH	1033601		Yes
9	Yellow Dimpled Baseball, Yellow Dimpled Pitching Machine Baseball, Macgregor MCBDBYEL			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC DOZEN \$27.57 BSN SPORTS LLC MAC YL DIMPLED PITCHING MACHINE BALLS	MCBDBYEL		Yes
10	Ball & Bucket, with 3 Doz Baseballs			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods SET \$124.74	CHAMPROBUC6+CBB200D-X3	1	Yes
11	Rawlings Pro Style Coolflo Baseball Batting Helmet NOCSAE Approved, Sizes: L (7 1/8 - 7 1/4), XXL (7 5/8 - 7 7/8), XL (7 3/8 - 7 1/2), M (6 7/8 - 7), S (6 5/8 - 6 3/4), Assorted colors, Item #CFABH - Rawlings			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EACH \$27.96 CFABH is discontinued- sub with R16 HELMET,CLEAR COAT, SENIOR SIZE	RAWLINGS R1601S-x-SR	1	No
12	Basic Batting Tee, Each			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EACH \$19.95	CHAMPION #90	1	Yes
13	Bat - Adult Wood Fungo, Each			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EACH \$34.20	Louisville WBL271101036	1	Yes
14	Baseball Bat, Adult, 33/30 oz Easton Reflex, Barrel Diameter 2 5/8, Easton			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Pyramid School Products EACH \$68.99 EASTON REFLEX IS DISCONTINUED - REPLACED BY EASTON SPEED	EASTON SPEED 8073904		No

15	Louisville Slugger TPX Armor- Bat, CB85T, 32, 29 oz.				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	LOUISVILLE WBL2645010+	1	No
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$89.63	TPX Armor is discontinued- sub Vapor BBCOR			
16	2017 Louisville Slugger Prime 917 BBCOR Baseball Bat, Just Bats BBP9173 or Equal				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	LouisvilleWBL2641010+	1	
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$328.50	Prime 917 is discontinued- sub SELECT PWR (-3) BBCOR			
17	2017 Easton MAKO BEAST BBCOR Baseball Bat, Just Bats BB17MK or Equal				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	MAKO BEAST is discontinued- sub EASTON ROPE BBCOR	1	No
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$367.25	MAKO BEAST is discontinued- sub EASTON ROPE BBCOR			
18	Fungo Bat #K100, L Slugger All Purpose, 36 24.5 oz, 1016001				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	1385178		Yes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$27.88	BSN SPORTS LLC Slugger K100 Fungo Bat (36")			
19	Catchers Equipment Bag, Heavy Duty Travel Bag, Nylon Zipper w/wrap-around handles and leather on end				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	CHAMPROE40	1	Yes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$29.85				
20	Chest Protectors - Men's Adult - All Colors, Adjustable Attachment for Custom Fit				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	1298437		Yes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$50.27	BSN SPORTS LLC MAC B70 PRO PROTECTOR BLACK, ROYAL, OR SCARLET. SPECIFY COLOR ON PO			
21	Easton Men's Stealth Leg Guards, Triple kneecap design, Specify color				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	1159288		No
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$58.87	BSN SPORTS LLC MAC B61 DBL KNEE VARSITY LEG GRD PR - BLACK, ROYAL, OR SCARLET. SPECIFY COLOR ON PO			
22	Knee Supporter Protective Gear, Various colors				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	1184747		Yes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$12.16	BSN SPORTS LLC MACGREGOR KNEE SAVER BLK ADULT BLACK ONLY			
23	Hockey Style Catchers Mask - Collegiate, Meets the NOCSAE Standard for Catcher's Helmets, One Size fits Range of 6 5/8 - 7 1/2				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	ALL STAR MVP2300		Yes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$68.95	AVAILABLE COLORS ARE BLACK, NAVY, ROYAL AND SCARLET			
24	Catchers Mask, CH-HS2 Hockey Style Catcher's Helmet, Specify Size, Riddell, Riddell				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	ALL STARMVP2400	1	No
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$95.90	Ultra Cool Catching Helmet / Adult / Solid			
25	Soft Touch Bases - Incumber bases + Ground Mounts, 3 bases per set				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Soft Touch BasesA1500	1	Yes
	Laux Sporting Goods	SET	\$519.76				
26	Pro Home Plate, Bilco Soft Spike				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	BBHPXXXXY		No
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$22.57	BSN SPORTS LLC 5 SPIKE HOMEPLATE			
27	Belts, Adult 30-46				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	1172577		Yes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$2.24	BSN SPORTS LLC BLACK, COLUMBIA BLUE, DARK GREEN, GOLD, MAROON, NAVY, ORANGE, PURPLE, ROYAL, SCARLET, OR KELLY. SPECIFY COLOR ON PO.			

28	Solid Tube Sock, Size 9-12	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	PAIR	\$1.98	
		PEAR SOX AS-COLOR-AD		Yes
29	Men's Narrow Channel TF1000, Exclusive ZK Composite Cover 2/Superior Grip and Feel, 100% Top Grade 2-Ply Nylon Windings and Butyl Rubber Bladder, Spalding	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	NO AWARD			
30	Men's Wide Channel TF1000, Exclusive ZK Composite Cover 2/Superior Grip and Feel, 100% Top Grade 2-Ply Nylon Windings and Butyl Rubber Bladder, Spalding	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$58.99	
		SPALDING PRECISION 768138		Yes
31	TCK Poly Pro Tube Sock - 1463408	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	PAIR	\$4.37	BSN SPORTS TWIN CITY 1463409
		1463409		Yes
32	Peterson Scoremaster MSPTRBOK	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EA	\$4.69	
		PETERSON 7SB1		Yes
33	PITCHERS POCKET 9 Hole 1450761	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EA	\$324.00	BSN SPORTS LLC 9 Hole Pitcher's Pocket
		1450761		Yes
34	PITCHERS POCKET 12 Pocket 1450769	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EA	\$488.00	BSN SPORTS LLC PITCHERS POCKET 12 Pocket
		1450769		Yes
35	PITCHERS POCKET 16 Pocket 1450774	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EA	\$568.00	BSN SPORTS LLC PITCHERS POCKET 16 Pocket
		1450774		Yes
36	Nike Baseball Belt 3.0 1459323	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EA	\$9.23	BSN SPORTS LLC Nike Baseball Belt 3.0
		1459323		Yes

SOFTBALL

38	Baseball/Softball Lineup Card MCLINEUP	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC EA \$4.96 BSN SPORTS LLC	MCLINEUP		Yes
39	MacGregor Double First Base BBDFBSNR	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC EA \$138.00 BSN SPORTS LLC	BBDFBSNR		Yes
40	MacGregor Pitchers Rubber Plate BBPLATE	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC EA \$17.87 BSN SPORTS LLC	BBPLATE		Yes
41	Jugs 12 Softie Yellow Game Balls, B5105DZ	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$101.60	JUGS5105	12	Yes
42	Dudley SB12LND-FP 12 FastPitch Softball ASA .47 Cor Synthetic, Yellow w/Red Seam, Dozen	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$81.86 NFHS SB12, .47 COR 375 lbs.,Cork core,12" yellow leather,red stitch	DUDLEY4H311Y	12	No
43	Soft Touch Incrediball Softball, 12, Easton	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$68.80	EASTON6036651(DZ)	12	Yes
44	Spalding Dudley SB-12 Fast Pitch, Leather cover, Item 4H-311Y, Dozen	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$81.86	DUDLEY4H311Y	12	Yes
45	Jugs Pitching Machine Softballs	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC DOZEN \$34.88 BSN SPOPTS LLC MACGREGOR DIMPLED SOFTBALL-YELLOW	BBDSBALL		No
46	Easton Softball Bat SX 70B Reflex, Participants will specify size when placing orders, Each, Easton	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EACH \$56.80 Reflex is discontinued- sub AMETHYST -11oz	EASTON80738xx	1	No
47	Softball Batting Helmet w/Mounted Cage & w/Chin Strap, Schutt Sports Air Pro - Must have NOSCAE Seal, Various Sizes	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EACH \$35.99 Softball Batting Helmet,MATTE finish helmet w/Mounted White Cage & Chin Strap,NOSCAE,OSFM	RAWLINGSRCFHLFG	1	No
48	Softball Batting Helmet w/Mounted Cage & Chin Strap, Schutt Sports Air Pro Pony Tail Batting Helmet- All Colors, Must have NOSCAE Seal, Pony Tail Port	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EACH \$35.99 Softball Batting Helmet,MATTE finish helmet w/Mounted White Cage & Chin Strap,NOSCAE,OSFM	RAWLINGSRCFHLFG	1	No
49	Chest Protector - Women's Youth - All Colors, Adjustable Attachment for Custom Fit	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC EACH \$41.56 BSN SPORTS LLC MAC B81 GIRLS PROTECTOR, BLACK, ROYAL, OR SCARLET. SPECIFY COLOR ON PO	1298505		Yes

SUPPLIES CATALOG

50	Softball Screen, 6 1/2' Tall x 6'Wide with 33 X 20 pitch hole for live-arm, or machine pitching. With Ball Pouch., Each				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$238.00	BSN SPORTS LLC Collegiate 7x7 Softball Protector Screen	1399588		No
51	Women's Wide Channel TF1000, Exclusive ZK Composite Cover 2/Superior Grip and Feel, 100% Top Grade 2-Ply Nylon Windings and Butyl Rubber Bladder, Spalding				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$58.95	Z COMPOSITE IS DISCONTINUED AND REPLACED BY PRECISION	SPALDING PRECISION 768168		No

BASKETBALL

Item #	Description	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
53	AUTOGRAPH BASKETBALL Official size (29.5"). 1072501							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Laux Sporting Goods	EA	\$21.97	synthetic leather cover, 4 White panels, Official size	MARTINAB7	1	No	
54	Wilson Evolution Basketball 28.5 WTB0586, Women's, tacky feel for better control							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$68.25		WILSON WTB0586		Yes	
55	SPALDING TF-1000 LEGACY Official Size 1457054							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Laux Sporting Goods	EA	\$59.90		SPALDING768138	1	Yes	
56	SPALDING TF-1000 LEGACY Intermediate Size 1457055							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Laux Sporting Goods	EA	\$59.90		SPALDING768148	1	Yes	
57	Wilson Evolution Basketball WTB0516, 29.5, Mens, NFHS Approved							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$68.25		WILSON WTB0516		Yes	
58	Wilson Solution NCAA Game Basketball, Each							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$85.95	SOLUTION IS DISCONTINUED AND REPLACED WITH NCAA EVO NXT	WILSON WZ1003301XB7		No	
59	MONSTER BALL CART. Holds 15 official size basketballs 1162608							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Laux Sporting Goods	EA	\$221.86	Deluxe Heavy-Duty Basketball Cart, Heavy-duty 1" square steel construction Durable black powder coated finish Four locking swivel casters Three tiers hold 15 official size basketballs 50.75" L x 16" W x 34.75" H	CHAMPIONBKCART	1	No	
60	Fox Classic Whistle - MSWHIFOX							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Laux Sporting Goods	EA	\$3.59		FOX 40CLASSIC	1	Yes	
61	FOX 40 BREAKAWAY LANYARD 1383898							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	BSN Sports, LLC	doz	\$12.56	BSN SPORTS LLC Fox 40 Breakaway Lanyard - Black	1383898		Yes	
62	Mark V Basketball Score Book, Mark V							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Medco Supply	EACH	\$5.99		77060	1	Yes	
63	Anti-Whip Basketball Nets, 21 Length, 12 Loops, 288 grams							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$3.23	BSN SPORTS LLC HEAVY DUTY ANTI-WHIP NET	SNBBNWIPY		Yes	
64	The Slipp Nott, #SS60 Complete Set Base Pads w/60 Sheets							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Medco Supply	EACH	\$83.89		317223	1	Yes	
65	The Slipp Nott, #SM60 Replacement Sheets, Set of 60							
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes				
	Medco Supply	PER SET	\$39.20		17842	1	Yes	

SUPPLIES CATALOG

66 Write-on, Wipe-off Clipboard, With Basketball Court on Face, 12.5 X 18.5				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$15.54	Dry erase board 12x18",full court front,plain white back	KBARSRM1	1	No

67 Basketball Playmaker Dry Erase Board (Wall Mount Version). 1366512				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
BSN Sports, LLC	EA	\$678.00	BSN SPORTS LLC Locker Room BKB Playmaker-Wall Mount	1366512		Yes

68 Basketball Playmaker Dry Erase Board (Roll-A-Way Version) 1298840				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
BSN Sports, LLC	EA	\$1,187.00	BSN SPORTS LLC ROLL-A-WAY PLAYMAKER-BASKETBALL	1298840		Yes

69 HOT SHOT BASKETBALL SHOOTING MACHINE. 1399645				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
BSN Sports, LLC	EA	\$11,587.00	BSN SPORTS LLC Hot Shot Basketball Shooting Machine FOB DESTINATION ONLY	1399645		Yes

FOOTBALL

				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
71	Spalding ALPHA Football - Composite					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$18.89	SPALDING PRO REPLACES ALPHA COMPOSITE	SPALDING 728548	No
72	Revolution Speed Helmet, Sizes S-XL, Each, Riddell					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$239.98	sub Vengeance Pro LTD II w/att carbon steel guard,Earned a 5-star safety rating in the Virginia Tech Helmet Ratings,Equipped with a carbon steel facemask,TPU cushioning, the most advanced impact absorption system in football,absorbs more impact across a wider variety of temperatures than any other helmet on the field,Flexural resistance engineering improves the overall strength and durability of the shell in a critical location and improves impact absorption,Inflatable Surefit Air and Crown Liners along the back and sides reduces the weight of the helmet, but still gives a great, customizable fit,STOCK COLORS,PLUS \$20 for XL	SCHUTT204401	1 No
73	Footballs (1ST Quality) Leather, ST-5 NFHSA 1/2 Stripe, Rawlings					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$86.95		RAWLINGSST5AB	1 Yes
74	Rawlings ST5 Official Football, Composite, Adult Player, must be Dark Brown in Color, Rawlings					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$21.14	Soft Touch Youth Composite Football	RAWLINGSEDGECYB	1 No
75	Spalding ALPHA Varsity Size Football, Leather, Each					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Pyramid School Products	Each	\$84.95		SPALDING 726758	Yes
76	Rawlings ST 5 Modified Football					
	NO AWARD					
77	Web Belts, 60, Specify color, Riddell					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$1.09	0 1/4" WEB BELT W/ D RING 60"	MARTINFFB	1 Yes
78	Revolution Speed Helmet, XL, Riddell, Each					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$259.85	sub SIZE XL, Vengeance Pro LTD II w/att carbon steel guard,Earned a 5-star safety rating in the Virginia Tech Helmet Ratings,Equipped with a carbon steel facemask,TPU cushioning, the most advanced impact absorption system in football,absorbs more impact across a wider variety of temperatures than any other helmet on the field,Flexural resistance engineering improves the overall strength and durability of the shell in a critical location and improves impact absorption,Inflatable Surefit Air and Crown Liners along the back and sides reduces the weight of the helmet, but still gives a great, customizable fit,STOCK COLORS	SCHUTT204401	1 No
79	5-Piece Padded Girdle, Adult Sizes S-4XL, GWP-Riddell, Riddell					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$21.45	82% polyester/18% spandex,6 pocket w/ 5 built in pads	RUSSELLRAIGR4	1 No

Item ID	Description	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
80	Girdle Shells w/Pads, Pocket Lycra w/Hip Tail Asent											
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>DOZEN</td> <td>\$18.84</td> <td>FORMATION 5-PAD INTEGRATED GIRDLE w/cup pocket,Poly/spandex,4-way stretch fabric with high-compression fit,Integrated pads with perforated holes provide maximum protection and breathability,2" jaquard elastic waistband,PRICE PER EACH,NOT dozen</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	DOZEN	\$18.84	FORMATION 5-PAD INTEGRATED GIRDLE w/cup pocket,Poly/spandex,4-way stretch fabric with high-compression fit,Integrated pads with perforated holes provide maximum protection and breathability,2" jaquard elastic waistband,PRICE PER EACH,NOT dozen	CHAMPROFPGU18A	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	DOZEN	\$18.84	FORMATION 5-PAD INTEGRATED GIRDLE w/cup pocket,Poly/spandex,4-way stretch fabric with high-compression fit,Integrated pads with perforated holes provide maximum protection and breathability,2" jaquard elastic waistband,PRICE PER EACH,NOT dozen									
81	Power 5 SPK Shoulder Pad (new 2013), Each, Riddell											
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$237.60</td> <td>sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(All Purpose) All-Purpose is the shoulder pad cut,designed for a wide range of positions,Tactical Full-Arch Protection for All-Purpose impact players,Tapered V-Shape to enhance the fit,create the look and integrate well with jersey,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1"Swivel Belts for improved comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$237.60	sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(All Purpose) All-Purpose is the shoulder pad cut,designed for a wide range of positions,Tactical Full-Arch Protection for All-Purpose impact players,Tapered V-Shape to enhance the fit,create the look and integrate well with jersey,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1"Swivel Belts for improved comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit	SCHUTT801603xx	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$237.60	sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(All Purpose) All-Purpose is the shoulder pad cut,designed for a wide range of positions,Tactical Full-Arch Protection for All-Purpose impact players,Tapered V-Shape to enhance the fit,create the look and integrate well with jersey,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1"Swivel Belts for improved comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit									
82	PM19 - Pro Quarterback, Wide Receiver Pad, Power Shoulder Pads, Professional/College, S-2XL, 4311100-Riddell, Riddell											
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$237.60</td> <td>sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Skill Position) Skill is the shoulder pad cut, designed for skill positions (QB, WR, DB),Split-back arch contours to player shape and creates ultimate flexibility,Tapered V-Shape to improve fit and function,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$237.60	sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Skill Position) Skill is the shoulder pad cut, designed for skill positions (QB, WR, DB),Split-back arch contours to player shape and creates ultimate flexibility,Tapered V-Shape to improve fit and function,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit	SCHUTT801503xx	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$237.60	sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Skill Position) Skill is the shoulder pad cut, designed for skill positions (QB, WR, DB),Split-back arch contours to player shape and creates ultimate flexibility,Tapered V-Shape to improve fit and function,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit									
83	PM78 - Offensive Lineman, Shoulder Pads, Professional/College, L-5XL, 48022-Riddell, Riddell											
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$237.60</td> <td>sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Line) Line is the shoulder pad cut,designed for OL, DL,and DE positions,Sleeker arch design to enhance range of motion,Increased chest width for larger players,Wider neck opening allowing relief for better pre-snap head positioning and making line calls,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1.5" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and fit,Rear neck relief for better pre snap head positioning. "AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$237.60	sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Line) Line is the shoulder pad cut,designed for OL, DL,and DE positions,Sleeker arch design to enhance range of motion,Increased chest width for larger players,Wider neck opening allowing relief for better pre-snap head positioning and making line calls,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1.5" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and fit,Rear neck relief for better pre snap head positioning. "AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit	SCHUTT801703xx	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$237.60	sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Line) Line is the shoulder pad cut,designed for OL, DL,and DE positions,Sleeker arch design to enhance range of motion,Increased chest width for larger players,Wider neck opening allowing relief for better pre-snap head positioning and making line calls,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1.5" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and fit,Rear neck relief for better pre snap head positioning. "AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit									
84	Evolution Shoulder Pad, Each, Riddell											
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$164.92</td> <td>sub Legacy DD Adult skill position pad,designed as a multi-position pad for RB,DB,LB,TE,QB and WR.Designed as a FLAT, low profile pad, with belt's & buckles.The lightweight, streamlined design,makes it perfect for players that want solid protection and greater range of motion. The Air-Management system of open cell foam, soft removable channels, streamlined plastic shell along with 1" belts and buckles, creates the FLAT PAD Design that helps disperse the energy of contact collisions.DOUGLAS The Legacy Series,one of the most streamlined, low profile shoulder pad series on the market.</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$164.92	sub Legacy DD Adult skill position pad,designed as a multi-position pad for RB,DB,LB,TE,QB and WR.Designed as a FLAT, low profile pad, with belt's & buckles.The lightweight, streamlined design,makes it perfect for players that want solid protection and greater range of motion. The Air-Management system of open cell foam, soft removable channels, streamlined plastic shell along with 1" belts and buckles, creates the FLAT PAD Design that helps disperse the energy of contact collisions.DOUGLAS The Legacy Series,one of the most streamlined, low profile shoulder pad series on the market.	DOUGLASPLDD	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$164.92	sub Legacy DD Adult skill position pad,designed as a multi-position pad for RB,DB,LB,TE,QB and WR.Designed as a FLAT, low profile pad, with belt's & buckles.The lightweight, streamlined design,makes it perfect for players that want solid protection and greater range of motion. The Air-Management system of open cell foam, soft removable channels, streamlined plastic shell along with 1" belts and buckles, creates the FLAT PAD Design that helps disperse the energy of contact collisions.DOUGLAS The Legacy Series,one of the most streamlined, low profile shoulder pad series on the market.									

85	SPX10i - Skilled Positions, Shoulder Pads, Professional/College, S-2XL, 48030-Riddell, Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$237.60</td> <td>sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Skill Position) Skill is the shoulder pad cut, designed for skill positions (QB, WR, DB),Split-back arch contours to player shape and creates ultimate flexibility,Tapered V-Shape to improve fit and function,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$237.60	sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Skill Position) Skill is the shoulder pad cut, designed for skill positions (QB, WR, DB),Split-back arch contours to player shape and creates ultimate flexibility,Tapered V-Shape to improve fit and function,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit	SCHUTT801503xx	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$237.60	sub XV AIR Shoulder Pads(Skill Position) Skill is the shoulder pad cut, designed for skill positions (QB, WR, DB),Split-back arch contours to player shape and creates ultimate flexibility,Tapered V-Shape to improve fit and function,Ultra-Move Arch Technology for improved range of motion,1" Swivel Belts for increased comfort and range of motion,Rear neck relief for better pre-snap head positioning."AIR" is the shoulder pad cushioning,5/8" air management traditional foam cushioning throughout,Rate-sensitive impact system,Quick-dry construction,4-Piece removable air management channels for customized fit									
86	SPX50 - Fullback/Linebacker/Multi Purpose, Shoulder Pads, Professional/College, M-2XL, 48034-Riddell, Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	NO AWARD											
87	Riddell Air Pump w/Needle for Air Helmets, Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$7.84</td> <td>Air Pump w/Needle for Air Helmets</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$7.84	Air Pump w/Needle for Air Helmets	TANDEMTHP	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$7.84	Air Pump w/Needle for Air Helmets									
88	Varsity Rib Vest, Each, Riddell, Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$23.93</td> <td>AirTech Rib Vest; Varsity: S-XL</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$23.93	AirTech Rib Vest; Varsity: S-XL	CHAMPROFR3V	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$23.93	AirTech Rib Vest; Varsity: S-XL									
89	Game Socks, Specify Color, Riddell, Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Pyramid School Products</td> <td>PAIR</td> <td>\$1.98</td> <td>ALL SPORT TUBE SOCK</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Pyramid School Products	PAIR	\$1.98	ALL SPORT TUBE SOCK	PEAR SOX AS-COLOR-AD		No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Pyramid School Products	PAIR	\$1.98	ALL SPORT TUBE SOCK									
90	Polyester Practice Pant, Adult Sizes S-4XL, PPP-Riddell, Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$11.29</td> <td>Touchback adult practice pant,100% polyester Dyno-Stretch double knit fabric,No-show belt system with ten slots for the belt on the inside of the waistband,No-fly duke crotch gusset,Zig-zag sewn, envelope style thigh and knee pockets,Cover stitched for optimum durability,6 colors</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$11.29	Touchback adult practice pant,100% polyester Dyno-Stretch double knit fabric,No-show belt system with ten slots for the belt on the inside of the waistband,No-fly duke crotch gusset,Zig-zag sewn, envelope style thigh and knee pockets,Cover stitched for optimum durability,6 colors	CHAMPROFP12	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$11.29	Touchback adult practice pant,100% polyester Dyno-Stretch double knit fabric,No-show belt system with ten slots for the belt on the inside of the waistband,No-fly duke crotch gusset,Zig-zag sewn, envelope style thigh and knee pockets,Cover stitched for optimum durability,6 colors									
91	HP 5 Pocket 5 Padded Girdle, Hip, knee, thigh tail sewn in - draw string and elastic waistband, Each, Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$21.45</td> <td>82% polyester/18% spandex,6 pocket w/ 5 built in pads</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$21.45	82% polyester/18% spandex,6 pocket w/ 5 built in pads	RUSSELLRAIGR4	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$21.45	82% polyester/18% spandex,6 pocket w/ 5 built in pads									
92	Girdle - 5 Pocket, Nylon/Lycra, Draw string and elastic waistband, Each, Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$21.45</td> <td>82% polyester/18% spandex,6 pocket w/ 5 built in pads</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$21.45	82% polyester/18% spandex,6 pocket w/ 5 built in pads	RUSSELLRAIGR4	1	No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$21.45	82% polyester/18% spandex,6 pocket w/ 5 built in pads									
93	Placement Tees - 2 & Extra Point, 27540 & 27541-Riddell	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Pyramid School Products</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$5.98</td> <td></td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$5.98		CHAMPION KT2+KT3		No
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$5.98										
94	Rawlings ST5 Youth Football, Composite Leather	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Supplier</th> <th>UOM</th> <th>Unit Price</th> <th>Supplier Notes</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Laux Sporting Goods</td> <td>EACH</td> <td>\$18.95</td> <td></td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$18.95		RAWLINGSEDGECYB	1	Yes
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes									
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$18.95										
95	Football Cleat 1/2	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified								
	NO BID											

GOLF

Item ID	Description	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
97	Wrist Coach, Holds 3 x 5 Card, Assorted colors available, Each			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EACH \$3.85 Triple Window Wrist Coach	MARTINFC3	1	No
98	Laser Range Finder 250+. 1457176			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EA \$247.65	CALLAWAY250+	1	Yes
99	Nike Air Hybrid 2 Golf Bag NKN1003478			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC EA \$244.00 BSN SPORTS LLC	NKN1003478		Yes
100	Men's 10 Piece Right Handed Set 3075RHXX			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC set \$287.00 BSN SPORTS LLC	3075RHXX		Yes
101	Women's 10 Piece Right Handed Set 3076RHXX			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC set \$274.00 BSN SPORTS LLC	3076RHXX		Yes
102	Men's 10 Piece Left Handed Set 3075LHXX			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC set \$287.00 BSN SPORTS LLC	3075LHXX		Yes
103	Titleist NXT Tour Balls			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods DOZEN \$34.84 Titleist NXT Tour is N/A- sub Titleist Velocity	TitleistVelocity	12	No
104	Golf Balls, Teams logo and ball numbers (Example: Red's 1 - 4), Dozen NO BID			
105	Whiffle Golf Balls			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	School Health Corporation DOZEN \$2.83	27119PS	12	Yes
106	Golf Tees, State amount			
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods BOX \$19.58 2 3/4" WHITE WOOD (500 PK)	CAM GOLF234500	500	No

LACROSSE

				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
108	Brine Goalie Shin Guards, Non-Plastic, (Lacrosse)					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	BSN Sports, LLC	PAIR	\$29.56	BSN SPORTS LLC Stx Contour Shin Guards. BLACK OR WHITE. SPECIFY COLOR ON PO.	1391010	No
109	Brine Current Year Model Body Pad - Large, Brine Lacrosse					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$102.08	BSN SPORTS LLC MAVERIK MX EKG Goalie Chest Protector - L/XL	1459015	No
110	Brine Shoulder Pads (Lacrosse), Large					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	PAIR	\$44.89	STALLION 75 SHOULDER PAD,Meets NOCSAE standard for chest protection,Generous coverage area to protect players,Expanded adjustability for a wider range of player sizes,Modular bicep pads allow for a custom fit	STXSP75	1 No
111	MX EKG Goalie Chest Pad Must be NOCSAE approved, AnaForm chest plates & adjustable strap to reduce impact forces while allowing for freedom of movement. Sizes: S/M,					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	BSN Sports, LLC	EA	\$102.08	BSN SPORTS LLC	1459014	Yes
112	Brine Shoulder Pads (Lacrosse), Medium					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	PAIR	\$44.89	STALLION 75 SHOULDER PAD,Meets NOCSAE standard for chest protection,Generous coverage area to protect players,Expanded adjustability for a wider range of player sizes,Modular bicep pads allow for a custom fit	STXSP75	1 No
113	Brine Current Year Model Rib Pads (Lacrosse), Large					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$54.86	STALLION 200 RIB PAD,Low-profile pad offers improved protection,Strategically placed hard plastic for added protection,Adjustable straps allow for a custom fit	STXRPT2	1 No
114	Foam Goalie Throat Protector					
	NO BID					
115	Cascade Throat Protector - Current Year Model					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$26.13	BSN SPORTS LLC	1454505	Yes
116	STX Stinger Goalie Chest Protector, Each					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$73.92	SHIELD 200,Meets NOCSAE standard for chest protection,Hard plastic throughout chest plate and shoulder caps for increased protection,Multiple hinges enhance fit, allowing for unrestricted mobility,Optional stomach pad for additional coverage,Strap system offers vertical adjustability	STXCP24	1 No
117	Brine Gloves (Lacrosse)					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	PAIR	\$44.34	Stallion 75 Gloves,Ventilated palm and gussets for improved breathability,Lightweight construction in a robust polyester shell,3 piece thumb provides flexibility and control	STXS75F	1 No
118	Brine Factor Gel Arm Pads (Lacrosse)					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$33.57	Stallion 75,Generous coverage area provides protection,2 Adjustable straps,Hard plastic inserts for added protection on the elbow and ulnar nerve	STXAP75	1 No

119	Brine Current Year Model Arm Pads (Lacrosse)	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	PAIR	\$33.57	Stallion 75,Generous coverage area provides protection,2 Adjustable straps,Hard plastic inserts for added protection on the elbow and ulnar nerve
				STXAP75
				1
				No
120	Goalie Lacrosse Gloves, Various Sizes and Colors, Heavy duty goalie thumb	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	PAIR	\$98.56	Shield 300 GK Gloves,Fixed thumb guard locks in thumb for more protection,Extra protection for the tip of the thumb,Back of hand designed with reinforced protection in key areas,Durable single piece nash palm offers superior grip and stick feel
				STXSHLG
				1
				No
121	Padded Goalie Pants - Current Year Model, with poly mesh and reinforced waistband, XS-XL	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$67.88	BSN SPORTS LLC STX Breaker Goalie Pants
				1390909
				No
122	Cascade Helmet - Current Year Model, Must have NOCSAE Seal, Medium, Specify Color	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$334.00	BSN SPORTS LLC XRS PRO STD CLIP MTE HELMET
				1469197
				No
123	Men's Scorebook Lacrosse, Brine	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$6.19	BIG RED Mens Lax scorebook 24 games
				BLAZER5155
				1
				No
124	Lacrosse Coach Whiteboard, L 18.5 x H 13.5 x D 7, Each	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$15.54	MENS LACROSSE BOARD 12 x18"
				KBARSRM13
				1
				No
125	Women's Lacrosse Coaches Clipboard, Full Field on one side, Half Field on other side, Dry Erase Board	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$11.28	BSN SPORTS LLC Double Sided Wmn's Lacrosse Coach's Brd
				1388112
				Yes
126	Womens Brine Lacrosse Scorebook, Brine	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$6.19	BIG RED Womens Lax scorebook 24 games
				BLAZER5150
				1
				No
127	Official Lacrosse Balls - NOCSAE, Game - White	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	DOZEN	\$16.84	
				CHAMPROLBNW
				12
				Yes
128	LaCrosse Yellow Game Balls - NOCSAE, Girls Lax	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	DOZEN	\$16.84	
				CHAMPROLBNG
				12
				Yes
129	Goalie Stick - Current Year Model, Each	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$85.24	BSN SPORTS LLC Shield 100 Complete Stick - WE/PL
				1454248
				No
130	Official Lacrosse Nets, White, knotless nylon, minimum 5mm net	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$58.93	5MM LACROSSE NET(price per each,sold by pair)
				CHAMPIONLN55(EACH)
				2
				Yes
131	Pop-Up Lacrosse Goal, 4' x 4', Folds up easily into a handy carrying case	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$108.86	
				MARTINLG44
				Yes

SOCCER

133	Spalding TF-5000 Soccer Ball, Size 5, Each	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	Each	\$39.43	
		SPALDING 647929		Yes
134	Brine International Ball (Hand Sewn) Give Color White/Black	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$20.95	BRINE INTERNATIONAL WAS DISCONTINUED IN 2017- PLEASE REMOVE FROM SPECS
		BRINE VORACITY SBV0R4		No
135	Brine Attack Soccer Ball, Size 3, 4, 5	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$14.95	
		BRINE FB23313G5		Yes
136	NCAA Championship Soccer Ball, Must have National Federation Stamp, Brine	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$36.89	
		BRINE SBCHAMP7		Yes
137	Corner Flags, For grass field, Set of 4	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	PER SET	\$34.24	BSN SPORTS LLC SOCCER CORNER FLAGS 4/ST
		MSSOCFLGY		Yes
138	Eurosport - Adidas Tournament Ball Bag, Carry Handle and Shoulder Strap, Includes Pocket to Hold Ball Pump, Hold 15 - size 5 balls	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$29.96	
		ADIDAS5143954	1	Yes
139	Adidas Polo Goalkeeping Numbered Jersey, S-XXL	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$26.92	Goalie Jersey,100% polyester flat-back mesh body,chest,and sleeve inserts,Mitered rib v-neck,Sewn on contrasting elbow padding,Full-length sleeves,ribbed cuffs,Straight bottom,double needle hemmed,COLORS - GREEN/BK and ORANGE/BK only. INCLUDES NUMBERS front and back.
		CHAMPROSGK1-LETTERED	1	No
140	#SCAB-6 Captain Arm Bands - Any Color, For Boys and Girls, No Substitutes, 6/pkg, Kwik Goal	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	PACK	\$12.89	KWIK GOAL 6/PKG SCAB-6 IS DISCONTINUED
		CHAMPION CAP-COLOR (X6)		No
141	Twin City Soccer Socks, Full Foot, Black, Red, White	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	PAIR	\$2.88	
		TWIN CITY TSK11		Yes
142	Socks, Black & White	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	PAIR	\$1.98	
		PEAR SOX AS-COLOR-AD		
143	Model Soccer Socks - Adidas Current Year, Boys/girls, Snug fit., Polyester, nylon and lycra	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	PAIR	\$5.48	
		Adidas515xx	1	Yes
144	Diadora Practice Vest, Model 992560, Neon Yellow, Each	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$5.29	Over Vest training bib,Sr size, PINK,ORG,YEL,GREEN,RED,BLU
		SELECT68953	1	No

SUPPLIES CATALOG

145 Goalie Glove KPR012 Size 6, Brine				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
BSN Sports, LLC	PAIR	\$15.28	BSN SPORTS LLC MAC YOUTH GOALIE GLOVE SIZE 6	MCSGLVY6		No

146 Dry Erase Soccer Clipboard				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$8.93		MARTINCSO19	1	Yes

147 Soccer Score Book, For Boys and Girls, 20 Games w/extra page for Season Totals, Brine				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$5.77	BSN SPORTS LLC	MSSOCBOK		No

TENNIS

				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
149	Heavy Duty Balls Yellow, Dozen					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Laux Sporting Goods	DOZEN	\$14.50	DUNLOP601349-DZ	12	Yes
150	Penn Tennisballs Extra Duty, USTA Certified					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Pyramid School Products	DOZEN	\$14.79	PENN 521001		Yes
	3 BALLS PER CAN - 4 CANS PER DOZEN					
151	Foam Tennis Ball, Each					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$1.58	MSVOLHB2		Yes
	BSN SPORTS LLC 2-3/4" DIAM (70MM) HIGH BOUNCE FOAM BAL					
152	Extra Duty Felt Balls T1001, USTA Certified, Wilson					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Pyramid School Products	DOZEN	\$14.64	WILSON T1001		Yes
	3 BALLS PER CAN - 4 CANS PER DOZEN					
153	Wilson Championship Extra Duty Tennis Balls, USTA Certified, Case: 3 balls/Can, 72/Case					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Pyramid School Products	CASE	\$87.84	WILSON T1001		Yes
154	Scorekeeper Unit, Clamps easily to any size tennis post. Tracks both games & sets won., Steel, 16. Comes with a swivel base., Set numbers: 5 x 3, Game Numbers: 7 x 4, Each					
	NO BID					
155	Pro Tennis Net, Regulation Net 42' x 39					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$86.95	CHAMPION T2		Yes
156	GAMMA Deluxe Squeegee, Reinforced aluminum frame with 36 rubber blade., Power coated 60 handle with vinyl grip, Each					
	NO BID					
157	Coaches Cart Ball Hopper, Holds 250 Balls, 4 rubber wheels, 25 lbs					
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes		
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$184.94	1342543		No
	BSN SPORTS LLC Foldable Teaching Cart					

SWIM

159	Swim Fins, Assorted Sizes	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	PAIR	\$18.96	
		BETTER TIMESFINS	1	Yes

TRACK

161	Pyramid Spikes 3/8, 100/Pkg	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	PKG	\$9.48	
		GILL843	100	Yes

162	Pyramid Spikes 1/4, 100/Pkg	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	PKG	\$9.48	
		GILL842	100	Yes

163	Pyramid Spikes 1/2, Bag of 100	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	BAG	\$9.48	
		GILL841	100	Yes

164	Pole Vault Cross Bar, 14'10, Each	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$115.00	BSN SPORTS LLC PV-1500 ORANGE XBAR PV
		AFPV1500		Yes

165	Aluminum Hurdle, Elite, Meets IAAF Specifications and NCAA Rule 2-2-1, Adjustable to 5 Heights 30, 33, 36, 39 & 42	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	MFAC, LLC (M-F ATHLETIC)	EACH	\$231.00	
		6620-color		Yes

166	Measuring Wheel, Records up to 100,000 meters	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	School Health Corporation	EACH	\$58.15	
		54012PS	1	Yes

167	Measuring Tape Kit w/case, 1- #988 (300'/90m), 2- #985 (100'/30m), 1- #984 (50'/15m).	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$96.64	BSN SPORTS LLC
		GA982		Yes

168	Stop Watch Accu-Split #725	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$16.99	
		ACCUSPLIT AX725		Yes

169	Spray Chalk, Orange, 12/cs	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	CASE	\$87.00	BSN SPORTS LLC USSC DSCHO SPRAY CHALK OR
		DSCHO		Yes

170	Net Height Measuring Chain, Measures Mens or Womens Heights	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$8.55	
		TANDEMTSNETSET	1	Yes

VOLLEYBALL

172	Tachikara Collapsible Ball Cart	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$109.89	BLACK ONLY
				TACHIKARA B1KSPBK
173	Tandem Sport Antennae, Made of durable glass fiber, clamps attach to both the top and bottom of net, Each set includes two red and white antennae and case	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	BSN Sports, LLC	Set	\$78.00	BSN SPORTS LLC
				1451585 No
174	Tachikara SV-5WSC Volleyballs, State Color	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$28.98	
				TACHIKARA SV-5WSC No
175	Spalding TF-VB5 Series Volleyball, Leather cover, Each	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	Each	\$49.70	
				SPALDING 721358 Yes
176	Tachikara SV-5W Gold Official Volleyball	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	School Health Corporation	EACH	\$39.55	
				33014PS 1 Yes
177	Volleyball Scorebook, 1 Game per page; deciding game format, Official Volleyball Scorebook	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Laux Sporting Goods	EACH	\$5.75	23 GAME- VB SCOREBOOK
				BIG RED5020 1 No
178	Volleyball Clipboard	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes
	Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$8.90	
				CHAMPION VLBOARD Yes

WRESTLING

Item Number	Description	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
180	Mat Straps, 2W x 114L, Each			
	Supplier			
	Pyramid School Products		EACH	\$11.27
		CLIFF KEEN M57		
181	Mat Tape 4 X 84'			
	Supplier			
	BSN Sports, LLC		ROLL	\$7.28
		6406XXX		Yes
182	Gorilla Grip Mat Tape, 4 x 84'			
	Supplier			
	BSN Sports, LLC		ROLL	\$12.13
		1406245		Yes
183	Mat Cleaner			
	Supplier			
	Laux Sporting Goods		GALLON	\$59.99
		CLIFF KEENMC9	1	Yes
184	Mat Kleen Disinfectant, Cramer			
	Supplier			
	Medco Supply		GALLON	\$17.48
		081222587	1	Yes
185	KS Skin Cream for KS0012C, Kennedy Industries			
	NO BID			
186	Tornado Head Gear, PowerTaba Strapping System, Various Colors			
	Supplier			
	Laux Sporting Goods		EACH	\$31.83
		CLIFF KEENF5	1	Yes
187	Head Gear, Cliff Kleen - Any Color			
	Supplier			
	Laux Sporting Goods		EACH	\$27.89
		Cliff KeenE58	1	No
188	Wrestling Aids Nasal Plugs			
	Supplier			
	BSN Sports, LLC		PKG	\$12.17
		MU191221		Yes
189	Asic Gel Knee Pads Black/White, Asic			
	NO BID			

MISCELLANEOUS

191	Score Book, Cliff Keen	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Pyramid School Products EACH \$5.89	CLIFF KEEN SB7		Yes
192	Line-up Cards-NCR 3 copy paper, 25/package, 5802004	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods PKG \$4.78 4 part lineup cards, booklet of 25 games	MARTINLUC25	1	No
193	Heavy Duty Mesh Bag, Drawstring Closure w/Spring Lock, 24 X 36, State Color	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	School Health Corporation EACH \$1.69 RED	36125PS	1	Yes
194	Jumbo Mesh Ball Carrier, Heavy Duty, Drawstring Top and Shoulder Harness, Blue, White, Red & Yellow, Basketballs, Footballs, Volleyballs & Soccerballs	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Pyramid School Products EACH \$3.95	CHAMPION MB25		Yes
195	Ball Bag - Baseball/Softball, Heavy Duty Nylon Reinforced Vinyl, Holds 48 Baseballs or 24 Softballs	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC EACH \$13.78 BSN SPORTS LLC 1385399 BALL BAG WHILE SUPPLIES LAST	1385399		Yes
196	Orange Cone Markers, 4 Per Pkg	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods PKG \$5.32	CHAMPIONTC9-4	4	Yes
197	Game Clock, Table Top, Champion	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Pyramid School Products EACH \$15.95	CHAMPION DC100		Yes
198	Full Court Mop, 72, Wooden handle with (2) microfiber cleaning heads, Each, Tuway or equal	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Pyramid School Products EACH \$380.00	MONARCH M850072(X2)+ABCO BH2457WF+ABCO 01406NB		No
199	Baseball/Softball Scorebook, NFHS, Standard Size, 30 Game Scorebook w/16 Batting Positions and 9 Innings per Sheet, Peterson Score Master	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Pyramid School Products EACH \$3.89	PETERSON 75B1		Yes
200	Colored Mouthguards - Strapless, Adult	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC EACH \$0.43 BSN SPORTS LLC MOUTHGUARD W/O STRAP	1462029		Yes
201	Water Bottles - 32oz Plastic, Durable Plastic with push/pull top squirt ops, Set of 6	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Pyramid School Products SET \$13.92	CHAMPION WX32(X6)		Yes
202	Mouth Guard w/Strap, State Color and Size	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	Laux Sporting Goods EACH \$0.45	MARTINMGA	1	
203	Power Air Compressor, 120 Volt	Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
	Supplier UOM Unit Price Supplier Notes			
	BSN Sports, LLC EACH \$84.24 BSN SPORTS LLC	MSECOELEY		Yes

SUPPLIES CATALOG

204 Agility Ladder				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
BSN Sports, LLC	EACH	\$13.87	BSN SPORTS LLC FIXED RUNG AGILITY LADDER	1271560		Yes

205 Speed Chute, Adjustable waistband with quick release strap, Each				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
Pyramid School Products	EACH	\$13.89	48"	CHAMPRO AB23		Yes

206 Locker Room Towels-White, 20 x 40 White 5 lb.				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
School Health Corporation	DOZEN	\$16.09		48024	12	Yes

207 Whistle, Color-Black, Dozen				Vendor Item Number	Unit Pack Size	As Specified
Supplier	UOM	Unit Price	Supplier Notes			
BSN Sports, LLC	DOZEN	\$5.23	BSN SPORTS LLC MAC BLACK PLASTIC WHISTLE	3059XXXXZ		Yes