



FRANK J. JABBIA
Superintendent

PROJECT

Woodlake Elementary School
New Limestone Parking Lot
STPSB Project No. P0467

321 N. Theard St.
Covington, LA 70433
985.892.2276 • Fax 985.898.3267

DATE

April 30, 2024 – 2:00 p.m.

BIDDER	LICENSE NO.	BASE BID
21 Construction, LLC	74839	\$412,000.00
AB Gallardo Construction, LLC	73235	NO BID
Alonso, LLC	76669	\$347,000.00
APC Construction	51053	\$557,922.00
BEI General Contractors (Barbara Enterprises)	30088	\$437,541.35
Bernard Brothers, LLC	18052	NO BID
Beverly Construction, LLC	35678	\$466,935.00
Brunt Construction, Inc.	6328	NO BID
Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc.	12198	\$421,000.00
Chase Excavating, LLC	78514	NO BID
Command Construction	40038	\$693,500.00
Durr Heavy Construction, LLC	4674	\$513,000.00
Hendrick Construction, Inc.	61167	NO BID
Kort's Construction Services, Inc.	49356	NO BID
LA Contracting Enterprise	34263	\$496,844.00
Otwell Services, LLC	75850	\$367,479.00
Richard Price Contracting Co., LLC	14807	NO BID
Thompson Construction Co.	2239	\$557,500.00
Treuting, Inc.	2887	NO BID
White Group Partners, LLC	65362	NO BID
Willis Construction Co.	37657	\$426,806.76
Wolf Group Construction	59207	NO BID

THIS LIST OF BIDS IS POSTED FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A DETERMINATION WHETHER THERE WILL BE AN AWARD OF A PROJECT TO A BIDDER, AND IS NOT DEMONSTRATIVE OF WHETHER A PARTICULAR BIDDER IS RESPONSIVE OR THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW. THE ST. TAMMANY PARISH SCHOOL BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT OR REFUSE TO AWARD ANY OR ALL BIDS IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW.