



**FRANK J. JABBIA**  
Superintendent

321 N. Theard St.  
Covington, LA 70433  
985.892.2276 • Fax 985.898.3267

**PROJECT**

Bonne Ecole Elementary School  
HVAC Replacement  
STPSB Project No. P0473

**DATE**

April 9, 2024 – 3:00 p.m.

BIDDER	LICENSE NO.	BASE BID	ALTERNATE NO. 1	TOTAL
Sharkey Mechanical Services, LLC	68229	\$549,000.00	\$69,000.00	\$618,000.00
LouMis Air, LLC	68122	\$626,100.00	\$67,800.00	\$693,900.00
Trison Conststruction Co.	55781	\$689,000.00	\$89,000.00	\$778,000.00
BGSN Mechanical, LLC	75699	\$763,721.00	\$55,687.00	\$819,408.00
Metro Mechanical, Inc.	32212	\$800,000.00	\$66,000.00	\$866,000.00
Dove Group, LLC	56568	\$865,000.00	\$90,000.00	\$955,000.00
Gootee Construction, Inc.	8	\$1,058,000.00	\$88,000.00	\$1,146,000.00
Blanchard Mechanical Contractors, Inc.	13794	NO BID	NO BID	
Cajun Innovative Solutions	75661	NO BID	NO BID	
Calcasieu Mechanical Contractors	23795	NO BID	NO BID	
CDX Construction, LLC	62427	NO BID	NO BID	
Gallo Mechanical, LLC	1027	NO BID	NO BID	
Johnson Controls	504	NO BID	NO BID	
New Image Property, LLC	44077	NO BID	NO BID	
Star Service, Inc.	34465	NO BID	NO BID	

*THIS LIST OF BIDS IS POSTED FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A DETERMINATION WHETHER THERE WILL BE AN AWARD OF A PROJECT TO A BIDDER, AND IS NOT DEMONSTRATIVE OF WHETHER A PARTICULAR BIDDER IS RESPONSIVE OR THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW. THE ST. TAMMANY PARISH SCHOOL BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT OR REFUSE TO AWARD ANY OR ALL BIDS IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW.*