



FRANK J. JABBIA
Superintendent

321 N. Theard St.
Covington, LA 70433
985.892.2276 • Fax 985.898.3267

PROJECT
Slidell High School
Ninth Street Building Renovations - Phase I
STPSB Project No. P0449

DATE
April 9, 2024 – 2:00 p.m.

BIDDER	LICENSE NO.	BASE BID	ALTERNATE NO. 1	TOTAL
Voelkel McWilliams	46298	\$1,493,000.00	\$293,000.00	\$1,786,000.00
Ellison Builders, LLC	41426	\$1,665,500.00	\$310,000.00	\$1,975,500.00
Smith Construction Company	33374	\$1,675,311.00	\$270,000.00	\$1,945,311.00
Hopkins Construction & Maintenance, LLC	73164	\$1,726,000.00	\$505,000.00	\$2,231,000.00
Blanchard Construction Company	62353	NO BID	NO BID	
Brunt Construction	6328	NO BID	NO BID	
CDX Construction, LLC	62427	NO BID	NO BID	
Crescent City Remodeling, LLC (CCR)	60718	NO BID	NO BID	
Cuzan Services, LLC	45474	NO BID	NO BID	
Dixon Contracting Group, LLC	61971	NO BID	NO BID	
Kent Design Build	35232	NO BID	NO BID	
L&M Louisiana's Contractor, LLC	75769	NO BID	NO BID	
NOLA Build Contracting Services	68621	NO BID	NO BID	
Sieverding Construction, Inc.	43074	NO BID	NO BID	
Spartan Building Corporation	4805	NO BID	NO BID	
Star Service, Inc.	34465	NO BID	NO BID	
Steele-R Development	55757	NO BID	NO BID	
Taylor Enterprises of Louisiana, LLC	47282	NO BID	NO BID	
TEH Enterprise, LLC	56590	NO BID	NO BID	
Tyler Towers Roofing & Construction, LLC	71724	NO BID	NO BID	

THIS LIST OF BIDS IS POSTED FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A DETERMINATION WHETHER THERE WILL BE AN AWARD OF A PROJECT TO A BIDDER, AND IS NOT DEMONSTRATIVE OF WHETHER A PARTICULAR BIDDER IS RESPONSIVE OR THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW. THE ST. TAMMANY PARISH SCHOOL BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT OR REFUSE TO AWARD ANY OR ALL BIDS IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW.