BID RESULTS

Site 4 Elementary Schools A d f

Project Security Vestibules e o r

ITB 24-00-15

Bid Due Date 4/16/2024 SCHOOL DISTR

Bidders Outlier Construction LLC Adroit Construction Co., Inc. Taylor Site Development, Inc. Vitus Construction, Inc.
Hoover Base Bid $57,600.00 NO BID $64,591.65 $47,000.00
Howard Base Bid $89,100.00 NO BID $126,071.22 $74,900.00
Howard Add Alternate 1 $3,960.00 $4,800.00 $12,706.82 $6,500.00
Jefferson Base Bid $76,300.00 NO BID $89,175.00 $66,000.00
Griffin Creek Base Bid $82,800.00 NO BID $103,925.08 $71,700.00

*If All 4 awarded $305,800.00 $284,500.00 $383,732.95 $266,100.00
Time Bid Received 4/16/2024 - 1:44 P.M 4/16/2024 - 1:37 P.M. 4/16/2024 - 1:38 P.M. 4/16/2024 - 1:38 P.M.
CCB Number 217660 44384 133046 63643

Bid Bond YES YES YES YES
Addenda Acknowledged (4) YES YES YES YES

Bid Form Signed YES YES YES YES

1st Tier Sub Contractors (4) YES YES YES YES




