



FRANK J. JABBIA

Superintendent

321 N. Theard St.
Covington, LA 70433
985.892.2276 • Fax 985.898.3267

PROJECT

Salmen High School
Female Sports Locker Room and Home Side Concessions
STPSB Project No. P0435

DATE

April 4, 2024 – 2:00 p.m.

BIDDER	LICENSE NO.	BASE BID	ALTERNATE NO. 1
ARL Construction, Inc.	16992	NO BID	
Barbara Enterprises, Inc.	30088	\$1,612,174.00	\$184,650.00
Brunt Construction	6328	\$1,597,300.00	\$212,300.00
BSD Construction, LLC	39998	\$1,895,000.00	\$295,500.00
Centric Gulf Coast, Inc.	57595	\$2,099,000.00	\$345,000.00
CM Combs Construction, LLC	55237	\$2,039,000.00	\$273,000.00
Del-Con, LLC	64047	NO BID	
Dixon Contracting Group, LLC	61971	NO BID	
Ellison Builders, LLC	41426	\$1,889,000.00	\$266,500.00
Gootee Construction, Inc.	8	NO BID	
Jireh Construction Group	67077	NO BID	
Kent Design Build	35232	NO BID	
NOLA Build Contracting Services	68621	NO BID	
P&W Construction Co., Inc.	35207	NO BID	
Ryder & Ryder Construction, LTD	43144	NO BID	
Sieverding Construction, Inc.	43074	NO BID	
Spartan Building Corporation	4805	\$1,518,500.00	\$200,000.00
Steele-R Development	55757	\$1,698,000.00	\$280,000.00
Tasch, LLC	45736	\$1,998,000.00	\$298,000.00

THIS LIST OF BIDS IS POSTED FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A DETERMINATION WHETHER THERE WILL BE AN AWARD OF A PROJECT TO A BIDDER, AND IS NOT DEMONSTRATIVE OF WHETHER A PARTICULAR BIDDER IS RESPONSIVE OR THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW. THE ST. TAMMANY PARISH SCHOOL BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT OR REFUSE TO AWARD ANY OR ALL BIDS IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW.