

Printing Services RFP#24-001, Contract period is April 1, 2024, to March 31, 2025

	COMPANY NAME	Checkomatic.com 28029	Company Printing 3723	Longhorn Office Pro Concho Business 1156	Q's Printing & Design 13302	Rangel Printing 18827
	ADDRESS	308 Museum Village RD Monroe, NY 10950	3419 Knickerbocker Rd San Angelo, TX 76904	3302 Foster Street San Angelo, TX 76903	20 Howard Street Ste 8 San Angelo, TX 76901	1502 W Beauregard San Angelo, TX 76901
	CONTACT NAME	Miriam Joseph	Lorenzo Lasater	David Snider	Helen S Marshall	Manuel Rangel
	PHONE #	845.781.7675 X112	325.949.9941	32.949.1697	325.944.2942	325.653.9889
	FAX #	215.243.8047	325.947.8113	325.944.7427	325.944.0994	325.655.4053
	E-MAIL	Miriami@checkomatic.com	lorenzo@companyprinting.com	dsnider@longhornop.com	suzi@gspd.com	rangelprinting@yahoo.com
	WEB	www.checkomatic.com	www.companyprinting.com	www.myworksmart.com	www.gspd.com	
Item #	Description & Quantity					
1	AEIS Report – approx. 200 pages 8 ½ x 11 finished – front & back – 20 lb white inner pages black only – cover 1 sided, green card stock cover 65 lb (Full color) & 5 card stock divider sheets black only 1 sided – GBC or spiral binding on 11" side - 60 copies	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26081 1218.48	705.00	130.77	2,500.00
2	Superintendent Note Cards – 6 ¼ x 9 ¼ score card print 1 side – (A6) 6 ½ x 4 ¾ envelope (address on flap) – both card and envelope Natural Astroparche – 1 color - 1000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26082 395.13	310.00 allow 10 days for the paper-nonstock item from Mill	212.28	645.00
3	Business Cards – 3 ½ x 2 – 2 color with bleed 3 sides – white card stock 80 lb		Estimate #26083			
3a	Box of 250	\$ NO BID	35.83	25.90	52.32	48.00
3b	Box of 500	\$ NO BID	43.01	31.10	69.98	70.00
3c	Box of 1000	\$ NO BID	62.00	40.50	79.98	112.00
4	Program – Lake View Graduation – 2 sheets 8 ½ x 11 (folded and Saddle stitched) – Nature Linen finish cover 80 lb, inner page natural linen 24 lb - 1 Color - 3000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26084 1265.44	NO BID	977.54	3,500.00
5	Program – Central Graduation – 3 sheets 11 x 17 (folded and Saddle stitched – 8 ½ x 11 finished size) – Natural Linen finish cover 80 lb, inner pages natural linen 24 lb – 1 color - 5000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26085 6552.02	NO BID	3,250.62	8,000.00
6	Graduation Tickets – 4 ¼ x 3 white card stock 80 lb – 2 color – perforated once - 6000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26086 306.31	NO BID	431.97	1,500.00
7	Cuddle Gram Form – 2 part carbonless NCR paper – 5 ½ x 8 ½ finished forms – Top 2 hole punch & top 5 ½ edge glued - 1000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26087 206.23	155.75	163.31	250.00

Printing Services RFP#24-001, Contract period is April 1, 2024, to March 31, 2025

		Checkomatic.com	Company Printing	Longhorn Office Pro Concho Business	Q's Printing & Design	Rangel Printing
8	Athletic Participation Form – 2 sheets 11 x 17 card stock 65 lb – front & back black only – 8.5 x 11 finished size – Saddle stitched – page 5 perforated on vertical and horizontal (horizontal perf does NOT go all the way through) - 6000 ct	\$ NO BID	1000 Quantity Estimate #26088 778.93	NO BID	2,392.21	3,000.00
9	Football Season Ticket Order Form – 8 ½ x 3 ½ card 67 white Bristol card stock – front only – black only - 600 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26089 36.27	38.00	55.58	215.00
10	San Angelo Relay Note card – 4 ¾ x 5 ¼ white card stock 80lb, front & back print – black only - 120 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26090 21.82	30.00	33.31	106.00
11	Sideline Pass – 3 x 8 ½ - printed front only – Bright paper – laminated – single top hole punch - 100 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26091 90.99	NO BID	93.09	225.00
12	Athletic Season Pass – Business Card – Full Color – white card stock 80 lb - 100 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26092 17.01	25.00	34.75	48.00
13	Player Pass – 3 ¾ x 2 5/8 card stock – printed front only *Full Color					
13a	(Volleyball/Basketball) Green: 65 lb - 1500 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26093 40.94	59.00	66.09	250.00
13b	(Football) White: 80 lb - 1200 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26094 32.76	48.00	59.98	225.00
14	Forms – 8 ½ x 5 ½ card stock 65 lb – printed 2 sided black only					
14a	Pastels Colors: 300 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26095 42.21	37.50	72.03	133.50
14b	Pastels Colors: 1000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26095 118.58	120.00	115.48	445.00
14c	(Hot Colors) Brights: 300 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26096 45.95	40.00	75.34	133.50
14d	(Hot Colors) Brights: 1000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26096 148.63	125.00	126.54	445.00

Printing Services RFP#24-001, Contract period is April 1, 2024, to March 31, 2025

		Checkomatic.com	Company Printing	Longhorn Office Pro Concho Business	Q's Printing & Design	Rangel Printing
15	Forms – 8 ½ x 11 card stock 65 lb – printed 2 sided black only					
15a	White: 300 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26097 71.46	85.00	91.34	267.00
15b	White: 1000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26097 196.20	170.00	163.36	890.00
15c	Pastels Colors: 300 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26098 72.27	58.00	91.34	267.00
15d	Pastels Colors: 1000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26098 198.90	174.95	163.36	890.00
15e	(Hot Colors) Brights: 300 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26099 79.77	65.00	94.34	267.00
15f	(Hot Colors) Brights: 1000 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26099 233.88	195.31	173.49	890.00
16	Forms – 2 part NCR 8 ½ x 11 – 2 color (all parts same) – top 8 ½ edge glued - 1000 ct Examples: Central HS AGR Information Form	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26131 283.70	235.20	392.66	425.00
17	Forms – 3 part NCR 8 ½ x 11 – black only (all parts same) – top 8 ½ edge glued - 300 ct Examples: Code of Conduct Violation Form	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26132 136.19	164.00	122.56	275.00
18	Forms – 8 ½ x 5 ½ – black only (all parts same) – top 8 ½ edge glued					
18a	2 part NCR: 200 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #326134 78.79	67.43	59.54	150.00
18b	3 part NCR: 200 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26133 87.45	74.46	70.54	175.00
19	Forms – 4 ¼ x 5 ½ - black only (all parts same) – top 4 ¼ edge glued					
19a	2 part NCR: 200 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26135 70.94	58.60	49.26	150.00
19b	3 part NCR: 200 ct	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26136 83.64	69.17	55.70	175.00
20	Padded Forms – 5 ½ x 8 ½ form – black only – 1 sided – padded per 50 - 1 -price per pad	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26137 6.49	0.85	1.51	175.00
21	Padded Forms – 8 ½ x 3 ½ form – black only – 1 sided – padded per 50 - 1 -price per pad	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26138 5.35	0.65	4.05	5.00/per pad
22	Padded Forms – 5 ½ x 4 ¼ - black only – 1 sided – padded per 50 - 1 - price per pad	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26139 4.79	0.69	2.07	5.00/per pad
23	Letterhead – natural linen, 24 lb, 2 color - 3000 ct	\$ 205.5	Estimate #26140 468.27	541.10	507.32	1,050.00

Printing Services RFP#24-001, Contract period is April 1, 2024, to March 31, 2025

		Checkomatic.com	Company Printing	Longhorn Office Pro Concho Business	Q's Printing & Design	Rangel Printing
24	#10 Envelopes – printed return address – 24 lb natural linen					
24a	1 Color: 1 case (2,500)	\$ 145.95	Estimte #26141 386.92	623.25	400.80	225.00
24b	2 Color: 1 case (2,500)	\$ 215.00	Estimate #26142 411.08	648.25	400.80	275.00
25	#10 Window Envelopes – printed return address – 24 lb white					
26a	1 Color: - 1000 ct	\$ 72.95	Estimate #26144 130.37	106.25	124.19	200.00
26b	2 Color: - 1000 ct	\$ 129.95	Estimate #26143 192.74	150.06	124.19	225.00
27	Reproduce a set of Blue Prints - Each	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26146 2.70	NO BID	n/a	n/a
28	Reproduce Large district boundary Maps – 1 side - black only, 24 lb white					
28a	11 x 17 Each	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26145 1.35	0.18	1.75	N/A
28b	22 x 34 ½ Each	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26146 2.70	NO BID	15.57	N/A
28c	36 x 44 Each	\$ NO BID	Estimate #26147 6.75	NO BID	33.00	N/A