

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM

AWARDED VENDOR LIST

BID TITLE: K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES		SPONSORING DISTRICT:	
BID NUMBER: P2023-8		DISTRICT CONTACT:	
CONTRACT PERIOD: Jan. 1, 2024 - Dec. 31, 2024		MINIMUM FREE FREIGHT: \$50.00	
LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY		DELIVERY: 30 Calendar Days ARO	
VENDOR NAME	ADDRESS	PHONE/FAX NUMBER WEBSITE	CONTACT NAME
Pyramid School Products - include "#P2023-8" on all orders	6510 N 54th Street Tampa, FL 33610	800-792-2644 x240- Toll Free 800-792-2644 x248- Cust Svc	
School Specialty - include bid #Q-397328 on all orders	W6316 Design Drive Greenville, WI 54942	888-388-3224 - Toll Free 310-200-5778 - Sales	
Southwest School & Office Supply	1500 S Dupont Ontario CA 91761	800-227-7159 - Toll Free 909-980-7777 - Direct	
ODP Business Solutions	6600 N Military Trail Boca Raton, FL 33496	888-263-3423 - Toll Free 512-890-0652 - Direct	

NORTH COUNTY EDUCATIONAL PURCHASING CONSORTIUM - BID AWARD

BID TITLE: K-6 ELEMENTARY ART SUPPLIES

SPONSORING DISTRICT:

MINIMUM FOR FREE SHIPPING \$50.00

BID NUMBER: P2023-8

DISTRICT CONTACT:

LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: 2.5% PER DAY

CONTRACT PERIOD: 01/01/24 - 12/31/24

DELIVERY: 30 CALENDAR DAYS ARO

ITEM #	EST USAGE	UNIT OF ISSUE	ITEM OF SPECIFICATION/DESCRIPTION	Vendor	Manufacturer & Mfr. Model Number	Vendor Stock Number	Price	
1	837	Each	Clay, modeling, four 1/4lb sticks/box, permanently pliable, 4 colors red, green, blue, yellow, individually wrapped sticks , Prang #00740, Crayola #57-0300, School Smart 2003083, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	DIXON 00740	221532	\$ 1.30	
2	15,177	Box	Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Primary, 8 assorted colors/box, Crayola 52-0080, Dixon Prang 51800, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 52-0080	413440	\$ 0.53	
3	1,160 30026	Box	Crayons, 4" x 7/16", Large Primary, 16 assorted colors/box, Crayola 52-0336, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	ODP	CRAYOLA 52-0336	949677	\$ 1.30	
4	9,648	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 8 colors/box, 12 box/carton, Crayola 52-3008, Prang DIX00000, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 52-3008	603573	\$ 0.27	
5	7,511	Box	Crayons, 3-5/8" x 5/16", 16 colors/box, Crayola 52-3016, Prang DIX00100, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	ODP	CRAYOLA 52-3016	565528	\$ 0.39	
6	477	Each	Glitter, 1 lb, Pacon-Spectra P0091XXX, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	PACON			
				Blue	SOUTHWEST	PACON 91750	409367	\$ 5.15
				Gold	SOUTHWEST	PACON 91780	477735	\$ 5.15
				Green	SOUTHWEST	PACON 91760	409363	\$ 5.15
				Multi	SOUTHWEST	PACON 91790	812178	\$ 5.15
				Red	SOUTHWEST	PACON 91740	409360	\$ 5.15
Silver	SOUTHWEST	PACON 91710	409368	\$ 5.15				
7	4,116	Each	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, plastic bottle, 4 oz, 12/carton, Sanford Elmer's E304, School Smart 2124032, Staples ST39417, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	STAPLES ST39417	855975	\$ 0.53	
8	300	Gal	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, 1 gallon size, 2/carton, Sanford Elmers #E340, School Smart 2124031, Staples ST39921, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	STAPLES ST39921	886373	\$ 9.92	

9	699	Each	Glue, white, polyvinyl, washable, plastic bottle, POINTED TIP , 8 oz, 12/carton, Sanford Elmers #E308NR School Smart 2124033, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	ELMERS E308NR	405827	\$ 1.02	
10	15,567	Set	Markers, Classic Colors, Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 8 colors/set, Crayola 58-7808, Dixon Prang #80680. ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	PYRAMID	PRANG 80680	1174630	\$ 1.59	
11	7,916	Set	Markers, Classic Colors, NON-WASHABLE, Water Soluble, Water-Based Ink. MADE IN AMERICA. Broad Line Conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 8 colors/set. Crayola #58-7708, Dixon Prang #80128. AP Certified Non-Toxic. ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 58-7708	445743	\$ 1.33	
12 30065	2,652	Set	Markers, Washable Broad line conical tip for both thick and thin lines; 12 colors/set, Must wash from skin, clothing and painted walls; Crayola 58-7812, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 58-7812	382256	\$ 2.34	
13	615	Jar	Paint, finger, liquid, 16 oz, Crayola 55-1316-XXX, School Smart 20024XX, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA			
				Black	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316051	823824	\$ 1.86
				Blue	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316042	636599	\$ 1.86
				Brown	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316007	1111576	\$ 1.86
				Green	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316044	823822	\$ 1.86
				Orange	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316036	824006	\$ 1.86
				Red	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316038	636675	\$ 1.86
				Violet	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316040	824007	\$ 1.86
				White	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316053	823825	\$ 1.86
Yellow	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 551316034	636676	\$ 1.86				
14	8,763	Jar	Paint, Tempera, liquid, 16 oz, plastic bottle complete with dispensing tops, paint bottle must have a seal; all colors available, Sunburst #3500-XX, Crayola Arista II 54-3115XXX, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST			
				Black	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500BK	24536626	\$ 1.52
				Blue	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500BE	24536573	\$ 1.52
				Brown	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500BN	24536568	\$ 1.52
				Green	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500GN	24536601	\$ 1.52
				Magenta	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500MA	24536599	\$ 1.52
				Orange	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500OE	24536620	\$ 1.52
				Peach	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500PH	24536614	\$ 1.52
				Red	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500RD	24536625	\$ 1.52
Turquoise	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500TE	24536616	\$ 1.52				

				Violet	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500VT	24536611	\$ 1.52
				White	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500WE	24536598	\$ 1.52
				Yellow	SOUTHWEST	SUNBURST 3500YW	24536584	\$ 1.52
15	948	Set	Paint, Water Color, 8 oval pans, assorted, with brush , 12 sets/carton, Prang #00800, Crayola 53-0080, or equal, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING		SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 53-0080	430745	\$ 1.42
16	4,527	Set	Paint, Water Color, 8 oval pans, assorted, with brush, 12 sets/carton, Crayola Artista II 53-1508, NO SUBSTITUTE, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING		SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 53-1508	823973	\$ 1.55
17	300	Rolls	Paper, Art Craft, 36" wide x 1000', 50lb, Duo-Finish. Pacon ArtKraft P00670XX, Color-Brite #5560XX		SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST COLORBRITE		
				Aqua	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560AQ	24538358	\$ 64.75
				Autumn Gold	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560GD	24543618 (gold)	\$ 66.15
				Black	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560BK	24538379	\$ 60.67
				Bright Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560GN	24543594	\$ 73.13
				Brown	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560BN	24543599	\$ 55.41
				Canary	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560CY	24538549	\$ 61.58
				Dark Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560DBE	24543590	\$ 57.68
				Emerald Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560EGN	24538411	\$ 55.69
				Flame Red	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560FRD	24538546	\$ 65.25
				Gray	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560GY	24538441	\$ 63.97
				Light Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560LGN	24538436	\$ 64.20
				Orange	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560OE	24538502	\$ 64.02
				Pink	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560PK	24543615	\$ 61.93
				Purple	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560PE	24543619	\$ 64.26
				Scarlet	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560ST	24543616	\$ 58.62
Sky Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560SBE	24543598	\$ 63.28				
White	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5560WE	24538466	\$ 54.73				
18	408	Rolls	Paper, Art Craft, 36" wide x 1000', 40lb, FIRE/FLAME RETARDANT , All colors. Pacon-Decolor P1012-XX, Southwest 5550XX		SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST		
				Black	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550BK	24538452	\$ 85.64
				Blue	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550BE	24538486 sapphire	\$ 82.56
				Dark Brown	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550DBN	24543605	\$ 93.06
				Emerald	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550FGN	24543608	\$ 97.81
				Festive Green	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550FGN	24543608	\$ 97.81
				Festive Red	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550FRD	24543601	\$ 95.68
				Orange	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550OE	24543603	\$ 95.62
				Pink	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550PK	24543596	\$ 89.74
				Purple		DISCONTINUED		

				Red	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550FRD	24543601	\$ 95.68
				Sky Blue	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550SBE	24543598	\$ 89.72
				White	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550WE	24538463	\$ 74.51
				Yellow	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST 5550YW	24543606	\$ 91.30
			Paper, Construction, 9"x12", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76# basis, 50% recycled fiber content & recyclable. All colors incl. asstd. (brightness & range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray P102XXX and P103XXX, Color-Brite 5690		SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST COLORBRITE		
				Almond	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Assorted	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690AD	24545693	\$ 1.67
				Black	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690BK	24545667	\$ 1.67
				Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690BE	24545686	\$ 1.67
				Brilliant Lime	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Chartreuse	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690CE	24538454	\$ 1.67
				Dark Brown	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690DBN	24545668	\$ 1.67
				Dark Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690DGN	24538418	\$ 1.67
				Dark Pink	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Electric Orange	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Festive Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690FGN	24545694	\$ 1.67
				Festive Red	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690FRD	24545689	\$ 1.67
				Gold	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690GD	DISCONTINUED	
				Gray	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690SGY	24538465 slate gray	\$ 1.67
				Holiday Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690HGN	24545692	\$ 1.67
				Hot Lime	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690HLE	24545652	\$ 1.67
				Hot Pink	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690HPK	24545659	\$ 1.67
				Holiday Red	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690HRD	24545657	\$ 1.67
				Light Brown	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690LBN	24538483	\$ 1.67
				Light Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690LGN	--	\$ 1.67
				Lilac	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690LC	24538527	\$ 1.67
				Magenta	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690MA	24545650	\$ 1.67
				Orange	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690OE	24545665	\$ 1.67
				Pearl Gray	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690PGY	24545648	\$ 1.67
				Pink	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRIGE 5690PK	24545649	\$ 1.67
				Pumpkin	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690PN	24538425	\$ 1.67
				Purple	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690PE	24545696	\$ 1.67
				Red	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690RD	24545643	\$ 1.67
				Royal Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690RBE	24545697	\$ 1.67
				Salmon	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690SN	24545695	\$ 1.67
				Shocking Pink	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Sky Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690SBE	24545644	\$ 1.67
				Tan	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690TN	24538385	\$ 1.67
19	9,785	Pkg						

20	39,059	Pkg	

Paper, Construction, 12"x18", 50 sheets/pkg, 100% vat-dyed sulphite, acid free, 76# basis, 50% recycled fiber content and recyclable. All colors including assorted (brightness and range of colors important) Pacon Tru-Ray P102XXX and P103XXX, Color-Brite 5700XX

Turquoise	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690TE	24545645	\$ 1.67
Violet	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690VT	24556376	\$ 1.67
Warm Brown	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690WBN	24545651	\$ 1.67
White	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690WE	24538360	\$ 1.67
Yellow	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5690YW	24545660	\$ 1.67
	SOUTHWEST	SOUTHWEST COLORBRITE		
Almond	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Assorted	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700AD	24538505	\$ 3.20
Black	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700BK	24538442	\$ 3.20
Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700BE	24538481	\$ 3.20
Bright Neon Yellow	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700BNY	24543589	\$ 3.20
Chartreuse	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700CE	24538520	\$ 3.20
Dark Brown	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700DBN	24543613	\$ 3.20
Dark Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700DGN	24538445	\$ 3.20
Electric Orange	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Festive Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700FGN	24543614	\$ 3.20
Festive Red	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700FRD	24543602	\$ 3.20
Gold	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700GD	24543604	\$ 3.20
Holiday Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700HGN	24538419	\$ 3.20
Holiday Red	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700HRD	24538420	\$ 3.20
Hot Lime	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700HLE	24543607	\$ 3.20
Hot Pink	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700HPK	24543610	\$ 3.20
Light Brown	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700LBN	24538462	\$ 3.20
Light Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700LGN	24538535	\$ 3.20
Light Yellow	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700LYW	24538538	\$ 3.20
Lilac	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700LC	24538431	\$ 3.20
Magenta	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700MA	24543593	\$ 3.20
Orange	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700OE	24538421	\$ 3.20
Pearl Gray	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700PGY	24543597	\$ 3.20
Pink	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700PK	24538432	\$ 3.20
Pumpkin	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700PN	24538460	\$ 3.20
Purple	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700PE	24543595	\$ 3.20
Red	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700RD	24538440	\$ 3.20
Royal Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700RBE	24543600	\$ 3.20
Salmon	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700SN	24538524	\$ 3.20
Shocking Pink	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Sky Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700SBE	24538478	\$ 3.20
Slate Gray	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700SGY	24538437	\$ 3.20
Sunshine Yellow	SOUTHWEST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

				Tan	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700TN	24538429	\$ 3.20
				Turquoise	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700TE	24538484	\$ 3.20
				Violet	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700VT	24543591	\$ 3.20
				Warm Brown	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700WBN	24543611	\$ 3.20
				White	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700WE	24538383	\$ 3.20
				Yellow	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 5700YW	24538422	\$ 3.20
21	2,847	Qr	Paper, Tissue, 20"x30" sheets, quire folded, colored, 24 sheets/quire, all colors, Pacon Kolorfast	Apple Green		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Black		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Brown		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Dark Pink		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Holly Green		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Light Blue		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Light Pink		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Navy		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Orange		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Purple		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Scarlet		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Turquoise		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				White		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
				Yellow		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
22	947	Box	Pastels, Oil, 12 colors/box, Pentel #PHN12, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON	ODP	PENTEL PHN12	222851	\$ 0.82	
23	1,289	Set	Pencils, colored 8 assorted colors/set, pre-sharpened, 3.3mm core. Crayola #68-4008, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 68-4008	641607	\$ 0.87	
24	29,679	Set	Pencils, Colored, 12 assorted colors/set, Crayola 68-4012, Prang #22120, School Smart 245787, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	SCHOOL SMART 245787	245787	\$ 0.85	
25	300	Set	Pencils, Colored, 24 assorted colors/set, Crayola 68-4024, Prang #22240, School Smart 245788, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	ODP	CRAYOLA 68-4024	550996	\$ 1.40	
26	1,201	Set	Pencils, Watercolor, 12 Color Set, Crayola 68-4302, NO SUBSTITUTE, ACMI AP SEAL & "CONFORMS TO ASTM D 4236" STATEMENT REQUIRED ON PRODUCT PACKAGING	SOUTHWEST	CRAYOLA 68-4032	414851	\$ 1.84	
			Yarn, Acrylic roving, 8 oz, 3 ply, 150 yard (450 foot) skein, all colors, Pacon Trait-Tex P0007XXX, Imperial Color-Brite 3900XX	SOUTHWEST	IMPERIAL COLORBRITE			
			Black	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900BK	24538300	\$ 7.15	
			Brown	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900BN	24538293	\$ 7.15	
			Dark Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900DBE	24538302	\$ 7.15	

27	1,215	Each
-----------	--------------	------

Dark Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900DGN	24538299	\$ 7.15
Hot Pink	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900HPK	24538303	\$ 7.15
Lavender	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900LR	24538294	\$ 7.15
Light Blue	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900LBE	24538301	\$ 7.15
Light Green	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900LGN	24538297	\$ 7.15
Orange	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900OE	24538296	\$ 7.15
Purple	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900PE	24538295	\$ 7.15
Red	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900RD	24538291	\$ 7.15
White	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900WE	24538292	\$ 7.15
Yellow	SOUTHWEST	COLORBRITE 3900YW	24538298	\$ 7.15