



FRANK J. JABBIA
 Superintendent

321 N. Theard St.
 Covington, LA 70433
 985.892.2276 • Fax 985.898.3267

PROJECT

Folsom Elementary School
 Additional Parking and Car Stacking Lane
 STPSB Project No. P0397

DATE

February 28, 2024 – 2:00 p.m.

BIDDER	LICENSE NO.	BASE BID	ALTERNATE NO. 1
21 Construction, LLC	74839	NO BID	
Brunt Construction	6328	\$450,700.00	-\$10,300.00
Casco Contracting, LLC	62490	NO BID	
Durr Heavy Construction, LLC	4674	\$399,508.00	-\$13,000.00
JAC Construction of South Louisiana, LLC	58607	\$393,650.00	-\$21,250.00
Jim Toy 5 Contracting, LLC	69929	\$400,000.00	
JJH Construction Co.	72409	\$615,745.00	-\$22,000.00
Kort's Construction Services, Inc.	49356	\$545,000.00	-\$13,000.00
Landry's Construction Services	70346	NO BID	
Madden Gulf Coast, LLC	73475	NO BID	
McLin Construction, LLC	42839	NO BID	
Omega Foundation Services, Inc.	69770	NO BID	
Otwell Services, LLC	75850	\$497,835.00	-\$16,277.00
RHA Construction, LLC	73503	NO BID	
Triple B Construction & Fence Co., Inc.	26719	NO BID	
Warner Construction, Inc.	60826	NO BID	

THIS LIST OF BIDS IS POSTED FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES ONLY AND DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A DETERMINATION WHETHER THERE WILL BE AN AWARD OF A PROJECT TO A BIDDER, AND IS NOT DEMONSTRATIVE OF WHETHER A PARTICULAR BIDDER IS RESPONSIVE OR THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW. THE ST. TAMMANY PARISH SCHOOL BOARD RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REJECT OR REFUSE TO AWARD ANY OR ALL BIDS IN ACCORDANCE WITH LAW.