



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting of January 6, 2024

Bid # 24-075 Oxygen, Acetylene and Welding Supplies District-Wide

1	OXYGEN CYLINDER 125 LD CUBIC FEET						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$14.00	1st Vendor of Choice		
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$14.04	2nd Vendor of Choice		
2	OXYGEN 244 K CUBIC FEET						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$15.13	1st Vendor of Choice		
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$17.00	2nd Vendor of Choice		
3	OXYGEN R-20 CUBIC FEET						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$9.96	1st Vendor of Choice		
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$11.00	2nd Vendor of Choice		
4	OXYGEN R-40 CUBIC FEET						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$12.00	1st Vendor of Choice		
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$13.44	2nd Vendor of Choice		
5	ACETYLENE CYLINDER #3						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$35.00	1st Vendor of Choice		
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$44.06	2nd Vendor of Choice		
6	ACETYLENE CYLINDER #4						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$48.00	1st Vendor of Choice		
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$65.68	2nd Vendor of Choice		
7	ACETYLENE #5						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$110.00	1st Vendor of Choice		
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$129.74	2nd Vendor of Choice		
8	ACETYLENE B						
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price			
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$22.00	1st Vendor of Choice		
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$28.12	2nd Vendor of Choice		



Board Meeting of January 6, 2024

Bid # 24-075 Oxygen, Acetylene and Welding Supplies District-Wide

9 MC ACETYLENE

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$13.00	1st Vendor of Choice
Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$16.35	2nd Vendor of Choice

10 ARGON MIX WITH CO2

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	YLINDER T330 CUBIC FEE	\$49.94	1st Vendor of Choice
Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	YLINDER T330 CUBIC FEE	\$55.00	2nd Vendor of Choice

11 STRAIGHT CO2

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	\$23.00	1st Vendor of Choice
Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	\$28.00	2nd Vendor of Choice

12 CHLORINE CYLINDER, 150 LB

Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	
Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	CYLINDER	No Bid	
Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	CYLINDER	No Bid	

13 WELDING RELATED SUPPLIES - % PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	
Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	AS NEEDED	30.0%	Recommended
Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	AS NEEDED	10.0%	Recommended

14 WELDING RELATED MATERIALS - % PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	
Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	AS NEEDED	30.0%	Recommended
Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	AS NEEDED	10.0%	Recommended

15 WELDING RELATED TOOLS - % PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	
Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	AS NEEDED	30.0%	Recommended
Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	AS NEEDED	5.0%	Recommended

16 STEEL PRODUCTS, % PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

Supplier	QTY	UOM	% Discount	
Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	AS NEEDED	No Bid	
Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	AS NEEDED	No Bid	



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting of January 6, 2024
 Bid # 24-075 Oxygen, Acetylene and Welding Supplies District-Wide

17	DAILY DUMMERAGE CHARGE	QTY	UOM	Price	1st Vendor of Choice	2nd Vendor of Choice
	Supplier					
	Linde Gas & Equipment Inc. (Praxair Distribution Inc.)	1	EA	\$0.40		
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	EA	\$0.45		

18	% PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM TRADE CATALOG	QTY	UOM	% Discount	Recommended
	Supplier				
	Two Frontiers Welding Supply LLC	1	AS NEEDED	5.0%	Recommended