
I HAVE A QUESTION. WHO SHOULD I CONTACT?
W h e r e  t o  s t a r t ?  U s e  t h i s  g u i d e  w h e n  y o u  h a v e  a  c o n c e r n  o r  q u e s t i o n  t o  r e s o l v e :

TEACHING AND
LEARNING

TRANSPORTATION ATHLETICS/EXTRA
CURRICULARS

TAX QUESTION

Step 1: Begin by contacting your
student's classroom teacher as
they are best equipped to
address classroom-related
issues. If a student encounters
an issue that falls outside of
their teacher's area of expertise
or influence, you will be directed
towards a school counselor or
another staff member. 

Step 2: If you are not able to
resolve your concern with the
teacher, then contact the school
Principal or Assistant Principal. 

Step 3: If you are unable to
resolve your concern with the
above channels contact the
Office of the Superintendent.
You may be directed to a District
Administrator. 

Step 1: Contact your teacher
sponsor or coach. 

Step 2: If you are not able to to
resolve your concern from the
teacher sponsor or coach then
contact the Athletic Director:

MS Athletics Office 
HS Athletics Office

Step 3: If you are not able to
resolve your concern with the
Athletics office , then contact
the school Principal or Assistant
Principal. 

Step 4: If you are unable to
resolve your concern with the
above channels contact the
Office of the Superintendent.
You may be directed to a District
Administrator. 

Step 1: Contact the
Transportation Department or
610-853-5929.

Step 2: Contact the Director of
Transportation, or 610-853-
5929.

Step 3: Contact your Principal
and Anthony Testa, Business
Manager or 610-853-5900
x7106. 

Contact Desiree Riccardelli at
610-853-5916 or Email: Tax
Office

School Information:
Elementary Family Handbook

HMS Students Handbooks
HHS School Student & Family Handbook

Chatham Park Elementary
Chestnutwold Elementary
Coopertown Elementary
Lynnewood Elementary

Manoa Elementary

HMS Contact Information
HHS Contact Information
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mailto:transportation@haverfordsd.net
mailto:atesta@haverfordsd.net
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https://docs.google.com/document/d/1c8qaBbsAnhcw5RcvwSIGV63fvCWeQvrADtIgyjvjrzM/edit?usp=sharing
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/fs/pages/2679
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/fs/pages/2737
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/home-chatham-park/chatham-park/contact-us
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/home-chestnutwold/chestnutwold/contact-us
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/home-coopertown/coopertown/contact-us
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/home-lynnewood/lynnewood/contact-us
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/home-manoa/manoa/contact-us
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/home-middle-school/haverford-middle-school/administration
https://www.haverford.k12.pa.us/home-high-school/haverford-high-school/contact-us

