

**WILLIAMSVILLE CENTRAL SCHOOL DISTRICT - BID TABULATION**

<b>COPY PAPER BID 2023-07</b>			<b>W.B MASON CO.</b>			<b>EATON OFFICE SUPPLY</b>		
<b>ITEM DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>UOM</b>	<b>QTY</b>	<b>PER CASE COST (including delivery)</b>	<b>CATALOG ITEM #</b>	<b>ESTIMATED DELIVERY TIME AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER</b>	<b>PER CASE COST (including delivery)</b>	<b>CATALOG ITEM #</b>	<b>ESTIMATED DELIVERY TIME AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER</b>
Cardstock white 8.5 x 11, 90lb, 2000/case	CS	1	No Bid			97.60	WAU40311	1-2 days
Cardstock white 8.5 x 11, 90lb, 2000/case 40 case/pallet	PALLET	1	No Bid			97.60	WAU40311	3-5 days
Cardstock color 8.5 x 11, 90lb, 2000/case - BLUE, CANARY, GREEN, PINK, SALMON	CS	1	No Bid			No Bid		
Cardstock color 8.5 x 11, 90lb, 2000/case 40 case/pallet - BLUE, CANARY, GREEN, PINK, SALMON	PALLET	1	No Bid			No Bid		
Paper white 8.5 x 11, 20lb, 5000/case	CS	1	41.70	WBM21200	1-2 days	45.50	10578959	1-2 days
Paper white 8.5 x 11, 20lb, 5000/case 40 case/pallet	PALLET	1	40.46	WBM21200 SKID	2-5 days	44.50	10578959	3-5 days
Paper white 8.5 x 11, 20lb, 5000/case 40 case/pallet 840 case/truckload	TRUCK	1	39.46	WBM21200 TLOAD	7-14 days	43.50	10578959	5-7 days
Paper white 8.5 x 14, 20lb, 5000/case	CS	1	63.22	BLZ44200	3-10 days	68.50	HAM105015	1-2 days
Paper white 8.5 x 14, 20lb, 5000/case 40 case/pallet	PALLET	1	61.22	BLZ44200 SKID	3-10 days *30 case per skid	66.50	HAM105015	3-5 days
Paper white 11 x 17, 20lb, 2500/case	CS	1	48.83	BLZ48110	3-10 days	55.00	HAM105023	1-2 days
Paper white 11 x 17, 20lb, 2500/case 40 case/pallet	PALLET	1	47.67	BLZ48110 SKID	3-10 days	55.00	HAM105023	3-5 days
Paper bright color 8.5 x 11, 20lb, 5000/case - BLUE, LIGHT GREEN, ORANGE, YELLOW, PINK, RED	CS	1	No Bid			No Bid		
Paper bright color 8.5 x 11, 20lb, 5000/case 40 case/pallet - BLUE, LIGHT GREEN, ORANGE, YELLOW, PINK, RED	PALLET	1	No Bid			No Bid		
Paper color 8.5 x 11, 20lb, 5000/case - PINK, YELLOW, BLUE, GREEN, GOLD, TAN, LAVENDER, SALMON	CS	1	51.70	WBM22201XX	1-4 days * Tan is discontinued	79.50	HAM103... or UNV112...	
Paper color 8.5 x 11, 20lb, 5000/case 40 case/pallet - PINK, YELLOW, BLUE, GREEN, GOLD, TAN, LAVENDER, SALMON	PALLET	1	49.90	WBM22201XX SKID	3-10 days * Tan is discontinued	79.50	HAM103... or UNV112...	
Envelope #10 Standard sub 24 white, 2500/case	CS	1	65.00	WBM35210	1-3 days	72.50	BSN42250	
Envelope #10 Window sub 24 white, 2500/case	CS	1	132.00	WBM35211	1-3 days	140.00	UNV36321	
Envelope #10 Window tint security sub 24 white, 2500/case	CS	1	No Bid			149.00	UNV35203	
Envelope #10 Bottom Feed - Reverse Flap window w/security tint, 2500/case	CS	1	No Bid			No Bid		

\* Pricing above is good through December 16, 2022.