

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS							
Bid: IFB No. 24-24 Fire Alarm Replacement at Five Schools							
Due: Tuesday, December 12, 2023							
Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)							
Vendor Name	Base Bid A - Barbour/Breakout	Base Bid B - Eisenhower/Breakout	Base Bid C - Linclon/Breakout	Base Bid D - RESA/Breakout	Base Bid E - Jefferson/Breakout	Alt. No. 1	Alt. No. 2
Kelso-Burnett	\$342,000.00	\$709,000.00	\$703,000.00	\$515,000.00	\$988,000.00	\$2,850 - add	\$2,850 - add
Miller Engineering Co.	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$15,000 - add	\$11,000 - add
SMG Security	\$798,926.00	\$1,218,372.00	\$1,605,402.00	\$1,025,146.00	\$1,915,137.00	\$3,000 - add	\$3,000 - add
Bid Opening Official:							Dane Youngblood
Bid Recording Official:							Casey Ramas

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS							
Bid: IFB No. 24-24 Fire Alarm Replacement at Five Schools							
Due: Tuesday, December 12, 2023							
Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)							
Vendor Name	Unit Price No. 1	Unit Price No. 2	Unit Price No. 3	Unit Price No. 4	Unit Price No. 5	Unit Price No. 6	Unit Price No. 7
Kelso-Burnett	\$1,095.00	\$935.00	\$885.00	\$930.00	\$825.00	\$935.00	\$825.00
Miller Engineering Co.	\$1,850.00	\$850.00	\$700.00	\$1,000.00	\$22.50	\$25.00	\$27.50
SMG Security	\$1,522.00	\$500.00	\$493.00	\$554.00	\$135.00	\$139.00	\$143.00
Bid Opening Official:							Dane Youngblood
Bid Recording Official:							Casey Ramas