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EDUCATIONAL SERVICES COMMISSION OF NEW JERSEY
COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #65MCESCCPS
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL BID # ESCNJ 16/17-22 BID DATE: 8/25/16
BID TERM: 10/21/16- 10/20/18; Extended through 10/20/19
| | | | | | | | |
That the Executive Committee award the Gasoline & Diesel Fuel Bid #ESCNJ 16/17-22 from 10/21/16 to 10/20/18 as follows:
Pricing is based on the Qil Price Information Service (OPIS) daily petroleum prices for Newark, New Jersey plus a fixed adder as stated
‘ ‘ ‘ in thT Bid Propos‘al Pricing Sheet.

GASOLINE & DIESEL-Regular Grade- YEAR ONE

National Fuel Inc. Petroleum Traders
BERGEN 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid $0.5000 $0.5000 $0.2000 $0.1500 $0.0500| $0.05008 $0.1050]

National Fuel Inc. Petroleum Traders
HUDSON 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700->
Bid Price: $2.0000 $0.5000 $0.4000 $0.2500 $0.1500 $0.1000 $0.0500| $0.05008 $0.1050]

National Fuel Inc. Petroleum Traders
ESSEX 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $2.0000 $0.5000 $0.4000 $0.2000 $0.0750 $0.0650 $0.0500| $0.05008 $0.1050]

National Fuel Inc. Petroleum Traders
PASSAIC 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.1500 $0.1000 $0.0500|  $0.0500f $0.1050]

National Fuel Inc. Petroleum Traders
UNION 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.4000 $0.3000 $0.2000 $0.0800 $0.0700 $0.0500|  $0.0400§ $0.1050]

National Fuel Inc. Petroleum Traders
MIDDLESEX 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.4500 $0.3500 $0.2000 $0.0700 $0.0600 $0.0500|  $0.0500f $0.1050]

National Fuel, Inc. Petroleum Traders
MORRIS 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.4000 $0.1000 $0.0800 $0.0600/  $0.06004 $0.1050]

National Fuel, Inc. Petroleum Traders
SOMERSET 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000j 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050]

Petroleum Traders
SUSSEX 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150§ $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

WARREN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150§ $0.1050}
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EDUCATIONAL SERVICES COMMISSION OF NEW JERSEY
COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #65MCESCCPS
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL BID # ESCNJ 16/17-22

BID DATE: 8/25/16

BID TERM: 10/21/16- 10/20/18

| |
GASOLINE & DIESEL-Reg_;uIar Grade- YEAR ONE
Petroleum Traders
HUNTERDON 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000} 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350] $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders
MERCER 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000} 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders
MONMOUTH 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000} 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
OCEAN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
BURLINGTON 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000( 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
CAMDEN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
GLOUCESTER 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000] 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Petroleum Traders
ATLANTIC 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
SALEM 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000] 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
CUMBERLAND 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000] 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
CAPE MAY 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
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EDUCATIONAL SERVICES COMMISSION OF NEW JERSEY

COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #65MCESCCPS
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL BID # ESCNJ 16/17-22
BID DATE: 8/25/16 BID TERM: 10/21/16- 10/20/18

GASOLINE & DIES‘EL-ReguIar G‘rade- YEAR ‘TWO
National Fuel Qil, Inc. Petroleum Traders
BERGEN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No Bid No Bid $0.5000 $0.5000 $0.2000 $0.1500 $0.0500|  $0.0500( $0.1050]
National Fuel Qil, Inc. Petroleum Traders
HUDSON 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $2.0000 $0.5000 $0.4000 $0.2500 $0.1500 $0.1000 $0.0500|  $0.0500( $0.1050]
National Fuel Qil, Inc. Petroleum Traders
ESSEX 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $2.0000 $0.5000 $0.4000 $0.2000 $0.0750 $0.0650 $0.0500|  $0.0500( $0.1050}
National Fuel Qil, Inc. Petroleum Traders
PASSAIC 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.1500 $0.1000 $0.0500|  $0.0500( $0.1050}
National Fuel Qil, Inc. Petroleum Traders
UNION 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.4000 $0.3000 $0.2000 $0.0800 $0.0700 $0.0500| $0.04008 $0.1050}
National Fuel Qil, Inc. Petroleum Traders
MIDDLESEX 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.4500 $0.3500 $0.2000 $0.0750 $0.0600 $0.0500|  $0.0500( $0.1050}
National Fuel Qil, Inc. Petroleum Traders
MORRIS 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid $0.4000 $0.1000 $0.0800 $0.0600/  $0.0600) $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
SOMERSET 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
National Fuel Qil, Inc. Petroleum Traders
SUSSEX 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
WARREN 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
HUNTERDON 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
MERCER 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350] $0.1150 $0.1050
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EDUCATIONAL SERVICES COMMISSION OF NEW JERSEY
COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #65MCESCCPS
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL BID # ESCNJ 16/17-22

BID DATE: 8/25/16

BID TERM: 10/21/16- 10/20/18

GASOLINE & DIESEL-Regular Grade- YEAR TWO

Petroleum Traders

MONMOUTH 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

OCEAN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

BURLINGTON 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350] $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

CAMDEN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350] $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

GLOUCESTER 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350] $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

ATLANTIC 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

SALEM 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

CUMBERLAND 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050]
Petroleum Traders

CAPE MAY 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000§ 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bidl $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050}
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EDUCATIONAL SERVICES COMMISSION OF NEW JERSEY
COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #65MCESCCPS
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL BID # ESCNJ 16/17-22
BID DATE: 8/25/16 BID TERM: 10/21/16- 10/20/18
| | | | | | |
DIESEL & HEATING OIL YEAR ONE - # 2 Heating, Ultra Low Sulfur
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

BERGEN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $2.0000 $1.0000 $0.5000 $0.2900 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0500| $0.0500 $0.0500]
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

HUDSON 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $1.0000 $0.5000 $0.2500 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0800 $0.0500| $0.0500 $0.0500]
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

ESSEX 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.5000 $0.2500 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0700 $0.0500|  $0.0500 $0.0500}
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

PASSAIC 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $2.0000 $1.0000 $0.5000 $0.2900 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0500|  $0.0500 $0.0500}
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

UNION 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.5000 $0.2500 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0700 $0.0500|  $0.0500 $0.0500}
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

MIDDLESEX 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.5000 $0.2500 $0.2000 $0.0750 $0.0700 $0.0500|  $0.0500 $0.0500}
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

MORRIS 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700->
Bid Price: No bid $1.0000 $0.5000 $0.3500 $0.1800 $0.0700 $0.0500|  $0.0500 $0.0500

Petroleum Traders
SOMERSET 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f] 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
SUSSEX 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000j 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
WARREN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000j 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
HUNTERDON 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000§ 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
MERCER 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000§ 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350] $0.1150 $0.1050}
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EDUCATIONAL SERVICES COMMISSION OF NEW JERSEY
COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #65MCESCCPS
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL BID # ESCNJ 16/17-22

BID DATE: 8/25/16

BID TERM: 10/21/16- 10/20/18

DIESEL & HEATING OIL YEAR ONE - # 2 Heating, Ultra Low Sulfur

Petroleum Traders

MONMOUTH 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders

OCEAN 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders

BURLINGTON 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders

CAMDEN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders

GLOUCESTER 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders

ATLANTIC 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000] 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders

SALEM 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders

CUMBERLAND 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000] 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders

CAPE MAY 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000f 3001-6000, 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >

Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
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EDUCATIONAL SERVICES COMMISSION OF NEW JERSEY
COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #65MCESCCPS
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL BID # ESCNJ 16/17-22

BID DATE: 8/25/16

BID TERM: 10/21/16- 10/20/18

DIESEL & HEATING OIL YEAR TWO - # 2 Heating, Ultra Low Sulfur

National Fuel Qil, Inc.

BERGEN 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699|8700- >

Bid Price: $2.0000 $1.0000 $0.5000 $0.2900 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0500| $0.0500 $0.0500]
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

HUDSON 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $1.0000 $0.5000 $0.2500 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0800 $0.0500| $0.0500 $0.0500]
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

ESSEX 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.5000 $0.2500 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0700 $0.0500| $0.0500 $0.0500]
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

PASSAIC 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $2.0000 $1.0000 $0.5000 $0.2900 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0500| $0.0500 $0.0500]
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

UNION 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.4500 $0.2500 $0.2000 $0.1000 $0.0700 $0.0500| $0.0500 $0.0500]
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

MIDDLESEX 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: $0.5000 $0.5000 $0.2500 $0.2000 $0.0750 $0.0700 $0.0500|  $0.0500 $0.0500}
National Fuel Qil, Inc.

MORRIS 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000| 6001-7500D7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid $1.0000 $0.5000 $0.3500 $0.1800 $0.0700 $0.0500/  $0.0500 $0.0500}

Petroleum Traders
SOMERSET 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000§ 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
SUSSEX 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000§ 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
WARREN 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000§ 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350) $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
HUNTERDON 1-200 201-500/ 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000j 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050}
Petroleum Traders
MERCER 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000§ 3001-6000| 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350] $0.1150 $0.1050}
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EDUCATIONAL SERVICES COMMISSION OF NEW JERSEY
COOPERATIVE PRICING SYSTEM #65MCESCCPS
GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL BID # ESCNJ 16/17-22

BID DATE: 8/25/16

BID TERM: 10/21/16- 10/20/18

DIESEL & HEATING OIL YEAR TWO # 2 Heating, Ultra Low Sulfur ‘
Petroleum Traders
MONMOUTH 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000] 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
OCEAN 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000] 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
BURLINGTON 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000] 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
CAMDEN 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000] 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
GLOUCESTER 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000] 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
ATLANTIC 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000f 6001-7500 7501-> 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
SALEM 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000] 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
CUMBERLAND 1-200 201-500| 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000] 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350| $0.1150 $0.1050
Petroleum Traders
CAPE MAY 1-200 201-500 501-1000| 1001-2000| 2001-3000| 3001-6000] 6001-7500| 7501-8699 8700- >
Bid Price: No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid $0.2200 $0.1350 $0.1150 $0.1050
|




