

BID TAKER: Mark Custer

| ITEM NUMBER | TOTAL BID:          |  | REQUIRED? | BIDDER:            | Carl Bolander & Sons | Rachel Contracting | Veit & Company  |      |      |      |
|-------------|---------------------|--|-----------|--------------------|----------------------|--------------------|-----------------|------|------|------|
|             | LOW BIDDER:         |  |           |                    |                      |                    |                 |      |      |      |
|             | \$ 1,086,550        | Next Apparent Low Bidder                               |           | PHONE NUMBER:      |                      |                    |                 |      |      |      |
|             |                     | Delta Between Low and Next Bid (%)                     |           | CONTACT:           |                      |                    |                 |      |      |      |
|             |                     | Threshold  |           | EMAIL:             |                      |                    |                 |      |      |      |
|             | 3                   | Bids Received  |           | SELECT BIDDER?:    |                      |                    |                 |      |      |      |
|             | \$ -                | Trade Budget   |           | ORIGINAL BASE BID: | \$ 1,086,550.00      | \$ 1,062,800.00    | \$ 2,106,479.00 | \$ - | \$ - | \$ - |
| Reference   | General Scope Items |  | y         |                    |                      |                    |                 |      |      |      |
| 1           | 1 Add. Issued       | Number of Addenda Received                             | y         | ONE INCLUDED       | ONE INCLUDED         | ONE INCLUDED       |                 |      |      |      |
| 2           |                     | Bid Security if \$175,000 or more                      | y         | INCLUDED           | INCLUDED             | INCLUDED           |                 |      |      |      |
| 3           | 00 41 05            | Responsible Contractor Verification & Compliance Form  | y         | INCLUDED           | INCLUDED             | INCLUDED           |                 |      |      |      |
| 4           | 00 41 10            | A-1 and A-2 Supplements to Responsible Contractor Form | y         | INCLUDED           | INCLUDED             | INCLUDED           |                 |      |      |      |
| 5           |                     | Contract Award Eligibility Criteria                    | y         | INCLUDED           | INCLUDED             | INCLUDED           |                 |      |      |      |
|             |                     | Sales Tax Required?                                    |           |                    |                      |                    |                 |      |      |      |
|             |                     | 0.000%   |           |                    |                      |                    |                 |      |      |      |
|             | ADJUSTED BASE BID   |  |           |                    | \$1,086,550.00       | \$1,062,800.00     | \$2,106,479.00  |      |      |      |

| Alternates                        |                                   | REQ? | Selected Low Bidder: Alternate | Carl Bolander & Sons | Rachel Contracting | Veit & Company  | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
|-----------------------------------|-----------------------------------|------|--------------------------------|----------------------|--------------------|-----------------|--------|--------|--------|
|                                   | not applicable to this work scope | n    |                                | n/a                  | n/a                | n/a             | \$ -   | \$ -   | \$ -   |
| ADJUSTED BASE BID WITH ALTERNATES |                                   |      |                                | \$ 1,086,550.00      | \$ 1,062,800.00    | \$ 2,106,479.00 |        |        |        |

| Unit Prices |   | REQ? | Selected Low Bidder: Unit Prices | Carl Bolander & Sons | Rachel Contracting | Veit & Company | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
|-------------|---|------|----------------------------------|----------------------|--------------------|----------------|--------|--------|--------|
|             | UP1: Removal of regulated soils from site / ton     | n    |                                  | \$ 45.00             | \$ 34.20           | \$ 55.00       | \$ -   | \$ -   | \$ -   |
|             | UP2: Removal of unregulated soils from site / CY    | n    |                                  | \$ 23.00             | \$ 22.50           | \$ 44.00       | \$ -   | \$ -   | \$ -   |
|             | UP3: Add satisfactory replacement soil to site / CY | n    |                                  | \$ 23.00             | \$ 22.10           | \$ 34.00       | \$ -   | \$ -   | \$ -   |
|             | UP4: Removal of buried debris / ton                 | n    |                                  | \$ 45.00             | \$ 35.90           | \$ 64.00       | \$ -   | \$ -   | \$ -   |
|             |   |      |                                  |                      |                    | \$ -           | \$ -   | \$ -   | \$ -   |