

23-025-10-24
Data Cabling and AV Installation
OPENS: 10/10/23, 11 AM

		COMPANY NAME:	Elite Solutions
		ADDRESS:	6895 Timplin Ct San Angelo, TX 76904
		CONTACT PERSON:	Jon C. Kinsey
		PHONE:	3256515733
		FAX:	3256515713
		E-MAIL	chris.kinsey@elitesolution.com
Data Cabling Pricing Section			
SAISD reserves the right to award individual items			
Item #		Each Price	
Price Per Drop indoor-rated CAT6 Copper Cabling			
Circle all of the district approved brands of cable you provide. Commscope, Systimax, Ortronics, Panduit, Leviton, Hitachi, Berk-Tek			
1	Installation of network drop of 1-10 per drop	Price Per Drop	\$ 290.00
2	Installation of network drop of 11-25 per drop	Price Per Drop	\$ 290.00
3	Installation of network drop of 26-50 per drop	Price Per Drop	\$ 290.00
4	Installation of network drop of 51-100 per drop	Price Per Drop	\$ 290.00
Price Per Installed Foot for terminated fiber optic cable			
Circle all of the district approved brands of cable you provide. Optical Cable Corp, Superior, Systimax, Belden, Mohawk, Leviton, Essex			
5	Six (6) strand multimode 50/125m	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 3.86
6	Six (6) strand multimode 8/125m	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 3.15
7	Twelve (12) strand multimode 50/125	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 4.59
8	Eighteen (18) strand multimode 50/125m	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 6.93
Price per drop RG6 and RG11 indoor rated			
Specify the vendor cable you will use for this section.			
9	Installation of RG6 coaxial drops of 1-10	Price Per Drop	\$ 333.00
10	Installation of RG6 coaxial drops of 11-25	Price Per Drop	\$ 333.00
11	Installation of RG6 coaxial drops of 26-50	Price Per Drop	\$ 333.00
12	Installation of RG6 coaxial drops of 51-100	Price Per Drop	\$ 333.00
13	Installation of RG11 coaxial drops of 1-10	Price Per Drop	\$ 699.00
Price per foot for installation of HDMI cable with the designated footage			
Installation of cable with the designated footage listed below: HDMI cabling, active rating, standard or 4K definition			
14	Installation of HDMI cabling per foot 25ft	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 556.00
15	Installation of HDMI cabling per foot 50ft	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 634.00
16	Installation of HDMI cabling per foot 75ft	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 751.00
17	Installation of HDMI cabling per foot 100ft	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 852.00
18	Installation of HDMI cabling per foot 125ft	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 897.00
19	Installation of HDMI cabling per foot 150ft	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 962.00
20	Installation of HDMI cabling per foot 175ft	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 1,034.00
21	Installation of HDMI cabling per foot 200ft	Price Per Installed Foot	\$ 1,086.00

AV Installation , installed products could include but are not limited to TV's, Interactive Panels, and Projectors.			
Item #			
New Installs Pricing			
Total price for AV installation including the following: mounting of the mount, mounting of the device, removal of debris and trash accumulated during installation, and removal of boxes off site at			
22	Installation price per new AV device 1-10	Price Per Installed Device	\$ 550.00
23	Installation price per new AV device 11-25	Price Per Installed Device	\$ 550.00
24	Installation price per new AV device 26-50	Price Per Installed Device	\$ 550.00
25	Installation price per new AV device 50-100	Price Per Installed Device	\$ 550.00
26	Installation price per new AV device 100+	Price Per Installed Device	\$ 550.00
Most new installations will require electrical plugs added state your price per linear foot for electrical runs including supplies and materials.			
27	Price per linear foot: 0-25ft	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
28	Price per linear foot: 26-50ft	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
29	Price per linear foot: 51-75ft	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
30	Price per linear foot: 76-100ft	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
31	Price per linear foot: 100ft+	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
Relocation Pricing			
Price per AV Device re-location including the following: Removal of device and mount from previous location, re-locate device and mount to the new designated area, Installation of Mount and Device in new location.			
32	Relocation price per new AV device 1-10	Price Per Relocated Device	\$ 550.00
33	Relocation price per new AV device 11-25	Price Per Relocated Device	\$ 550.00
34	Relocation price per new AV device 26-50	Price Per Relocated Device	\$ 550.00
35	Relocation price per new AV device 50-100	Price Per Relocated Device	\$ 550.00
36	Relocation price per new AV device 100+	Price Per Relocated Device	\$ 550.00
Some Relocations will require electrical plugs added. State your price per linear foot for electrical runs including supplies and materials.			
37	Price per linear foot: 0-25ft	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
38	Price per linear foot: 26-50ft	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
39	Price per linear foot: 51-75ft	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
40	Price per linear foot: 76-100ft	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid
41	Price per linear foot: 100ft+	Price Per Installed Foot	No Bid

Bid Questionnaire		
1	Are you a member of a Purchasing Co-op.	Yes or No Yes
	If YES, state the name of the co-op and your awarder contract number	
	Co-op Name	TIPS
	Contract #	200-105 & 220-704
2	Did you attach copy of your certification for installing your bided products?	Yes or No Yes
3	Once a request is made, State your average response time.	
4	Do you support after-hours emergency requests (ex: nights, weekends, holiday) in case of a critical outage?	Yes or No Yes
	At times San Angelo ISD has additional repairs that arise outside of the normal business hours, are you willing to do additional work outside of the normal business hours?	Yes or No Yes
	If YES, State your Labor rates	
	Regular Time Skilled	75
	Regular Time Unskilled	75
	Over Time Skilled	112.5
	Over Time Unskilled	112.5
	Materials Mark up	25%
5	Will you perform other wireing needs not stated in the bid at your hourly rate plus materials and markup?	Yes or No Yes
	If YES, State your other wiring and cabeling services you offer.	Intercom, Access Control, Video Surveillance