

Board Meeting of May 2, 2023
 RFP # 23-172 Purchase of New Service Vehicles District-Wide

1	<p>Ford F350 XL crew cab DRW 4x4 with steel service bodies and aluminum service bodies for mechanic trucks with towing package. Engine 6.7 power truck diesel. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier Southwest CDJR Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville</p>	<p>Price \$82,138.50 No Bid</p>	<p>Recommended</p>	<p>Delivery Time 8 to 10 months</p>
2	<p>Ford F450 XL crew cab DRW 4x4 with steel service bodies and aluminum service bodies for mechanic trucks with towing package. Engine 6.7 power truck diesel. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier Southwest CDJR Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville</p>	<p>Price \$85,103.50 No Bid</p>	<p>Recommended</p>	<p>Delivery Time 8 to 10 months</p>
3	<p>Ford F550 XL crew cab DRW 4x4 with steel service bodies and aluminum service bodies for mechanic trucks with towing package. Engine 6.7 power truck diesel. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier [ALT] Southwest CDJR Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville Southwest CDJR</p>	<p>Price \$92,990.00 No Bid No Bid</p>	<p>Recommended</p>	<p>Delivery Time 8 to 10 months</p>
4	<p>Ford F250 XL crew cab 4x4 SRW truck with towing package. Engine 6.7 power truck diesel. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier Tipton Ford Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville Southwest CDJR</p>	<p>Price \$69,855.00 No Bid No Bid</p>	<p>Recommended</p>	<p>Delivery Time In Stock</p>
5	<p>Ford Van - F250 engine V-8. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier Southwest CDJR Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville</p>	<p>Price No Bid No Bid</p>	<p>Recommended</p>	<p>Delivery Time</p>



Board Meeting of May 2, 2023
 RFP # 23-172 Purchase of New Service Vehicles District-Wide

6	<p>Ford Pickup - F150 cab 1/2 engine V-6. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier Southwest CDJR Brownsville Toyota Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville</p>	<p>Price \$37,450.00 \$52,896.00 No Bid</p>	<p>1st vendor of choice 2nd vendor of choice</p>	<p>Delivery Time 6 TO 8 MONTHS</p>
7	<p>Ford Pickup - F250 cab 1/2 engine V-8 Gas. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier [ALT] Southwest CDJR Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville Southwest CDJR</p>	<p>Price \$57,990.00 No Bid No Bid</p>	<p>Recommended</p>	<p>Delivery Time NO UPFIT - 6 MONTHS</p>
8	<p>Chevrolet Express w/supreme body. 12,300#GVWR, 6.0L-V8 Gas, 177" Wheelbase, 6-SPD Automatic, vinyl buckets (2), Air condition, AM/FM Stereo, wide angle mirrors, 14" x 85" h x 96" w supreme body, waltco flipaway C2088 32" x 72" +4 2000# Lift gate, bed toggle control rubber bumpers, mud flaps, supreme #70423-071118-120810. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier Southwest CDJR Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville</p>	<p>Price No Bid No Bid</p>		<p>Delivery Time</p>
9	<p>2023 Honda Civic - 22-33 city miles / 28-42 Hwy MPG. Fuel efficient, comfortable, well-build and loaded. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier Brownsville Toyota Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville Southwest CDJR</p>	<p>Price \$24,104.00 \$24,980.00 \$28,808.50</p>	<p>1st vendor of choice 2nd vendor of choice 3rd vendor of choice</p>	<p>Delivery Time In Stock In Stock IN-STOCK NOW</p>
10	<p>2023 Maza Mazda3. 23-28 City / 31-37 Hwy MPG with cargo room and tight back seats. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.</p>	<p>Supplier [ALT] Southwest CDJR Brownsville Toyota Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville Southwest CDJR</p>	<p>Price \$23,118.50 \$24,104.00 \$25,345.00 No Bid</p>	<p>1st vendor of choice 2nd vendor of choice 3rd vendor of choice</p>	<p>Delivery Time 8 to 10 months In Stock In Stock</p>

Board Meeting of May 2, 2023
 RFP # 23-172 Purchase of New Service Vehicles District-Wide

11	2023 Volkswagen GTI, athletic, peppy and practical hatchback that can carve corners with aplomb. 23-24 city/ 32-34 Hwy MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.					Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price	Recommended			IN-STOCK NOW
	Southwest CDJR	\$40,519.50				
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	No Bid				
12	2022 Hyundai Veloster N 20-23 city / 27-28 Hwy MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.					Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price	1st vendor of choice			In Stock
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	\$25,090.00				IN-STOCK NOW
	[ALT1] Southwest CDJR	\$25,403.50	2nd vendor of choice			
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid				
13	2023 Toyota Corolla 30-32 city / 38-41 Hwy MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.					Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price	1st vendor of choice			In Stock
	Brownsville Toyota	\$24,104.00				In Stock
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	\$24,135.00	2nd vendor of choice			IN-STOCK NOW
	Southwest CDJR	\$27,808.50	3rd vendor of choice			
14	2023 Hyundai Elantra 20-33 City / 30-42 Hwy MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.					Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price	1st vendor of choice			In Stock
	Tipton Ford	\$20,255.00				IN-STOCK NOW
	[ALT1] Southwest CDJR	\$23,638.50	2nd vendor of choice			In Stock
	Brownsville Toyota	\$24,104.00	3rd vendor of choice			In Stock
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	\$25,375.00	4th vendor of choice			
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid				
15	2023 Kia Forte 22-28 city / 31-39 Hwy MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.					Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price	1st vendor of choice			IN-STOCK NOW
	[ALT1] Southwest CDJR	\$23,118.50				In Stock
	Brownsville Toyota	\$24,104.00	2nd vendor of choice			In Stock
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	\$25,815.00	3rd vendor of choice			
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid				



Board Meeting of May 2, 2023
 RFP # 23-172 Purchase of New Service Vehicles District-Wide

16	2023 Volkswagen Jetta 26-31 City / 36-42 HWY MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.				Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price			
	Southwest CDJR	\$24,658.50	1st vendor of choice		IN-STOCK NOW
	Brownsville Toyota	\$29,417.00	2nd vendor of choice		In Stock
17	2023 Nissan Sentra sports 28-29 City / 37-39 Hwy MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.				Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price			
	Brownsville Toyota	\$24,104.00	1st vendor of choice		In Stock
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	\$25,815.00	2nd vendor of choice		In Stock
	Southwest CDJR	\$27,056.50	3rd vendor of choice		IN-STOCK NOW
18	2023 Subaru Impreza strong suits include standard all-wheel drive, a balanced ride and adult-friendly seating throughout the cabin. 22-28 city / 30-36 Hwy MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.				Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price			
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	\$28,870.00	1st vendor of choice		IN-STOCK NOW
	[ALT1] Southwest CDJR	\$31,157.50	2nd vendor of choice		In Stock
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid			
19	2023 Subaru WRX with a flat-four engine, sport handling and grippy all-wheel-drive system. 19 city/ 25-26 Hwy MPG. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.				Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price			
	[ALT1] Southwest CDJR	\$33,409.50	Recommended		IN-STOCK NOW
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	No Bid			
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid			
20	2023 Chevrolet Tahoe PPV CC10706. LH LED Spotlight, 4x2-ppv, 5.3L-V8, 10-spd automatic, locking rear axle differential, dual batteries, cloth buckets/vinyl rear bench, full rubber floor, air condition front/read, tilt, cruise, AMFM- w/bluetooth, keyless entry, power windows, power locks, power mirrors, deep tint glass, running boards, rear view camera, flasher system headlamp and taillamp DRL compatible w/control wire, calibration surveillance mode interior lights, calibration tail lamp lasher re/red, calibration taillamp red/white trailer tow hitch, deliver to Brownsville. GM Warranty 5yr/100,000 miles powertrain @ n/c. Equipment Install CAPQ104949. Or equal, if you are submitting an equal brand please send illustration and information. the end-users will evaluate and determine the best value.				Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price			
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	\$62,000.00	Recommended		
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid			



Board Meeting of May 2, 2023
 RFP # 23-172 Purchase of New Service Vehicles District-Wide

21	2023 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD work trucks 4x4 double cab 6.75 ft box 149.4 in WB 6.6L V-8, 6 spd auto w/OD, 401 @5200 rpm, four wheel.				Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price			
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid			
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	No Bid			
22	2023 Ford Transit Cargo Vans 250 Medium Roof exterior V6 cylinder, 275 HP @ 6250 rpm, 260 lb-ft @ 4000 rpm				Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price			
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid			
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	No Bid			
23	Chevrolet 2500 Express Cargo Van 4.3L-V6, 6-SPD AUTOMATIC, AIR. CONDITION, AMFM-Stereo, Vinyl Buckets (2), Power windows, power locks, fixed read side cargo doors (with glass).				Delivery Time
	Supplier	Price	Supplier Notes		
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid			
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	No Bid			
24	Percentage Discount (%) on items 1-23 if more than one (1) vehicle is purchased.				
	Supplier	% Discount	Supplier Notes		
	Southwest CDJR	No Bid			
	Boggus Motor Co. II, LLC	0.0%	Recommended		
25	Percentage Discount (%) on other new vehicles such as; trucks, cars, cargo vans, etc. that are not listed above.				
	Supplier	% Discount	Supplier Notes		
	Southwest CDJR	5.0%	Recommended		
	Tipton Ford	0.0%	Recommended		
	Brownsville Toyota	0.0%	Recommended		
	Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	0.0%	Recommended		
	Boggus Motor Co. II, LLC	0.0%	Recommended		



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNSVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting of May 2, 2023

RFP # 23-172 Purchase of New Service Vehicles District-Wide

Participant Name	Response Date	Response Status	City	State
Charlie Clark Nissan Brownsville	04/21/2023	Submitted	Brownsville	TX
Boggs Motor Co. II, LLC	04/21/2023	Submitted	Harlingen	TX
Brownsville Toyota	04/21/2023	Submitted	Brownsville	TX
Tipton Ford	04/21/2023	Submitted	Brownsville	TX
Southwest CDJR	04/20/2023	Submitted	CLEBURNE	TX
1UT LLC			Brownsville	TX
791 Purchasing Cooperative			San Antonio	TX
911Vehicle (911Vehicle.com)			Anaheim	CA
A4 AUTO SUPPLY, INC.			PORT ISABEL	TX
ALC Schools (Alternative Logistics Technologies Holdings, Inc.)			San Clemente	CA
All Valley Charters, LLC			McAllen	TX
Apex Wireless of Texas Inc			Austin	TX
BURGESS FABRICS & UPHOLSTERY SUPPLIES			McAllen	TX
Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC)			Weslaco	TX
C.C. Battery Co., Inc.			Corpus Christi	TX
Caldwell Country Chevrolet			Caldwell	TX
Chalks Truck Parts			Houston	TX
Chicos Air Conditioning			Houston	TX
Clark Additives			brownsville	TX
Clean Earth Environmental Solutions			Los Fresnos	TX
CNH Construction LLC (Lavient Thomas)			Harburo	PA
competitive choice (Aundrea Young)			EL PASO	TX
Construction Journal LLC			Houston	TX
Convergent Technologies LLC (DG Investments Holdings 2, Inc.)			Stuart	FL
CORPORATE SERVICES INTERNATIONAL			Harlingen	TX
Creative Bus Sales			Houston	TX
Cummins Inc			Chino	CA
Dana Safety Supply (Dana Safety Supply, Inc)			Corpus Christi	TX
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.			Greensboro	NC
DG Tires & Wheels LLC			Palmhurst	TX
Doggett Freightliner			Brownsville	TX
Don Brown Bus Sales Inc.			Pharr	TX
Easy Way Safety Services, INC			Johnstown	NY
EDUARDO GALLEGOS (GALLEGOS)			Cincinnati	OH
Elizabethhean (student)			BROWNSVILLE	TX
E-LOGIC, INC.			Brownsville	TX
E-N-G Mobile Systems LLC			Washington	DC
Escamilla Tour Buses LLC			Fayetteville	NC
ESTCO Enterprises, Inc.			McAllen	TX
Event & Suppliers Inc			Escondido	CA
Everon Green LED and Solar (Everon Green Energy Resources LLC)			Hidalgo	TX
Far UV Technologies, Inc.			Weslaco	TX
Farber Specialty Vehicles Inc (Farber Specialty Vehicles)			Kansas City	MO
Farwest Environmental			Reynoldsburg	OH
			Schertz	TX



AN EARLY COLLEGE DISTRICT
BROWNVILLE
 INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

Board Meeting of May 2, 2023
 RFP # 23-172 Purchase of New Service Vehicles District-Wide

<u>Participant Name</u>	<u>Response Date</u>	<u>Response Status</u>	<u>City</u>	<u>State</u>
First Vehicle Services			Cincinnati	OH
Fleetpride			Dallas	TX
Foret Global Energy			HOUSTON	TX
G T DISTRIBUTORS, INC			AUSTIN	TX
Gallagher Special Risk			Quincy	MA
Gerling and Associates, Inc.			Sunbury	OH
Go With Jol Tours (Go With Jol Inc.)			Hartlingen	TX
Got Hydraulics (WTS AC LLC)		Viewed	Los Fresnos	TX
Grainger (WW Grainger Inc)			Mcallen	TX
GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC			Grapevine	TX
Green Light Group Tours (Grand Fund Inc)			Saint Augustine	FL
Gunn Chevrolet LTD			San Antonio	TX
H & H Golf Carts Inc			hartlingen	TX
Heritage Environmental Services			Marion	TX
Highend Advertising			Mission	TX
Imperial Supplies LLC			Janesville	WI
Industrial Soap Company is a Janitorial/Disposable Food Service Distri			Saint Louis	MO
International Academy of Emergency Medical Technology, LLC (Intern			Brownsville	TX
IVS, Inc. dba AngelITrax (IVS, Inc.)			Dothan	AL
J.V. EQUIPMENT INC			EDINBURG	TX
Jame's Tire Store (Sylvia G. Perez)			Brownsville	TX
JHB Group, Inc.			Lake In The Hills	IL
Kerville Bus/Coach USA (Kerville Bus)			San Antonio	TX
Key Performance Petroleum			Navasota	TX
Kyrish Truck Center (Santex Truck Center)			San Antonio	TX
Linebarger Goggan Blair & Sampson LLP			Navasota	TX
Longhorn Bus Sales (Longhorn Bus Sales, LLC)			Austin	TX
M Motoring Auto Transport & Service			La feria	TX
Mac Haik Ford Lincoln (Austin Mac Haik Ford Lincoln LTD)			Brownsville	TX
Magneto & Diesel Injector Service, Inc. (M&D Distributors)			Georgetown	TX
Malott			LAREDO	TX
Master's Transportation, Inc.			Redwood City	CA
Mathews Specialty Vehicles, Inc. (Mathews Specialty Vehicles)			Bellon	MO
Mobile Relays LLC (Ledasma)			Greensboro	NC
NORTHSIDE CHEVROLET (Tejas Chevrolet)			Mcallen	TX
OK TOURS, LLC			San Antonio	TX
Paul Johnson			San Antonio	TX
R Reyes Trucking & Tractor Svcs (R&J Reyes Enterprises, LLC)			Brownsville	TX
Radio Engineering Industries, Inc. (REI)			San Benito	TX
Red Barn Tire Center			Omaha	NE
Red Charter Buses LLC			Brownsville	TX
RKA Petroleum Companies, Inc.		Viewed	Brownsville	TX
Rush Truck Center, Brownsville (RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS			Romulus	MI
Ryder Systems, Inc.		Viewed	Brownsville	TX
			Pharr	TX



Board Meeting of May 2, 2023

RFP # 23-172 Purchase of New Service Vehicles District-Wide

Participant Name	Response Date	Response Status	City	State
Safely Sanitize America			Olympia	WA
Sage Energy Consulting (Sage Renewable Energy Consulting Inc)			San Rafael	CA
Santa Rosa Express LLC			McAllen	TX
Secure First Aid & Safety Supp			MCALLEN	TX
Sewell Fleet Management			Odessa	TX
Sirchie Acquisition Company, llc			Youngsville	NC
Sistrunk Global, LLC			Union City	GA
South Texas Solar Systems Inc (Aberrration Inc)			San Antonio	TX
South Texas Truck Centers			Pharr	TX
Spot Rubber Welders Inc (PEQUENO)			BROWNSVILLE	TX
SSICA			Orange	CA
Stadium Creations			Porter	TX
Star Shuttle & Charter (Star Shuttle, Inc.)			San Antonio	TX
STVT-AAI Education Inc.			Hurst	TX
TER Texas		Viewed	Conroe	TX
TESCO (Transportation Equipment Sales Corp)			Oregon	OH
The Yancy Group, Incorporated			Burleson	TX
TheCharterBus.com (MVLE Enterprises Inc)			Pharr	TX
Tipton Motors, Inc.			Brownsville	TX
Tony's Body Shop			Brownsville	TX
Transportant			Lenexa	KS
TRI-COUNTY COMMUNICATION			WESLACO	TX
TriVan Truck Body			Ferndale	WA
Truckers Equipment (Truckers Sales & Service, LLC)			Corpus Chrst	TX
Turnkey Technical Services LLC			Oliver Springs	TN
Uniforms Sales and Laundry			Brownsville	TX
Valley Transit Company			Harlingen	TX
Vector Fleet Management			Charlotte	NC
Vertex Marketing			Stafford	TX
Vidauri's Mobile Oil Change, LLC			Brownsville	TX
WingCo Construction			San Benito	TX
Woodhills Labs			Frisco	TX
Wynne Transportation			Irving	TX
YJ Commodities (Yesenia Jones)			Brownsville	TX
York Risk Services Group, Inc.			Parsippany	NJ

123 - Vednors Notified
 5 - Submitted