

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid: IFB No. 24-15 Roof Replacement at Conklin E.S., Lathrop E.S. and Whitehead E.S.

Due: Tuesday, October 10, 2023

Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

Vendor Name	Base Bid 1 - Conklin & Lathrop	Conklin Bid	Lathrop Bid	Base Bid 2 - Whitehead	Total of Base Bid 1 & 2 (all 3 Schools)	Conklin Bid	Lathrop Bid	Whitehead Bid
Weatherguard Roofing	\$1,900,000.00	\$950,000.00	\$950,000.00	\$1,194,000.00	\$3,076,000.00	\$945,000.00	\$945,000.00	\$1,186,000.00
Distinctive Roofing, Inc.	\$1,789,306.00	\$894,653.00	\$894,653.00	\$1,346,604.00	\$3,135,910.00	\$894,653.00	\$894,653.00	\$1,346,604.00
McDermaid Roofing Co.	\$1,415,892.00	\$707,992.00	\$707,992.00	\$1,413,679.00	\$2,832,759.00	\$709,540.00	\$709,540.00	\$1,413,679.00
HC Anderson Roofing, Inc.	\$1,201,823.00	\$601,634.00	\$600,189.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Opening Official: Dane Youngblood

Bid Recording Official: Casey Ramas

ROCKFORD PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Bid: IFB No. 24-15 Roof Replacement at Conklin E.S., Lathrop E.S. and Whitehead E.S.

Due: Tuesday, October 10, 2023

Time: 2:00 pm (6th FL Conference Rm)

Vendor Name	Alt. Bid No. 1	Unit Price No. 1	Unit Price No. 2	Unit Price No. 3	Unit Price No. 4	Unit Price No. 5	Addendums Received*	Bid Bond Received*	Required Documentation
Weatherguard Roofing	\$98,500.00	\$15.00	\$6.50	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$5.00	Y	Y	Y
Distinctive Roofing, Inc.	\$73,350.00	\$15.00	\$12.50	\$5.00	\$7.00	\$22.00	Y	Y	Y
McDermaid Roofing Co.	\$81,800.00	\$13.50	\$6.50	\$1.50	\$1.23	\$6.95	Y	Y	Y
HC Anderson Roofing, Inc.	\$26,548.00	\$30.00	\$6.50	\$3.25	\$2.50	\$0.93	Y	Y	Y

Bid Opening Official: **Dane Youngblood**

Bid Recording Official: **Casey Ramas**

***If Applicable**