

Award By Vendor Report

Purchasing Entity: Godley ISD
Bid ID: 22
Description: Supplies for 2017-2018 School Year
Bids Due By: 08/31/2017 9:00 AM
Bids Sealed Until: 08/31/2017 11:00 AM

Awarded: 09/08/2017
Effective Start Date: 08/31/2017
Effective End Date: 08/30/2018

Run Date: 09/08/2017 9:15 AM

Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name	Response Terms	Response Payment Terms
Forde-Ferrier, LLC	0% discount. Shipping = 15% of order.	
ABDO Publishing Company	7-10 after receipt of PO	Net 30
Abecedarian		
AbleNet	Standard shipping rates will apply. Chart included in attached file.	Net 30
ACE Educational Supplies	Orders over \$50 after discount from our current catalog or website receive free shipping (add 20% of the retail price to items with UPS, Truck, FX-GRD symbol). Discount is from LIST PRICES. www.ACEEDucational.com - website	Net 30 days
Ace Mart Restaurant Supply	7% off floor pricing. Free shipping on orders over \$400. Special Order items and equipment must be quoted on case by case basis. Returns and exchanges will be done in accordance with Ace Mart policies.	Net 30
Affordable Computer Products	Shipping Terms are FOB Destination, Prepay & Add. Discount does NOT include shipping charges. See attached Freight Policy. Samples only per mutual consent. See website at www.acpdirect.com for online catalog and pricing.	Net 30
ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC dba ALAMO IRON WORKS		Net 30 Days
Alert Services Inc.		
Arbor Scientific	Arbor Scientific has been in business for over 31 years. We sell Science related Instructional materials. Visit us at www.arborsci.com.	Net 30
ASW Enterprises, LLC	Agreement is attached	60 days

Athletic Supply, Inc.	none specified	none specified
Bearport Publishing		Send payment to: Bearport Publishing 45 West 21st St, Suite 3B New York, NY 10010
Big Star Branding, Inc.	10 business days following all approvals	Net 30 Days with PO
BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's	52% is an average. Our discount ranges from 5% to 85% off of MSRP - TIPS matrix pricing. See attached for details	Net 30
BSN Sports	F.O.B. DESTINATION / 2 - 30 DAYS ARO	NET 30 DAY
Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co.		Net 30
Capstone	www.capstonepub.com 7-10 ARO	Net 30
Capstone Classroom	7-10 days ARO	Net 30
Carey's Sporting Goods		net 30
Carolina Biological Supply Company	Carolina Biological is pleased to submit the following bid for Instructional Supplies. Please see the attached Carolina Proposal Letter for discount exclusions and freight terms. Pricing is a discount from website pricing at www.carolina.com.	Net 30 days
Cavendish Square Publishing, LLC	30% OFF LIST FOR HARDCOVER BOOKS/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS 30% OFF LIST FOR PAPERBACK BOOKS FREE SHIPPING FREE LIBRARY PROCESSING DISCOUNT IS ALREADY REFLECTED IN CATALOG https://cavendishsq.com/	NET 30
Cengage Learning, Inc.	*Estimated delivery is 10% of the total order. Actual shipping/handling charges will be included in the invoice total. Catalog prices are subject to change without notice. Catalog prices contain all applicable discounts.	30 Days ARO
CEV MULTIMEDIA		net 30 days
Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation	DELIVERY: 5-7 DAYS ARO	NET 30

Classroom Products LLC

Net 30

Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc.

Free standard ground shipping. Please contact us for expedited shipping requests. Discount structure will remain the same but list prices are subject to increase. Not all items are returnable, unless incorrect or damaged.

Net 30 or credit card

Coole School, Inc.

DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc.

Net 30 Days

Dynamic Designs Inc.

ECS LEARNING SYSTEMS, INC / Novel Units

25% discount of STAAR MASTER products. Shipping not FOB destination. Shipping charges are prepaid and added to the invoice.

Net 30 Days

Enslow Publishing LLC

25% OFF LIST PRICE FOR HARDCOVER BOOKS/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS 15% OFF LIST FOR PAPERBACK BOOKS. CATALOG ALREADY REFLECTS DISCOUNT FREE SHIPPING FREE LIBRARY PROCESSING

NET 30

ETA hand2mind

EXCLUSIONS: Professional Development, Custom Kits incl, but not limited to, National Geo NGSS, Disc Ed STEM Camp, National & N Carolina 4-H. Kits for use with Great Minds' Eureka Math Curriculum. Special promos, sales, quotes, (prefixed by BD) are excluded.

Net 30 days.

Express Booksellers

We offer a discount range for trade publications in print 25%-40% off publisher's list price. Textbooks, library books, instructional materials and professional publications discounts range from range from 0%-25% off the publisher's list price.

Net 30 days

Flinn Scientific, Inc.

10% discount, free shipping, see included Flinn quote form for exceptions.

Net 30 Days

Follett School Solutions

Please see attached bid letter for company, product and complete discount/pricing information.

Net 30 days

FROG STREET PRESS, INC

Pricing sheet is attached. Pricing listed includes 10% shipping.

Purchase Order is required. Payment terms are net 30.

Gareth Stevens Publishing	25% OFF LIST FOR HARDCOVER BOOKS/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS 15% OFF LIST FOR PAPERBACK BOOKS FREE SHIPPING FREE LIBRARY PROCESSING DISCOUNT IS ALREADY REFLECTED IN CATALOG https://www.garethstevens.com/	NET 30
Greenhaven Publishing LLC	20% OFF LIST PRICE HARDCOVER/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS/PAPERBACK BOOKS. CATALOG ALREADY REFLECTS DISCOUNT. https://greenhavenpublishing.com/	NET 30
Inzer Advance Designs	I am unable to upload Non-Collusion Affidavit with notary stamp as well as Form 1295 with notary stamp. I will physically mail these today.	
IXL Learning, Inc		
Kamico Instructional Media, Inc.	KAMICO Instructional Media, Inc. agrees to all Terms and Conditions set by Godley ISD. KAMICO's prices will remain firm for the duration of the contract.	Net 60
Lakeshore Learning Materials	Please reference "Per Bid # 22" on all purchase orders. Delivery in 7-10 Business Days ARO. FREE shipping on all orders over \$250. Please estimate shipping on orders under as 15% of your order subtotal. Minimum charge of \$5.00.	NET 30
Lone Star Learning	Please note that we do have a 12% S&H charge on print items (\$10 min); no shipping on web-based programs	Net 30
Lone Star Percussion	See attachment "Lone Star Percussion - Terms & Conditions"	See attachment "Lone Star Percussion - Terms & Conditions"
M&R McGowen LLC (dba NAPA Auto Parts)	See NAPA PROLINK Account for Godley ISD	Net 10th EOM
Mackin Educational Resources		Net 30
Magazine Subscriptions PTP	Discount for periodicals/magazines	Net 30 days
MathWarm-ups.com		net 30
Matthews Office Supply		

Mentoring Minds, L.P.	We provide TEKS-based math, reading, writing and science supplementary materials in print & online. STAAR Flip charts, RTI tools, Intervention & Instructional Strategies, & Critical Thinking materials. Some student and teacher resources. Some Spanish.	30 days net. Mentoring Minds L.P. does not have a pre-payment discount.
MUSIC IN MOTION, INC	\$25.00 minimum for Purchase Orders *Bid Number/Name must be referenced on Purchase Orders to receive bid discount.	Net 30
NASCO		Net 30 w/approved credit
Oriental Trading Company, Inc.	Please refer to attached files	Net 30
PepWear, LLC	Deep discounts based on quantity ordered. 10 day turn around for screen printing and embroidery.	Net 30 with PO.
Precision Business Machines, Inc.	5-7 Business Days	N30
Premier Therapy Services, PLLC	Professional Therapy Services in Special Education	\$65/hour
PRO-ED	Prices advertised by PRO-ED do not reflect shipping/handling charges. 10% is added to most items for standard delivery (10-15 business days); 15% for expedited 2nd day delivery; 20% for expedited next-day delivery. See Exhibit "A" PRO-ED bid deviations.	Net-30
Project Wisdom	Net 30	Net 30
QEP, Inc. Professional Books	See Exceptions Page	Net 30
Riddell / All American		1% 10 Days, Net 30
Rosen Publishing Group	25% OFF LIST PRICE FOR HARDCOVER BOOKS/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS 15% OFF LIST PRICE FOR PAPERBACK BOOKS. FREE SHIPPING FREE LIBRARY PROCESSING	NET 30
Scarborough Specialties, Inc.		Net 30

Scholastic Inc.	2017-2018 Scholastic Education Catalog- 25% Discount off list price. Discounts do not apply to GR Short Reads Digital (pages 37 &72) 2017 Teacher Resources Catalog at a 25% off catalog price. See Discount Schedule attached.	Net 30 Days
School Life, a division of imagestuff.com		Net 30
SiteOne Landscape Supply		0% NET 30
SmartSchool Systems		
SOS Therapy Services		
Southern Science Supply	All orders will be fulfilled within 1-3 days	Net 30
Spirit Monkey, LLC	There is a one-time \$400 minimum per campus to open an account. There is a \$100 minimum after that. Shipping is free to the school or district warehouse. There is a \$10 fee to ship elsewhere.	
Sullivan Supply South, Inc.	APPLIED.	NET 30
Teamline	as needed	net 15
Tennis Outlet		
Tex-Air Filters		Net 30 days
The Bandwagon Music Store & Repair		
U.S. Games	F.O.B. DESTINATION / 2 - 30 DAYS ARO	NET 30 DAY
Wood Etc. Corp.		Net 30

Category Description: Instructional Supplies

Category Notes: Godley ISD is NOT bidding on specific items. We are requesting bids under the general category of Instructional supplies.

Vendor	Percent Discount	Award	ID	Item Description	Purchase Unit	Item Manufacturer & Part Number	List Price	Discount Price	Quantity	Extended Discount Price	
Forde-Ferrier, LLC	0.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes: Shipping = 15% of order.							
				Percent: 0.0000							
										Forde-Ferrier, LLC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
ABDO Publishing Company	0.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes: Catalog and website already reflect a 30% discount off the list price.							
				Percent: 0.0000							
										ABDO Publishing Company Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Abecedarian	0.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes: 0% Discount							
				Percent: 0.0000							
										Abecedarian Total Extended Price:	0.0000
AbleNet	0.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes: Volume purchase discount may be available. Standard shipping rates will apply to all purchases.							
				Percent: 0.0000							
										AbleNet Total Extended Price:	0.0000
ACE Educational Supplies	33.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes:							
				Percent: 33.0000							
										ACE Educational Supplies Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Ace Mart Restaurant Supply	7.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes: 7% off floor pricing. Free shipping on orders over \$400. Special Order items and equipment must be quoted on case by case basis. Returns and Exchanges will be done in accordance with Ace Mart policies.							
				Percent: 7.0000							
										Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Affordable Computer Products	0.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes: Shipping Terms are FOB Destination, Prepay & Add. Discount or Price does NOT include shipping charges. Shipping charges must be added to each purchase order and are for one shipment to one location per order. See attached Freight Policy form for details. Samples may only be provided per mutual consent. See website at www.acpdirect.com for online catalog and pricing.							
				Percent: 0.0000							
										Affordable Computer Products Total Extended Price:	0.0000
ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC dba ALAMO IRON WORKS	10.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes: From our website: www.aiwdirect.com except sale items. Steel is price on application only.							
				Percent: 10.0000							
										ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC dba ALAMO IRON WORKS Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Arbor Scientific	0.0000	Y									
				Response Category Notes: We sell Science related Instructional materials. Visit us at www.arborsci.com . Freight charges will be approximately 8% of the order total or \$7.00, whichever is greater. Freight will be prepaid on the invoice.							
				Percent: 0.0000							
										Arbor Scientific Total Extended Price:	0.0000
ASW Enterprises, LLC	0.0000	Y									

	Response Category Notes: Bulk discounts offered, not percentage			ASW Enterprises, LLC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 0.0000				
Bearport Publishing	30.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: 30% off List Price, Free Shipping and Processing			Bearport Publishing Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 30.0000				
Big Star Branding, Inc.	20.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: promotional items or pens for classroom			Big Star Branding, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 20.0000				
BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's	52.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: 52% is an average. Our discount ranges from 5 to 85% off of MSRP - TIPS matrix pricing. Call, fax, email or go on line for exact pricing. www.TexasSchoolweb.com. User id: 1847, Password Godley2536. Catalog items are invoiced thru TIPS/MOS Agent: Bennett's. Printing, badges, etc., will invoice thru Bennett's. No freight/No minimum other than applies to special orders.				
	Percent: 52.0000			BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's Total Extended Price:	0.0000
BSN Sports	10.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: SEE ATTACHED FOR EXCEPTIONS				
	Percent: 10.0000			BSN Sports Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Capstone	25.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: 25% off List Price is reflected in the catalog and on the website as School/Library Price (S/L).				
	Percent: 25.0000			Capstone Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Capstone Classroom	0.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: Various programs are discounted 5-10%. Catalog and website pricing reflects discount. www.capstoneclassroom.com				
	Percent: 0.0000			Capstone Classroom Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Carolina Biological Supply Company	5.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: Please see the attached Carolina Proposal Letter for discount exclusions and freight terms. Pricing is a discount from website prices at www.carolina.com.				
	Percent: 5.0000			Carolina Biological Supply Company Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Cavendish Square Publishing, LLC	30.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: 30% OFF PRICE LIST FOR HARDCOVER BOOKS/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS AND PAPERBACK BOOKS. CATALOG ALREADY REFLECTS DISCOUNT https://cavendishsq.com/				
	Percent: 30.0000			Cavendish Square Publishing, LLC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Cengage Learning, Inc.	0.0000	Y			
	Response Category Notes: *Estimated delivery is 10% of the total order. Actual shipping/handling charges will be included in the invoice total. Catalog prices are subject to change without notice. Catalog prices contain all applicable discounts.				
	Percent: 0.0000			Cengage Learning, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
CEV MULTIMEDIA	0.0000	Y			

Response Category Notes:			CEV MULTIMEDIA Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 0.0000			
Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation	10.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes:			Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 10.0000			
Classroom Products LLC	0.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Orders \$3,500 - \$4,999 - 10% Discount Orders \$5,000 - UP - 15% Discount To qualify for these discounts order will be delivered to one location. Location must be able to accept skidded orders.			Classroom Products LLC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 0.0000			
Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc.	45.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Discount ranges from 10% to 50% depending on vendor and quantity requested			Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 45.0000			
Coole School, Inc.	25.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: The school district will receive a 25 % discount off the suggested retail price of the student planners.			Coole School, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 25.0000			
ECS LEARNING SYSTEMS, INC / Novel Units	25.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: 25% of STAAR MASTER products. Shipping charges are added to the invoice. Orders under \$55 add 8.95, \$55.01 to \$500 add 16%, \$500.01 to \$2,000 add 12%, \$2,000.01 to \$5,000 add 10% and over \$5,000 add 8%.			ECS LEARNING SYSTEMS, INC / Novel Units Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 25.0000			
Enslow Publishing LLC	25.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: 25% OFF LIST PRICE FOR HARDCOVER BOOKS/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS 15% OFF LIST PRICE FOR PAPERBACK BOOKS CATALOG ALREADY REFLECTS DISCOUNT http://www.enslow.com/			Enslow Publishing LLC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 25.0000			
ETA hand2mind	15.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes:			ETA hand2mind Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 15.0000			
Express Booksellers	25.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Express Booksellers is a book distributor able to procure any book publication in print. We do not offer a catalog or price list. The discount offered is based on the type of publication and quantity ordered. Purchase orders and quote requests can be emailed to Jule Maxwell at jule@expressbooksellers.com . We offer a discount range for trade publications in print 25%-40% off publisher's list price. Textbooks, library books, instructional materials and professional publications discounts range from range from 0%-25% off the publisher's list price. We offer free shipping and there is no minimum order.			Express Booksellers Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 25.0000			
Flinn Scientific, Inc.	10.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Some exceptions, please see included Flinn quote form.			Flinn Scientific, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
	Percent: 10.0000			

FROG STREET PRESS, INC	0.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: 10% shipping on all purchases.				
Percent: 0.0000			FROG STREET PRESS, INC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Gale Cengage Learning	0.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Cengage Learning's discounts for Gale print materials and electronic resources range up to 70%. Discounts for print publications are presented in the attached Standard Print Business Policies document. Please contact your Gale consultant, Tammy McGee, Education Sales Consultant, at 817.781.0456 or tammy.mcgee@cengage.com to arrange a conversation that will ensure Gale library resources meet the specific interests and needs of Godley ISD. We welcome your questions and conversations about how Gale library resources can support achievement of educational standards for your students.				
Percent: 0.0000			Gale Cengage Learning Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Gareth Stevens Publishing	25.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: 25% OFF LIST FOR HARDCOVER BOOKS/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS 15% OFF LIST FOR PAPERBACK BOOKS FREE SHIPPING FREE LIBRARY PROCESSING DISCOUNT IS ALREADY REFLECTED IN CATALOG https://www.garethstevens.com/				
Percent: 25.0000			Gareth Stevens Publishing Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Greenhaven Publishing LLC	20.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: 20% OFF LIST HARDCOVER/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS AND PAPERBACK BOOKS DISCOUNT ALREADY REFLECTS DISCOUNT https://greenhavenpublishing.com/				
Percent: 20.0000			Greenhaven Publishing LLC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
IXL Learning, Inc	0.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: IXL provides volume and multi-subject discounts for our annual subscriptions. These discounts are included in the attached 2017-2018 Pricing Catalog for Godley ISD.				
Percent: 0.0000			IXL Learning, Inc Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Kamico Instructional Media, Inc.	0.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Though KAMICO does not offer discounts per se, our everyday prices are competitive with other companies' discounted prices. KAMICO offers free shipping, free web-based training, and free technical support. Products are usually received within 2-3 days ARO.				
Percent: 0.0000			Kamico Instructional Media, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Lakeshore Learning Materials	5.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Please reference "Per Bid # 22" on all purchase orders.				
Percent: 5.0000			Lakeshore Learning Materials Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Lone Star Learning	0.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Materials already discounted				
Percent: 0.0000			Lone Star Learning Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Lone Star Percussion	0.0000	Y		
Response Category Notes: Catalog pricing is 5-60% off MSRP.				
Percent: 0.0000			Lone Star Percussion Total Extended Price:	0.0000

Mackin Educational Resources	5.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: We are offering an ADDITIONAL 5% discount off Mackin.com (which is already discounted up to 45% off List price) for PRINT and AV ITEMS. EBOOKS will also receive an additional 3% discount. Databases, online curriculums, audio/video devices, makerspace products, and digital audio/video are excluded from these additional discounts.	Percent: 5.0000	Mackin Educational Resources Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Magazine Subscriptions PTP	30.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: 0/15/30% depending on the publication. Shipment 4-12 weeks after order depending on the frequency of the publication.	Percent: 30.0000	Magazine Subscriptions PTP Total Extended Price:	0.0000
MathWarm-ups.com	0.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: Free Shipping - USPS Priority 2-3 days	Percent: 0.0000	MathWarm-ups.com Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Matthews Office Supply	5.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: We offer a discount range of 5 to 93% off of list price.	Percent: 5.0000	Matthews Office Supply Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Mentoring Minds, L.P.	0.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: Mentoring Minds' instructional resources provide flexible instructional support to meet the needs of all students, including students with special needs. Our materials provide TEKS-based math, reading, writing and science supplementary materials in print and online, STAAR Flip Charts, Rtl tools, Intervention and Instructional Strategies and Critical Thinking materials. Some student and teacher resources are available. Some materials are available in Spanish. Exceptions: 1. 0% discount; however, some bulk pricing discounts are available based on quantities purchased. 2. We honor F.O.B., and shipping charges are not included. They will be 10% of the total order amount and will be a separate line item on an invoice. 3. Some materials require a minimum quantity. See our website for more information: www.mentoringminds.com . 4. Bid is based on current catalog pricing. Catalogs are published annually each fall, and prices could increase which would affect this bid.	Percent: 0.0000	Mentoring Minds, L.P. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
MUSIC IN MOTION, INC	0.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: Free shipping/handling discount will be offered, however, free S&H does not apply to heavy, oversized or drop whip items. Please see attached S&H Info sheet for rates.	Percent: 0.0000	MUSIC IN MOTION, INC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
NASCO	10.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: Nasco offers discount on a per catalog basis. Discount percentage will range from 10-20% depending. Please see included discount quote 55004 for details.	Percent: 10.0000	NASCO Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Oriental Trading Company, Inc.	5.0000	Y	Response Category Notes:	Percent: 5.0000	Oriental Trading Company, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Precision Business Machines, Inc.	0.0000	Y				

Response Category Notes: Discounts vary due to manufacturer specials and incentives.

Percent: 0.0000

Precision Business Machines, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

PRO-ED 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: PRO-ED, Inc. is a leading publisher of standardized assessments, books (resource and reference texts), and curricular and therapy materials. We produce and provide high-quality products in the areas of Speech-Language Pathology and Special Education, Rehabilitation and Transition, Psychology and Counseling, Occupational and Physical Therapy, and Early Childhood. Our products are designed to help professionals, caregivers and students. Detailed descriptions of all products offered by PRO-ED are available on our website www.proedinc.com. Additionally, we publish our catalogs twice per year. Please let us know if you prefer to have a current set of catalogs sent to you. PRO-ED pricing runs Jan 1 - Dec. 31 of each new year. Pricing and availability are not guaranteed and are subject to change at any time without notice. Prices listed or advertised by PRO-ED do not reflect shipping/handling charges. 10% will be added to most items for standard delivery; 15% for expedited 2nd day delivery; 20% for expedited next-day delivery.

Percent: 0.0000

PRO-ED Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Project Wisdom 13.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 13.0000

Project Wisdom Total Extended Price:

0.0000

QEP, Inc. Professional Books 20.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Discounts range from 0 - 35% based on publisher and quantity. Our average discount is 20%, as noted in the response field. QEP website (www.qepbooks.com) displays our standard discounts on our bestselling books and DVDs from over 40 publishers. For best pricing contact QEP at qeporders@qepbooks.com or 800-323-6787 for a written price quote. Minimum shipping \$7.00; orders over \$100 add 9%. Free Shipping/Handling on orders over \$5000. Expedited shipping paid by the district. Special order books may require additional shipping charges. To receive delivery tracking information for your PO, please provide recipients email address.

Percent: 20.0000

QEP, Inc. Professional Books Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Rosen Publishing Group 25.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: 25% OFF LIST PRICE HARDCOVER/EBOOKS/INTERACTIVE EBOOKS 15% OFF LIST PAPERBACK BOOKS CATALOG ALREADY REFLECTS DISCOUNT <https://www.rosenpublishing.com/>

Percent: 25.0000

Rosen Publishing Group Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Scholastic Inc. 25.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Scholastic Inc. wishes to submit two catalogs for this bid. The 2017-2018 Scholastic Education Catalog at a 25% Discount. Discounts do not apply to Guided Reading Short Reads Digital (pages 37 and 72). We also wish to submit the 2017 Teacher Resources Catalog at a 25% off catalog price. See Discount Schedule attached for additional information.

Percent: 25.0000

Scholastic Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

School Life, a division of imagestuff.com 0.0100 Y

Response Category Notes: Please visit our website for current items and pricing. www.schoolife.com

Percent: 0.0100

School Life, a division of imagestuff.com Total Extended Price:

0.0000

SmartSchool Systems 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 0.0000

SmartSchool Systems Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Southern Science Supply 5.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: The discount will vary from 5-25% depending on the item and the quantity requested.

Percent: 5.0000

Southern Science Supply Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Spirit Monkey, LLC 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 0.0000

Spirit Monkey, LLC Total Extended Price: 0.0000

U.S. Games 15.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: 15% OFF CURRENT PRICE WITH EXCEPTIONS SEE ATTACH

Percent: 15.0000

U.S. Games Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Wood Etc. Corp. 30.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: 1. Shipping cost will be prepaid and added to final invoice. 2. Installation is not included in price of items.

Percent: 30.0000

Wood Etc. Corp. Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Follett School Solutions 0.0000 N

Response Category Notes: 0% Additional. Follett's online catalog at titlewave.com is net priced and updated daily. Please see Discount Summary and Quantity Discounts included in the bid letter included with this response for complete details.

Percent: 0.0000

Follett School Solutions Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Category Description: Maintenance Supplies

Category Notes: Godley ISD is NOT bidding on specific items. We are requesting bids under the general category of Maintenance supplies.

Vendor	Percent Discount	Award	ID	Item Description	Purchase Unit	Item Manufacturer & Part Number	List Price	Discount Price	Quantity	Extended Discount Price
--------	------------------	-------	----	------------------	---------------	---------------------------------	------------	----------------	----------	-------------------------

ACE Educational Supplies 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: N/A

Percent: 0.0000

ACE Educational Supplies Total Extended Price: 0.0000

ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC 10.0000 Y

dba ALAMO IRON WORKS

Response Category Notes: From our website: www.aiwdirect.com except sale items. Steel is price on application only.

Percent: 10.0000

ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC dba ALAMO IRON WORKS Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Big Star Branding, Inc. 20.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Maintenance shirts and uniforms - custom printed

Percent: 20.0000

Big Star Branding, Inc. Total Extended Price: 0.0000

BPC Business Solutions 52.0000 Y

dba Bennett's

Response Category Notes: 52% is an average. Our discount ranges from 5 to 85% off of MSRP - TIPS matrix pricing. Call, fax, email or go on line for exact pricing. www.TexasSchoolweb.com. User id: 1847, Password Godley2536. Catalog items are invoiced thru TIPS/MOS Agent: Bennett's. Printing, badges, etc., will invoice thru Bennett's. No freight/No minimum other than applies to special orders.

Percent: 52.0000

BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Chemsearch a Div of NCH 10.0000 Y

Corporation

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 10.0000

Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. 40.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Discount ranges from 10% to 50% depending on vendor and quantity requested

Percent: 40.0000

Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc. 10.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 10.0000

DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Lakeshore Learning Materials 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: No Bid

Percent: 0.0000

Lakeshore Learning Materials Total Extended Price:

0.0000

NASCO 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: No Bid

Percent: 0.0000

NASCO Total Extended Price:

0.0000

SiteOne Landscape Supply 50.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Actual discounts vary from 0-70% off. Discounts based on the Texas Buyboard. Please use Buyboard contract number 529-17 for Maintenance equipment, irrigation, landscape, and supplies or contract 540-17, outdoor lighting. visit buyboard.com for products, catalogs, and specific discounts

Percent: 50.0000

SiteOne Landscape Supply Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Tex-Air Filters 50.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Godley ISD's price will be 50% off the List Price Catalog for Air Filters. List price catalog is in Attachment files.

Percent: 50.0000

Tex-Air Filters Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Follett School Solutions 0.0000 N

Response Category Notes: No bid

Percent: 0.0000

Follett School Solutions Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Category Description: Custodial Supplies

Category Notes: Godley ISD is NOT bidding on specific items. We are requesting bids under the general category of Custodial supplies.

Vendor	Percent Discount	Award	ID	Item Description	Purchase Unit	Item Manufacturer & Part Number	List Price	Discount Price	Quantity	Extended Discount Price
--------	------------------	-------	----	------------------	---------------	---------------------------------	------------	----------------	----------	-------------------------

ACE Educational Supplies 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: N/A

Percent: 0.0000

ACE Educational Supplies Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply 7.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: 7% off floor pricing. Free shipping on orders over \$400. Special Order items and equipment must be quoted on case by case basis. Returns and exchanges will be done in accordance with Ace Mart policies.

Percent: 7.0000

Ace Mart Restaurant Supply Total Extended Price:

0.0000

ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC dba ALAMO IRON WORKS	10.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: From our website: www.aiwdirect.com except sale items. Steel is price on application only.	
	Percent: 10.0000			ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC dba ALAMO IRON WORKS Total Extended Price: 0.0000
Big Star Branding, Inc.	20.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: shirts or uniforms - with custom logo	
	Percent: 20.0000			Big Star Branding, Inc. Total Extended Price: 0.0000
BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's	52.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: 52% is an average. Our discount ranges from 5 to 85% off of MSRP - TIPS matrix pricing. Call, fax, email or go on line for exact pricing. www.TexasSchoolweb.com. User id: 1847, Password Godley2536. Catalog items are invoiced thru TIPS/MOS Agent: Bennett's. Printing, badges, etc., will invoice thru Bennett's. No freight/No minimum other than applies to special orders.	
	Percent: 52.0000			BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's Total Extended Price: 0.0000
Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation	10.0000	Y	Response Category Notes:	
	Percent: 10.0000			Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation Total Extended Price: 0.0000
Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc.	40.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: Discount ranges from 10% to 50% depending on vendor and quantity requested	
	Percent: 40.0000			Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price: 0.0000
DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc.	10.0000	Y	Response Category Notes:	
	Percent: 10.0000			DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price: 0.0000
Lakeshore Learning Materials	0.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: No Bid	
	Percent: 0.0000			Lakeshore Learning Materials Total Extended Price: 0.0000
NASCO	0.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: No Bid	
	Percent: 0.0000			NASCO Total Extended Price: 0.0000
SiteOne Landscape Supply	50.0000	Y	Response Category Notes: Actual discounts vary from 0-70% off. Discounts based on the Texas Buyboard. Please use Buyboard contract number 529-17 for Maintenance equipment, irrigation, landscape, and supplies or contract 540-17, outdoor lighting. visit buyboard.com for products, catalogs, and specific discounts	
	Percent: 50.0000			SiteOne Landscape Supply Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Category Description: Transportation Supplies

Category Notes: Godley ISD is NOT bidding on specific items. We are requesting bids under the general category of Transportation supplies.

Vendor	Percent Discount	Award	ID	Item Description	Purchase Unit	Item Manufacturer & Part Number	List Price	Discount Price	Quantity	Extended Discount Price
ACE Educational Supplies	0.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes: N/A						
				Percent: 0.0000	ACE Educational Supplies Total Extended Price:					0.0000
Big Star Branding, Inc.	15.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes: Vehicle Graphics and wraps						
				Percent: 15.0000	Big Star Branding, Inc. Total Extended Price:					0.0000
BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's	52.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes: 52% is an average. Our discount ranges from 5 to 85% off of MSRP - TIPS matrix pricing. Call, fax, email or go on line for exact pricing. www.TexasSchoolweb.com. User id: 1847, Password Godley2536. Catalog items are invoiced thru TIPS/MOS Agent: Bennett's. Printing, badges, etc., will invoice thru Bennett's. No freight/No minimum other than apply to special orders.						
				Percent: 52.0000	BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's Total Extended Price:					0.0000
Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co.	15.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes: On all school bus parts and services, including special needs restraints, alignments, body work, frame work, etc.						
				Percent: 15.0000	Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. Total Extended Price:					0.0000
Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation	10.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes: 10% DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE						
				Percent: 10.0000	Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation Total Extended Price:					0.0000
Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc.	40.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes: Discount ranges from 10% to 50% depending on vendor and quantity requested						
				Percent: 40.0000	Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:					0.0000
DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc.	10.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes:						
				Percent: 10.0000	DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:					0.0000
Dynamic Designs Inc.	0.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes: We offer Vehicle Wraps, Decals and Magnets.						
				Percent: 0.0000	Dynamic Designs Inc. Total Extended Price:					0.0000
Lakeshore Learning Materials	0.0000	Y								
				Response Category Notes: No Bid						
				Percent: 0.0000	Lakeshore Learning Materials Total Extended Price:					0.0000
M&R McGowen LLC (dba NAPA Auto Parts)	0.0000	Y								

Response Category Notes: Actual percentage discount varies from 10-40% depending on product. NAPA offers hundreds of products via special FLEET pricing specifically for Godley ISD.

Percent: 0.0000 **M&R McGowen LLC (dba NAPA Auto Parts) Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

NASCO 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: No Bid

Percent: 0.0000 **NASCO Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

PepWear, LLC 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Please see attached files

Percent: 0.0000 **PepWear, LLC Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

Follett School Solutions 0.0000 N

Response Category Notes: No bid

Percent: 0.0000 **Follett School Solutions Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

Category Description: Athletic Supplies

Category Notes: Godley ISD is NOT bidding on specific items. We are requesting bids under the general category of Athletic supplies.

Vendor	Percent Discount	Award	ID	Item Description	Purchase Unit	Item Manufacturer & Part Number	List Price	Discount Price	Quantity	Extended Discount Price
--------	------------------	-------	----	------------------	---------------	---------------------------------	------------	----------------	----------	-------------------------

ACE Educational Supplies 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: N/A

Percent: 0.0000 **ACE Educational Supplies Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC 10.0000 Y
dba ALAMO IRON WORKS

Response Category Notes: From our website: www.aiwdirect.com except sale items. Steel is price on application only.

Percent: 10.0000 **ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC dba ALAMO IRON WORKS Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

Alert Services Inc. 20.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 20.0000 **Alert Services Inc. Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

Athletic Supply, Inc. 25.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 25.0000 **Athletic Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

Big Star Branding, Inc. 20.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: t shirts, polo shirts, sweats, logo apparel and promotional items for fundraising efforts

Percent: 20.0000 **Big Star Branding, Inc. Total Extended Price:** 0.0000

BPC Business Solutions 52.0000 Y
dba Bennett's

Response Category Notes: 52% is an average. Our discount ranges from 5 to 85% off of MSRP - TIPS matrix pricing. Call, fax, email or go on line for exact pricing. www.TexasSchoolweb.com. User id: 1847, Password Godley2536. Catalog items are invoiced thru TIPS/MOS Agent: Bennett's. Printing, badges, etc., will invoice thru Bennett's. No freight/No minimum other than applies to special orders.

	Percent: 52.0000		BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's Total Extended Price:	0.0000
BSN Sports	10.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: SEE ATTACHED FOR EXCEPTIONS			
	Percent: 10.0000		BSN Sports Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Carey's Sporting Goods	10.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: includes shipping, except on heavy equipment. A quote will be given on that.			
	Percent: 10.0000		Carey's Sporting Goods Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation	10.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes:			
	Percent: 10.0000		Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc.	40.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: Discount ranges from 10% to 50% depending on vendor and quantity requested			
	Percent: 40.0000		Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Dynamic Designs Inc.	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: We have an extensive catalog of items for Music and Athletics programs.			
	Percent: 0.0000		Dynamic Designs Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Inzer Advance Designs	35.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: Shipping is 12% of Total or \$10.00 whichever is greater. Not to exceed \$100.00			
	Percent: 35.0000		Inzer Advance Designs Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Lakeshore Learning Materials	5.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: Please reference "Per Bid # 22" on all purchase orders.			
	Percent: 5.0000		Lakeshore Learning Materials Total Extended Price:	0.0000
NASCO	10.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: Nasco offers discount on a per catalog basis. Discount percentage will range from 10-20% depending. Please see included discount quote 55004 for details.			
	Percent: 10.0000		NASCO Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Riddell / All American	1.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: Riddell would like to offer a discount of 1 - 40% from our catalog prices to Godley ISD. Please see attached letter. Thank you !			
	Percent: 1.0000		Riddell / All American Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Scarborough Specialties, Inc.	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: We are a full service promotional products and branded apparel company as well as being a certified HUB company. We can get literally any decorated item you need and we have our own in house screen printing and embroidery along with various other specially decoration methods. Team logo'd t-shirts, jersey's, promotional products, caps, and other athletic clothing/promotional			

products
Percent: 0.0000

Scarborough Specialties, Inc. Total Extended Price: 0.0000

SiteOne Landscape Supply 50.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Actual discounts vary from 0-70% off. Discounts based on the Texas Buyboard. Please use Buyboard contract number 529-17 for Maintenance equipment, irrigation, landscape, and supplies or contract 540-17, outdoor lighting. visit buyboard.com for products, catalogs, and specific discounts
Percent: 50.0000

SiteOne Landscape Supply Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Teamline 0.1000 Y

Response Category Notes: as quoted
Percent: 0.1000

Teamline Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Tennis Outlet 30.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: 0-30% discount
Percent: 30.0000

Tennis Outlet Total Extended Price: 0.0000

U.S. Games 15.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: 15% OFF CURRENT PRICE WITH EXCEPTIONS SEE ATTACH
Percent: 15.0000

U.S. Games Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Follett School Solutions 0.0000 N

Response Category Notes: No bid
Percent: 0.0000

Follett School Solutions Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Category Description: Band/Music Supplies

Category Notes: Godley ISD is NOT bidding on specific items. We are requesting bids under the general category of Band/Music supplies.

Vendor	Percent Discount	Award	ID	Item Description	Purchase Unit	Item Manufacturer & Part Number	List Price	Discount Price	Quantity	Extended Discount Price
--------	------------------	-------	----	------------------	---------------	---------------------------------	------------	----------------	----------	-------------------------

ACE Educational Supplies 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: N/A
Percent: 0.0000

ACE Educational Supplies Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Big Star Branding, Inc. 20.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: t shirts, polo shirts, logo apparel and promotional items for fundraising efforts
Percent: 20.0000

Big Star Branding, Inc. Total Extended Price: 0.0000

BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's 52.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: 52% is an average. Our discount ranges from 5 to 85% off of MSRP - TIPS matrix pricing. Call, fax, email or go on line for exact pricing. www.TexasSchoolweb.com. User id: 1847, Password Godley2536. Catalog items are invoiced thru TIPS/MOS Agent: Bennett's. Printing, badges, etc., will invoice thru Bennett's. No freight/No minimum other than applies to special orders.
Percent: 52.0000

BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's Total Extended Price: 0.0000

Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation 10.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

	Percent: 10.0000		Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc.	40.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: Discount ranges from 10% to 50% depending on vendor and quantity requested			
	Percent: 40.0000		Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Dynamic Designs Inc.	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: We have an extensive catalog for HS Music and Athletics programs.			
	Percent: 0.0000		Dynamic Designs Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Lakeshore Learning Materials	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: No Bid			
	Percent: 0.0000		Lakeshore Learning Materials Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Lone Star Percussion	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: Catalog pricing is 5-60% off MSRP.			
	Percent: 0.0000		Lone Star Percussion Total Extended Price:	0.0000
MUSIC IN MOTION, INC	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: Free shipping/handling discount will be offered, however, free S&H does not apply to heavy, oversized or drop whip items. Please see attached S&H Info sheet for rates.			
	Percent: 0.0000		MUSIC IN MOTION, INC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
NASCO	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: No Bid			
	Percent: 0.0000		NASCO Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Scarborough Specialties, Inc.	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes: We are a full service promotional products and branded apparel company as well as being a certified HUB company. We can get literally any decorated item you need and we have our own in house screen printing and embroidery along with various other specially decoration methods. We have the special capability to do the screen printing color spot process that Band directors prefer on their band t-shirts.			
	Percent: 0.0000		Scarborough Specialties, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Spirit Monkey, LLC	0.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes:			
	Percent: 0.0000		Spirit Monkey, LLC Total Extended Price:	0.0000
The Bandwagon Music Store & Repair	35.0000	Y		
	Response Category Notes:			
	Percent: 35.0000		The Bandwagon Music Store & Repair Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Follett School Solutions	0.0000	N		
	Response Category Notes: No bid			

Percent: 0.0000

Follett School Solutions Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Category Description: Office Supplies

Category Notes: Godley ISD is NOT bidding on specific items. We are requesting bids under the general category of Office supplies.

Vendor	Percent Discount	Award	ID	Item Description	Purchase Unit	Item Manufacturer & Part Number	List Price	Discount Price	Quantity	Extended Discount Price	
ACE Educational Supplies	33.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes: n/a											
Percent: 33.0000										ACE Educational Supplies Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Big Star Branding, Inc.	20.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes: Pens, promotional items with school logo. Also custom printed shirts for office staff											
Percent: 20.0000										Big Star Branding, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's	52.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes: 52% is an average. Our discount ranges from 5 to 85% off of MSRP - TIPS matrix pricing. Call, fax, email or go on line for exact pricing. www.TexasSchoolweb.com. User id: 1847, Password Godley2536. Catalog items are invoiced thru TIPS/MOS Agent: Bennett's. Printing, badges, etc., will invoice thru Bennett's. No freight/No minimum other than applies to special orders.											
Percent: 52.0000										BPC Business Solutions dba Bennett's Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation	10.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes:											
Percent: 10.0000										Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc.	40.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes: Discount ranges from 10% to 50% depending on vendor and quantity requested											
Percent: 40.0000										Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc.	10.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes:											
Percent: 10.0000										DeSoto Janitorial Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Dynamic Designs Inc.	0.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes: We offer a variety of office tools with logos.											
Percent: 0.0000										Dynamic Designs Inc. Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Lakeshore Learning Materials	5.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes: Please reference "Per Bid # 22" on all purchase orders.											
Percent: 5.0000										Lakeshore Learning Materials Total Extended Price:	0.0000
Matthews Office Supply	5.0000	Y									
Response Category Notes: We offer a discount range of 5 to 93% off of list price.											

Percent: 5.0000

Matthews Office Supply Total Extended Price:

0.0000

NASCO 10.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Nasco offers discount on a per catalog basis. Discount percentage will range from 10-20% depending. Please see included discount quote 55004 for details.

Percent: 10.0000

NASCO Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Precision Business Machines, Inc. 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Discounts vary due to manufacturer incentives and specials.

Percent: 0.0000

Precision Business Machines, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Scarborough Specialties, Inc. 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: We are a full service promotional products and branded apparel company as well as being a certified HUB company. We can get literally any decorated item you need and we have our own in house screen printing and embroidery along with various other specially decoration methods. Logo'd office supplies such as pens, notepads, journals, etc

Percent: 0.0000

Scarborough Specialties, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Sullivan Supply South, Inc. 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Please see attachment above.

Percent: 0.0000

Sullivan Supply South, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Follett School Solutions 0.0000 N

Response Category Notes: No bid

Percent: 0.0000

Follett School Solutions Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Category Description: Professional Services in the area of Special Education

Category Notes: PROFESSIONAL SERVICES IN THE AREA OF SPECIAL EDUCATION FOR THERAPISTS, TEACHERS AND CONSULTANTS THAT MAY BE PAID FROM FEDERAL FUNDS

Vendor	Percent Discount	Award	ID	Item Description	Purchase Unit	Item Manufacturer & Part Number	List Price	Discount Price	Quantity	Extended Discount Price
--------	------------------	-------	----	------------------	---------------	---------------------------------	------------	----------------	----------	-------------------------

ACE Educational Supplies 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: N/A

Percent: 0.0000

ACE Educational Supplies Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Big Star Branding, Inc. 20.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: t shirts and other school related apparel & apparel accessories that are printed or embroidered.

Percent: 20.0000

Big Star Branding, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation 10.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 10.0000

Chemsearch a Div of NCH Corporation Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. 40.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: Discount ranges from 10% to 50% depending on vendor and quantity requested

Percent: 40.0000

Complete Book & Media Supply, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Kamico Instructional Media, Inc. 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: KAMICO is a TEA-approved Continuing Professional Education Provider (CPE #501171). KAMICO will customize its professional development to meet the specific needs of Godley ISD and its teachers, instructional coaches, and principals. Attendees will receive a certificate for completion of 6 hours of Continuing Professional Education. Though KAMICO does not offer discounts per se, our everyday prices are competitive with other companies' discounted prices. KAMICO Instructional Media, Inc. provides free shipping, free technical support, free web based training, and free data imports. KAMICO also ships the day an order is received to ensure that materials arrive within two business days ARO.

Percent: 0.0000

Kamico Instructional Media, Inc. Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Lakeshore Learning Materials 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: No Bid

Percent: 0.0000

Lakeshore Learning Materials Total Extended Price:

0.0000

NASCO 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes: No Bid

Percent: 0.0000

NASCO Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Premier Therapy Services, PLLC 0.0000 Y

Response Category Notes:

Percent: 0.0000

Premier Therapy Services, PLLC Total Extended Price:

0.0000

SOS Therapy Services 0.1000 Y

Response Category Notes: as above

Percent: 0.1000

SOS Therapy Services Total Extended Price:

0.0000

Follett School Solutions 0.0000 N

Response Category Notes: Please see our Professional Development offerings included within the bid letter for details.

Percent: 0.0000

Follett School Solutions Total Extended Price:

0.0000