
PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Event Number # 21-22-047 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Event Title Charter Bus Services Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type Bid Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us

Issue Date 11/19/2021 01:25:28 PM (CT) Phone

Close Date 12/8/2021 02:30:00 PM (CT) Fax

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education approve the Charter Bus Services Bid  # 21-22-047 to the lowest bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name City State Lines Awarded Award Total Award Reason

All Valley Charters, LLC MCALLEN TX 3 $5,178.50

DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC MCALLEN TX 10 $4,136.00

Escamilla Tour Buses LLC McAllen TX 2 $2,554.25

Kerrville Bus/Coach USA SAN ANTONIO TX 3 $11,863.50

MVLE Enterprises Pharr TX 10 $13,246.00

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing Jon Taylor, Fine Arts Director

BUDGETARY CONSIDERATIONS:

Funds for these purchases are budgeted through local, state, federal and grant funds

One Hundres Twenty  (120) invitations were emailed to vendors

Eight (8) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Five (5) Submitted Bid

Three (3) No Bid
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line Qty UOM Description

Award 

Response

Award 

Quantity Awarded Supplier Award Reason
1 1 EA Minimum 58 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
1 1 EA Minimum 58 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
2 1 EA Minimum 57 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
2 1 EA Minimum 57 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
3 1 EA Minimum 56 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
3 1 EA Minimum 56 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
3 1 EA Minimum 56 Seat Charter Bus $3,129.25 1 Kerrville Bus/Coach USA
3 1 EA Minimum 56 Seat Charter Bus $1,324.25 1 Escamilla Tour Buses LLC
4 1 EA Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus $3,129.25 1 Kerrville Bus/Coach USA
4 1 EA Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus $2,014.25 1 All Valley Charters, LLC
4 1 EA Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
4 1 EA Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
5 1 EA Minimum 54 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
5 1 EA Minimum 54 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
5 1 EA Minimum 54 Seat Charter Bus $2,014.25 1 All Valley Charters, LLC
6 1 EA Minimum 53 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
6 1 EA Minimum 53 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
7 1 EA Minimum 52 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
7 1 EA Minimum 52 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
8 1 EA Minimum 50 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
8 1 EA Minimum 50 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
9 1 EA Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus $204.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
9 1 EA Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus $1,394.00 1 MVLE Enterprises

10 1 EA Additional Fees $700.00 1 MVLE Enterprises
10 1 EA Additional Fees $2,300.00 1 DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC
10 1 EA Additional Fees $1,150.00 1 All Valley Charters, LLC
10 1 EA Additional Fees $5,605.00 1 Kerrville Bus/Coach USA
10 1 EA Additional Fees $1,230.00 1 Escamilla Tour Buses LLC
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Sales Representative information.
Representative Name
Representative Location

Representative Telephone Number
Representative Cellular Number
Representative Fax Number
Representative Email Address
What is the email address for all Purchase Orders to be sent?
Company Website
Business Hours

Company Quote or Reference #
Total Price $5,178.50 Total Price $4,136.00 Total Price $2,554.25

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Minimum 58 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $204.00 $204.00 No Bid

1.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $100.00
Minimum hours per trip:

1.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $100.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

1.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
2 Minimum 57 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA $204.00 $204.00 No Bid

2.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA No Bid $100.00
Minimum hours per trip:

2.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA No Bid $100.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

2.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA No Bid $4.00
3 Minimum 56 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA $204.00 $204.00 $1,324.25 $1,324.25

3.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA No Bid $100.00 $120.00
Minimum hours per trip:

3.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA No Bid $100.00 $1,200.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

3.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA No Bid $4.00 $4.25
4 Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA $2,014.25 $2,014.25 $204.00 $204.00 No Bid

4.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $210.00 $100.00
Minimum hours per trip:

4.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,800.00 $100.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

4.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.25 $4.00
5 Minimum 54 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA $2,014.25 $2,014.25 $204.00 $204.00 No Bid

5.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $210.00 $100.00 No Bid
Minimum hours per trip:

5.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,800.00 $100.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

5.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.25 $4.00
6 Minimum 53 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $204.00 $204.00 No Bid

6.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $100.00
Minimum hours per trip:

6.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $100.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

6.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
7 Minimum 52 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $204.00 $204.00 No Bid

7.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA No Bid $100.00
Minimum hours per trip:

7.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA No Bid $100.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

7.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA No Bid $4.00
8 Minimum 50 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $204.00 $204.00 No Bid

8.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $100.00
Minimum hours per trip:

8.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $100.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

8.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
9 Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $204.00 $204.00 No Bid

9.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $100.00
Minimum hours per trip:

9.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $100.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

9.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00

AWARD AWARD AWARD

Con mas de 200 millas

10

Con mas de 100 millas

10

Con mas de 100 millas

10

4 10

Con mas de 100 millas

10

Rates are based on hours, mileage or 

days whichever is greater
Con mas de 100 millas

NAN/AN/A

allvalleycharters@hotmail.com

allvalleycharters@hotmail.com

Rates are based on hours, mileage or 

days whichever is greater
Con mas de 100 millas Mileage rate will apply when it exceeds the 

minimum hourly rate.

10

4 10 8

Con mas de 100 millas

104

Con mas de 100 millasRates are based on hours, mileage or 

days whichever is greater

Rates are based on hours, mileage or 

days whichever is greater
Con mas de 100 millas

4 10

hcepeda@discoverycharterbuses.com

csr@discoverycharterbuses.com

HTTP://www.discoverycharterbuses.com

M-Th 9 am - 5 pm, Friday 9 am - 12 noon, 

Sat & Sun Closed. 

*Due to Covid -19, our temporary hours are: 

M -W 9 am -1 pm, Thu-Sun Closed.

Hector Escamilla
2801 Zinnia Ave. 

McAllen TX 78504

(956) 994-1169

http://allvalleycharters.com

Monday - Friday 8AM - 5PM

Laurie Coffey
600 Ash Ave., 

McAllen, TX 78502

(956) 213-1181
(956) 984-9101
(956) 213-1194

e-escamilla@sbcglobal.net

e-escamilla@sbcglobal.net

HTTP://www.escamillatourbuses.com

M-F 8-5

Heidi Y Cepeda de Escamilla
1608 Mozelle St. 

Pharr, TX 78577

(956) 627-2260
(956) 239-4337 (956) 648-9691

(956) 994-9491

Escamilla Tour Buses LLCDiscovery Charter Buses, LLCAll Valley Charters, LLC

(956) 797-6300
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Escamilla Tour Buses LLCDiscovery Charter Buses, LLCAll Valley Charters, LLC

10 Additional Fees 1 EA $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $1,230.00 $1,230.00
10.1 Second driver fee (Driver Relief Rate) 1 EA $800.00 $300.00 $400.00

Indicate when a second driver fee would apply:

10.2 Overnight Rate - any trip over 24 hours 1 EA $200.00 $1,000.00 $750.00
10.3 Cancellation Fee 1 EA $75.00 $1,000.00 $80.00
10.4 Fuel Surcharge - if applicable. 1 EA $75.00 $0.00 $0.00

Supplier Notes
All Valley Chaters, LLC

 $210.00 PER HOUR IN STATE - OR MILEAGE / DAYS WHICHEVER IS GREATERAll quotes are based on detailed itinerary
 All rates are based on the detailed itinerary. Calculated by hours, mileage or days whichever is greater.
 Second driver is not available during peak days which are Thursday, Friday or Saturdays.
 TBD > charter party is responsible for a Non smoking room for each driver, meals are helpful. This rate is an estimate.


100% of the charter order.
 Should diesel prices increase by 7%  (Diesel prices today @ $3.15 per gallon)

Discovery Charter Buses, LLC
 There are no 58, 57, 56, or 55-seat buses.
 Hourly Rate - Mas $100.00/extra hr.
 Mileage Rate - Minimo de 200 millas.
 Given the pandemic in 2020, there was an adjustment in the number of seats on some buses. These can have from 50, 52 and up to 54 seats.
 Extra driver fee may vary $300.00-600.00 depending on destination.


Escamilla Tour Buses LLC
 Second Driver Fee - will charge according to trip.
 Cancellation Fee - 80% will be charged if cnacelled wihtin 48 hours of trip

Kerrville Bus/Coach USA
 Fuel Surcharge - 5% fsc added to total.

MVLE Enterprises


to: (1.) 15 consecutive hours on duty in any one day. (2.) Of this 15 hours, a maximum of 10 hours may be actual driving hours. (3.) Upon reaching a destination and the driver’s total driving 
hours have been used, the driver must have a minimum of eight (8) hours off duty before local service may be performed or to begin an extended period of driving. For our customers safety 
and to comply with DOT regulations we require on all one day trips to have a hotel room for driver to rest the 8 hours required by law, pay $80 hotel fee, or $350 for an extra driver per day.

 Cancellation Fees: 
More than 1 month prior to the trip -  Deposit is not refundable               
Two weeks to a month - 50% of charter rate   
Less than two weeks prior to the trip100% of charter rate

The Department of Transportation, Bureau of Motor Carrier Safety, has adopted certain regulations for the protection and safety of both the customer and the driver. Drivers are limited 

When charter exceeds the 15 hour rule 

(driver can be on duty 15 hours / ten of 

which are driving) and driver has not 

been off duty 8 undisturbed hours prior 

to return

Trips over 15 hrs/ day A second driver is needed when a trip 

surpasses the 10 hour driving limit per day.

Cancellations must be in writing during business hours. A $75 service fee for each bus.Cancellation Fees: 31 + Days - no fee except service fee - 30-11 days - $600 per bus - 10 days or less - 

Cancellation Fee - Entered 1000.00 as it may vary and the system did not accept letters. Please refer to our Cancellation fee. You can find it attached on the Other response attachments section 

and/or in the Charter Bus Service Agreement copy. 
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Sales Representative information.
Representative Name
Representative Location

Representative Telephone Number
Representative Cellular Number
Representative Fax Number
Representative Email Address
What is the email address for all Purchase Orders to be sent?
Company Website
Business Hours

Company Quote or Reference #
Total Price $11,863.50 Total Price $13,246.00

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Minimum 58 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $1,394.00 $1,394.00

1.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

1.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

1.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
2 Minimum 57 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $1,394.00 $1,394.00

2.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

2.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

2.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
3 Minimum 56 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA $3,129.25 $3,129.25 $1,394.00 $1,394.00

3.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $125.00 $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

3.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $3,000.00 $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

3.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.25 $4.00
4 Minimum 55 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA $3,129.25 $3,129.25 $1,394.00 $1,394.00

4.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $125.00 $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

4.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $3,000.00 $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

4.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.25 $4.00
5 Minimum 54 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $1,394.00 $1,394.00

5.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

5.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

5.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
6 Minimum 53 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $1,394.00 $1,394.00

6.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

6.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

6.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
7 Minimum 52 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $1,394.00 $1,394.00

7.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

7.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

7.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
8 Minimum 50 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $1,394.00 $1,394.00

8.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

8.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

8.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00
9 Minimum 47 Seat Charter Bus 1 EA No Bid $1,394.00 $1,394.00

9.1 Hourly Rate 1 EA $140.00
Minimum hours per trip:

9.2 Daily Rate - between min. hr for Hrly Rate and up to 24 hrs 1 EA $1,250.00
Indicate when mileage rate charge will apply:

9.3 Mileage Rate 1 EA $4.00

AWARD AWARD

out of the valley

5

out of the valley

5

out of the valley

5

out of the valley

5

out of the valley

5

PHARR001 n/a

When total miles price estimate exceeds 

total price time estimate
out of the valley

51

5

8

out of the valley

5

out of the valley

When total miles price estimate exceeds 

total price time estimate
out of the valley

8 5

sales@thecharterbus.com

sales@thecharterbus.com

HTTP://thecharterbus.com

m-f 9AM-5PM

gloria.butler@coachusa.com

maria.perez@coachusa.com

HTTP://www.coachusa.com

Monday-Friday 8am-5pm

Gloria Butler
1430 E. Houston St, 

San Antonio, Texas 78202

(800) 256-2757 x325
(210) 241-4803
(210) 299-1237

MVLE Enterprises

Vicente Solar
3900 N Jackson Rd 

Pharr, TX 78577

(956) 467-5170
(956) 467-5170
(956) 467-5170

Kerrville Bus/Coach USA 

(Kerrville Bus)
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

MVLE EnterprisesKerrville Bus/Coach USA 

(Kerrville Bus)

10 Additional Fees 1 EA $5,605.00 $5,605.00 $700.00 $700.00
10.1 Second driver fee (Driver Relief Rate) 1 EA $350.00 $350.00

Minimum hours per trip:

10.2 Overnight Rate - any trip over 24 hours 1 EA $3,750.00 $350.00
10.3 Cancellation Fee 1 EA $1,500.00 $0.00
10.4 Fuel Surcharge - if applicable. 1 EA $5.00 $0.00

Supplier Notes
All Valley Chaters, LLC

 $210.00 PER HOUR IN STATE - OR MILEAGE / DAYS WHICHEVER IS GREATERAll quotes are based on detailed itinerary
 All rates are based on the detailed itinerary. Calculated by hours, mileage or days whichever is greater.
 Second driver is not available during peak days which are Thursday, Friday or Saturdays.
 TBD > charter party is responsible for a Non smoking room for each driver, meals are helpful. This rate is an estimate.


100% of the charter order.
 Should diesel prices increase by 7%  (Diesel prices today @ $3.15 per gallon)

Discovery Charter Buses, LLC
 There are no 58, 57, 56, or 55-seat buses.
 Hourly Rate - Mas $100.00/extra hr.
 Mileage Rate - Minimo de 200 millas.
 Given the pandemic in 2020, there was an adjustment in the number of seats on some buses. These can have from 50, 52 and up to 54 seats.
 Extra driver fee may vary $300.00-600.00 depending on destination.


Escamilla Tour Buses LLC
 Second Driver Fee - will charge according to trip.
 Cancellation Fee - 80% will be charged if cnacelled wihtin 48 hours of trip

Kerrville Bus/Coach USA
 Fuel Surcharge - 5% fsc added to total.

MVLE Enterprises


to: (1.) 15 consecutive hours on duty in any one day. (2.) Of this 15 hours, a maximum of 10 hours may be actual driving hours. (3.) Upon reaching a destination and the driver’s total driving 
hours have been used, the driver must have a minimum of eight (8) hours off duty before local service may be performed or to begin an extended period of driving. For our customers safety 
and to comply with DOT regulations we require on all one day trips to have a hotel room for driver to rest the 8 hours required by law, pay $80 hotel fee, or $350 for an extra driver per day.

 Cancellation Fees: 
More than 1 month prior to the trip -  Deposit is not refundable               
Two weeks to a month - 50% of charter rate   
Less than two weeks prior to the trip100% of charter rate

Cancellations must be in writing during business hours. A $75 service fee for each bus.Cancellation Fees: 31 + Days - no fee except service fee - 30-11 days - $600 per bus - 10 days or less - 

Cancellation Fee - Entered 1000.00 as it may vary and the system did not accept letters. Please refer to our Cancellation fee. You can find it attached on the Other response attachments 

section and/or in the Charter Bus Service Agreement copy. 

The Department of Transportation, Bureau of Motor Carrier Safety, has adopted certain regulations for the protection and safety of both the customer and the driver. Drivers are limited 

When trip exceeds 10 driving hours and/or 

15 hours on duty
See note below
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Attribute Name All Valley Charters, LLC DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC Escamilla Tour 

Buses LLC

Kerrville Bus/Coach USA 

(Kerrville Bus)

MVLE Enterprises

Business/Company Owner Name Dwight Yoder Owner  Discovery Charter Buses, LLC Escamilla Tour Buses Kerrville Bus/ Coach USA Jose Vicente Solar
Date of Establishment 6/25/2015 January 28, 2013 8/19/2002 07/29/1929 2007
Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications? Yes No No No No
If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please 

specify deviations:

Overnight stay(s), charter party is 

responsible for Norn-smoking room for each 

driver. Changes are allowed without penalty 

only if additional miles or hours don't 

increase or hours don't increase. 

Cancellations made twenty-four (24) hours 

prior to the event "Will" be charge a 

cancelation fee.

No deviation NA N/A no deviation

CERTIFICATIONS AND REQUESTED DOCUMENTATION
The following is to be used as a check list for the 

Bidder for submission of the bid response.

Proof of compliance with all Federal, including the 

Federal Motor Carrier Safety Regulations 

(FMCSR) and State Regulation.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Licensing from the Interstate Commerce 

Commission (ICC) and the United States 

Department of Transportation (USDOT).

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Current Department of Transportation MCS 90B, 

Endorsement for Motor Carrier Policies of 

Insurance for Public Liability.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Company policy documentation outlining 

program requirements, statement of compliane 

with (FMCSR) concerning drug testing, and proof 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

The selection criteria and approval of bus drivers. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Emergency Road Service Contingency Plan. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
List of equipment (by make, model, year, and 

mileage) that will be used in performance of 

services, and the number of buses that are 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Brief Description of preventative maintenance 

program and verification of compliance with 

(FMCSR) concerning motor vehicle maintenance.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Proof of business Automobile Liability Insurance 

(Each Person, Each Occurrence) - Bodily Injury - 

five million dollars combined single limit / in the 

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Proof of Property Damage Insurance (Each 

Occurrence) - five million dollars combined single 

limit/ in the aggregate.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Proof of Workman's Compensation Employer's 

Liability Insurance (Statutory Limits) - five 

hundred thousand each accident, five hundred 

thousand policy limit and five hundred thousand 

Yes No Yes Yes Yes

Must provide Texas Department of Motor 

Vehicles TxDMV Certificate Number, US DOT 

Number and Certificate Status.

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Must submit at least three (3) references that 

have contracted with company to provide like 

products and/or services (Vendor Reference 

Form available in "Attachments" tab).

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Additional Comments/Notes: Our bus insurance will be renewed soon. It 

must be completely renewed by February 

23, 2022. You may obtain an updated copy 

of the Certificate of Insurance by that date. 

Thank you.

N/A
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

All Valley Charters, LLC Laurie Coffey allvalleycharters@hotmail.com All Valley Charters respectfully submits this bid and supporting 

documentation for the charter bus service bid #21-22-047.

We look forward working the the P.S.J.A Independent School District 

for you charter bus needs.

Mileage for the vehicles, I don't have, they are all out today.

DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC Heidi Cepeda de Escamilla hcepeda@discoverycharterbuses.com

Escamilla Tour Buses LLC Hector Escamilla e-escamilla@sbcglobal.net

Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrville Bus) Gloria Butler gloria.butler@coachusa.com

MVLE Enterprises Jose Vicente Solar sales@thecharterbus.com

Page 8

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / FEBRUARY 7, 2022



PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 01/21/2022

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner/CEO
All Valley Charters, LLC 12/07/2021 Submitted Dwight Yoder MCALLEN TX Automatic 11/19/2021 Dwight Yoder
DISCOVERY CHARTER BUSES,LLC 12/08/2021 Submitted Heidi Y. Cepeda de Escamilla MCALLEN TX Automatic 11/19/2021 Heidi. Y. Escamilla
Escamilla Tour Buses LLC 12/07/2021 Submitted Hector Escamilla McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021 Hector Escamilla
Kerrville Bus/Coach USA (Kerrville Bus) 12/03/2021 Submitted Gloria Butler SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 11/19/2021 Rich Funkey
MVLE Enterprises 12/06/2021 Submitted Jose Vicente Solar Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021 Jose V. Solar

Meme's Paint & Body Shop Viewed Manuel Alvarado Sullivan City TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Milnet Architectural Services, PLLC. Viewed Rodolfo R. Molina, Jr. McAllen TX

PWXpress Viewed mary miller Jacksonville FL

SPIKES FORD (SPIKES MOTOR COMPANY) Viewed MICHAEL RAMIREZ MISSION TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Student Transportation of America dba GoldStar Transit (Student Transportation of America)Viewed Austin TX

Texas Music Festivals Enterprise, Inc Viewed Wilberto Perez San Juan TX Automatic 11/19/2021

TRI-COUNTY COMMUNICATIONS Viewed WESLACO TX Automatic 11/19/2021

TRS Equipment LLC Viewed Adkins TX Automatic 11/19/2021

EF Educational Tours 11/22/2021 No Bid Denver CO Automatic 11/19/2021

FUEL INJECTION SERVICE (SOUTH TEXAS DIESEL SERVICE, INC)11/19/2021 No Bid FELIX CANO PHARR TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Gateway Printing 11/23/2021 No Bid Chris Diaz Edinburg TX

AFFORDABLE AUTO GLASS ANA VACA MCALLEN TX Automatic 11/19/2021

AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV Javier Olmos McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

ALC Schools, LLC (Alternative Logistics Technologies Holdings, Inc.) St. George UT Automatic 11/19/2021

Amalgamated Services, Inc. Derrick Bovino Frankfort IL Automatic 11/19/2021

ARTS Automotive Repair Tire Service LLC Fernando Crispin Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

BLUEFIN, LLC (a division of Mantis Innovation, LLC) Kim Peters Greenwood VillageCO Automatic 11/19/2021

Boggus Motor Sales II, LLC Raul Gonzalez McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Boswell Elliff Ford (L.T. Boswell Ford) Robert Garcia San Benito TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Brewster's Guacamaya Enterprises Frank Brewster III Mission TX Automatic 11/19/2021

BURGESS FABRICS & UPHOLSTERY SUPPLIES Daniel D Polewski McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC) Scott Vaughan Weslaco TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Bus.Com Oleh Kaluzny Montreal QC Automatic 11/19/2021

Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell TX Automatic 11/19/2021

CompuGroup Medical Phoenix AZ Automatic 11/19/2021

ConstructConnect Cincinnati OH Automatic 11/19/2021

Construction Journal LLC Pamela Exton Stuart FL Automatic 11/19/2021

Copy Zone (CBSPrint, LLC) Pily Stevens Mcallen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Cougar Bus Lines Ltd. Ricardo Rodriguez Jr. Laredo TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Creative Bus Sales Steve Allen Irving TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Data Recognition Corporation Maple Grove MN Automatic 11/19/2021

Defender Supply Mike Hewitt Argyle TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Doggett Freightliner Robert Burk Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS, PHARR MICHAEL GUZMAN PHARR TX Automatic 11/19/2021

EAN Holdings LLC SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Early Childhood Writing Consultants LLC Maria Tamez McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Educational Rights Information and Consulting Center (Mary M Durheim) Mary Durheim Spring TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Elsa Auto & Truck Parts Lupe Garza McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Event & Suppliers Inc. Roberto Lagos Hidalgo TX Automatic 11/19/2021

EXPRESS TRAVEL (EXPRESS CRUISE & TOURS INC) sofia DelToro McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Five star lights Eduardo sanchez Mcallen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Fleetpride Truck and Trailer parts (Fleetpride inc) Richard Ramirez Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Footsteps 2 Brilliance, Inc. Holly De Leon Washington DC Automatic 11/19/2021

Ford Motor Company Downers Grove IL Automatic 11/19/2021

Fourtify, LLC David Iglesias McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Gallagher (Gallagher Benefit Service, Inc.) San Antonio TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Go With Jo! Travel (Go With Jo! Inc.) Jonathan Kantun Harlingen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Guardian Music and Group Travel Matthew Granger Park Ridge IL Automatic 11/19/2021

Gunn Chevrolet LTD David Espinoza Selma TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Heavy Duty Bus Parts Inc Molly Jannett Willis TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Hi-LoContractor LLC Edmundo Carreon Elsa TX Automatic 11/19/2021

HINO GAS SALES INC Alex Hinojosa Jr Harlingen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

HP Financial Services (Hewlett Packard Financial Services Company, Inc.) Paul Hermann Berkeley Heights NJ Automatic 11/19/2021

Hunt & Woodruff Construction  Co LLC Keith F. Hunt Laguna Vista TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Infinite Computer Solutions Rockville MD Automatic 11/19/2021

Insight Darak Weaver McAllen, TX Automatic 11/19/2021

International Travel Education Delia Magdaleno McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

JRF INDUSTRIES LLC JOHN R FLOOD SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Kyrish Truck Center (Santex Truck Center) Kelly Jennings San Antonio TX Automatic 11/19/2021
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

CHARTER BUS SERVICES BID # 21-22-047

BID OPENING: DECEMBER 8, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Legna International Trade Albeza Alanis El Paso TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Library Video Company d/b/a SAFARI Montage West ConshohockenPA Automatic 11/19/2021

Lone Star Education Products and Services, LLC Vicki Robinson Bulverde TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Longhorn Bus Sales Marcos Gutierrez Houston TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Lowman Consulting LLC John Lowman Sachse TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Lydia Savedra Consulting Lydia Savedra McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Magneto & Diesel Injector Service, Inc. (M&D Distributors) Carlos Briones LAREDO TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Marco A. Arredondo, Inc. Marco Arredondo Portland TX Automatic 11/19/2021

MatlScience Inc. Barbara S. Brown Dallas TX Automatic 11/19/2021

MB Services LLC George Selvera Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Meraki Institute of Beauty and Wellness, LLC Belinda Ibarra Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

MINDFULNESS FOR A CHANGE LLC Claudia Luna Lenexa KS Automatic 11/19/2021

MSB Consulting Austin TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Newkirk & Newkirk, Inc. Pierre Newkirk McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

North Side Chevrolet (Tejas Chevrolet) DAVID ESPINOZA San Antonio TX Automatic 11/19/2021

OK TOURS, LLC (OK TOURS LLC) Marcos Sarmiento SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Ortegon Insurance Agency LLC Yvonne M. Ortegon Weslaco TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Pan American Auto, LLC omar molina Mcallen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Perform America-Texas, LLC. Chris Martin Spring TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Pfluger Architects, Inc. Austin TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Prismatic Services Cornelius NC Automatic 11/19/2021

Puro Aseguro Inc Melba Figueroa Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Radio Engineering Industries, Inc. (REI) Proposal Writer Omaha NE Automatic 11/19/2021

Red Barn TK, LLC John Egan Weston CT Automatic 11/19/2021

Red Charter Buses LLC Andres Ortiz brownsville TX Automatic 11/19/2021

RGV Boilers Inc. Mike Garcia McAllen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

RGV GUARDIAN ENTERPRISES LLC DBA DERTY SPORTS (DERTY SPORTS) Rick Romo PHARR TX Automatic 11/19/2021

RGVCM Group, Consultants & Managers (RGVCM Group, LLC) JOSE ALFREDO LOPEZ Edinburg TX Automatic 11/19/2021

RODRIGUEZ FORD DBA CARDENAS FORD FRANK CASTILLO RAYMONDVILLE TX Automatic 11/19/2021

RTI International (Research Triangle Institute) Linda Eubanks Research Triangle ParkNC Automatic 11/19/2021

Rush Bus Centers Randy McWhirter Selma TX Automatic 11/19/2021

RUSH TRUCK CENTER, PHARR (Rush Truck Centers of Texas, L.P) Mario M. Trevino Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Sam's Limousine & Transportation, Inc. Joellen Howell Houston TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Schindler Elevator Corporation Corpus Christi TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Sharon Wells Mathematics Curriculum Inc. Vanessa Hamel Edinburg TX Automatic 11/19/2021

SILSBEE FORD Jarrod Runnels SILSBEE TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Sirius Education Solutions (Sirius Education Solutions LLC) Susan Bernal Austin TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Solid Border, Inc. David Williams San Antonio TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Southern Tire Mart, LLC Richard Conwill Columbia MS Automatic 11/19/2021

speedy transmissions #2 JUAN HERRERA Mcallen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

SRC Solutions, Inc. Center Valley PA Automatic 11/19/2021

Star Shuttle, Inc. Melanie Camarillo San Antonio TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Stewart & Stevenson Jerry Perez PHARR TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Technology International, Inc. Lake Mary FL Automatic 11/19/2021

The Certified Welding and Testing Co. Richard DePue Springville NY Automatic 11/19/2021

The College Board Austin TX Automatic 11/19/2021

The Rose Report Beeville TX Automatic 11/19/2021

the valley windshields llc ricardo rojas PHARR TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Thermo King Of South Texas Jose Gonzalez Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Thomas Bus Gulf Coast (Thomas Bus Gulf Coast, G.P.,Inc) Harry Hughes Houston TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Top Gear Diesel On The Go LLC. rafael ledezma Pharr TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Trinity Review Services, Inc Johnny L. Rogers Desoto TX Automatic 11/19/2021

United Data Technologies Tyler Coombs Miramar FL Automatic 11/19/2021

US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS Jeff Alloway SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Valley Transit Company Antonio Nino Harlingen TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Vertex Marketing Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Western Motorcoach, Inc Sales Houston TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Wexford Inc Sheila Cassidy Executive Director Rancho Palos VerdesCA Automatic 11/19/2021

Wynne Transportation LLC Nicki Smith Irving TX Automatic 11/19/2021

Zuniga's House Mover, LLC Hugo A Zuniga San Juan TX Automatic 11/19/2021
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