PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO |.S.D.
PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Event Number 21-22-031 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Event Title Paper Towels and Dispenser for Use District-Wide Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type Bid Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Issue Date 9/17/2021 01:38:34 PM (CT) Phone

Close Date 10/6/2021 04:00:00 PM (CT) Fax

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education approve the Paper Towels and Dispenser for Use District-Wide Bid # 21-22-031 to the
lowest bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name City State Lines Awarded Award Total Award Reason
OMA Industries, LLC HARLINGEN X 1 $32,112.00
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC Pharr TX 1 $84,480.00
TOTAL: $116,592.00
Ralph Mendez, Director of Procurement Jim Brewster, Property Control Coordinator

Budgetary Considerations: Funds for these purchases are budgeted through local, state, federal, and grant funds.

Three Hundred Eighty-Two (382) invitations were emailed to vendors
Sixteen (16) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Five (5) Submitted Bid

Nine (9) No Bid
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PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO 1.S.D.

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Award  |Award
Line Qty UOM Description Manufacturer Manuf. Number Response |Qty Awarded Supplier Award Reason
1 6600 CS Natural Roll Hand Towel Comfort Institucionales C2018-1 $12.80 6600 Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC Low Bid
2 720 EA Auto-Cut Towel Dispenser Dispensing Dynamics International HF108-03 (smoke) $44.60 720 OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC Low Bid Justified

**JUSTIFICATION**

2 C&VSupply Inc. bid response was for a percentage discount and not a price per product.
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PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO |.S.D.
PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

| 1|Natura| Roll Hand Towel

Supplier QTY UOM  Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
OMA Industries, LLC 6600 CASE $0.00 $0.00 Comfort Institucionales C2018-1
Competitive Choice Inc. 6600 CASE $0.00 $0.00 Comfort Institucionales €2018-1
AWARD Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC 6600 CASE $12.80 $84,480.00 ifacturer: Comfort Institucional e confortinstitucionales G201
C€2018-1 Item Notes: 6 rolls per case, 600.4 feet per roll,
one-ply, natural, embossed paper. 100% recycled
fiber,base weight 25.84 gr/cm, roll weight 2.89 Ibs.,
exterior diameter 7.08in., interior diameter 1.81 in.,
width 7.87in., boxes per pallet 50 and 50% post-
consumer content.
[ALTZ] Competitive Choice Inc. 3300 CASE $34.65 $114[345_00 Morsoft Universal Roll Towels, Kraft, 1-Ply, 600 ft, 7.8" Dia, MORCON MORR12600
12 Rolls/Carton
C&V Supply Inc. 6600 CASE $18.50 $122,100.00 Comfort Institucionales €2018-1
[ALTl] Competitive Choice Inc. 6600 CASE $20_53 $135,498.00 Morsoft Universal Roll Towels, 8" x 800 ft, Brown, 6 MORCON MORR6800
Rolls/Carton
Gulf Coast Paper 6600 CASE 520_75 5135,950.00 NPS M30700 Comfort Institucionales C2018-1
[ALTl] OMA Industries, LLC 6600 CASE $113_00 $745,800.00 ESSITY TORK 7171300 (6-800 Essity Universal Hand Towel  ESSITY Mfg. Part # TRK7171300,
Roll, Notched, 7.5" x 800 ft, Natural, 6 Rolls/Carton) UPC # 10073286646184
| 2|Auto—Cut Towel Dispenser
Supplier QTY UOM  Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Gulf Coast Paper 720 EA 50.00 50.00 KC 09990. MUST WIN ROLL TOWEL BID TO QUALIFY FOR  Dispensing Dynamics Int'l HF108-03 (smoke)
FREE DISPENSERS.
competitive Choice Inc. 720 EA $0_00 $o_oo **NO INSTALLATION INCLUDED** Dispensing Dynamics Int'l HF108-03 (smoke)
c&V Supply Inc. 720 EA 518.50 $131320-00 Dispensing Dynamics Int'l HF108-03 (smoke)
AWARD OMA Industries, LLC 720 EA $44.60 $32,112.00 Dispensing Dynamics Int'l HF108-03 (smoke)
[ALTl] Competitive Choice Inc. 720 EA 598.66 571,035.20 Tear-N-Dry Essence Automatic Dispenser, Classic, 11.75x  CFS BRANDS SJIMT8000TBK
9.13 x 14.44, Black Pearl
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC 720 EA No Bid Dispensing Dynamics Int'l  HF108-03 (smoke)
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PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO |.S.D.
PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Attribute Name C&V Supply Inc. Competitive Choice Inc. Gulf Coast Paper OMA Industries, LLC Yanitor Paper and

Supplies, LLC
Business/Company Owner Name JUAN O'FARRILL Aundrea Young GULF COAST PAPER Lucia M. Valdez Jorge E. Garza

COMPANY
Date of Establishment 08/30/1990 2003 08/24/1965 01-01-2007 3/21/2012
Will the bid/proposal deviate from No No No No No
specifications?
If no please state "No deviation", if yes, NO DEVIATION N/A NO DEVIATION No deviation "No deviation"
please specify deviations:
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|Responding Supplier

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO 1.S.D.

PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031

Signature Full Name

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

C&V Supply Inc.

JUAN O'FARRILL

Signature Email Supplier Notes

Competitive Choice Inc.

Gulf Coast Paper

OMA Industries, LLC

Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC

Julia Suan

Jessica Cavazos

Lucia M. Valdez
Carlos Manuel Franco

administration@cvsupplyinc.com
BIDS@COMPETITIVECHOICE.NET
jessica.cavazos@imperialdade.com
luciavaldez@omaindustries.com

pharr@yanitor.com We are just bidding on item #1 with the product and model you

requested. Thank you for inviting us to participate!
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Participation Summary - As of 01/05/2022

Participant Name

C&V SUPPLY INC.

COMPETITIVE CHOICE INC.

Gulf Coast Paper

OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC

Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC
Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp

CC Distributors, Inc.

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.

Delta Specialties Supply (Martin Pena)
EPIC SOLAR CONTROL, LLC

MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY PRODUCTS (N
Rio Paper & Supply, LLC

School Specialty, Inc.

Traveling Beans

ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.

Bomar air conditioning and refrigeratic
COMOROZ INC

CompuGroup Medical

Ferguson Facilities Supply

Gateway Printing

Goliath Services (Goliath Builders and |
McKesson Medical-Surgical Governme
Office Depot, Inc

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAM
Samsclub 8250

Six Shooter Softwawsh (Sixto Garza Jr |
SOURCEONE SUPPLY (RESOURCE VENT
Staples Contract & Commercial
Strategic Partnerships, Inc

The PlanIT Room

11400 Inc

2M Lighting RGV

365 Paving & Construction LLC

3C Mechanical Technologies

9TO 5 COMPUTER

A+ Medical Examiners

Aarco Products, Inc.

Aasdel Corporation

ABC Custom Advertising (Marketing Cc
ABC Supply inc.

Academic Specialties Texas (Haldeman
ACCO Brands USA LLC (ACCO Brands Ci
Accredited Lock Suppy Co (Accredited
Accu Aire Mechanical LLC

Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.
Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAst Grc
Advantage Imaging Supply, Inc

AHI Facility Services, Inc.

AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV

AITA CONSULTING SERVICES,INC
Alamo Iron Works (Alamo Distribution,
Alamo Iron Works (Vallen Distribution)
All American Poly

Allied Plastics Co., Inc.

AllState Supplies

Allstates Coatings Company (LBS Enter
Alpha and Omega Cleaning Services,LLl
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS

Alvarez Roofing LLC

AM Utilities and Construction LLC
American Industrial Supplies & Tool Re
Amsterdam Partners

Arga development

Auto-Chlor Services, LLC

Battery Systems Inc

Bell's Security Sales Inc

Best Buy For Business (Best Buy Stores
Betco Corporation

big m pest services, inc

BioFit Engineered Products Limited Par
BizSupplies

Blink Marketing Inc

Blue Sky Enterprises

BM Benchmark Construction, LLC

BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION, LLC
Bocci Engineering

Bon Tool Co

Response Date Response Status

PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031

10/04/2021
10/06/2021
10/06/2021
09/30/2021
10/06/2021
09/28/2021
09/29/2021
09/23/2021
09/23/2021
09/28/2021
09/20/2021
10/06/2021
09/24/2021
09/21/2021

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO 1.S.D.

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Contact

JUAN O'FARRILL
JULIA SUAN

Jessica Cavazos

Lucia Valdez

Carlos Manuel Franco
Celeste Cantu

Andrew Serhofer
MARTIN PENA
KELLY EDER

ARLENE KENNEDY
Jesus A. Sanchez
Accounts Receivable
Leslie Rocha

KATE HOUGHTON
Michael Bocanegra
STANLEY ADIGUN

Chris Diaz

Edgar Gallegos
Thomas Bryant
Nadia Garza
PATRICIA OLIVAS
Carlos Garcia
Sixto Garza
MARILYN MURRAY
Ladara Lucas
Kristin Gordon
Cecilia Hernandez
Lisa Wick

Pete Ostrowski
Gilberto Maldonado
Shane Howard
RICHARD RAAB
Freddy Romero
Jay L. Krause
Sabbir Mahmud
Martha J Miller
katherine garcia
Justin Perez
Customer Care

Monica M Harris

Marguerite Burton
James Reid

Luke Bruns

Javier Olmos
KEVIN KUMAR
Stacey B Sims
Robert Garcia

Jay L. Krause
Wendy Davis

Ismael De Leon

Marco Alvarez
Roberto Morales
Ruben Diaz

Suzanne Cruz
Rick Middleton

mathew thamaravelil
Cathy M. Thomas
rushelle wetzel
Darlene Zwolinski
Alonzo Acosta

TONY RODRIGUEZ
Lianne Lami
Paul Bender
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City

MISSION
Houston
Brownsville
HARLINGEN
Pharr

Alamo
Corpus Christi
Linden
EDINBURG
MCKINNEY
SIOUX CITY
Pharr
Greenville
San Juan
pearl river
Pharr
AVENTURA
Phoenix

San Anotnio
Edinburg
Pharr

Atlanta
Austin
TAMPA
mcallen
MCALLEN
ZANESVILLE
Dallas

Austin

El Paso
Lancaster
Pharr

Mission
Waco
Jacksonville Beach
McAllen
Yaphank
Norcross
McAllen
McAllen
Minneapolis
Dallas
Secaucus
SAN ANTONIO
Harlingen
Forest Hill
San Juan Capistrano
Dallas
McAllen
NORTH BRUNSWICK
Alpharetta
Pharr
Piscataway
Jacksonville
Athens
Gladewater
Edinburg
edinburg
Weslaco
Mission
McAllen
Lincoln Park
Mission
Jefferson
Garden Grove
BLOOMFIELD
Richfield
Bowling Green
Ingleside
Bowling Green
Houston
Cleveland

La Blanca
McAllen

San Juan
Cypress
Gibsonia

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / JANUARY 17, 2022

state
X
TX
X
TX
X
X
T
NJ
T
X

X
Wi
X
NY
X
FL
AZ
X
X
X
GA
X
FL
X
X
OH
X
X
X
PA
X
X
X

X
NY
GA
X
X
MN
X
NJ
X
X
X
CA
X
X
NJ
GA
X
NJ
FL
GA
X
X
X
X
X
X
NJ
X
LA
CA
NJ
MN
OH
X
OH
X
OH
X
X
X
X
PA

Invitation Type Invitation Date
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021

Owner/CEO
Juan O'Farrill
Aundrea Young
Pete Petkoff
Lucia M. Valdez
Jorge E. Garza



Participation Summary - As of 01/05/2022

Participant Name
Boost Metal

BOXX Modular (Nortex Modular Leasin
Boydsco Holdings LLC

Brodart Co.

Bros Pressure Washing and Striping
BuckHorn Construction LLC

Buffalo Construction LLC.

Burton Companies (Burton Companies
Butler Business Products

C&H Distributors, LLC

C.E.D. / Valmac Electric Supply

CAPA Texas

Caprice Electronics, Inc.

Carrier Corporation

Cascade School Supples

Cascade School Supplies

Castcon Construction Co., LLC

Catalyst PR INC

CDW Government LLC

Celso Gonzalez Construction

Center Stone Services

Central Plumbing & Electric Supply (CE
Certified Laboratories (a divsion of NCt
Champion Flooring LLC

CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS

Cintas Corporation #538

Circle Saw Builders Supply, Inc
Claridge Products and Equipment, Inc.
Classic Images Photos and AWARDSS (;
Coast To Coast Computer Products, Inc
Coastal Distribution (Coastal Roofing S
COLLEGE THRIVER INC

Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (G
Compostology LLC

Computer Comforts, Inc
ConstructConnect

Construction Bid Source (Plan Room)
Construction Journal LLC

Continental Flooring Company

Copy Graphics Inc.

Copy Plus LLC

Copy Zone (CBSPrint, LLC)

Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Compa
Costco Wholesale

Curbell Plastics, Inc.

CV INDUSTRIAL HARDWARE LLC

D & R Commercial Glass LLC

Daikin Applied (Daikin Applied Americe
Dallas Lighthouse for the Blind/ Envisic
Daybreak LED LLC

Dealers Electrical Supply Co.

Del Valle Pest Control

Delegard Tool of Texas

Deltek

Demo Con, Inc.

Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.
Diamond G Services, LLC

Diaz Floors & Interiors, Inc.

Dispensing Dynamics

Dixon Ticonderoga

DOCK & DOOR SYSTEMS, INC. (AAA DC
Doggett Heavy Machinery Services
Double M laser products inc.

Dream Ranch Office Supplies (Dream R
Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc.
ECOEFFECT

Ecolab Inc.

Econ Group, LLC

Education Account Executive

Elite Disinfecting Services (Elite Oil Fiel
ELITE PROMOTIONS

Elsa Auto & Truck Parts

Embroidery Express

EMEX, LLC dba Mantis Innovation, Inc.
Empire Paper Company

Encino Construction

ESHA AV

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO 1.S.D.

PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Contact

Sully Villarreal
Harold Weatherly
Carl j boyd

Cathy M. Thomas
John Ramirez
Chad Bishop
FRED GUERRA
Scott Vaughan
Stacy Duke
William Rose
Ricardo Casarez
junior ocampo
Michael Kluger
Carrier Corporation
Todd Shafer
Todd Shafer
Robert Castaneda, Jr.
Holly Arbuckle
Mike Smith

Celso Gonzalez

Toni Boyd

Carol Werket
Derek Barrera
Roger Rodriguez
Juan R Ruiz

Kristi Popin

Jesse Garcia
Miranda Horowitz
Joyce Stephenson
shawntia lee
D'Ann lvers

Kash Nathan
Cathy L. Thomas

Pamela Exton

Tracy Johnson

David Valdez

Lorissa Pecina

Pily Stevens
Baldomero Gonzalez
Esmeralda Maldonado
Bill Heckert
Giovanni Olivos
Robert Gomez
Joanne Lawson

Rebecca McCarthy
Orlando Cruz

Paul C. Nave
Source Management

Sandra Salinas
Carlos A. Garcia
Andres Diaz, Sr.

Chrissie Mouton
Agustin Arreola
Andy Ramos

Rosanne Benoit
Alejandro Alanis
Dale Mrozinski
Gilbert Enriquez
Luis Montes
Juan Suarez
Rossy Galarza
Lupe Garza

Wendy Callan
Bids

Fred

Shrey Parikh
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City

McAllen
Fort Worth
Lansing
Williamsport
Edinburg
Harlingen
WESLACO
Weslaco
Houston
Chicago
Pharr
Mission
Brooklyn
Milssouri
North Adams
North Adams
Mission
Conroe
Vernon Hills
Mission
Weslaco
Weslaco
Irving
Pittsburg
MCALLEN
Mercedes
Houston
Farmers Branch
Pharr

Simi Valley
Webster
orlando

San Antonio
Waco
Kemah
Cincinnati
Felton
Stuart
Scottsdale
McAllen

MC ALLEN
Mcallen
Pharr

Pharr
Houston
Mission
McAllen
Chicago
Dallas

SAN ANTONIO
Waco, Texas
McAllen
Houston
Herndon

La Feria
Palmhurst
McAllen
Pharr

San Marcos
Lake Mary
PHARR

San Juan
Houston
Krum

Dallas
McAllen

St. Paul
Edinburg
San Antonio
Mission
Brownsville
McAllen
Weslaco
Houston
Wichita Falls
mcallen

East Brunswick

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / JANUARY 17, 2022

state
T
X
MI
PA
T
X
T
X
T
IL
T
X
NY
X
MA
MA
T
X
IL
X
T
X
T
KS
X
TX
X
TX
X
CA
X
FL
X
TX
X
OH
CA
FL
AZ
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
IL
X
X
X
X
X
VA
X
T
X
T
CA
FL
X
T
X
T
X
T
MN
T
X
T
X
T
X
T
X
T
NJ

Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner/CEO
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021



Participation Summary - As of 01/05/2022

Participant Name

Evolve Paints (BMB Paints and Coating
Facility Solutions Group LLC

Fairway Supply, Inc.

FasClampitt Paper-McAllen

fat cat signs lic

Fedex Office and Print Services, Inc
FERGUSON ENTERPRISES

Fomcore, LLC

Fourtify Construction

Fourtify, LLC

Francisco tenorio

Full Stop Equipment LLC

Fully Promoted McAllen (Hema, Ltd. Cc
GALVAMET STEEL LLC

GALVAN BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION CC
gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)
General contractor/Construction (Davi
General Garage Door Service, INC.
Genesis I, Inc

Global Industrial (Global Equipment Cc
GNG General Contracting

Go UnderGround

Gonzalez Enterprises, LLC

Green Dream Internationl

Greenwood Office Outfitters

Groupo GTE, LLC

GTL LIGHTING (CLAY BRANCH, INC.)
H&H door (Zelkowski)

Hand Safety, LLC

Hann Manufacturing, Inc.

Harcourt Outlines, Inc. (Harcourt Indus
hdc video and communications dba (M
HDL Promos

High End Advertising

High Point (Western BRW Paper Co., Ir
Hillyard, Texas

Hi-LoContractor LLC

Hobart Service

Holchemont, Ltd.

Home Design Center (V&L ENTERPRISE
Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC
Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)

IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc

llusion invitaciones & boutique
Imagery Graphic Systems

Indoff, Inc. (Indoff, Incorporated)
Industrial Signs and Welding
International Carpet One (Yeshua Inc)
INTERNATIONAL ROADWAY RESEARCH
Ironwood Manufacturing, Inc.

Javier Navarrete (All Star Trophies & T-
JCO "the door people"

JGA ROOFING SYSTEMS, LLC
JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE PROTECTIOI
Jolvaz LLC dba RIO-TECH

JR RAMON & SONS INC (JR(Joe)Ramon
Justin Seed Co.

K12Marketplace LLC

K12Savings (Textbook Brokers inc)
kautsch lumber co inc

KAUTSCH TRUE VALUE (TRUE TEST VEN
Kimball Midwest (Midwest Motor Supg
King Pest Solutions LLC

Klein Design Inc

L & M Food Service Inc.

Lamac (Trey Gonzalez)

LARRY WUNSCH AND ASSOCIATES
Lawson Products Inc

LD Products, Inc.

Legna International Trade

Leija Welding

Lennox Industries Inc.

Lewis Electric Motors, Inc.

Lexine Inc

Liberty Office Products (Liberty Data Pi
Limitless Office Products

Little Giants Learning Center

Response Date Response Status

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO 1.S.D.

PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Contact

Elda Barbosa
Doug Brown
Kathy Millican
Andres Ramos JR
Liza Lemos
Humberto Barberena
JESUS CAMPOS
Jay L. Krause
Sam De la Garza
David Iglesias
Francisco Tenorio
Elias Macias
Hector Leal

GALVAN BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION CO
Juan Garcia

Tommy Canul

Manuel chapa

William Cox

William Rose

Phillip Garza

Eli Gonzalez
Antone Austin
Robert Rosalez
Gregg Taylor
Michael Lee

Ramon K Flanigan
Jay L. Krause
Andrew M Norris
Maria del Castillo
HERIBERTO LOPEZ
Mariano Nunez
Jane Lopez

Mario Gonzales
Edmundo Carreon
Michael Birt
Annette Carmona
Victor Cantu

Keith F. Hunt

Roy Garrison IlI
Donato Vera
CYNTHIA LEYVA
Matt Tumelson

Roman Gonzales
Francisco Galvan
LINDA TRAHAN
Cathy M. Thomas
Javier Navarrete
Joe Perez

Heather Foster
Connie Garza
Joe R Ramon llI

Dalton Williams

Dylan Silkey

kookii crerar

KOOKII CRERAR

Katelyn Pankuch

Iris Galvan / Eric De Leon

Stacie Wilburn
TREY GONZALEZ
JOHN FREEMAN

Diana Athey
Albeza Alanis

Enrique Mendez
Frank Martinez
Scott Wiland
Mita Guha
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City

Pharr
Harlingen
Austin
Mcallen
Edinburg
McAllen
PHARR
Muskegon
Edinburg
McAllen

San Juan

La Joya
McAllen
EDINBURG
CORPUS CHRISTI
san juan
Pharr

Pharr

Rock Hill
Chicago
McAllen
harlingen
Edinburg
Erie

Fort Worth
Las Vegas
Houston
Victoria
Wichita Falls
McConnelsville
Milroy
mcallen
WESLACO
Mission
Dallas

San Antonio
Elsa

Troy
McAllen
McAllen
Laguna Vista
Harlingen
Pharr

Pharr

San Antonio
Kansas City
DONNA
Brownsville
HUMBLE
Missoula
Los Fresnos
EDINBURG
Waco
ROUND ROCK
McAllen
SAN ANTONIO
Justin

Ozark
Sparta
alamo
alamo
Columbus
Pharr

Henry
Henderson
MCALLEN
SAN ANTONIO
Chicago
Long Beach
El Paso
Pharr
Richardson
HARLINGEN
McAllen
Houston
RICHARDSON
Alamo

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / JANUARY 17, 2022

state
T
X
T
X
T
X
T
Ml
T
X
T
X
T
X
T
X
T
X
SC
IL
T
X
T
PA
X
NV
X
TX
X
OH
IN
TX
X
TX
X
TX
X
OH
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
MO
X
X
X
MT
X
X
X
X
X
T
X
MO
MO
T
X
OH
X
IL
NV
T
X
IL
CA
T
X
T
X
T
X
T
X

Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner/CEO
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021



Participation Summary - As of 01/05/2022

Participant Name

Lone Star General Services (Lone Star (
Lowes Of Pharr (lowe's home center. |l
Lumatec Lighting Service

LUNA GLASS LLC

M&A Technology (M&A Technology In
M&K Imports LLC

Mark Andy, Inc. dba Mark Andy Print P
MARK HOSKINS ENTERPRISES LLC
MARKS PLUMBING PARTS (JOHN W. G
Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS

MB Services LLC

McAllen Sports Inc.

McCoys Building Supply (McCoy Corpo
McLemore Building Maintenance, Inc.
MEGA RACKS LLC (GERARDO DAVALOS
MH ENTERPRISES (MH ENTERPRISES 8¢
Mid Valley Pest Control

MiIEN Company, Inc.

Modern Imaging Solutions

Morning Star Industries Inc

MPWR Electrical Direct

National Art & School Supplies Inc.
National Chemical Laboratories Inc
Natural Wellness Brand

Nightlock RGV Distributor LLC.

Noble Texas Builders

Ontiveros Floor Covering LLC
OVERHEAD DOOR OF SOUTH TEXAS
Paragon Furniture, Inc.

Peerless Marketing Group
Performance Safety Group |, LP
Performing Arts Supply Co.

Pest Professionals, LLC

Petrogas Group of McAllen, LLC
PicoMan Photography

Pinturas & Lacas (PPG Paints)

PKJ INTERNATIONAL LLC

Platinum Fleet Wash (Angela Salinas)
PLUMBMASTER INC

PortionPac Chemical Corporation

PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc
Precision Micrographics & Imaging, Ini
PRECISION SAW & TOOL, INC
PREMIER & COMPANIES

Prevention & Treatment Resource Pre:
Print-EC, LLC

Pro Tech Mechanical, Inc.

ProActive Roof Systems and Construct
PROFESSIONAL POLISH, INC.

Promo Solutions

Promo Universal LLC

Pro-Tech Exterminating (Raul Martinez
PTI Sports & Recreation Construction
Public Consulting Group Inc

R REYES TRUCKING & TRACTOR SERVIC
R.L. Abatement, Inc.

Ray's Business Products

RB Doors & Hardware Inc

RCA Building Materials Inc.

RDB Instrument Cleaning Solutions
RecovaPro, LLC

REFCO (R E Friedrichs Company)
Region 1 Repair, LLC

Rex Widle Plbg

RGV Boilers Inc.

RGV Glass Inc

RGV GUARDIAN ENTERPRISES LLC DBA
RHINO SERVICES

Rio Air, LLC

Rio Grande CAS

Rio Grande Plumbing Supply inc

Rio Grande Steel LTD

Rio Grande Valley Chapter Associated
RISICA & SONS, INC.

Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus Ram
Romo Contractors, LLC

Response Date Response Status

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO 1.S.D.

PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Contact
Alan Mendez

Victor T Rios
JOSE LUNA
Donna Shepard

Donna Alesch-Woodin
Mark Hoskins

LEE HICKEY

Mike Zappia

DAVID CASTILLO
George Selvera

Joe Escamilla

Tina McArthur

Dave Prewitt
GERARDO DAVALOS
Miyoung Hong

Mid Valley Pest Control
Jay L. Krause

Ana Belleza

Brittny Bonawitz
Jesse Rodriguez

Tom Lesher
Rachel Rials
Michael Perez

Gregory Ontiveros
KARLA ARREOLA
Cathy M. Thomas
Brenda Blair
Drew Allrich
Stacey Ambrose
U McCoy

Rick Rodriguez
Rudy Garza
SO JOSE
Angela Salinas
RICHARD PLACE

Ernie Garcia
jerry collins
EDDIE HOMAN
Henry Melendez

Mike Pepper
Jeremy Fojtik
David Gordon
VANESA GONZALEZ

Anthony Anzaldua
Raul Martinez

Joanis Riebl

Maureen Farrell
JOHANA REYES
Roberto Valladares, Jr.

Ruby Melgoza
Gustavo Rea
Rodolfo B Barrera
Jordan Quiroz
Vicki Delgado
John E Yeupell

Mike Garcia
Rick Romo
Antonio Lerma
Gene Espinoza
Perry A. Vaughn
RON RISICA

Jesus Ramirez
Romo Contractors LLC

Page 9

City

San Benito
Pharr
McAllen
MCALLEN
Carrolton
Mount Vernon
Des Plaines
MCALLEN
FORT WORTH
Stow

PHARR

Pharr
McAllen

San Marcos
Houston
McAllen
McKinney
Edinburg
Grand Rapids
CANOGA PARK
Jensen Beach
Pharr
Rahway
Philadelphia
San Antonio
McAllen

La Feria
Alamo
EDINBURG
Arlington
Dallas

St. Louis
Houston
Mission
McAllen
Weslaco
Weslaco
STAFFORD
Alamo
ATLANTA
Chicago
McAllen
Austin
CONVERSE
NEW YORK
Mandeville
Selma
Corpus Christi
Las Cruces
FORT WORTH
Frisco
Corpus Christi
McAllen
Goodrich
Boston

SAN BENITO
WESLACO
Pharr
McAllen
Pharr

Rio Grande City
McAllen
McAllen
Harlingen
San Juan
McAllen
Edinburg
PHARR
Mission
pharr
McAllen
MCALLEN
McAllen
Harlingen
EDINBURG
Mission
Laredo

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / JANUARY 17, 2022

state
T
X
T
X
T
NY
IL
X
T
OH
T
X
T
X
T
X
T
X
MI
CA
FL
X
NJ
PA
X
TX
X
TX
X
TX
X
MO
X
TX
X
TX
X
TX
X
GA
IL
X
X
X
NY

X
X
NM
X
X
X
X
X
MA
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X

Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner/CEO
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021



Participation Summary - As of 01/05/2022

Participant Name
Roth IAMS LLC

royal media network inc.

rudys upholstery

Russell Carroll Manufacturing, Inc
Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)

San Juan Bolt & Supply

Sanchez Building Supplies, Inc.
Sanitech

Santre USA LLC

Save Techs

Schaeffer Manufacturing Co.

School Outfitters

SCOTT ELECTRIC

SCREEN GRAPHICS OF FLORIDA, INC.
Second Chance Treasures

Seekr Essentials (Seekr Global INC)
SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA GROUI
Sherwin Williams

SHI international

South Texas Moulding dba Texas Wooc
Southern Accounting Systems, Inc (SAS
Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc.
Southern Post Construction LLC
Southern Stone, LLC.

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Sout|
SparelT LLC

SPIRAL BINDING LLC

Spiral Binding LLC (Sturchio)

Stand Up Stations (Toss Up Events LLC)
Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC
Staples Inc (Staples Contract and Comr
STC&FCo

Striping Service and Supply Inc.
Summit Building & Design (AOC Calton
TanChes Global Management Inc

TCl Roofing & Construction
TDIndustries, Inc.

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC)

Tenzo McAllen, LLC.

Teqg-Tex Lic

Texas Political Subdivisions

The Carpet House

The Grafix Express LLC

The Habits Group, LLC

The Office Pal

the valley windshields llc
Tint-On-Wheels (David Padilla)
Toshiba America Business Solutions, In
Total Imaging Solutions (Digital Service
Trane Company

Trinity3 Technology

Troxell Communications, Inc.

Turbo Images

Twin City Hardware, Inc. (TCH Southwe
Twin Construction (Noel Cavazos)
Unifirst Holdings

Unipak Corp.

United Data Technologies

United Sales usa corp.

Univar Solutions

US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS

V Prints

VAE Industries Corporation (INS'TENT |
Valley Herbal Products (Valley Herbal F
Valley Striping Corp

ValTex (Figueroa & Sons, Inc.)

VCI Builders, Inc.

Vertex Marketing

Virtual Builders Exchange

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (VISCER.
Walmart Inc

WasteZero Inc.

Weaver Manufacturing Company, Inc.
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP G¢
Whitmeyers Distillery Co., LLC
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CARLOS |
Woder (Nehara LLC)

Response Date Response Status

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO 1.S.D.

PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Contact City

Bill Roth St. Petersburg

irene diaz WINDSOR MIL
pharr

Jay L. Krause Raleigh

Johnny Hunte San Antonio
san juan

Juan Sanchez Pharr

Belinda Wolovich Lakeland

Flavio Garduno Hidalgo

Raymond Lee McAllen

Customer Service/ Sales Rep St. Louis
Cincinnati

MARK TROUTMAN GREENSBURG

Matt Sadowski POMPANO BEACH
McAllen

Andoni Almeida Austin
SAN ANTONIO

karissa Carrizales Mcallen
Austin

Daniel Ortiz DONNA

Julie Pruett Tuscumbia

Julia Stewart Marietta

Charles E. Cavazos McAllen

Sylvia Webber Donna

Dale Christiansen Maryland Heights

Ed Pierce Rochester

Michael Diaz AUSTIN

Chip Sturchio Austin

Alex Carroll Irving

David Wilson Wheeling

Ronnie Valentin Houston

David Enriquez EDINBURG

Lori Ann Tardif GRAND PRAIRIE

David Acevedo Laredo

Tanaz Choudhury HOUSTON

Arturo Escobedo Mission

Lorraine Vuong Houston

JOSH BOX BIRMINGHAM

Christian Diaz Mission

Marco Gonzalez Mcallen
Dallas

Daniel Garza Edinburg

Janie Cedillo Pharr

Raynor McKinnon Austin
Freehold

ricardo rojas PHARR

David Padilla Mcallen

BRIGITTE HOLMDAHL Lake Forest

Silver Esparza McAllen

Joe Rivera Weslaco

Kendell Rickman Saint Paul

Andres Barragan Phoenix

Steve Payne Saint-Georges, QC. Canada

Joe Gandara Oakdale

Noe Cavazos Weslaco

Jose Alvarado McAllen

Brian Marcus West Long Branch

Tyler Coombs Miramar

Pinny Ziegler brooklyn

Joey Alvarez Harlingen

Jeff Alloway SAN ANTONIO

Antonio or Marisol Villalobos Edinburg

Isam Muwanas HUNTINGTON BEACH

Brent McBain McAllen
Mission

Felipe Lopez McAllen

Joe Arredondo MISSION

Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford

Jeannette Olguin SAN ANTONIO

VISCERAL ILLUMINATION CODE LLC Edinburg
Bentonvile

lan Noble RALEIGH

Ray Adkins Flower Mound

Cindy Leander Dallas
Houston

JUAN CARLOS ISASI PHARR

Chelsea Kovesh Dover
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TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / JANUARY 17, 2022

state
FL
MD
T
NC
T
X
T
FL
T
X
MO
OH
PA
FL
T
X
T
X
T
X
AL
GA
T
TX
MO
NY
X
TX
X
IL
X
TX
X
TX
X
TX
X
AL
X
X
X
X
X
X
NJ
X
X
CA
X
X
MN
AZ

MN
X
X
NJ
FL
NY
X
X
X
CA
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
AR
ND
X
X
X
X
DE

Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner/CEO
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021
Automatic 09/17/2021



PAPER TOWELS AND DISPENSER FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 21-22-031

Participation Summary - As of 01/05/2022

Participant Name

www.gs-jj.com (EnamelPins Inc.)
Xerox Corporation/XRX Business Const
Xpress Printing and Embroidery LLC
Ygriega Environmental Services LLC
Zitro Electric

Zones,LLC

Response Date Response Status

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO 1.S.D.

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Contact City
Elaine Qi Walnut
Jaime Huerta Mcallen
Dayanne Villegas Edinburg
Arnold A. Maldonado Edinburg
Juan Ortiz Palmview
Steve Morberg Auburn
Page 11

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / JANUARY 17, 2022

State [Invitation Type

CA
X
X
X
X
WA

Invitation Date  Owner/CEO

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021



