PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.
TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Event Number #21-22-028 Addendum 1 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Event Title Twenty-Two (22) Double Face Electrical Marquee Signs With Color Video Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type Bid Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Issue Date 9/17/2021 05:12:41 PM (CT) Phone

Close Date 10/6/2021 02:30:00 PM (CT) Fax

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education award the Twenty-Two (22) Double Face Electrical Marquee Signs with Color Video

Bid # 21-22-028 to the lowest bidder listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name City State Classifications Lines Awarded Award Total
Mega LED Technology Grand Prairie  TX MBE (Primary),SBE 1 $541,874.74
Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing Roel Faz, Chief Operations Officer

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: Funds for the purchases are budgeted through local, state, federal and grant funds.

Four Hundred Eighty One (481) invitations were emailed to vendors
Seven (7) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Nine (9) Submitted Bid

Three (3) Unsubmitted Bid

Thirteen (13) No Bid
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

| Line Qty UOM Description |Award ResponselAward QuantitylAwarded Supplier Award Reason
1 22 EA Marquee Option #1 $21,258.94 22 No Award
2 22 EA Marquee Option #2 $23,695.90 22 Mega LED Technology Low Bid
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TWENTY TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

1 Marquee Option #1 60 month extended PSJA ISD reserves the right to select all
labor warranty per sites or any combination of sites to
each location keep the project within budget.

Supplier QTY uomMm Price Extended  Supplier Notes
Mega LED Technology (Mega Sign Inc.) 22 EA  $21,258.94 $467,696.68 $934.77 | acknowledge
United Signs, LLC 22 EA  $28,710.00 $631,620.00 $200.00 | acknowledge
Facility Solutions Group LLC 22  EA  $28,797.09 $633,535.98 We are proposing Daktronics Galaxy GS6 displays we believe $0.00 | acknowledge
Daktronics offers superior products , software and support
through out the lifetime of the units.
AAA ELECTRICAL SIGNS 22 EA $31,121.00 $684,662.00 This is for 16MM. Color Video manufactured by Samsung a $75.00 | acknowledge
DIV. OF TESORO CORP USA Company. Electrical Sign manufactured by AAA Electrical
Signs and installed by Certified & Licensed Technicians
COMET SIGNS 22 EA $32,056.55 $705,244.10 Our pricing includes Watchfire units for EMC portion of the $36,784.00 | acknowledge
pylon. See our Technical Approach attachment for more
details on our scopes of services. Also, please see schedule
GULF COAST SIGN COMPANY, INC. 22 EA $33,500.00 $737,000.00 Optec Displays - 16 mm - Model INf-MOD-16-RGBViewing Area $0.00 | acknowledge
3'-1" X 6'-3"All cabinets and complete structure manufactured
by Gulf Coast Sign Company, Inc. in San Benito, Texas.
VCRNOW (Visual Candy Resources Inc.) 22 EA  $43,062.69 $947,379.18 $3,174.92 | acknowledge
The Grafik Spot (The Grafik Spot LLC) 22 EA $45,000.00 $990,000.00 $5,000.00 | acknowledge
JettMedia 22 EA $45,300.00 $996,600.00 $5,800.00 | acknowledge

2 Marquee Option #2 60 month extended PSJA ISD reserves the right to select all
labor warranty per sites or any combination of sites to
each location keep the project within budget.

Supplier QTY uom Price Extended  Supplier Notes
AWARD Mega LED Technology (Mega Sign Inc.) 22 EA  $23,695.90 $521,309.80 $934.77 I acknowledge
United Signs, LLC 22 EA $28,710.00 $631,620.00 $200.00 | acknowledge
GULF COAST SIGN COMPANY, INC. 22 EA $30,500.00 $671,000.00 3'X 6' double sided Cirrus Blade M -9mm- full color - LED $0.00 | acknowledge
Displayviewing area 3' X 6' Cirrus item detail included in
"response attachments"All cabinets and complete structure
manufactured by Gulf Coast Sign Company, Inc. in San Benito,
Texas.
AAA ELECTRICAL SIGNS 22 EA $33,878.00 $745,316.00 This is for 10MM. Color Video manufactured by Samsung a $75.00 | acknowledge
DIV. OF TESORO CORP USA Company. Electrical Sign manufactured by AAA Electrical
Signs and installed by Certified & Licensed Technicians
Facility Solutions Group LLC 22 EA $34,575.55 $760,662.10 We are proposing Daktronics Galaxy GS6 displays we believe $0.00 | acknowledge
Daktronics offers superior products , software and support
through out the lifetime of the units.
COMET SIGNS 22 EA $35,090.55 $771,992.10 Our pricing includes Watchfire units for EMC portion of the $42,614.00 | acknowledge
pylon. See our Technical Approach attachment for more
details on our scopes of services. Also, please see schedule
The Grafik Spot (The Grafik Spot LLC) 22 EA  $45,000.00 $990,000.00 $5,000.00 | acknowledge
VCRNOW (Visual Candy Resources Inc.) 22 EA  $46,078.01 $1,013,716.22 $3,476.45 I acknowledge
JettMedia 22 EA $46,300.00 $1,018,600.00 $6,000.00 | acknowledge
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Attribute Name

AAA ELECTRICAL SIGNS COMET SIGNS Facility Solutions | GULF COAST SIGN JettMedia

Mega LED Technology

DIV. OF TESORO CORPORATION Group LLC COMPANY, INC. (Mega Sign Inc.)
Business/Company Owner Name PAUL W. SULLIVAN Comet Signs, LLC - William Graham GULF COAST SIGN Randy Garza David J. Park
Pete Sitterle COMPANY, INC.
Date of Establishment 1970 1958 06/15/1986 April 1987 11/1/2014 2021
Will the bid/proposal deviate from Yes No No No No No
specifications?
If no please state "No deviation", if yes, SEE LETTER OF DEVIATION No deviation No Deviation No deviation No Deviation No deviation

please specify deviations:

Attribute Name

VCRNOW
(Visual Candy Resources
Inc.)

The Grafik Spot
(The Grafik Spot LLC)

United Signs, LLC

Business/Company Owner Name Blanca N. Lopez Jill Lowe Jeff Andersen
Date of Establishment 2012 1984 09/28/2009
Will the bid/proposal deviate from No No No
specifications?
If no please state "No deviation", if yes, NA No deviation No deviation
please specify deviations:
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Responding Supplier

Signature Full Name

Signature Email

Supplier Notes

AAA ELECTRICAL SIGNS
DIV. OF TESORO CORPORATION

COMET SIGNS

Facility Solutions Group LLC
GULF COAST SIGN COMPANY, INC.

JettMedia
Mega LED Technology (Mega Sign Inc.)

The Grafik Spot (The Grafik Spot LLC)

United Signs, LLC
VCRNOW (Visual Candy Resources Inc.)

PAUL SULLIVAN

Tina Coleman

Aaron Salinas
ANGEL ARCE

Randy Garza
Steve Klein

Jose H Altamirano

Jared Owens
Jason Forte

SIGNS@3ASIGNS.COM

tina.coleman@cometsigns.com

aaron.salinas@fsgi.com

ges@gulfcoastisigncompany.com

randy@jettprints.com

steve@megasigninc.com

jose.altamirano@thegrafikspot.net

jowens@unitedsignsga.com

jforte@vcrnow.com
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AAA ELECTRICAL SIGNS WILL BE DROPPING OFF DESIGNS PER
INDIVIDUAL CAMPUS PRIOR TO THE BID PROPOSAL DEADLINE. THIS IS
DONE FOR THE SOLE PURPOSE THAT EACH SCHOOL WILL BE
CHOOSING THEIR MARQUEE COLORS UNLESS THE SCHOOL DISTRICT
DECIDES ON COLOR UNIFORMITY.

Thank you for the opportunity to bid the signage project for Pharr-
San Juan - Alamo ISD. We have read over the scope of work and have
a clear understanding of the requirements for the project. Our
pricing is turnkey to include survey, code research, permit,
engineering, fabrication, and installation of the signage.

Thank you for accepting this bid.
Bids were submitted for Marquee Option 1 & Option 2.
No alternate bids were entered for either option 1 or 2.

Mega Sign Inc. was originally founded in 2007 in Los Angeles,
California. We relocated our headquarters and manufacturing to
Grand Prairie, Texas in the summer of 2021. While we are bidding
under a newly formed business entity we are under the same
management and have retained the industry experience we've built
upon since inception.

The estimate provided by The Grafik Spot LLC is in compliance with
specifications requested by the buyer. If at any moment any item
requires additional modifications we are willing to include them at
no additional cost as long as it is exceedingly considerable.
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 12/10/2021

Participant Name
AAA ELECTRICAL SIGNS DIV. OF TESORO CORP

COMET SIGNS

Facility Solutions Group LLC

GULF COAST SIGN COMPANY, INC.
JettMedia

Mega LED Technology (Mega Sign Inc.)

The Grafik Spot (The Grafik Spot LLC)
United Signs, LLC

VCRNOW (Visual Candy Resources Inc.)

A1 Skylite Signs

AAA SIGNS

NM Contracting, LLC

AndyMark, Inc.

Audio Visual Aids (Audio Visual Aids Co)
CM Graphics/JaMar (Huntco Media LLC)
Delta Specialties Supply (Martin Pena)
Gateway Printing

GTS Technology Solutions, Inc.

Huntington Sky Production DBA FASTSIGNS
Lightspeed Technologies, Inc.

McCormick's Group, LLC

MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY PRODUCTS (MIDWEST ¢
Traveling Beans

TRI-COUNTY COMMUNICATIONS
Virtucom, Inc.

4 Signs Digital Print

ConstructConnect

J. SALAZAR CONSTRUCTION

Leija Welding

Rio Grande Valley Chapter Associated General Ci
The PlanIT Room

Virtual Builders Exchange

1.50 Cleaners llc Dba fat cat signs

365 Paving & Construction LLC

4Aimprint, Inc.

4TELLX LLC

5 Star Embroidery & Vinyl Printing

5 Star GC Construction LLC

523 Express Printing LLC

8/A Builders LLC

970 5 COMPUTER

AV Pro, Inc.

Aasdel Corporation

ABC Custom Advertising (Marketing Concepts Ur
ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LMH, LLC)
Accu Aire Mechanical LLC

Ace Promotions

Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.

Adorama Inc.

ADT Commercial

Advanced Communications & Cabling
Advantage Imaging Supply, Inc

Advertising Matters L.L.C.

AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV

AISYS Consulting, LLC

AITA CONSULTING SERVICES,INC

Alamo Iron Works (Vallen Distribution)

All American Poly

AllPlayers Network Inc. (Rank One Sport)
AllState Supplies

ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS

Altex Electronic's Ltd.

AM Utilities and Construction LLC
American Value Construction

Amsterdam Partners

AMSYS Innovative Solutions LLC

Anser Advisory (Anser Advisory Consulting, LLC)
Applied Industrial Technologies

Arga development

Artcom Communications (Artcom Associates)
ASAP Printing Solutions (O'Conn LLC)
AssetGenie, Inc. DBA AGiRepair and AGParts Edu
AT&T Corp

AUDIO RESOURCE GROUP, INC (AUDIO RESOUR(
Authentic Promotions.com

aves audio visual systems, inc.

Baroq Apparel L.L.C.

Response Date Response Status

Contact

10/05/2021
10/06/2021
10/05/2021
10/06/2021
10/06/2021
10/06/2021
10/06/2021
10/05/2021
10/06/2021

10/01/2021
09/20/2021
09/20/2021
09/20/2021
09/27/2021
09/20/2021
09/29/2021
09/30/2021
09/21/2021
09/20/2021
09/21/2021
09/22/2021
09/17/2021

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Unsubmitted
Unsubmitted
Unsubmitted
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed

PAUL W SULLIVAN
Tina Coleman
Doug Brown
ANGEL ARCE
Randy Garza

Jose H Altamirano
Jared Owens

Jeff Andersen
Arturo

KEVIN newsham
Noel Munoz

Ernest Mendez
Brent Hunter
MARTIN PENA
Chris Diaz

Rod Snell

Melissa Williams
Jessica Slabaugh
ARLENE KENNEDY
Leslie Rocha

Tim Prince
Edgar Rodriguez

ERICA GONZALES

Perry A. Vaughn
Cecilia Hernandez
Jeannette Olguin
samuel avila
Gilberto Maldonado
Shay Freund

Jorge Gonzalez Il
Peyton Oakley

Arnoldo Ochoa
RICHARD RAAB
Heather Winkelman
Sabbir Mahmud
Martha J Miller
Larry Helgeson
Monica M Harris
Pat Garcia

Kent Taylor
James Reid
Rose Key
Javier Olmos
Elizabeth Lopez
KEVIN KUMAR
Robert Garcia

Brian Mann
Wendy Davis

Roberto Morales
Luis Muro

Chuck Williams
Anser Marketing

Sean O' Connor

Tina Covalesky
Hector Orellana
Melonie Olson

Peter Carmazzi
Cynthia Rademacher
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City
MCALLEN
San Antonio
Harlingen
San Benito
Pharr

Grand Prairie
BROWNSVILLE
Norcross

Red Oak
McAllen
Donna
MCALLEN
Kokomo

San Antonio
Harlingen
EDINBURG
Edinburg
Austin
McAllen
Tualatin
Wheeling
SIOUX CITY
San Juan
WESLACO
Peachtree Corners
San Juan
Cincinnati
PALMVIEW
Pharr
Harlingen

El Paso

SAN ANTONIO
mcallen
Mission
Oshkosh
Austin
Mcallen
Mission
Edinburg
Mission
Jacksonville Beach
DeSoto
Norcross
McAllen
McAllen

SAN ANTONIO
San Benito
Harlingen
NEW YORK
Edinburg
Georgetown
San Juan Capistrano
Ft Worth
McAllen
McAllen
NORTH BRUNSWICK
Pharr
Piscataway
Sanger
Athens
edinburg

San Antonio
Mission
McAllen
Lincoln Park
Houston
Austin

Pharr
Mission

San Antonio
McAllen
Greensburg
McAllen
WEST FARGO
Carmichael
SUGAR LAND
McAllen

State Zip Code

X
X
X
X
X
X
X
GA
X
X
X
X
IN
X
X
X
X
X
X
OR
IL
1A
X
X
GA
X
OH
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
Wi
X
X
X
X
X
FL
X
GA
X
X
X
X
X
NY
X
X
CA
X
X
X
NJ
X
NJ
X
GA
X
X
X
X
NJ
X
X
X
X
X
X
PA
X
ND
CA
X
X
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Invitation Type

Invitation Date

Owner

78502
78219
78552
78586
78577
75051
78520
30071
75154
78504
78537
78504
46901
78212
78550
78542
78539
78758
78504
97062
60090
51111
78589
78596
30071
78589
45209
78574
78577
78552
79925
78217
78504
78572
54901
78749
78504
78574
78541
78572
32250
75115
30093
78504
78504
78220
78586
78550
10011
78539
78626
92675
76110
78501
78501
08902
78577
08854
76266
30604
78577
78233
78572
78501
07035
77074
78735
78577
78572
78250
78501
15601
78501
58078
95608
77487
78504

Automatic

Automatic

Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

09/17/2021

09/17/2021

09/17/2021

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021

Paul W. Sullivan
Pete Sitterle
William Graham
Pete Petkoff
Randy Garza
David J. Park
Blanca N. Lopez
Jill Lowe

Jeff Anderson



PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028

Participation Summary - As of 12/10/2021

Participant Name

Beagle Learning, Inc.

Bearcom

Beneftifocus

Bernardo Gomez jr (Brand Boosters Co LLc)
Best Buy For Business (Best Buy Stores, L.P.)

Big Bear Roofing & Construction, LLC.

Bison Roofing and Construction (Montelongo Gr
BizSupplies

bkdsignsandgraphicslic

Blink Marketing Inc

Blue Sky Enterprises

BM Benchmark Construction, LLC

BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION, LLC

Bocci Engineering

Bon Tool Co

BOTACH INC DBA BOTACH TACTICAL

BOXX Modular (Nortex Modular Leasing & Const
brands imaging

BTI, Inc.

BuckHorn Construction LLC

Buffalo Construction LLC.

Burning Light Designs, LLC (Felipe Guerra)
Butler Business Products

C&H Distributors, LLC

C&V SUPPLY INC.

Calico Construction and Development LLC

CAPA Texas

Caprice Electronics, Inc.

Cascade School Supples

Cascade School Supplies

Castcon Construction Co., LLC

Catalyst PR INC

CDW Government LLC

Celso Gonzalez Construction

Centennial Contractors Enterprises

Centennial Contractors Enterprises, Inc.

Center Stone Services

CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS

Circle Industries Inc.

Circle Saw Builders Supply, Inc

CJIS GROUP

Clary Business Machines (Sufian Munir Inc.)
Classic Images Photos and AWARDSS (garcia)
Clore Equipment, LLC

Coast To Coast Computer Products, Inc.
COLLEGE THRIVER INC

Communications ETC (Valeric, LLC)

Commvault

COMPETITIVE CHOICE INC.

Compostology LLC

Computer Dealers & Recyclers Global, Inc (CDR (
Connections Education Pearson Online & Blende
Conscendo Medical Products LLC (Conscendo Av
Construction Bid Source (Plan Room)
Construction Journal LLC

Copy Graphics Inc.

Copy Plus LLC

Copy Zone (CBSPrint, LLC)

Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Company (UBEO
Costco Wholesale

crisisgo Inc

Cubit Contracting, LLC

Curbell Plastics, Inc.

Curtis (CURTIS 1000, INC)

Cytek Media Systems, Inc.

D. Wilson Construction (D. Wilson Construction (
Dallas Lighthouse for the Blind/ Envision

dba Barcom Technology Solutions (Jet Web Com
dba Nightlock (Taylor Brothers Door Lock, LLC)
Decisin Tree Inc.

Dell EMC

Deltek

Demo Con, Inc.

Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.

Diamond M Sports LLC

DiscountPC

Dispensing Dynamics

Response Date Response Status

Contact

Patrick Russell
Bernardo Gomez

Craig Tindle

Genaro Montelongo
rushelle wetzel
Brenda Henderson
Darlene Zwolinski
Alonzo Acosta

TONY RODRIGUEZ
Lianne Lami

Paul Bender
ACKAH SARBAH
Harold Weatherly
brett brand

Jose F. Torres, P.E.
Chad Bishop
FRED GUERRA
Felipe Guerra
Stacy Duke
William Rose
JUAN O'FARRILL
David Cantu
junior ocampo
Michael Kluger
Todd Shafer

Todd Shafer

Robert Castaneda, Jr.

Holly Arbuckle
Mike Smith
Celso Gonzalez
Rebecca Hollies
Rebecca Hollies

Derek Barrera
Joel Hilliard
Juan R Ruiz
Mariah Elliott

Jesse Garcia
Geoffrey Clore
Miranda Horowitz
shawntia lee

Jeremy Shaw
JULIA SUAN
Kash Nathan
Jon Barton

Don Li

Pamela Exton
David Valdez

Lorissa Pecina
Pily Stevens

Baldomero Gonzalez
Esmeralda Maldonado

chris vuillaume

Bill Heckert

Oscar Zapata
Steve Patton
Norma Lerma

John Huebener
Cris Ahearn
Brent Lawson

Source Management

Sandra Salinas
Wesley O'Neal
P Michael Charles
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BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

City

Boston
Corpus Christi
Charleston
Mcallen
Richfield
waco
Alamo
Houston
Edinburg
Cleveland
La Blanca
McAllen
San Juan
Cypress
Gibsonia
LAS VEGAS
Fort Worth
philadelphia
McAllen
Harlingen
WESLACO
Alamo
Houston
Chicago
MISSION
Mission
Mission
Brooklyn
North Adams
North Adams
Mission
Conroe
Vernon Hills
Mission
Reston
Reston
Weslaco
MCALLEN
Houston
Houston
Tallahassee
San Diego
Pharr
Harlingen
Simi Valley
orlando
McAllen
Tinton Falls
Houston
Waco
oklahoma city
Columbia
Sterling
Felton
Stuart
McAllen
MC ALLEN
Mcallen
Pharr

Pharr
CLAYTON
Corpus Christi
Houston
DULUTH
Topeka
McAllen
Dallas

San Antonio
Mount Morris
El Paso
Round Rock
Herndon

La Feria
Palmhurst
Murchison
Austin

San Marcos

State
MA
X
Ne
X
MN
X
X
X
X
OH
X
X
X
X
PA
NV
X
PA
X
X
X
X
X
IL
X
X
X
NY
MA
MA
X
X
IL
X
VA
VA
X
X
X
X
FL
CA
X
X
CA
FL
X
NJ
X
X
OK

VA
CA
FL
X
X
X
X
X
MO
X
X
GA
KS
X
X
X
Mi
X
X
VA
X
X
X
X
CA

Zip Code Invitation Type Invitation Date
02210 Automatic 09/17/2021
78408 Automatic 09/17/2021
29492 Automatic 09/17/2021
78503 Automatic 09/17/2021
55423 Automatic 09/17/2021
76710 Automatic 09/17/2021
78516 Automatic 09/17/2021
77056 Automatic 09/17/2021
78539 Automatic 09/17/2021
44114 Automatic 09/17/2021
78558 Automatic 09/17/2021
78504 Automatic 09/17/2021
78589 Automatic 09/17/2021
77429 Automatic 09/17/2021
15044 Automatic 09/17/2021
89103 Automatic 09/17/2021
76155 Automatic 09/17/2021
19134 Automatic 09/17/2021
78502 Automatic 09/17/2021
78550 Automatic 09/17/2021
78599 Automatic 09/17/2021
78516 Automatic 09/17/2021
77041 Automatic 09/17/2021
60673 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
11224 Automatic 09/17/2021
01247 Automatic 09/17/2021
01247 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
77301 Automatic 09/17/2021
60061 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
20190 Automatic 09/17/2021
20190 Automatic 09/17/2021
78596 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
77064 Automatic 09/17/2021
77008 Automatic 09/17/2021
32301 Automatic 09/17/2021
92126 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
78550 Automatic 09/17/2021
93063 Automatic 09/17/2021
32801 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
07724 Automatic 09/17/2021
77054 Automatic 09/17/2021
76705 Automatic 09/17/2021
73116 Automatic 09/17/2021
21044 Automatic 09/17/2021
20164 Automatic 09/17/2021
95018 Automatic 09/17/2021
34994 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78504 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
63105 Automatic 09/17/2021
78418 Automatic 09/17/2021
77040 Automatic 09/17/2021
30096 Automatic 09/17/2021
66603 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
75204 Automatic 09/17/2021
78216 Automatic 09/17/2021
48458 Automatic 09/17/2021
79912 Automatic 09/17/2021
78681 Automatic 09/17/2021
20171 Automatic 09/17/2021
78559 Automatic 09/17/2021
78573 Automatic 09/17/2021
75778 Automatic 09/17/2021
78753 Automatic 09/17/2021
92078 Automatic 09/17/2021



PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028

Participation Summary - As of 12/10/2021

Participant Name

DISYS Solutions, Inc.

Diverse Education Resources (Discovery Educatic
Dixon Ticonderoga

DocuNav Solutions (VP Imaging, Inc.)

Dodge Data & Analytics

DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS, PHAI
Double M laser products inc.

Dream Ranch Office Supplies (Dream Ranch LLC)
EBSCO Information Services

ECOEFFECT

Econ Group, LLC

Education Account Executive

Educational Innovations, Inc

ELITE PRO SIGNS LLC

ELITE PROMOTIONS

Embroidery Express

Empire Paper Company

Encino Construction

Encore Data Products, Inc. (Burgess)

Epitome Technology, Inc

ESHA AV

ExaGrid Systems, Inc.

FlW

FasClampitt Paper-McAllen

fat cat signs llc

Fedex Office and Print Services, Inc

Fielder's Choice Inc

FireFly Computers

Flaghouse Inc

Floral Park Consulting LLC

Flux Media LLC

Focus Camera LLC

Focused Technology LLC

Follett School Solutions, Inc.

Footsteps 2 Brilliance, Inc.

Foremost Paving Inc.

Fourtify Construction

Fourtify, LLC

Frio Marketing Group , LLC

Frontera Concetps, LLC

Frontier Business

Frontier Southwest Incorporated (Frontier Comn
Full Compass (Full Compass Systems)

Full Stop Equipment LLC

Fully Promoted McAllen (Hema, Ltd. Co.)
FuvaMedia Publishing lic

G&G Contractors (RG Enterprises, LLC)

Galaxy Next Generation, Inc.

GALLS, LLC

GALVAMET STEEL LLC

GALVAN BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)

GEM Engineers & Contractors (Gonzalez Enginee
General contractor/Construction (Davila Constru
Gerlach Builders LLC dba WIL-CON

Global Industrial (Global Equipment Company In:
GNG General Contracting

GNH Company, LLC

Go UnderGround

Goliath Services (Goliath Builders and Developm
GovConnection, Inc.

Govmation Enterprise Solutions

GRANDE VALLE APPAREL (Adan MArtinez)
GRANDE VALLEY BUILDERS,INC

Green Dream Internationl

Greenwood Office Outfitters

GT SCREEN PRINTING (GOODTIMES SCREEN PRIT
Guardian Security Solutions

Gulf Coast Paper

H&H door (Zelkowski)

hdc video and communications dba (Maria del C
HDL Promos

Hellas Construction, Inc.

HID GLOBAL K-12

HIDALGO ALL STARS SCREEN PRINTING & EMBR(
High End Advertising

Hi-LoContractor LLC

Response Date Response Status

Contact

Vinu Luthra

Phil Deats
Chrissie Mouton
Shannon Fellows

MICHAEL GUZMAN

Alison Lane
Alejandro Alanis
Gilbert Enriquez
Luis Montes

Jennifer Zambello / Boo

Oscar Campos
Rossy Galarza

Bids

Fred

Sabrina Manno
Bhagyasri

Shrey Parikh
Donna Fortier
Jeanne Baker
Andres Ramos JR
Liza Lemos

Humberto Barberena

John Holt

Carlos Bernaldez
Igal Avshalom
Chris Feeney
Sarah Eisenhauer
Holly De Leon
Joey Villarreal
Sam De la Garza
David Iglesias
Cynthia Rodriguez
John C Garza

Joseph Walker
Luis Acosta
Elias Macias
Hector Leal
Jerry Chapa

Magen McGahee

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

City
Ashburn
FORT WORTH
Lake Mary
Frisco
Hamilton
PHARR
Houston
Krum
Ipswich
McAllen
Edinburg
San Antonio
BETHEL
Lyford
Brownsville
Weslaco
Wichita Falls
mcallen
Lafayette
Columbia
East Brunswick
Marlborough
McAllen
Mcallen
Edinburg
McAllen
HOUSTON
Saint Paul
Hasbrouck Heights
Floral Park
Pharr
Brooklyn
Sarasota
McHenry
Washington
Weslaco
Edinburg
McAllen
SAN ANTONIO
San Antonio
Irving

Irving
Madison

La Joya
McAllen
McAllen
Edinb
Toccoa
Chicago
EDINBURG

GALVAN BUILDERS CON CORPUS CHRISTI

Juan Garcia
Hugo Gonzalez
Tommy Canul
Airika Stevens
William Rose
Phillip Garza
Javier Hernandez

Edgar Gallegos

Dwaylyn Holland
Adan Martinez
MANUEL PEREZ
Antone Austin
Robert Rosalez

John Greeson
Jessica Cavazos

Maria del Castillo
HERIBERTO LOPEZ
Frances Arreola
Mike Garcia

JOSE LOPEZ
Mariano Nunez
Edmundo Carreon
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TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / DECEMBER 13, 2021

san juan
EDINBURG, TX
Pharr
Edinburg
Chicago
McAllen
Alamo
harlingen
Pharr
Pittsburgh
McKinney
SAN BENITO
MCALLEN
Erie

Fort Worth
ALAMO
Lubbock
Brownsville
Victoria
mcallen
WESLACO
Austin

SAN ANTONIO
HIDALGO
Mission

Elsa

State
VA
X
FL
X
NJ
X
X
X
MA
X
X
X
CcT
X
X
X
X
X
co
MD
NJ
MA
X
X
X
X
X
MN

NY
X
NY
FL

IL

DC
X
X
X
X
X
X
X

X
X
X
X
GA
IL
X
X
X
X
X
X
IL
X
X
X
X
PA
X
X
X
PA
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X

Zip Code Invitation Type Invitation Date
20147 Automatic 09/17/2021
76137 Automatic 09/17/2021
32746 Automatic 09/17/2021
75034 Automatic 09/17/2021
08619 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
77224 Automatic 09/17/2021
76249 Automatic 09/17/2021
01938 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78540 Automatic 09/17/2021
78217 Automatic 09/17/2021
06801 Automatic 09/17/2021
78569 Automatic 09/17/2021
78520 Automatic 09/17/2021
78596 Automatic 09/17/2021
76301 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
80026 Automatic 09/17/2021
21046 Automatic 09/17/2021
8816 Automatic 09/17/2021
01752 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78539 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
77087 Automatic 09/17/2021
55112 Automatic 09/17/2021
07604 Automatic 09/17/2021
11001 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
11218 Automatic 09/17/2021
34240 Automatic 09/17/2021
60050 Automatic 09/17/2021
20008 Automatic 09/17/2021
78599 Automatic 09/17/2021
78539 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78230 Automatic 09/17/2021
78216 Automatic 09/17/2021
75063 Automatic 09/17/2021
75603 Automatic 09/17/2021
53593 Automatic 09/17/2021
78560 Automatic 09/17/2021
78504 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78539 Automatic 09/17/2021
30577 Automatic 09/17/2021
60694 Automatic 09/17/2021
78542 Automatic 09/17/2021
78411 Automatic 09/17/2021
78589 Automatic 09/17/2021
78539 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78542 Automatic 09/17/2021
60673 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78516 Automatic 09/17/2021
78550 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
15253 Automatic 09/17/2021
75071 Automatic 09/17/2021
78586 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
16501 Automatic 09/17/2021
76133 Automatic 09/17/2021
78516 Automatic 09/17/2021
79423 Automatic 09/17/2021
78521 Automatic 09/17/2021
77905 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78596 Automatic 09/17/2021
78759 Automatic 09/17/2021
78216 Automatic 09/17/2021
78557 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
78543 Automatic 09/17/2021



PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028

Participation Summary - As of 12/10/2021

Participant Name

Holchemont, Ltd.

Holzberg Communications, INc.

Home Design Center (V&L ENTERPRISES, LLC)
HP Financial Services (Hewlett Packard Financial
Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC
Hunt's Photo & Video (W.B. Hunt Co., Inc.)
Hypertec USA Inc. (Hypertec Direct)

iBenzer, Inc.

llusion invitaciones & boutique

Imagery Graphic Systems

Indeco

Indoff, Inc. (Indoff, Incorporated)

Industrial Signs and Welding

Infinite Computer Solutions

Innive Inc

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNOVA

Insight

Insight Public Sector (Sawyers)

Intech Southwest Services

Intervene

iParametrics

Istation (Imagination Station, Inc.)

IT RECYCLING GROUP

J Pena Construction Ltd

JANGA Technology LLC

JAR Systems, LLC

Javier Navarrete (All Star Trophies & T-Shirts)
JK Graphics, Inc #1

Jostens, Inc.

JS&A Fire and Safety

K-air Corporation

KAUTSCH TRUE VALUE (TRUE TEST VENTURES LL
KinderLab Robotics

Klein Design Inc

Lamac (Trey Gonzalez)

Laminating and Binding Solutions, Inc

LD Products, Inc.

Learn Lounge (314 Easy Math, LLC)

Learning Explorer LLC

Learning Services International Inc

Legna International Trade

LEGR Wheels Tires and More LLC (Luis Martinez)
LEX apparel (LEX apparel inc)

Lexine Inc

Liberty Office Products (Liberty Data Products)
Library Video Company d/b/a SAFARI Montage
Limitless Office Products

Little Giants Learning Center

LocoRobo Innovations Inc

Logical Front

Lone Star Communications

Lowes Of Pharr (lowe's home center. lic)

LTR Construction

M&A Technology (M&A Technology Inc.)
Magtec Corporation

Mancha Screen Print & Embroidery LLC.
Manning Navcomp Inc

Mark Andy, Inc. dba Mark Andy Print Products
MARK HOSKINS ENTERPRISES LLC
MasteryPrep (Ring Publications LLC)

MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS

maxi aids

MB Services LLC

MEGA SUPPLY LLC

Mid Valley Paving, Inc.

MJA Construction, LLC.

MJR EDUCATIONAL SUPPLIES

Modern Imaging Solutions

Morganti Texas Inc

Mor-Wil, L.L.C

Mustang Apparel dba Incentive Brands
Mvation Worldwide Inc.

MYVRSPOT (MYVRSPOT, LLC)

National Art & School Supplies Inc.

Natural Wellness Brand

Navigate360, LLC

NBCP Communications Systems (New Beginings

Response Date Response Status

Contact

Annette Carmona
Andy Holzberg
Victor Cantu
Paul Hermann
Keith F. Hunt
Roger Treadwell
Mike Marracino
Leon YU
CYNTHIA LEYVA
Matt Tumelson
Martin Pena

Roman Gonzales
Sales

Darak Weaver

Aaron McCloud

Monika Flood
Kay Ramon

Jose Pena
Andrea Anguiano

Javier Navarrete
Deanna Voitle
Carlos Trejo
James Stofer
Kyle Villarreal
KOOKII CRERAR
Jeff Starr

TREY GONZALEZ

Amy Moorehouse
Diana Athey
Alejandro Magallanes
Kenny Spain

Donna Villena

Albeza Alanis

Luis Eduardo Martinez
Alexander J Bender
Frank Martinez

Scott Wiland

Mita Guha

Pramod Abichandani
Adrian villalba Villalba
Kent Taylor

Roy Perez

Donna Shepard
Anelise Pires

Laura Fernandez
Michael Wells

Donna Alesch-Woodin
Mark Hoskins

Joe Guerra

DAVID CASTILLO
angela giglio

George Selvera
LAURA MALDONADO
William R. Mize
Sonya Gonzalez

Ana Belleza
Alejandra Gonzalez
Albert Garza Ill
Mike Monahan
Barry Weinstein
LISA HARMISON

Rachel Rials
Heather Connelly
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BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

City

McAllen
Totowa
McAllen
Berkeley Heights
Laguna Vista
Melrose
TEMPE
College Point
Pharr

San Antonio
Belton
Kansas City
DONNA
Rockville
Tampa
McAllen
McAllen,
Tempe

san antonio
Stafford
Alpharetta
Dallas
GEORGETOWN
McAllen
Pharr
Bradenton
Los Fresnos
Tomball
Chicago
Farmers Branch
San Antonio
alamo
Waltham
Henry
MCALLEN
Lake Forest
Long Beach
Houston
Santa Barbara
Springfield

El Paso
Mission
Savannah
McAllen
Houston
West Conshohocken
RICHARDSON
Alamo
Philadelphia
SANDY
Grand Prairie
Pharr

Pharr
Carrolton
Miami
Mission
Austin

Des Plaines
MCALLEN
Baton Rouge
PHARR
farmingdfale
Pharr
MCALLEN
MERCEDES
Mission
Houston
CANOGA PARK
Houston
Mission
Plano

Glen Cove
FORT COLLINS
Rahway

San Antonio
Richfield

San Antonio

State

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / DECEMBER 13, 2021

Zip Code Invitation Type Invitation Date
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
07511 Automatic 09/17/2021
78504 Automatic 09/17/2021
07922 Automatic 09/17/2021
78578 Automatic 09/17/2021
02176 Automatic 09/17/2021
85282 Automatic 09/17/2021
11356 Automatic 09/17/2021
78589 Automatic 09/17/2021
78217 Automatic 09/17/2021
76513 Automatic 09/17/2021
64184 Automatic 09/17/2021
78537 Automatic 09/17/2021
20852 Automatic 09/17/2021
33637 Automatic 09/17/2021
78502 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
85283 Automatic 09/17/2021
78240 Automatic 09/17/2021
77497 Automatic 09/17/2021
30009 Automatic 09/17/2021
75206 Automatic 09/17/2021
78626 Automatic 09/17/2021
78502 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
34211 Automatic 09/17/2021
78566 Automatic 09/17/2021
77377 Automatic 09/17/2021
60673 Automatic 09/17/2021
75234 Automatic 09/17/2021
78238 Automatic 09/17/2021
78516 Automatic 09/17/2021
02453 Automatic 09/17/2021
61537 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
60045 Automatic 09/17/2021
90808 Automatic 09/17/2021
77051 Automatic 09/17/2021
93101 Automatic 09/17/2021
97477 Automatic 09/17/2021
79901 Automatic 09/17/2021
78574 Automatic 09/17/2021
31401 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
77263 Automatic 09/17/2021
19428 Automatic 09/17/2021
75081 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
19103 Automatic 09/17/2021
84070 Automatic 09/17/2021
75050 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
75006 Automatic 09/17/2021
33131 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
78759 Automatic 09/17/2021
60018 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
78806 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
11735 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
78504 Automatic 09/17/2021
78570 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
77077 Automatic 09/17/2021
91303 Automatic 09/17/2021
77042 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
75075 Automatic 09/17/2021
11542 Automatic 09/17/2021
80527 Automatic 09/17/2021
07065 Automatic 09/17/2021
78216 Automatic 09/17/2021
44286 Automatic 09/17/2021
78201 Automatic 09/17/2021



PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028

Participation Summary - As of 12/10/2021

Participant Name

NCS-Network Cabling Services (Network Cabling
NEC DISPLAY SOLUTIONS OF AMERICA
NERDVANA (NERDVANA STEAM EDU)

Netsync Network Solutions

Noble Texas Builders

NovaTech

Nutanix

Office Depot, Inc

OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC

Otter Graphics Inc.

Panasonic i-PRO Sensing Solutions Corporation ¢
Paragon Furniture, Inc.

PASCO scientific (Montgomery)

Patina Fire & Safety

PCC Sports (Precision Construction and Contract
PCMG, Inc.

PCPC Direct

Peacock General Contractor

Peerless Marketing Group

Pemica Inc

Perez Technologies

Perseus Information Security Consulting, LLC
Phoenix embroidery and screen printing (RELY Et
Phynyx Fire & Security

PKJ INTERNATIONAL LLC

PRECISION SAW & TOOL, INC

PREMIER & COMPANIES

Prevention & Treatment Resource Press and Fir
Prime Systems

print spot solutions

Print-EC, LLC

Printed Promotionals

Printing Supplies USA LLC (B2B Supplies USA LLC!
ProComputing Corporation

Promo Masters (Alex Gene Del Fierro)

Promo Solutions

Promotions Plus

Public Consulting Group Inc

PWXpress

Quail Solutions

R REYES TRUCKING & TRACTOR SERVICES

Radio Engineering Industries, Inc. (REI)

Ramtech Building Systems (Ramtech Building Sys
Ranger Fire Inc

Rave Energy (TZMedia)

Ray's Business Products

RC Design/Construction, L.L.C.

RCA Building Materials Inc.

RDX Sharptech

RDZ Group Enterprises

READING PLUS LLC

Red River Technology LLC (Red River)

REFCO (R E Friedrichs Company)

Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Computer Repair Ce
RGV GUARDIAN ENTERPRISES LLC DBA DERTY SF
RGV YARD CARDS LLC

RGVCM Group, Consultants & Managers (RGVCN
Rigney Construction, LLC

Rio Creative Studio

Riverside Technologies, Inc.

Romeo Music

Romo Contractors, LLC

royal media network inc.

Royal T's Embroidery & Screen Printing

saenz brothers construction

Salvia Consulting (Maple Lake Services)

SAM Labs Inc

SAMES, Inc.

Samsclub 8250

Save Techs

School Outfitters

School Specialty, Inc.

SCOGGINS CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.

SCREEN GRAPHICS OF FLORIDA, INC.

Second Chance Treasures

Security International Inc

SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA GROUP, INC)

Response Date Response Status

Contact

Richard Walters
John Hauser
Hiten Patel
Xavier Trevino

Kristopher Alexander Di

Nadia Garza
Lucia Valdez
Robert Vincent

Cathy M. Thomas
Greg Montgomery

Elanie Bungay
Frank Parent
Kerry McBride
Brenda Blair
Elvis Jimenez
Mario Perez
Bill Nelson
lupe salinas
ROY OLIVAREZ
SO JOSE
EDDIE HOMAN
Henry Melendez

Mike Pepper
Mary Cantu

Luke Xu

Michael McKinstry
Edna J. Pena

Eloy Olivarez
Maureen Farrell
mary miller

Brad Meggison
JOHANA REYES
Proposal Writer
Jeff Ward
Sommer Baggett
Tarek Chowdhury

Ruben Castaneda
Gustavo Rea

Edna Salinas
Renato Rodriguez
Julie Miller-Johnson
Kimberly Reed

Vicki Delgado

Rick Romo

ARACELI COVARRUBIAS
JOSE ALFREDO LOPEZ

John Rigney

Tom Bosley
Julie Romeo

Romo Contractors LLC

irene diaz

Fernando Saenz
Charles Salvia
Fred Wolfe
Tirzah Rivera
Carlos Garcia
Raymond Lee

Accounts Receivable

Jeffrey Scoggins
Matt Sadowski

Tanya Wychopen
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BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

City
McAllen
Downers Grove
Edinburg
McAllen

La Feria
Nashville
San Jose
Austin
HARLINGEN
Oxnard
Rolling Meadows
Arlington
Roseville
MCALLEN
Lone Jack
Los Angeles
Houston
Harlingen
Dallas
Miami
Mission
Tampa
edinburg
San Juan
STAFFORD
CONVERSE
NEW YORK
Mandeville
HOUSTON
weslaco
Selma

Rio Grande City
Plainsboro
Grapevine
Alton

Frisco
McAllen
Boston
Jacksonville
Victoria
SAN BENITO
Omaha
Mansfield
Saginaw
Plano

Pharr

Pharr

Pharr
Brownsville
McAllen
Winooski
Claremont
McAllen
McAllen
PHARR
MCALLEN
Edinburg
Edinburg
Mission
North Sioux City
COPPELL
Laredo
WINDSOR MIL
Edinburg
Donna
Edinburg
Boston
McAllen
mcallen
McAllen
Cincinnati
Greenville
Harlingen
POMPANO BEACH
McAllen
Edinburg
SAN ANTONIO

State Zip Code

X
IL
X
X
X
N
X
X
X
CA
IL
X
CA
X
MO
CA
X
X
X
FL
X
FL
X
X
X
X
NY
LA
X
X
X
X
NJ
X
X
X
X
MA
FL
X
X
NE
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
vT
NH
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
sb
X
X
MD
X
X
X
MA
X
X
X
OH
wi
X
FL
X
X
X

Invitation Type

Invitation Date

78501
60515
78539
78501
78559
37209
78759
78729
78552
93035
60008
76011
95747
78502
64070
90074
77043
78553
75244
33155
78572
33626
78542
78589
77477
78109
10001
70471
77036
78596
78154
78582
08536
76099
78573
75036
78504
02109
32208
77904
78586
68117
76063
76131
75024
78577
78577
78577
78526
78501
05404
03743
78502
78501
78577
78504
78539
78541
78572
57049
75019
78046
21244
78542
78537
78539
02210
78501
78503
78504
45212
54942
78552
33069
78501
78540
78240

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021



PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 12/10/2021

Participant Name
Sherwin Williams

SHI international

Sign Gypsies RGV LLC

Signal Perfection, Ltd.

Silicon Mountain Memory (WayTech, LLC)
Skill Demand Corp

Skyline Technology Solutions, LLC.

Skyview Roofing LLC

Skyward, Inc

SLR Building Contractors

Smartcom Telephone, LLC.

SmartSchool Sytems

Softchoice Corporation

Solice Technologies (Echo Eight Inc.)

Solid Border, Inc.

Solid IT Networks, Inc

South Coast Helix Foundations, Inc.

SOUTH TEXAS COMMUNICATIONS, INC.
Southern Accounting Systems, Inc (SAS, Inc.)
Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc.
Southern Post Construction LLC

Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plas
SparelT LLC

SPIRAL BINDING LLC

Spiral Binding LLC (Sturchio)

Square Technology (David Frisbie)

ST Electric LLC

Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC

Staples Contract & Commercial

Staples Inc (Staples Contract and Commercial LL(
Starr Telecom (Artcom Communications South)
Strategic Partnerships, Inc

Striping Service and Supply Inc.

Strongline Security & Fire (Luis Alfonso Grimaldo
Summit Building & Design (AOC Calton, Ltd., dba
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder Enterprises, Incorpc
Synergy Builders of Texas

T.E.B. Benefits Group Inc

TanChes Global Management Inc

TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC)

Teaching Systems, Inc.

Techland Houston

Technology Integration Group

TechTerra Education

TENI-TRAK, INC.

Terra Fuerte Construction LLC

Texas Chiller Systems

Texas Fireguard, LLC

Texas Political Subdivisions

The 5125 Company

The Carpet House

The Grafix Express LLC

The Library Store, Inc.

The Office Pal

The Rose Report

THE SIGN DEPOT (LOZZ QUATEZZ LLC)

The Social Agency

The Supply Room Inc

Toolkit Technologies, Inc.

Toshiba America Business Solutions, Inc.
Total Imaging Solutions (Digital Service and Sales
Total Seminars, LLC.

Total Technology Results

TREASURE BUILDERS LLC

Trevino's Digital Photography, Inc

Tri-Gen Construction L.L.C.

Triggers Media

Trinity3 Technology

Tri-state Camera Exch. Inc.

Troxell Communications, Inc.

T-Shirts Unlimited (Irma Tirado)

Turbo Images

Twin Construction (Noel Cavazos)

Ultra Print LLC

Unipak Corp.

United Data Technologies

Universal Adaptive Consulting Services

Response Date Response Status

Contact

karissa Carrizales

VIVIANA OR REBECCA

Sales Dev

Ann Monticello
Adam McKnight
Donna Ridgeway

Darcy Grabski
Melissa Champion
Robert Sanchez
David Walling
Juan Arango
Alfredo Rubalcaba
David Williams
Staci Giddings
Robert Heckendorn
JAMES L. EWING
Julie Pruett

Julia Stewart
Charles E. Cavazos
Dale Christiansen
Ed Pierce

Michael Diaz

Chip Sturchio
David Frisbie
Santiago Tamez
David Wilson
Ladara Lucas
Ronnie Valentin
Juan Hinojosa
Kristin Gordon
Lori Ann Tardif

David Acevedo

Dagoberto Perez Jr
Marc Hernandez
Tanaz Choudhury
JOSH BOX

Kim Savage

Eric Campbell

John Putnam
Jeff St. John

Mark McMurray
Nadia Perez

Pat Espericueta
Daniel Garza
Janie Cedillo
Shayla Hill

Ruben Cepeda

Suzanne Taranto-Ethere

Crystal Valachi

BRIGITTE HOLMDAHL

Silver Esparza
Kathy Yale
Maureen Craine
FELIX HERNANDEZ
Joe G Trevino
Sara Alicia Orta
Bobby Villarreal
Kendell Rickman
Shmaya Friedlander
Andres Barragan
Irma Tirado

Steve Payne

Noe Cavazos
Belinda Flores
Brian Marcus
Tyler Coombs
Valencia S. Hicks
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City State
Mcallen X
Austin TX
Mission TX
Tampa FL
Fenton MO
Carmel IN
Glen Burnie MD
McAllen X
Stevens Point Wi
Edinburg TX
McAllen TX
Kingwood TX
Chicago IL
Brownsville X
San Antonio TX
Dallas X
San Antonio TX
MCALLEN X
Tuscumbia AL
Marietta GA
McAllen TX
Maryland Heights MO
Rochester NY
AUSTIN X
Austin TX
Carrollton X
Mission >
Wheeling IL
Dallas TX
Houston TX
Palmview TX
Austin TX
GRAND PRAIRIE 1S
San Juan TX
Laredo X
McAllen X
Edinburg TX
El Paso X
HOUSTON X
BIRMINGHAM AL
Arlington X
Houston X
San Antonio X
Durham NC
MERCEDES X
Alamo X
san Antonio X
Weslaco X
Dallas X
Mission X
Edinburg X
Pharr X
TREMONT IL
Freehold NJ
Beeville LS
Pharr X
San Antonio TX
Oxford AL
Austin TX
Lake Forest CA
McAllen X
Houston TX
San Marcos CA
Alamo X
Pharr X
McAllen X
Mission TX
Saint Paul MN
Brooklyn NY
Phoenix AZ
Weslaco X
Saint-Georges, QC. Ca QC
Weslaco X
Mission TX
West Long Branch NJ
Miramar FL
Henrico VA
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Zip Code Invitation Type Invitation Date
78503 Automatic 09/17/2021
78746 Automatic 09/17/2021
78573 Automatic 09/17/2021
33634 Automatic 09/17/2021
63026 Automatic 09/17/2021
46032 Automatic 09/17/2021
21061 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
54482 Automatic 09/17/2021
78542 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
77339 Automatic 09/17/2021
60693 Automatic 09/17/2021
78520 Automatic 09/17/2021
78248 Automatic 09/17/2021
75267 Automatic 09/17/2021
78269 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
35674 Automatic 09/17/2021
30067 Automatic 09/17/2021
78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
63043 Automatic 09/17/2021
14624 Automatic 09/17/2021
78758 Automatic 09/17/2021
78758 Automatic 09/17/2021
75006 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
60090 Automatic 09/17/2021
75266 Automatic 09/17/2021
77040 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
78746 Automatic 09/17/2021
75051 Automatic 09/17/2021
78589 Automatic 09/17/2021
78043 Automatic 09/17/2021
78502 Automatic 09/17/2021
78542 Automatic 09/17/2021
79902 Automatic 09/17/2021
77099 Automatic 09/17/2021
35208 Automatic 09/17/2021
76018 Automatic 09/17/2021
77007 Automatic 09/17/2021
78216 Automatic 09/17/2021
27707 Automatic 09/17/2021
78570 Automatic 09/17/2021
78516 Automatic 09/17/2021
78216 Automatic 09/17/2021
78596 Automatic 09/17/2021
75254 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
78542 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
61568 Automatic 09/17/2021
07728 Automatic 09/17/2021
78102 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
78209 Automatic 09/17/2021
36203 Automatic 09/17/2021
78746 Automatic 09/17/2021
92638 Automatic 09/17/2021
78504 Automatic 09/17/2021
77034 Automatic 09/17/2021
92078 Automatic 09/17/2021
78516 Automatic 09/17/2021
78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
78599 Automatic 09/17/2021
78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
55114 Automatic 09/17/2021
11231 Automatic 09/17/2021
85040 Automatic 09/17/2021
78596 Automatic 09/17/2021
G5Y 8C3  Automatic 09/17/2021
78599 Automatic 09/17/2021
78573 Automatic 09/17/2021
07764 Automatic 09/17/2021
33027 Automatic 09/17/2021
23228 Automatic 09/17/2021



PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.
TWENTY-TWO (22) DOUBLE FACE ELECTRICAL MARQUEE SIGNS WITH COLOR VIDEO BID # 21-22-028
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 12/10/2021

Participant Name Response Date Response Status  Contact City State Zip Code |Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner
UNIVERSAL FIRE SYSTEMS HENRY CHAVES JR WESLACO 1R 78599 Automatic 09/17/2021
Urban TV's Gilberto Rocha Palmview TX 78503 Automatic 09/17/2021
US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS Jeff Alloway SAN ANTONIO > 78265 Automatic 09/17/2021
V Prints Antonio or Marisol Villal Edinburg TX 78541 Automatic 09/17/2021
Valley Herbal Products (Valley Herbal Products Ir Brent McBain McAllen TX 78504 Automatic 09/17/2021
ValTex (Figueroa & Sons, Inc.) Felipe Lopez McAllen TX 78502 Automatic 09/17/2021
Vantage Point ITAD Martin Lampson Oklahoma City OK 73108 Automatic 09/17/2021
VCI Builders, Inc. Joe Arredondo MISSION TX 78573 Automatic 09/17/2021
VDV Communications LLC Hector Guerrero Mission > 78572 Automatic 09/17/2021
Venser Contractors LLC Ediburg TX 78541 Automatic 09/17/2021
Vertex Marketing Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford TX 77477 Automatic 09/17/2021
Videotex Systems, Inc. Dika Causevic Dallas TX 75238 Automatic 09/17/2021
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (VISCERAL ILLUMI VISCERAL ILLUMINATIOI Edinburg X 78539 Automatic 09/17/2021
Vivacity Tech PBC Tanya Maloley Saint Paul MN 55101 Automatic 09/17/2021
VTX1 Companies (VTX Communications, LLC) Linda Garza Raymondville TX 78580 Automatic 09/17/2021
WalkerCom, Inc. Ray Saldivar Pearland TX 77581 Automatic 09/17/2021
Walmart Inc Bentonvile AR 72716 Automatic 09/17/2021
Weldon, Williams & Lick, Inc. Shari Gillooley Fort Smith AR 72902 Automatic 09/17/2021
WellCheckCAM (AGTS LLC) April Alexander Elkridge MD 21075 Automatic 09/17/2021
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould) Cindy Leander Dallas TX 75006 Automatic 09/17/2021
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CARLOS ISASI) JUAN CARLOS ISASI PHARR X 78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
www.gs-jj.com (EnamelPins Inc.) Elaine Qi Walnut CA 91789 Automatic 09/17/2021
XanEdu Publishing, Inc. Sally Robinson Ann Arbor MI 48108 Automatic 09/17/2021
Xerox Business Solutions Southwest (Dahill Offic: SAN ANTONIO TX 78230 Automatic 09/17/2021
Xerox Corporation/XRX Business Consultants Inc Jaime Huerta Mcallen > 78501 Automatic 09/17/2021
Xm construction mario flores weslaco TX 78599 Automatic 09/17/2021
Xpress Printing and Embroidery LLC Dayanne Villegas Edinburg X 78539 Automatic 09/17/2021
XYZ Restorations LLC Harlingen TX 78550 Automatic 09/17/2021
Your Style Screen Printing Jessica Ledezma Pharr > 78577 Automatic 09/17/2021
Zones,LLC Steve Morberg Auburn WA 98568 Automatic 09/17/2021
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