PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Event Number 21-22-032 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Event Title Toilet Tissue and Dispensers for Central Supply Warehouse Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type Bid Email emily.garza@psijaisd.us
Issue Date 9/17/2021 01:38:44 PM (CT) Phone

Close Date 10/6/2021 04:30:00 PM (CT) Fax

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education approve the Toilet Tissue and Dispensers for Central Supply Warehouse Bid

#21-22-032 to the lowest bidders / lowest justified bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name

|State Lines Awarded Award Total Award Reason

CC Distributors, Inc.
Gulf Coast Paper
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC

Ralph Mendez, Director of Procurement

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 199-131301

Four Hundred Three (403) invitations were emailed to vendors
Fifteen (15) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Nine (9) Submitted Bid
Eight (8) No Bid

X 1 $5,930.00
TX 1 $3,205.00
X 1 $117,975.00

TOTAL: $127,110.00

Jim Brewster, Property Control Coordinator
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Line Qty UOM Description Manufacturer Manuf. Number Award | Award |[Awarded Supplier Award Reason
Response | Qtv

1AIt1 100 CS 2-PLY Bath Tissue 4X3.25. 500 sheets per NPS 12325 $32.05 100 Gulf Coast Paper Low Bid Justified
roll. 96/CS.

2 6050 CS 2-Ply Jumbo Roll Tissue. 2-Ply embossed Comfort Institucionales or equal 9305-2 or equal $19.50 6050 Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC Low Bid Justified
paper, 1000 ft./roll, 3.5 width, 12 rolls/case.
55 cases/pallet. Case weight: 22.86 Ibs.

3 250 EA Twin 9" Toilet Tissue Dispenser. Dimensions San Jamar or equal R4000TBK or equal $23.72 250 CC Distributors, Inc. Low Bid Justified

12" (H) x 19" (W) x 5.25". Capacity (2) 9"
jumbo rolls, core diameter 3.25", wall
mount, break resistant plastic.

**)ustification**

1
2

C & V Supply Inc. bid response was for a percentage discount and not a price per product.

Lowest bid from Stile Enterprises was an alternate product and did not supply a sample for testing. Second lowest bid from C & V Supply Inc. bid response was for a percentage discount

and not a price per product.
C & V Supply Inc. bid response was for a percentage discount and not a price per product.
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

| 1 |2-Ply Toilet Tissue. Heavenly Choice Double Layer, single roll, toilet tissue. 500 sheets per roll. Sheet size: 4.5 x 3.5". 96 rolls per case. 25 cases/pallet, case weight: 31.45 lbs.

Supplier QTY UOM  Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
Competitive Choice Inc. 100 Cases $0.00 $0.00 **INSTALLATION NOT INCLUDED** STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
C&V SUPPLY INC. 100 Cases $18.50 $1,850.00 STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
AWARD [ALT1] Gulf Coast Paper 100 Cases $32.05  $3,205.00 2-PLYBATH TISSUE 4X3.25. 500 SHEETS PER ROLL. 96/CS. NPS 12325
cc Distributors, Inc. 100 Cases 334'20 53,420_00 CASCADES B040 STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
[ALTl] Competitive Choice Inc. 100 Cases $44‘78 $4,478.00 Two-Ply Toilet Tissue, Septic Safe, White, 4.5 x 3, 500 BOARDWALK BWK6180
Sheets/Roll, 96 Rolls/Carton
Central Poly-Bag Corp. 100 Cases $51.12 $5,112.00 Resolute #2354.5"x3.4" STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
OMA Industries, LLC 100 Cases $55.00 $5,500.00 STERCOIOREQUAL 116410R EQUAL
[ALTl] OMA Industries, LLC 100 Cases 555'50 551550_00 Feather Soft #102810 Bath Tissue 4.5x3.6 500 sheet Feather Soft 102810
96/case
Pyramic School Products (pyramid Paper Company) 100 Cases No Bid STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC 100 Cases No Bid STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
Gulf Coast Paper 100 Cases No Bid NPS N12325 STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
Stile Enterprises 100 Cases No Bid STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL

| 2 |2-Ply Jumbo Roll Tissue. 2-Ply embossed paper, 1000 ft./roll, 3.5 width, 12 rolls/case. 55 cases/pallet. Case weight: 22.86 lbs.

Supplier QTY UOM  Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Competitive Choice Inc. 6050 Cases 50.00 50.00 **INSTALLATION NOT INCLUDED** Comfort Institucionales or ~ 9305-2 OR EQUAL
equal

Stile Enterprises 6050 Cases $17.40 $105,270.00 Comfort Institucionales o 9305-2 OR EQUAL
equal

[ALTl] Stile Enterprises 6050 Cases 517.40 51051270.00 2-Ply Jumbo Roll Tissue. 2-Ply embossed paper, 1000 Stile Enterprises STE-9JUMBO

ft./roll, 3.5” width, 12 rolls/case. 55 cases/pallet. Case
weight: 22.86 lbs.

C&V SUPPLY INC. 6050 Cases $18.50 5111,925.00 Comfort Institucionales or ~ 9305-2 OR EQUAL
equal
AWARD Yanitor paper and Supplies, LLC 6050 Cases $ 19.50 $ 117,975.00 WE ARE OFFERING:2-Ply Jumbo Roll Tissue. 2-Ply Comfort Institucionales or  9305-2 OR EQUAL

embossed paper, 1000 ft./roll, 3.5” width, 12 rolls/case. equal
55 cases/pallet. Case weight: 22.86 Ibs. Manufacturer:
COMFORT INSTITUCIONALES Manufacturer #: 9305-2

CC Distributors, Inc. 6050 Cases $20.33 5122,996.50 CASCADES B140 Comfort Institucionales or ~ 9305-2 OR EQUAL
equal

[ALT1] Gulf Coast Paper 6050 Cases $25.84 $156,332.00 2 PLYJRTIR ROLL TISSUE, 12/1000' KIMBERLY CLARK 67805

[ALT1] Competitive Choice Inc. 6050 Cases $26.21 5158,570.50 Jumbo Bath Tissue, Septic Safe, 2-Ply, White, 1000 ft, MORM99 MORCON

/Carton

Central Poly-Bag Corp. 6050 Cases $28.50 $172[425.00 Resolute #700 3.4"W Comfort Institucionales or ~ 9305-2 OR EQUAL
equal

OMA Industries, LLC 6050 Cases $39_99 $241,939.50 Please see Alternative item Coastwide Professional Jumbo Comfort Institucionales or ~ 9305-2 OR EQUAL

Toileet paper CW26215/BPR2621 Core Size (Inches) equal

SPECS3Diameter in Inches9Roll Length in Feet1000Rolls
Per Casel2Series or CollectionJumbo RollThickness (Ply)2-
plyToilet Paper Pack Size11-20Toilet Paper TypelumboTrue
ColorWhiteWidth in Inches3.5

[ALT1] OMA Industries, LLC 6050 Cases $39.99 $241,939.50 COASTWIDE Coastwide Professional Jumbo Toilet Paper, 2- Coastwide CW26215/BPR2621
Ply, White, 1000 ft./Roll, 12 Rolls/Carton (CW26215)Core

Size (Inches)3Diameter in Inches9Roll Length in
Feet1000Rolls Per Case12Series or CollectionJumbo
RollThickness (Ply)2-plyToilet Paper Pack Size11-20Toilet
Paper TypelumboTrue ColorWhiteWidth in Inches3.5

Pyramic School Products (Pyramid Paper Company) 6050 Cases No Bid Comfort Institucionales or  9305-2 OR EQUAL
equal

Gulf Coast Paper 6050 Cases No Bid KC K67805 Comfort Institucionales or ~ 9305-2 OR EQUAL
equal

| 3 |Twin 9" Toilet Tissue Dispenser. Dimensions 12" (H) x 19" (W) x 5.25". Capacity (2) 9" jumbo rolls, core diameter 3.25", wall mount, break resistant plastic.

Supplier QTY UOM  Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #

Gulf Coast Paper 250 EA $0.00 $0.00 FREE OF CHARGE DISPENSERS PROVIDED WE WIN BID FOR SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL
JUMBO ROLL TISSUE ONLY. GP59210.

Competitive Choice Inc. 250 EA $0.00 $0.00 **INSTALLATION NOT INCLUDED** SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL RA4000TBK OR EQUAL

C&V SUPPLY INC. 250 EA 518.50 $4,625-00 SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL

AWARD CC Distributors, Inc. 250 EA $23.72 $5,930.00 CASCADES DB12 SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL

Pyramic School Products (pyramid Paper Company) 250 EA $31.49 $7,872.50 ITEM QUOTED- SAN JAMAR #R4000TBK*MINIMUM ORDER SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL
IS 250 EA***NO INSTALLATION AVAILABLE**

[ALT1] Competitive Choice Inc. 250 EA $46.20 $11,550.00 Twin 9" Jumbo Tissue Dispenser, 19 x 5 1/4 x 12, CFS BRANDS SIMR4000TBK
Transparent Black Pearl

OMA Industries, LLC 250 EA $49.99 $12,497.50 SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL RA4000TBK OR EQUAL

Central Poly-Bag Corp. 250 EA No Bid SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL RA4000TBK OR EQUAL

Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC 250 EA No Bid SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL RA4000TBK OR EQUAL

Stile Enterprises 250 EA No Bid SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Attribute Name C&V Supply Inc. CC Distributors, Inc. Central Poly-Bag Corp. Competitive Choice Inc.
Business/Company Owner Name JUAN O'FARRILL CC Distributors, Inc. Andrew Serhofer Aundrea Young
Date of Establishment 08/30/1990 1906 06/23/1993 2003
Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications? No No Yes No
If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please NO DEVIATION N/A Item 1: 4.5"x3.4"; N/A
specify deviations: Item 2: 3.4"W

Attribute Name Gulf Coast Paper OMA Industries, LLC Pyramic School Products Stile Enterprises

(Pyramid Paper Company)
Business/Company Owner Name Gulf Coast Paper Company Lucia M. Valdez Kenneth D. Miller Matt Labeck
Date of Establishment 08/24/1965 01-01-2007 1932 08/04/2019
Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications? No No Yes No
If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please NO DEVIATION No deviation **Please Note the minimum No Deviation
specify deviations: order requirement listed with
Item #3**

Attribute Name Yanitor Paper and
Supplies, LLC
Business/Company Owner Name Jorge E. Garza
Date of Establishment 03/21/2012
Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications? No
If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please "No deviation"

specify deviations:

Page 4
TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION /JANAUARY 17, 2022



PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Responding Supplier

Signature Full Name

Signature Email

Supplier Notes

C&V SUPPLY INC.
CC Distributors, Inc.
Central Poly-Bag Corp.

Competitive Choice Inc.
Gulf Coast Paper
OMA Industries, LLC

Pyramic School Products (pyramid
Paper Company)

Stile Enterprises

Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC

Juan O'Farrill
David Berlanga
Andrew Serhofer

Julia Suan

Jessica Cavazos
Lucia M. Valdez
Kenneth D. Miller,
Vice President

Matt Labeck

Carlos Manuel Franco

administration@cvsupplyinc.com
dberlanga@ccdistributors.com

bids@centralpoly.com

BIDS@COMPETITIVECHOICE.NET
jessica.cavazos@imperialdade.com
luciavaldez@omaindustries.com

BIDDEPT@PYRAMIDSP.COM

stileenterprise@gmail.com

pharr@yanitor.com
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Delivery within 30-45 Days ARO.
Reference # 179026

*NO INSTALLATION AVAILABLE*
**OUR BID REFERENCE NUMBER IS #21-22-032PSJA. THIS NUMBER
MUST BE LISTED ON ALL ORDERS PLACED AGAINST THIS BID.**

On page 34 we noticed that the 1295 form must be notarized. We
notarized the form and sent a physical copy. The form that is being
submitted online will not have the notary stamp. 4 samples were also
sent with our package. We would also like to thank you for the
opportunity to bid on this solicitation and we hope to work with the
Alamo Independent School District soon!

We are just bidding on item #2 with the product and model you
requested. Thank you for inviting us to participate!

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION /JANAUARY 17, 2022



Participation Summary - As of 01/05/2022

Participant Name

C&V SUPPLY INC.

CC Distributors, Inc.

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.

COMPETITIVE CHOICE INC.

Gulf Coast Paper

OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMF
Stile Enterprises

Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC

CM Graphics/JaMar (Huntco Media LLC)
Delta Specialties Supply (Martin Pena)
Huntington Sky Production DBA FASTSIGNS
McCormick's Group, LLC

Rio Paper & Supply, LLC

School Specialty, Inc.

Traveling Beans

Virtucom, Inc.

acity specialty product dba zep sales and service
ATD-AMERICAN CO (Dinapoli)

Bomar air conditioning and refrigeration
COMOROZ INC

Eagle Brush & Chemical, Inc.

Ferguson Facilities Supply

Gateway Printing

Goliath Services (Goliath Builders and Developme
High End Advertising

NM Contracting, LLC

Office Depot, Inc

Samsclub 8250

Staples Contract & Commercial

Strategic Partnerships, Inc

The PlanIT Room

1,2,3 Screen Printing, LLC

11400 Inc

365 Paving & Construction LLC

4 Signs Digital Print

4imprint, Inc.

5 Star Embroidery & Vinyl Printing

523 Express Printing LLC

9TO 5 COMPUTER

A. Bargas and Associates, LLC.

A+ Medical Examiners

Aarco Products, Inc.

Aasdel Corporation

ABC Custom Advertising (Marketing Concepts Unl
ACCO Brands USA LLC (ACCO Brands Corporation)
Ace Promotions

Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.

Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAst Group Enterpr
Advantage Imaging Supply, Inc

Advertising Matters L.L.C.

AHI Facility Services, Inc.

AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV

AISYS Consulting, LLC

AITA CONSULTING SERVICES,INC

Alamo Iron Works (Alamo Distribution, LLC)
Alamo Iron Works (Vallen Distribution)

All American Poly

Allied Plastics Co., Inc.

AllState Supplies

All-Valley Screenprinting

Alpha and Omega Cleaning Services,LLC
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS

AM Utilities and Construction LLC

Amaze Awards LLC

Amsterdam Partners

Amsterdam Printing & Litho

Arga development

ASAP Printing Solutions (0'Conn LLC)
AssetGenie, Inc. DBA AGiRepair and AGParts Educ
Authentic Promotions.com

Auto-Chlor Services, LLC

Baroq Apparel L.L.C.

Bay Promo LLC

Beary Creative

Bernardo Gomez jr (Brand Boosters Co LLc)
Best Buy For Business (Best Buy Stores, L.P.)

PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032

Response Date Response Status

Contact

10/04/2021
10/05/2021
10/05/2021
10/06/2021
10/06/2021
10/06/2021
10/04/2021
10/05/2021
10/06/2021
09/29/2021
09/23/2021
09/29/2021
09/17/2021
10/06/2021
09/24/2021
09/21/2021
09/17/2021

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / JANUARY 17, 2022

JUAN O'FARRILL

Andrew Serhofer
JULIA SUAN

Jessica Cavazos
Lucia Valdez
PATRICIA OLIVAS
Matt Labeck

Carlos Manuel Franco
Brent Hunter
MARTIN PENA

Rod Snell

Jessica Slabaugh
Jesus A. Sanchez
Accounts Receivable
Leslie Rocha

Tim Prince

jim detamore
Connie Dinapoli
Michael Bocanegra
STANLEY ADIGUN
Rosanne Benoit

Chris Diaz

Edgar Gallegos
Mariano Nunez
Noel Munoz
Nadia Garza
Carlos Garcia
Ladara Lucas
Kristin Gordon
Cecilia Hernandez
Hiram

Lisa Wick
Gilberto Maldonado
Edgar Rodriguez
Shay Freund
Jorge Gonzalez IlI

RICHARD RAAB
Almon Bargas
Freddy Romero
Jay L. Krause
Sabbir Mahmud
Martha J Miller
Customer Care
Pat Garcia

Marguerite Burton
James Reid

Rose Key

Luke Bruns

Javier Olmos
Elizabeth Lopez
KEVIN KUMAR
Stacey B Sims
Robert Garcia

Jay L. Krause
Wendy Davis
Rod Zamora
Ismael De Leon

Roberto Morales
Justin Colebrissi

Sean O' Connor
Tina Covalesky
Peter Carmazzi

Margina Arguello
Jessica Zarate
Bernardo Gomez
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BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

City
MISSION
Corpus Christi
Linden
Houston
Brownsville
HARLINGEN
TAMPA
Whitestone
Pharr
Harlingen
EDINBURG
McAllen
Wheeling
Pharr
Greenville
San Juan
Peachtree Corners
atlanta
Wyncote
Pharr
AVENTURA
Dallas

San Anotnio
Edinburg
Pharr
Mission
MCALLEN
Austin
mcallen
Dallas
Austin

El Paso
Mission
Lancaster
Mission

San Juan
Oshkosh
Mcallen
Edinburg
Jacksonville Beach
San Antonio
McAllen
Yaphank
Norcross
McAllen
Dallas

San Benito
Harlingen
Forest Hill
San Juan Capistrano
Ft Worth
Dallas
McAllen
McAllen
NORTH BRUNSWICK
Alpharetta
Pharr
Piscataway
Jacksonville
Athens
McAllen
Edinburg
edinburg
Mission
Chehalis
Lincoln Park
Amsterdam
Mission
McAllen
Greensburg
Carmichael
Jefferson
McAllen
Tampa
McAllen
Mcallen
Richfield

State |Invitation Type

X
X
NJ
X
X
X
FL
NY
X
X
X
X
IL
X
wi
X
GA
GA
PA
X
FL
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
PA
X
X
Wi
X
X
FL
X
X
NY
GA
X
X
X
X
X
CA
X
X
X
X
NJ
GA
X
NJ
FL
GA
X
X
X
X
WA
NJ
NY
X
X
PA
CA
LA
X
FL
X
X
MN

Invitation Date

Owner

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic

Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021

09/17/2021
09/17/2021

09/17/2021

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021

09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021
09/17/2021

Juan O'Varril
Andrew Grey
Andrew Serhofer
Aundrea Young
Pete Petkoff
Lucia M. Valdez
Kenneth D. Miller
Matt Labeck
Jorge E. Garza



PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Betco Corporation Bowling Green OH  Automatic 09/17/2021
Beyond Technology (W.M. Corp.) Jessea Bowe Centennial CO  Automatic 09/17/2021
BioFit Engineered Products Limited Partnership Cathy M. Thomas Bowling Green OH  Automatic 09/17/2021
BizSupplies rushelle wetzel Houston TX Automatic 09/17/2021
bkdsignsandgraphicslic Brenda Henderson Edinburg TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Blink Marketing Inc Darlene Zwolinski Cleveland OH  Automatic 09/17/2021
Blue Sky Enterprises Alonzo Acosta La Blanca TX Automatic 09/17/2021
BM Benchmark Construction, LLC McAllen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION, LLC TONY RODRIGUEZ San Juan X Automatic 09/17/2021
Bon Tool Co Paul Bender Gibsonia PA  Automatic 09/17/2021
BOXX Modular (Nortex Modular Leasing & Constrt Harold Weatherly Fort Worth TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Boydsco Holdings LLC Carl j boyd Lansing Ml Automatic 09/17/2021
Brandit LLC Leonel Cantu Mcallen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
brands imaging brett brand philadelphia PA  Automatic 09/17/2021
BRIGHT WHITE PAPER CO. Rick Kazdin PALM CITY FL Automatic 09/17/2021
Brodart Co. Cathy M. Thomas Williamsport PA  Automatic 09/17/2021
BuckHorn Construction LLC Chad Bishop Harlingen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Buffalo Construction LLC. FRED GUERRA WESLACO TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Burning Light Designs, LLC (Felipe Guerra) Felipe Guerra Alamo TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC) Scott Vaughan Weslaco TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Butler Business Products Stacy Duke Houston TX Automatic 09/17/2021
C&H Distributors, LLC William Rose Chicago IL Automatic 09/17/2021
CAPA Texas junior ocampo Mission TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Caprice Electronics, Inc. Michael Kluger Brooklyn NY Automatic 09/17/2021
Cascade School Supples Todd Shafer North Adams MA  Automatic 09/17/2021
Cascade School Supplies Todd Shafer North Adams MA  Automatic 09/17/2021
Catalina (Gomez) Edinburg TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Catalyst PR INC Holly Arbuckle Conroe TX Automatic 09/17/2021
CDW Government LLC Mike Smith Vernon Hills IL Automatic 09/17/2021
Center Stone Services Weslaco TX  Automatic 09/17/2021
Certified Laboratories (a divsion of NCH Corporati: Toni Boyd Irving TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Champion Awards and Apparel Juan Valdez Weslaco TX Automatic 09/17/2021
CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS Derek Barrera MCALLEN X Automatic 09/17/2021
Cintas Corporation #538 Roger Rodriguez Mercedes 1S Automatic 09/17/2021
Circle Saw Builders Supply, Inc Juan R Ruiz Houston TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Claridge Products and Equipment, Inc. Kristi Popin Farmers Branch X Automatic 09/17/2021
Classic Images Photos and AWARDSS (garcia) Jesse Garcia Pharr TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Coast To Coast Computer Products, Inc. Miranda Horowitz Simi Valley CA Automatic 09/17/2021
Coastal Enterprises (Joy Products of California, Inc Shayne Kollins Fountain Valley CA  Automatic 09/17/2021
COLLEGE THRIVER INC shawntia lee orlando FL Automatic 09/17/2021
Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, | D'Ann lvers San Antonio TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Compostology LLC Kash Nathan Waco TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Computer Comforts, Inc Cathy L. Thomas Kemah X Automatic 09/17/2021
Conserv Flag Company Kenny Gudahl Sidney NE  Automatic 09/17/2021
ConstructConnect Cincinnati OH  Automatic 09/17/2021
Construction Bid Source (Plan Room) Felton CA  Automatic 09/17/2021
Construction Journal LLC Pamela Exton Stuart FL Automatic 09/17/2021
Copy Graphics Inc. David Valdez McAllen X Automatic 09/17/2021
Copy Plus LLC Lorissa Pecina MC ALLEN T Automatic 09/17/2021
Copy Zone (CBSPrint, LLC) Pily Stevens Mcallen X Automatic 09/17/2021
Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Company (UBEO L Baldomero Gonzalez Pharr X Automatic 09/17/2021
Costco Wholesale Esmeralda Maldonado  Pharr X Automatic 09/17/2021
Coverbind Corporation Wilmington NC  Automatic 09/17/2021
Creative Advertising Promotions Ponte Vedra Beach FL Automatic 09/17/2021
Creative Imaging LLC Norma Woodard Edinburg TX Automatic 09/17/2021
CRESTLINE SPECIALTIES, INC ANN MARIE PAYNE CINCINNATI OH Automatic 09/17/2021
Curbell Plastics, Inc. Bill Heckert Houston TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Curtis (CURTIS 1000, INC) Oscar Zapata DULUTH GA  Automatic 09/17/2021
Custom Sportswear, Inc. Ron Duzenski Sewell NJ Automatic 09/17/2021
CV INDUSTRIAL HARDWARE LLC Giovanni Olivos Mission T Automatic 09/17/2021
D' XPRESS EMBROIDERY (David Saldana) david saldana Alamo TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Dallas Lighthouse for the Blind/ Envision Dallas X Automatic 09/17/2021
Decisin Tree Inc. Brent Lawson El Paso TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Deltek Source Management Herndon VA  Automatic 09/17/2021
Demo Con, Inc. La Feria TX Automatic 09/17/2021
designs and more (edgar) edgar elizondo Edinburg X Automatic 09/17/2021
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc. Sandra Salinas Palmhurst TX Automatic 09/17/2021
DiscountPC P Michael Charles Austin X Automatic 09/17/2021
Dispensing Dynamics San Marcos CA  Automatic 09/17/2021
Diverse Education Resources (Discovery Educatior Phil Deats FORT WORTH TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Dixon Ticonderoga Chrissie Mouton Lake Mary FL Automatic 09/17/2021
Double M laser products inc. Houston X Automatic 09/17/2021
Dream Ranch Office Supplies (Dream Ranch LLC) Krum TX Automatic 09/17/2021
ECOEFFECT Alejandro Alanis McAllen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Ecolab Inc. Dale Mrozinski St. Paul MN  Automatic 09/17/2021
Econ Group, LLC Gilbert Enriquez Edinburg TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Economy Award Co. Delmita TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Education Account Executive Luis Montes San Antonio TX Automatic 09/17/2021
ELD APPAREL (perlmuter) Ezra Perlmuter Long Branch NJ Automatic 09/17/2021
Elite Disinfecting Services (Elite Oil Field and Const Juan Suarez Mission TX Automatic 09/17/2021
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ELITE PRO SIGNS LLC

ELITE PROMOTIONS

Elsa Auto & Truck Parts

Embroidery Express

Empire Paper Company

Encino Construction

ESHA AV

Evolve Paints (BMB Paints and Coatings)
Fairway Supply, Inc.

FasClampitt Paper-McAllen

fat cat signs lic

Fedex Office and Print Services, Inc

Flux Media LLC

Fomcore, LLC

Fourtify Construction

Fourtify, LLC

Full Stop Equipment LLC

Fully Promoted McAllen (Hema, Ltd. Co.)
FuvaMedia Publishing llc

G Tees Printing

GALVAMET STEEL LLC

GALVAN BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Gandy Ink (G&G Investments)

gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)
General contractor/Construction (Davila Construc
Genesis ll, Inc

Global Industrial (Global Equipment Company Inc.
GNG General Contracting

Go UnderGround

Govmation Enterprise Solutions

GRANDE VALLE APPAREL (Adan MArtinez)
GRANDE VALLEY BUILDERS,INC

Green Dream Internationl

Greenwood Office Outfitters

Groggy Dog Sportswear

Groupo GTE, LLC

GT SCREEN PRINTING (GOODTIMES SCREEN PRIN?
Guardian Innovations, LLC

H&H door (Zelkowski)

Hairnet Cornpany / Safeko producls (HNC Enterpri
Hand Safety, LLC

Hann Manufacturing, Inc.

Hasty Awards

hdc video and communications dba (Maria del Ca:
HDL Promos

H-E-B- LP

HIDALGO ALL STARS SCREEN PRINTING & EMBROI
High Point (Western BRW Paper Co., Inc)
Hillyard, Texas

Hi-LoContractor LLC

Hobart Service

Holchemont, Ltd.

Holzberg Communications, INc.

House of Print, LLC

Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC

llusion invitaciones & boutique

Imagery Graphic Systems

Imprezos Pro Uniforms LLC

Imprint Resources

Indeco

Indoff, Inc. (Indoff, Incorporated)

Industrial Signs and Welding

Ironwood Manufacturing, Inc.

Javier Navarrete (All Star Trophies & T-Shirts)
JCO "the door people"

JettMedia

J)'s Party House

JK Graphics, Inc #1

K12Marketplace LLC

K12Savings (Textbook Brokers inc)

kautsch lumber co inc

KAUTSCH TRUE VALUE (TRUE TEST VENTURES LLC
Klein Design Inc

L & M Food Service Inc.

Lamac (Trey Gonzalez)

Laminating and Binding Solutions, Inc

LD Products, Inc.

Legna International Trade

Leija Welding

Lewis Electric Motors, Inc.

PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Oscar Campos Lyford
Rossy Galarza Brownsville
Lupe Garza McAllen
Weslaco
Bids Wichita Falls
Fred mcallen
Shrey Parikh East Brunswick
Elda Barbosa Pharr
Kathy Millican Austin
Andres Ramos JR Mcallen
Liza Lemos Edinburg
Humberto Barberena McAllen
Carlos Bernaldez Pharr
Jay L. Krause Muskegon
Sam De la Garza Edinburg
David Iglesias McAllen
Elias Macias La Joya
Hector Leal McAllen
Jerry Chapa McAllen
Cris Garcia Pharr
EDINBURG
GALVAN BUILDERS CONS CORPUS CHRISTI
John Gandy San Angelo
Juan Garcia san juan
Tommy Canul Pharr
William Cox Rock Hill
William Rose Chicago
Phillip Garza McAllen
harlingen
Dwaylyn Holland McKinney
Adan Martinez SAN BENITO
MANUEL PEREZ MCALLEN
Antone Austin Erie
Robert Rosalez Fort Worth
Mary Ann Chambers DENTON
Gregg Taylor Las Vegas
ALAMO
Tony Plagman Peachtree Corners
Victoria
Mendel Chein brooklyn
Ramon K Flanigan Wichita Falls
Jay L. Krause McConnelsville
Thad O'Connor Ottawa
Maria del Castillo mcallen
HERIBERTO LOPEZ WESLACO
San Antonio
JOSE LOPEZ HIDALGO
Jane Lopez Dallas
Mario Gonzales San Antonio
Edmundo Carreon Elsa
Michael Birt Troy
Annette Carmona McAllen
Andy Holzberg Totowa
INNETTE CUELLAR - ORTI PHARR
Keith F. Hunt Laguna Vista
CYNTHIA LEYVA Pharr
Matt Tumelson San Antonio
Francisco Javier Morales Pharr
Lisa Schlensker Richardson
Martin Pena Belton
Kansas City
Roman Gonzales DONNA
Cathy M. Thomas Missoula
Javier Navarrete Los Fresnos
Joe Perez EDINBURG
Randy Garza Pharr
Homer Martinez McAllen
Deanna Voitle Tomball
Dalton Williams Ozark
Dylan Silkey Sparta
kookii crerar alamo
KOOKII CRERAR alamo
Henry
Stacie Wilburn Henderson
TREY GONZALEZ MCALLEN
Amy Moorehouse Lake Forest
Diana Athey Long Beach
Albeza Alanis El Paso
Pharr
Enrique Mendez HARLINGEN
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LEX apparel (LEX apparel inc)

Liberty Office Products (Liberty Data Products)
Limitless Office Products

Little Giants Learning Center

Lodging Kit Company

Lowes Of Pharr (lowe's home center. lic)
Lumatec Lighting Service

M&A Technology (M&A Technology Inc.)
M&K Imports LLC

Magtec Corporation

Mancha Screen Print & Embroidery LLC.

Mark Andy, Inc. dba Mark Andy Print Products
MARK HOSKINS ENTERPRISES LLC

Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation)
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS

MB Services LLC

MC Austin

McAllen Sports Inc.

McCoys Building Supply (McCoy Corporation)
McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solution:
Medicaid Claim Solutions of Texas, Inc.

MEGA SUPPLY LLC

MH ENTERPRISES (MH ENTERPRISES 888)
MIEN Company, Inc.

Modern Imaging Solutions

Morning Star Industries Inc

Mustang Apparel dba Incentive Brands
Namify, LLC

National Art & School Supplies Inc.

National Chemical Laboratories Inc

Natural Wellness Brand

New Image Institute of Cosmetology LLC
NFCS, LLC

Nitsom Promotional Manufacturing Corp
Noble Texas Builders

Oak Hill Technology, Inc.

Otter Graphics Inc.

Paragon Furniture, Inc.

PCMG, Inc.

Peerless Marketing Group

Performance Safety Group |, LP

Performant Technologies, LLC

Pheido Advertising

Phoenix embroidery and screen printing (RELY Ent
Pinturas & Lacas (PPG Paints)

PKJ INTERNATIONAL LLC

Plano Pin Company, Inc.

Platinum Fleet Wash (Angela Salinas)
PortionPac Chemical Corporation

Precision Micrographics & Imaging , Inc.
PRECISION SAW & TOOL, INC

PREMIER & COMPANIES

Prevention & Treatment Resource Press and Fire
print spot solutions

Print-EC, LLC

Printed Promotionals

PRINTEX EXPRESS (NORTH LEAN LTD)

Printing Supplies USA LLC (B2B Supplies USA LLC)
PROFESSIONAL POLISH, INC.

Progressive Marketing (JA Pro Marketing, Inc.)
Promo Entertainment Group

Promo Masters (Alex Gene Del Fierro)

Promo Solutions

Promo Universal LLC

Promotions Plus

Public Consulting Group Inc

R REYES TRUCKING & TRACTOR SERVICES
Ray's Business Products

RCA Building Materials Inc.

RDX Sharptech

READING PLUS LLC

REFCO (R E Friedrichs Company)

RGV Boilers Inc.

RGV GUARDIAN ENTERPRISES LLC DBA DERTY SPC
RGV Repro (RGV Reprographics)

RGV YARD CARDS LLC

Rio Creative Studio

Rio Grande Valley Chapter Associated General Col
RODRIGUEZ SCREEN PRINTING

Romo Contractors, LLC

PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Alexander J Bender Savannah
Scott Wiland Houston
Mita Guha RICHARDSON
Alamo
Sierra LaVeck Boonville
Pharr
Victor T Rios McAllen
Donna Shepard Carrolton
Mount Vernon
Anelise Pires Miami
Laura Fernandez Mission
Donna Alesch-Woodin  Des Plaines
Mark Hoskins MCALLEN
Mike Zappia Stow
DAVID CASTILLO PHARR
George Selvera Pharr
Monica Escamilla Austin
Joe Escamilla McAllen
Tina McArthur San Marcos
Thomas Bryant Atlanta
Kim Harmon Mansfield
LAURA MALDONADO MCALLEN
Miyoung Hong McKinney
Jay L. Krause Grand Rapids
Ana Belleza CANOGA PARK
Brittny Bonawitz Jensen Beach
Mike Monahan Plano
Springville
Rahway
Tom Lesher Philadelphia
Rachel Rials San Antonio
Crystal Maldonado SanJuan
Rudy Ramirez Wylie
Terrence Hu NORTH YORK
La Feria
Driftwood
Robert Vincent Oxnard
Cathy M. Thomas Arlington
Elanie Bungay Los Angeles
Brenda Blair Dallas
Drew Allrich St. Louis
Patricia Masters Livermore
Richard Feiden Houston
lupe salinas edinburg
Rudy Garza Weslaco
S1JO JOSE STAFFORD
Britt-Lee Smith Plano
Angela Salinas Alamo
Chicago
jerry collins Austin
EDDIE HOMAN CONVERSE
Henry Melendez NEW YORK
Mandeville
weslaco
Mike Pepper Selma
Mary Cantu Rio Grande City
YOLI MARTINEZ Pharr
Luke Xu Plainsboro
VANESA GONZALEZ FORT WORTH
Christina Noriega Lexington
McGovern GRAYSON
Edna J. Pena Alton
Frisco
Anthony Anzaldua Corpus Christi
Eloy Olivarez McAllen
Maureen Farrell Boston
JOHANA REYES SAN BENITO
Pharr
Gustavo Rea Pharr
Edna Salinas Brownsville
Julie Miller-Johnson Winooski
Vicki Delgado McAllen
Mike Garcia McAllen
Rick Romo PHARR
Rick Garcia McAllen
ARACELI COVARRUBIAS MCALLEN
Mission
Perry A. Vaughn Harlingen

RODRIGUEZ SCREEN PRIl San Juan
Romo Contractors LLC  Laredo
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Roth IAMS LLC Bill Roth St. Petersburg FL Automatic 09/17/2021
royal media network inc. irene diaz WINDSOR MIL MD  Automatic 09/17/2021
Royal T's Embroidery & Screen Printing Edinburg TX Automatic 09/17/2021
rudys upholstery pharr TX  Automatic 09/17/2021
Russell Carroll Manufacturing, Inc Jay L. Krause Raleigh NC  Automatic 09/17/2021
S&K Associates (Alan J Krieger) Alan J Krieger Playa del Rey, CA  Automatic 09/17/2021
Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte) Johnny Hunte San Antonio TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Sanitech Belinda Wolovich Lakeland FL Automatic 09/17/2021
Santre USA LLC Flavio Garduno Hidalgo TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Save Techs Raymond Lee McAllen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
School Outfitters Cincinnati OH  Automatic 09/17/2021
School Tee Factory (Custom Sportswear, Inc.) Ron Duzenski Sewell NJ Automatic 09/17/2021
SCOTT ELECTRIC MARK TROUTMAN GREENSBURG PA Automatic 09/17/2021
SCREEN GRAPHICS OF FLORIDA, INC. Matt Sadowski POMPANO BEACH FL Automatic 09/17/2021
Second Chance Treasures McAllen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Seekr Essentials (Seekr Global INC) Andoni Almeida Austin X Automatic 09/17/2021
SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA GROUP, INC) SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Sherwin Williams karissa Carrizales Mcallen X Automatic 09/17/2021
SHI international Austin TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Sign Gypsies RGV LLC VIVIANA OR REBECCA  Mission TX  Automatic 09/17/2021
Solice Technologies (Echo Eight Inc.) Alfredo Rubalcaba Brownsville TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Solix, Inc Parsippany NJ Automatic 09/17/2021
South Texas Moulding dba Texas Wood Supply Daniel Ortiz DONNA TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Southern Accounting Systems, Inc (SAS, Inc.) Julie Pruett Tuscumbia AL Automatic 09/17/2021
Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc. Julia Stewart Marietta GA  Automatic 09/17/2021
Southern Post Construction LLC Charles E. Cavazos McAllen X Automatic 09/17/2021
Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plast Dale Christiansen Maryland Heights MO  Automatic 09/17/2021
SparelT LLC Ed Pierce Rochester NY  Automatic 09/17/2021
speedy transmissions #2 JUAN HERRERA Mcallen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
SPIRAL BINDING LLC Michael Diaz AUSTIN 1S Automatic 09/17/2021
Spiral Binding LLC (Sturchio) Chip Sturchio Austin TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Spirit Monkey, LLC Luis deBonoPaula San Antonio TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Sportdecals, Absolutely Custom, Galapagos, Pauly KAY BOETTCHER SPRING GROVE IL Automatic 09/17/2021
Stand Up Stations (Toss Up Events LLC) Alex Carroll Irving X Automatic 09/17/2021
Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC David Wilson Wheeling IL Automatic 09/17/2021
Staples Inc (Staples Contract and Commercial LLC) Ronnie Valentin Houston X Automatic 09/17/2021
Summit Building & Design (AOC Calton, Ltd., dba S David Acevedo Laredo TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Surplus Supply Co Philip Leonard Harlingen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
TanChes Global Management Inc Tanaz Choudhury HOUSTON TX Automatic 09/17/2021
TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) JOSH BOX BIRMINGHAM AL Automatic 09/17/2021
Teq-Tex Llc Marco Gonzalez Mcallen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Texas Art Supply Company Elisa Ulloa Houston TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Texas Political Subdivisions Dallas TX Automatic 09/17/2021
TFD SUPPLIES (TFD Unlimited, LLC) Kelly Brown FAIRVIEW HEIGHTS IL Automatic 09/17/2021
The Carpet House Daniel Garza Edinburg TX Automatic 09/17/2021
The Grafix Express LLC Janie Cedillo Pharr X Automatic 09/17/2021
The Habits Group, LLC Raynor McKinnon Austin TX Automatic 09/17/2021
The Library Store, Inc. Shayla Hill TREMONT IL Automatic 09/17/2021
The Master Teacher Angelika Patterson Manhattan KS Automatic 09/17/2021
The Office Pal Freehold NJ Automatic 09/17/2021
THE SIGN DEPOT (LOZZ QUATEZZ LLC) Ruben Cepeda Pharr T Automatic 09/17/2021
The Social Agency Suzanne Taranto-Ethere( San Antonio X Automatic 09/17/2021
The Supply Room Inc Crystal Valachi Oxford AL Automatic 09/17/2021
Toshiba America Business Solutions, Inc. BRIGITTE HOLMDAHL  Lake Forest CA Automatic 09/17/2021
Total Imaging Solutions (Digital Service and Sales) Silver Esparza McAllen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Total Technology Results Maureen Craine San Marcos CA Automatic 09/17/2021
Trevino's Digital Photography, Inc Joe G Trevino Pharr TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Trinity3 Technology Kendell Rickman Saint Paul MN  Automatic 09/17/2021
Troxell Communications, Inc. Andres Barragan Phoenix AZ Automatic 09/17/2021
T-Shirts Unlimited (Irma Tirado) Irma Tirado Weslaco TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Turbo Images Steve Payne Saint-Georges, QC. Canada QC  Automatic 09/17/2021
Tuxedo Connect (Tuxedo Connect LLC) Wylie Branch Fort Worth TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Twin Construction (Noel Cavazos) Noe Cavazos Weslaco X Automatic 09/17/2021
Ultra Print LLC Belinda Flores Mission X Automatic 09/17/2021
Unifirst Holdings Jose Alvarado McAllen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Unipak Corp. Brian Marcus West Long Branch NJ Automatic 09/17/2021
United Data Technologies Tyler Coombs Miramar FL Automatic 09/17/2021
United Sales usa corp. Pinny Ziegler brooklyn NY  Automatic 09/17/2021
US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS Jeff Alloway SAN ANTONIO T Automatic 09/17/2021
V Prints Antonio or Marisol Villal Edinburg X Automatic 09/17/2021
Valley Herbal Products (Valley Herbal Products Inc Brent McBain McAllen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Valley Trophies, LLC Travis McDaniel Weslaco TX Automatic 09/17/2021
ValTex (Figueroa & Sons, Inc.) Felipe Lopez McAllen TX Automatic 09/17/2021
VCI Builders, Inc. Joe Arredondo MISSION TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Vertex Marketing Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Virtual Builders Exchange Jeannette Olguin SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (VISCERAL ILLUMIN VISCERAL ILLUMINATION Edinburg X Automatic 09/17/2021
Walmart Inc Bentonvile AR Automatic 09/17/2021
WasteZero Inc. lan Noble RALEIGH ND  Automatic 09/17/2021
Weaver Manufacturing Company, Inc. (Charles W. Ray Adkins Flower Mound TX Automatic 09/17/2021
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PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 21-22-032
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 6, 2021 @ 4:30 P.M.

Weldon, Williams & Lick, Inc. Shari Gillooley Fort Smith AR Automatic 09/17/2021
WellCheckCAM (AGTS LLC) April Alexander Elkridge MD  Automatic 09/17/2021
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould) Cindy Leander Dallas TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Whitmeyers Distillery Co., LLC Houston TX Automatic 09/17/2021
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CARLOS ISASI) JUAN CARLOS ISASI PHARR X Automatic 09/17/2021
World Wide Imaging Supplies (Zapopan Business ( Jesse Ayon San Antonio TX Automatic 09/17/2021
www.gs-jj.com (EnamelPins Inc.) Elaine Qi Walnut CA  Automatic 09/17/2021
XanEdu Publishing, Inc. Sally Robinson Ann Arbor Ml Automatic 09/17/2021
Xerox Business Solutions Southwest (Dahill Office SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Xerox Corporation/XRX Business Consultants Inc. Jaime Huerta Mcallen > Automatic 09/17/2021
Xpress Printing and Embroidery LLC Dayanne Villegas Edinburg TX Automatic 09/17/2021
xtremetees embroidery saldivar san juan X Automatic 09/17/2021
Your Style Screen Printing Jessica Ledezma Pharr TX Automatic 09/17/2021
Zones,LLC Steve Morberg Auburn WA  Automatic 09/17/2021
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