

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

Event Number	# 20-21-033	Organization	PSJA ISD Ebids
Event Title	TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE	Workgroup	Purchasing
Event Description		Event Owner	Emily Garza
Event Type	Bid	Email	emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Issue Date	12/8/2020 10:28:23 AM (CT)	Phone	
Close Date	1/14/2021 03:30:00 PM (CT)	Fax	

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education approve the Trash Can Liners for use District-Wide Bid # 20-21-033 to the lowest bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name	City	State	Lines Awarded	Award Total	Award Reason
Interboro Packaging Corp.	Montgomery	NY	1	\$1,624.00	
Unipak Corp.	BROOKLYN	NY	2	\$105,408.00	
TOTAL:				\$107,032.00	

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Jim Brewster, Property Control Coordinator

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 199-131301

Three Hundred Five (305) invitations were emailed to vendors
 Nineteen (19) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications
 Sixteen (16) Submitted Bid
 Two (2) Unsubmitted Bid
 Ten (10) No Bid

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

Line	Qty	UOM	Description	Manufacturer	Manuf. Number	Award Response	Award Qty	Awarded Supplier	Award Reason
1	200	CS	24" x 24" Mic 6, or Equal. 50 bags per roll / 20 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.1	Interplast Group	EC242406N	\$8.12	200	Interboro Packaging Corp.	LOW BID
2	6600	CS	33" x 39" .80 Mil or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 6 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.9	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW	\$8.72	6,600	Unipak Corp.	LOW BID JUSTIFIED
3	4800	CS	38" x 58" .80 MIL or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 4 Rolls per case. Net Lbs 11.3	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	\$9.97	4,800	Unipak Corp.	LOW BID JUSTIFIED

JUSTIFICATIONS:

- 2 Low bidder Safeway Supply Inc. did not submit sample for testing.
- 3 Low bidder Safeway Suppy Inc. did not submit a sample for testing. Second lowet bidder Advanced Blending, Inc. has a minimum order requirement and items did not test well during evaluation.

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

1	24" x 24" Mic 6, or Equal. 50 bags per roll / 20 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.1							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Interboro Packaging Corp.	200	CS	\$8.12	\$1,624.00	Inteplast INT-2424-L; Mfr: Inteplast IBS/Capital; Manufactured in Texas; 1,000/CaseSamples are available upon request!	Interplast Group	EC242406N
	Unipak Corp.	200	CS	\$8.33	\$1,666.00	MFG: UPC 242406NWE HAVE PERIODICALLY SUPPLIED THIS ITEM.	Interplast Group	EC242406N
	Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: L'ast Group Enterprises	200	CS	\$8.48	\$1,696.00	24" x 24" Mic 6, or Equal. 50 bags per roll / 20 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.1 Quoting Pinnacle #H242406N as an equal product Minimum order for Pinnacle Plastics is 256 cases mixed products each shipment (Items 1, 2 and 3) Pallets are 64 cases each for each product. Please order by even pallet count.	Interplast Group	EC242406N
	Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	200	CS	\$8.62	\$1,724.00	Duraplus 2424HT34 1000/cs	Interplast Group	EC242406N
	CC Distributors, Inc.	200	CS	\$9.02	\$1,804.00	CAPITAL PLASTICS N242406CR	Interplast Group	EC242406N
	[ALT1] Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	200	CS	\$9.75	\$1,950.00	H242406N 24 x 24 6 MIC NATURAL 1000/cs	CAPITAL	H242406N
	Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	200	CS	\$10.10	\$2,020.00	We are offering the same item you requested. Manufacturer: Interplast Group. anufacturer# EC242406N Color: Natural.Price is per case	Interplast Group	EC242406N
	Gulf Coast Paper	200	CS	\$10.15	\$2,030.00		Interplast Group	EC242406N
	CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.	200	CS	\$10.20	\$2,040.00	CENTRAL POLY #CP2424N6	Interplast Group	EC242406N
	[ALT1] PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY)	200	CS	\$10.38	\$2,076.00	24" x 24" Mic 6, or Equal. 50 bags per roll / 20 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.1	NAPCO	NR242406CLEAR
	Ferguson Facilities Supply	200	CS	\$10.44	\$2,088.00		Interplast Group	EC242406N
	Vizocom	200	CS	\$10.78	\$2,156.00	see attached for specification	Interplast Group	EC242406N
	[ALT1] Gateway Printing	200	CS	\$11.49	\$2,298.00	#GWP-NR242406N / 24X24,6MIC,20/50,Natural	Napco	GWP-NR242406N
	[ALT1] US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS	200	CS	\$12.99	\$2,598.00	24" X 24" MIC 6 10G 1000 PER CASE	CAPPLA	1121
	[ALT1] Office Depot, Inc	200	CS	\$13.07	\$2,614.00	6 Mic, 10 Gallons, 24" x 24", Natural, Box Of 1,000	HIGHMARK PROFESSIONAL	790797
	All American Poly	200	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	EC242406N
	Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	200	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	EC242406N

2	33" x 39" .80 Mil or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 6 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.9							
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
	Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	6600	CS	\$8.39	\$55,374.00	Duraplus 3339LW425 150/cs	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
AWARD	Unipak Corp.	6600	CS	\$8.72	\$57,552.00	MFG: UPC 3339 XHWAS PER USUAL; WE ARE CURRENT VENDOR.	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: L'ast Group Enterprises	6600	CS	\$8.72	\$57,552.00	33" x 39" .80 Mil or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 6 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 9.9 Quoting Pinnacle #L3339.8W as an equal product Minimum order for Pinnacle Plastics is 256 cases mixed products each shipment (Items 1, 2 and 3) Pallets are 64 cases each for each product. Please order by even pallet count.	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	[ALT1] PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY)	6600	CS	\$9.25	\$61,050.00	33" x 39" .80 Mil or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 6 Rolls per Case. Net Lbs 8.64	NAPCO	CUSTR3036W
	CC Distributors, Inc.	6600	CS	\$9.26	\$61,116.00	CAPITAL PLASTICS XW39CR	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	[ALT1] US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS	6600	CS	\$9.45	\$62,370.00	33" X 39" WHITE HVY 33G .74 MIL 150 PER CASE	CAPPLA	2467
	[ALT1] Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	6600	CS	\$9.55	\$63,030.00	L3339.8W 33 X 39 0.80 MIL WHITE 150/CS	CAPITAL	L3339.8W
	[ALT1] Interboro Packaging Corp.	6600	CS	\$9.98	\$65,868.00	Inteplast INT-3339-X-Hvy Black; Manufactured in Texas; 150/CaseSamples are available upon request!	Inteplast IBS/Capital/Glopak	Inteplast INT-3339-X-Hvy Black
	Ferguson Facilities Supply	6600	CS	\$9.99	\$65,934.00		Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	Interboro Packaging Corp.	6600	CS	\$10.24	\$67,584.00	Inteplast INT-3339-X-Hvy; Mfr: Inteplast IBS/Capital/Glopak; Manufactured in Texas; 150/CaseSamples are available upon request!	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.	6600	CS	\$10.80	\$71,280.00	CENTRAL POLY #CP3339XHW	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	Gulf Coast Paper	6600	CS	\$11.76	\$77,616.00		Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	Vizocom	6600	CS	\$11.88	\$78,408.00	see attached for specification	Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	[ALT1] All American Poly	6600	CS	\$12.98	\$85,668.00	33" x 39" Liners, Color: White, Gauge/Thickness: 1.0 mil, Flat Packed, 150/case, Case Weight 12.9 lbs	All American Poly	3339XH-AAP
	[ALT1] Gateway Printing	6600	CS	\$13.00	\$85,800.00	#GWP-C33398HDW / 33X39, .80MIL,White,6/25	Napco	GWP-C33398HDW
	[ALT1] Office Depot, Inc	6600	CS	\$14.64	\$96,624.00	0.75-mil, 33 Gallons, 33" x 39", White, 15 Bags Per Roll, Case Of 10 Rolls	PITT PLASTICS	MT401XW
	Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	6600	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW
	Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	6600	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	WSL3339XHW

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

3	38" x 58" .80 MIL or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 4 Rolls per case. Net Lbs 11.3							
Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #	
Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	4800	CS	\$9.49	\$45,552.00	Duraplus 3858LW425 100/cs	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises	4800	CS	\$9.96	\$47,808.00	38" x 58" .80 MIL or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 4 Rolls per case. Net Lbs 11.3 Quoting Pinnacle #L3858.8W as an equal product Minimum order for Pinnacle Plastics is 256 cases mixed products each shipment (Items 1, 2 and 3) Pallets are 64 cases each for each product. Please order by even pallet count.	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
AWARD	Unipak Corp.	4800	CS	\$9.97	\$47,856.00	MFG: UPC 3858 XHWAS PER USUAL; WE ARE CURRENT VENDOR.	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW
CC Distributors, Inc.	4800	CS	\$10.57	\$50,736.00	CAPITAL PLASTICS XW58CR	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	4800	CS	\$10.92	\$52,416.00	L3858.8W 38 X 58 0.80 mL WHITE 100/CS	CAPITAL	L3858.8W	
Ferguson Facilities Supply	4800	CS	\$11.41	\$54,768.00		Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] Interboro Packaging Corp.	4800	CS	\$11.48	\$55,104.00	Interplast INT-3858-X-Hvy Black; Manufactured in Texas; 150/CaseSamples are available upon request!	Interplast IBS/Capital/Glopak	Interplast INT-3858-X-Hvy Black	
Interboro Packaging Corp.	4800	CS	\$11.72	\$56,256.00	Interplast INT-3858-X-Hvy; Mfr: Interplast IBS/Capital/Glopak; Manufactured in Texas; 150/CaseSamples are available upon request!	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.	4800	CS	\$11.80	\$56,640.00	CENTRAL POLY #CP3858XHW	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS	4800	CS	\$11.99	\$57,552.00	38" X 58" WHITE HVY 60 G .80 MIL 100 PER CASE	CAPPLA	2472	
[ALT1] PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY)	4800	CS	\$12.59	\$60,432.00	38" x 58" .80 MIL or Equal. 25 Bags per Roll / 4 Rolls per case. Net Lbs 11.75	NAPCO	CUSTRST3858W	
Gulf Coast Paper	4800	CS	\$13.18	\$63,264.00		Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
Vizocom	4800	CS	\$13.53	\$64,944.00	see attached for specification	Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
[ALT1] Gateway Printing	4800	CS	\$14.72	\$70,656.00	#GWP-C38588HDW / 38X58, .80MIL, 4/25, White	Napco	GWP-C38588HDW	
[ALT1] All American Poly	4800	CS	\$14.82	\$71,136.00	38" x 58" Liners, Color: White, Gauge/Thickness: 1.0 mil, Flat Packed, 100/case, Case Weight 14.7 lbs	All American Poly	3858XH-AAP	
[ALT1] Office Depot, Inc	4800	CS	\$18.87	\$90,576.00	0.85-mils, 60 Gallons, 38" x 58", White, 10 Bags Per Roll, Case Of 10 Rolls	PITT PLASTICS	MT602XW	
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	4800	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	4800	CS	No Bid			Interplast Group	WSL3858XHW	

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

Att #	Attribute Name	Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises	All American Poly	CC Distributors, Inc.	CENTRAL POLY- BAG CORP.	Ferguson Facilities Supply	Gateway Printing	Gulf Coast Paper
93	Business/Company Owner Name	Advanced Blending, Inc. (DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises) is an S corporation; Laurie Walkenhorst/President; James Plog/COO	All American Poly	N/A	ANDREW SERHOFER	Ferguson Facilities Supply	Lin Miller	GULF COAST PAPER COMPANY
94	Date of Establishment	August 23, 1989	10/7/1976	1906	JUNE 23, 1993	1957	1965	08/24/1965
95	Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications?	No	No	No	No	No	Yes	No
96	If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please specify deviations:	No Deviations; Products quoted are equal to specifications listed on each product quoted	N/A	n/a	N/A	Bid EXACTLY to specification	In the event of a manufacture price incese on any item quoted, Gateway will raise the price of item as per increase. Gateway will provide a letter to confirm this.	NO DEVIATION

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

Att #	Attribute Name	Interboro Packaging Corp.	Office Depot, Inc	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY)	Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	Unipak Corp.	US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS	Vizocom
93	Business/Company Owner Name	Edith Jeremias	Wayne Lajoie	KENNETH D MILLER	Johnny Hunte	Brian Marcus	JEFF ALLOWAY	George Attar
94	Date of Establishment	8/31/1982	1986	1932	2004	Nov. 29, 1996	12/2018	24 may 2010
95	Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications?	No	Yes	No	No	Yes	No	Yes
96	If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please specify deviations:	No Deviation	The pricing and other terms and conditions of the Omnia Partners Region 4 ESC programs – Office Supplies – Contract Number R190303 & School Supplies – Contract Number R190502 shall take precedence over any other terms and conditions if Office Depot is selected.	NA	No Deviation	Same Proposal: Different Brand	NO DEVIATION	KAV imports

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

Att #	Attribute Name	Western BRW - Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC
93	Business/Company Owner Name	Western BRW Bosworth dba OVOL USA	Jorge E. Garza
94	Date of Establishment	1957	3/21/2012
95	Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications?	Yes	No
96	If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please specify deviations:	Due to the volatility of the market, we reserve the right to adjust pricing as the market changes. In the event of a price increase, a 30 day notice of increase will be provided along with supporting manufacturer increase letter.	No deviation

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

Responding Supplier	Signature Full Name	Signature Email	Supplier Notes
Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAsT Group Enterprises	Marguerite Ann Burton	marguerite.b@advancedblending.com	
All American Poly	Zeke Rosenwasser	zeke@allampoly.com	
CC Distributors, Inc.	David Berlanga	dberlanga@ccdistributors.com	
CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.	ANDREW SERHOFER	BIDS@CENTRALPOLY.COM	DELIVERY WITHIN 30 DAYS ARO. REFERENCE #: 175141
Ferguson Facilities Supply	Michael Boehnke	michael.boehnke@ferguson.com	Prices submitted are for delivery to a single-point destination. However, some manufacturers are telling us that prices could actually go down for liners by spring of this year. We intend on passing those savings along to PSJA ISD if they become available. We also believe that PSJA ISD could significantly reduce its expenses by going to a campus-delivery model. In this way, PSJA reduces its delivery expenses and labor, but also reduces its usage on custodial products. When a purchasing/custodial department has the ability to audit usage by campus, usage always is reduced. Once we deliver to a campus, that data is stored and can be analyzed by custodial supervisors or purchasing staff to identify over-usage. We can find theft, address honest over-use with custodial training, and help eliminate hoarding by custodial staff that happens all too often. We can offer next day delivery to your schools for 5% more than bid pricing on orders that total \$300 or more. Or, we can offer next-day delivery without a minimum for bid pricing plus 8%. Please review the attachments provided, and contact Michael Boehnke with any questions that you may have. We see total spend by districts reduced all the time when consistent deliveries are made by campus and information is able to be audited by custodial/purchasing staff by campus.
Gateway Printing	Chris Diaz	cdiaz@gatewayp.com	**a minimum of 250 cases mixed must be met per order to qualify for free freight**
Gulf Coast Paper	JESSICA CAVAZOS	JESSICA.CAVAZOS@IMPERIALDADE.COM	
Interboro Packaging Corp.	Toby Einhorn	Abraham@interboropackaging.com	Samples are available upon request!
Office Depot, Inc	Wayne Lajoie	wayne.lajoie@officedepot.com	The pricing and other terms and conditions of the Omnia Partners Region 4 ESC programs – Office Supplies – Contract Number R190303 & School Supplies – Contract Number R190502 shall take precedence over any other terms and conditions if Office Depot is selected.
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY)	KENNETH D MILLER	biddept@pyramidsp.com	
Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	Layla Berlanga	layla.b@safewaysupply.com	
Unipak Corp.	Brian Marcus	customer care@unipakcorp.net	
US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS	Jeff Alloway	uswpsanantonio@gmail.com	
Vizocom	George Attar	government@vizocom.us	
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	Richard Franco	rfranco@ovol.us	Due to the volatility of the market, we reserve the right to adjust pricing as the market changes. In the event of an increase, a 30 day notice of increase will be provided along with manufacturers letter of increase.
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	Carlos Manuel Franco Meza	pharr@yanitor.com	We are bidding only in item #1. We are offering the same item you requested. Manufacturer: Interplast Group. Manufacturer# EC242406N Color: Natural. Price is per case

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 06/22/2021

Participant Name	Response Date	Response Status	Contact	City	State	Invitation Type	Invitation Date	Owner/CEO
Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: Last Group Enterprises	01/14/2021	Submitted	Marguerite Burton	Forest Hill	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	James Plog, CEO
All American Poly	01/04/2021	Submitted		Piscataway	NJ	Automatic	12/08/2020	Jack Klein
CC Distributors, Inc.	01/13/2021	Submitted		Corpus Christi	TX			Andrew Grey
CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.	01/13/2021	Submitted	Andrew Serhofer	Linden	NJ	Automatic	12/08/2020	Andrew Serhofer
Ferguson Facilities Supply	01/14/2021	Submitted		San Anotnio	TX			Kevin Murphy
Gateway Printing	01/13/2021	Submitted	Chris Diaz	Edinburg	TX			Lin Miller
Gulf Coast Paper	01/12/2021	Submitted	Jessica Cavazos	Brownsville	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	Pete Petkoff
Interboro Packaging Corp.	12/23/2020	Submitted	Abraham Jeremias	Montgomery	NY			Edith Jeremias
Office Depot, Inc	01/14/2021	Submitted	Nadia Garza	Austin	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	Wayne Lajoie
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPAI	12/21/2020	Submitted	PATRICIA OLIVAS	TAMPA	FL	Automatic	12/08/2020	KENNETH D MILLER
Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)	01/04/2021	Submitted	Johnny Hunte	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	Johnny Hunte
Unipak Corp.	12/25/2020	Submitted	Brian Marcus	BROOKLYN	NY	Automatic	12/08/2020	Brian Marcus
US WHOLESALE PRODUCTS	01/13/2021	Submitted	Jeff Alloway	SAN ANTONIO	TX			JEFF ALLOWAY
Vizocom	01/07/2021	Submitted	George Attar	El Cajon,	CA			George Attar
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	01/13/2021	Submitted	Cindy Leander	Dallas	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	Joe Ryan
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	01/14/2021	Submitted	Carlos Manuel Franco	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	Jorge E. Garza
CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS		Unsubmitted	ELOY OLIVAREZ	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
PKJ INTERNATIONAL LLC		Unsubmitted	SIJO JOSE	STAFFORD	TX			
Ray's Business Products		Unsubmitted		Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
C.E.D. / Valmac Electric Supply	12/16/2020	No Bid	Ricardo Casarez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
LD Products, Inc.	01/04/2021	No Bid	Diana Athey	Long Beach	CA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	12/08/2020	No Bid	DAVID CASTILLO	PHARR	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY PRODUCTS (MIDWEST SHOP SU	12/08/2020	No Bid	ARLENE KENNEDY	SIOUX CITY	IA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
RDB Instrument Cleaning Solutions	12/29/2020	No Bid	Rodolfo B Barrera	Rio Grande City	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Rio Paper & Supply, LLC	01/14/2021	No Bid	Jesus A. Sanchez	Pharr	TX			
School Specialty, Inc.	12/21/2020	No Bid	Accounts Receivable	Greenville	WI			
South Texas Moulding dba Texas Wood Supply	12/29/2020	No Bid	Daniel Ortiz	DONNA	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Bindi	12/09/2020	No Bid	Dale Christiansen	Maryland Heights	MO	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Trinity3 Technology	12/08/2020	No Bid	Kendell Rickman	Saint Paul	MN	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Aasdel Corporation		Viewed	Sabbir Mahmud	Norcross	GA			
American Industrial Supplies & Tool Repair, Inc.		Viewed	Ruben Diaz	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ASLCO Line & Uniform Services		Viewed	Carlos Cancino	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Blink Marketing Inc		Viewed	Darlene Zwolinski	Cleveland	OH			
Bros Pressure Washing and Striping		Viewed	John Ramirez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
COMPETITIVE CHOICE INC.		Viewed	JULIA SUAN	Houston	TX			
gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)		Viewed	Juan Garcia	san juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Hillyard, Texas		Viewed	Mario Gonzales	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
kautsch lumber co inc		Viewed	kookii crerar	alamo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Legna International Trade		Viewed	Albeza Alanis	El Paso	TX			
Mercer Technologies Firm		Viewed	Garrett Mercer	Gary	IN			
Performance Safety Group I, LP		Viewed	Drew Allrich	St. Louis	MO	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Promo Solutions		Viewed		Frisco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Quill LLC		Viewed		Lincolnshire	IL			
Seekr Essentials (Seekr Global INC)		Viewed	Andoni Almeida	Austin	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Staples Inc (Staples Contract and Commercial LLC)		Viewed	Ronnie Valentin	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Tenzo McAllen, LLC.		Viewed	Christian Diaz	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
The PlanIT Room		Viewed	Cecilia Hernandez	El Paso	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
United Sales usa corp.		Viewed	Pinny Ziegler	brooklyn	NY			
2M Lighting RGV			Pete Ostrowski	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
365 Paving & Construction LLC			Gilberto Maldonado	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
9 TO 5 COMPUTER			RICHARD RAAB	Jacksonville Beac	FL	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ABC Custom Advertising (Marketing Concepts Unlimited)			Martha J Miller	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LMH, LLC)			Larry Helgeson	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Academic Specialties Texas (Haldeman Homme, Inc.)			Justin Perez	Minneapolis	MN	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Accredited Lock Suppy Co (Accredited Lock & Door Hardw				Secaucus	NJ	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Accu Aire Mechanical LLC			Monica M Harris	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.				Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
AHI Facility Services, Inc.			Luke Bruns	Dallas	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp			Celeste Cantu	Alamo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV			Javier Olmos	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
AITA CONSULTING SERVICES,INC			KEVIN KUMAR	NORTH BRUNSW	NJ	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Alamo Iron Works (Alamo Distribution, LLC)			Stacey B Sims	Alpharetta	GA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Alamo Iron Works (Valen Distribution)			Robert Garcia	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
AllState Supplies			Wendy Davis	Athens	GA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Allstates Coatings Company (LBS Enterprises, LLC)				Gladewater	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Alpha and Omega Cleaning Services,LLC			Ismael De Leon	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS				edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Alvarez Roofing LLC			Marco Alvarez	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
AM Utilities and Construction LLC			Roberto Morales	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Arga development				Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.			Vashti Maraj	Long Island City	NY	Automatic	12/08/2020	
AssetGenie, Inc. DBA AGiRepair and AGParts Education (Tina Covalesky	Greensburg	PA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Auto-Chlor Services, LLC				Jefferson	LA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
B2Z Engineering, LLC (Aisha Gonzalez)			Marisa Pompa	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Battery Systems Inc			Suzanne Cruz	Garden Grove	CA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Bell's Security Sales Inc			Rick Middleton	BLOOMFIELD	NJ	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Best Buy For Business (Best Buy Stores, L.P.)				Richfield	MN	Automatic	12/08/2020	

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.**

BizSupplies	rushelle wetzel	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Blue Sky Enterprises	Alonzo Acosta	La Blanca	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
BM Benchmark Construction, LLC		McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION, LLC	TONY RODRIGUEZ	San Juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Bocci Engineering	Simone Williams	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Bon Tool Co	Paul Bender	Gibsonia	PA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Boost Metal	Sully Villarreal	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
BOXX Modular (Nortex Modular Leasing & Construction C	Harold Weatherly	Fort Worth	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
BuckHorn Construction LLC	Chad Bishop	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Buffalo Construction LLC.	FRED GUERRA	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC)	Scott Vaughan	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Butler Business Products	Stacy Duke	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
C&H Distributors, LLC	William Rose	Chicago	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
C&V SUPPLY INC.	JESSIE RAYA	MISSION	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
CAPA Texas	junior ocampo	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Caprice Electronics, Inc.	Michael Kluger	Brooklyn	NY	Automatic	12/08/2020
Carrier Corporation	Carrier Corporation	Missouri	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Cascade School Supplies	Todd Shafer	North Adams	MA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Castcon Construction Co., LLC	Robert Castaneda, Jr.	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Catalyst PR INC	Holly Arbuckle	Conroe	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
CDW Government LLC	Mike Smith	Vernon Hills	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Celso Gonzalez Construction	Celso Gonzalez	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Center Stone Services		Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Central Plumbing & Electric Supply (CENCO, INC)		Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Champion Flooring LLC	Carol Werket	Pittsburg	KS	Automatic	12/08/2020
Chemical Response (Chemical Response & Remediation C	David A Hanawa	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Cintas Corporation #538	Roger Rodriguez	Mercedes	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Circle Saw Builders Supply, Inc	Juan R Ruiz	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Classic Images Photos and AWARDS (garcia)	Jesse Garcia	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Coast To Coast Computer Products, Inc.	Miranda Horowitz	Simi Valley	CA	Automatic	12/08/2020
COLLEGE THRIVER INC	shawntia lee	orlando	FL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, Inc.)	D'Ann Ivers	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Compostology LLC	Kash Nathan	Waco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
ConstructConnect		Cincinnati	OH	Automatic	12/08/2020
Construction Bid Source (Plan Room)		Felton	CA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Construction Journal LLC	Pamela Exton	Stuart	FL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Continental Flooring Company	Tracy Johnson	Scottsdale	AZ	Automatic	12/08/2020
Copy Graphics Inc.	David Valdez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Copy Plus LLC	Lorissa Pecina	MC ALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Company (UBEO LCC)	Baldomero Gonzalez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Costco Wholesale	Esmeralda Maldonado	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Coverbind Corporation		Wilmington	NC	Automatic	12/08/2020
Creative Imaging LLC	Norma Woodard	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Curbell Plastics, Inc.	Bill Heckert	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
D & R Commercial Glass LLC	Robert Gomez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Daikin Applied (Daikin Applied Americas Inc.)	Joanne Lawson	Chicago	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Dallas Lighthouse for the Blind/ Envision		Dallas	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Daybreak LED LLC	Rebecca McCarthy	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Dealers Electrical Supply Co.	Orlando Cruz	Waco, Texas	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Delegard Tool of Texas	Paul C. Nave	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Delta Specialties Supply (Martin Pena)	MARTIN PENA	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Deltek	Source Management	Herndon	VA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Demo Con, Inc.		La Feria	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.	Sandra Salinas	Palmhurst	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Diamond G Services, LLC	Carlos A. Garcia	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Diaz Floors & Interiors, Inc.	Andrew Diaz, Sr.	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Dixon Ticonderoga	Christie Mouton	Lake Mary	FL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Doggett Heavy Machinery Services	Andy Ramos	San Juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Dream Ranch Office Supplies (Dream Ranch LLC)		Krum	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
ECOEFFECT	Alejandro Alanis	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Econ Group, LLC	Gilbert Enriquez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Elite Disinfecting Services (Elite Oil Field and Constructio	Juan Suarez	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Elsa Auto & Truck Parts	Lupe Garza	Elsa	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Embroidery Express		Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Empire Paper Company	Bids	Wichita Falls	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Encino Construction	Fred	mcallen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
ESHA AV	Shrey Parikh	East Brunswick	NJ	Automatic	12/08/2020
Facility Solutions Group LLC	Doug Brown	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Fairway Supply, Inc.	Kathy Millican	Austin	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
fat cat signs llc	Liza Lemos	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Fedex Office and Print Services, Inc	Humberto Barberena	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
FERGUSON ENTERPRISES	JESUS CAMPOS	PHARR	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Fourtify Construction	Sam De la Garza	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Fragile Planet Wildlife Center	Tyler, C Thomas	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Francisco tenorio	Francisco Tenorio	San Juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Full Stop Equipment LLC	Elias Macias	La Joya	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Fully Promoted McAllen (Hema, Ltd. Co.)	Hector Leal	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
GALVAN BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	GALVAN BUILDERS CONS	CORPUS CHRISTI	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
General contractor/Construction (Davila Construction Inc	Tommy Canul	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
General Garage Door Service, INC.	Manuel chapa	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

Global Industrial (Global Equipment Company Inc.)	William Rose	Chicago	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Go UnderGround		harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Gonzalez Enterprises, LLC	Eli Gonzalez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Green World Technologies LLC	Eleazar Saenz	PHARR	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Greenwood Office Outfitters	Robert Rosalez	Fort Worth	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Groupo GTE, LLC	Gregg Taylor	Las Vegas	NV	Automatic	12/08/2020
GTL LIGHTING (CLAY BRANCH, INC.)	Michael Lee	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Hairnet Cornpany / Safeko products (HNC Enterprise)	Mendel Chein	brooklyn	NY	Automatic	12/08/2020
Harcourt Outlines, Inc. (Harcourt Industries, Inc.)	Andrew M Norris	Milroy	IN	Automatic	12/08/2020
hdc video and communications dba (Maria del Castillo LL	Maria del Castillo	mcallen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
HDL ENTERPRISES	HERIBERTO LOPEZ	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
High End Advertising	Mariano Nunez	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
High Point (Western BRW Paper Co., Inc)	Jane Lopez	Dallas	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Hi-LoContractor LLC	Edmundo Carreon	Elsa	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Holchemont, Ltd.	Annette Carmona	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Home Design Center (V&L ENTERPRISES, LLC)	Victor Cantu	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC	Keith F. Hunt	Laguna Vista	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	Roy Garrison III	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc	Donato Vera	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Ilusion invitaciones & boutique	CYNTHIA LEYVA	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Imagery Graphic Systems	Matt Tumelson	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Indoff, Inc. (Indoff, Incorporated)		Kansas City	MO	Automatic	12/08/2020
International Carpet One (Yeshua Inc)	Francisco Galvan	Brownsville	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
INTERNATIONAL ROADWAY RESEARCH (INTERNATIONAL	LINDA TRAHAN	HUMBLE	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
IT RECYCLING GROUP	Kay Ramon	GEORGETOWN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
JANGA Technology LLC	Andrea Anguiano	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
JCO "the door people"	Joe Perez	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
JGA ROOFING SYSTEMS, LLC		Waco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE PROTECTION	Heather Foster	ROUND ROCK	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Jolvaz LLC dba RIO-TECH	Connie Garza	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
JR RAMON & SONS INC (JR(Joe)Ramon & Sons, Inc)	Joe R Ramon III	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Justin Seed Co.		Justin	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
K12Marketplace LLC	Dalton Williams	Ozark	MO	Automatic	12/08/2020
K12Savings (Textbook Brokers inc)	Dylan Silkey	Sparta	MO	Automatic	12/08/2020
Kimball Midwest (Midwest Motor Supply Company)	Katelyn Pankuch	Columbus	OH	Automatic	12/08/2020
Klein Design Inc		Henry	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
L & M Food Service Inc.	Stacie Wilburn	Henderson	NV	Automatic	12/08/2020
Lamac (Trey Gonzalez)	TREY GONZALEZ	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
LARRY WUNSCH AND ASSOCIATES	JOHN FREEMAN	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Lawson Products Inc		Chicago	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Leija Welding		Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Lewis Electric Motors, Inc.	Enrique Mendez	HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Lexine Inc	Frank Martinez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Limitless Office Products	Mita Guha	RICHARDSON	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Liquid Environmental Solutions	Lina Ramirez	Irving	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Little Giants Learning Center		Alamo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Lowe's Of Pharr (lowe's home center. llc)		Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Lumatec Lighting Service	Victor T Rios	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
LUNA GLASS LLC	JOSE LUNA	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Mark Andy, Inc. dba Mark Andy Print Products	Donna Alesch-Woodin	Des Plaines	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
MARK HOSKINS ENTERPRISES LLC	Mark Hoskins	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
MARKS PLUMBING PARTS (JOHN W. GASPARINI, INC)	LEE HICKEY	FORT WORTH	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation)	Mike Zappia	Stow	OH	Automatic	12/08/2020
MB Services LLC	George Selvera	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
McCoy's Building Supply (McCoy Corporation)	Tina McArthur	San Marcos	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
McLemore Building Maintenance, Inc.	Dave Prewitt	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
MEGA RACKS LLC (GERARDO DAVALOS)	GERARDO DAVALOS	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
MH ENTERPRISES (MH ENTERPRISES 888)	Miyoung Hong	McKinney	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Modern Imaging Solutions	Ana Belleza	CANOGA PARK	CA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Morning Star Industries Inc	Brittney Bonawitz	Jensen Beach	FL	Automatic	12/08/2020
mo-vac Environmental inc	arnoldo perez jr	mcallen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Nasco Education LLC (Nasco)		Fort Atkinson	WI	Automatic	12/08/2020
National Art & School Supplies Inc.		Rahway	NJ	Automatic	12/08/2020
National Chemical Laboratories LLC	Tom Leshner	Philadelphia	PA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Nightlock RGV Distributor LLC.	Michael Perez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Noble Texas Builders		La Feria	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC	Lucia Valdez	HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Ontiveros Floor Covering LLC	Gregory Ontiveros	Alamo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
OVERHEAD DOOR OF SOUTH TEXAS	KARLA ARREOLA	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Paragon Furniture, Inc.	Cathy M. Thomas	Arlington	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Peerless Marketing Group	Brenda Blair	Dallas	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Performing Arts Supply Co.	Stacey Ambrose	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Petrogas Group of McAllen, LLC		McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Petroleum Solutions inc.	Ed Bleibdrey	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
PicoMan Photography	Rick Rodriguez	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Pinturas & Lacas (PPG Paints)	Rudy Garza	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Platinum Fleet Wash (Angela Salinas)	Angela Salinas	Alamo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
PLUMBMASTER INC	RICHARD PLACE	ATLANTA	GA	Automatic	12/08/2020
PortionPac Chemical Corporation		Chicago	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc	Ernie Garcia	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.**

PRECISION SAW & TOOL, INC	EDDIE HOMAN	CONVERSE	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
PREMIER & COMPANIES	Henry Melendez	NEW YORK	NY	Automatic	12/08/2020
Prevention & Treatment Resource Press and Fire Safety		Mandeville	LA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Pro Tech Mechanical, Inc.	Jeremy Fojtik	Corpus Christi	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
ProActive Roof Systems and Construction, LLC	David Gordon	Las Cruces	NM	Automatic	12/08/2020
PROFESSIONAL POLISH, INC.	VANESA GONZALEZ	FORT WORTH	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Pro-Tech Exterminating (Raul Martinez)	Raul Martinez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
PTI Sports & Recreation Construction	Joanis Riebl	Goodrich	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
R REYES TRUCKING & TRACTOR SERVICES	JOHANA REYES	SAN BENITO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RB Doors & Hardware Inc	Ruby Melgoza	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RCA Building Materials Inc.	Gustavo Rea	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
REBECEK ENTERPRISES LLC.	RAYMOND J. REBECEK	ROBSTOWN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RecovaPro, LLC	Jordan Quiroz	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
REFCO (R E Friedrichs Company)	Vicki Delgado	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Region 1 Repair, LLC	John E Yeupell	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Rex Widle Plbg		San Juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RGV Glass Inc		Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RGV GUARDIAN ENTERPRISES LLC DBA DERTY SPORTS (D	Rick Romo	PHARR	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Rio Air, LLC	Antonio Lerma	pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Rio Grande CAS		McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Rio Grande Plumbing Supply inc		MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Rio Grande Steel LTD	Gene Espinoza	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Rio Grande Valley Chapter Associated General Contracto	Perry A. Vaughn	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RISICA & SONS, INC.	RON RISICA	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RIVER CITY ENVIRONMENTAL LLC.		SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus Ramirez)	Jesus Ramirez	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Romo Contractors, LLC	Romo Contractors LLC	Laredo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
royal media network inc.	irene diaz	WINDSOR MIL	MD	Automatic	12/08/2020
rudys upholstery		pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Samsclub 8250	Carlos Garcia	mcallen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
San Juan Bolt & Supply		san juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Sanchez Building Supplies, Inc.	Juan Sanchez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Sanitech	Belinda Wolovich	Lakeland	FL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Santre USA LLC	Flavio Garduno	Hidalgo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Schaeffer Manufacturing Co.	Customer Service/ Sales F	St. Louis	MO	Automatic	12/08/2020
School Outfitters		Cincinnati	OH	Automatic	12/08/2020
SCOTT ELECTRIC	MARK TROUTMAN	GREENSBURG	PA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Second Chance Treasures		McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA GROUP, INC)		SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Sherwin Williams	karissa Carrizales	Mcallen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
SHI international		Austin	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Six Shooter Softwawsh (Sixto Garza Jr Enterprizes LLC)	Sixto Garza	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc.	Julia Stewart	Marietta	GA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Southern Science SUppl (Southern Science Supply, LLC)	Carol Espensen	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Southern Stone, LLC.	Sylvia Webber	Donna	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
SpareIT LLC	Ed Pierce	Rochester	NY	Automatic	12/08/2020
Spiral Binding LLC (Sturchio)	Chip Sturchio	Austin	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Stand Up Stations (Toss Up Events LLC)	Alex Carroll	Irving	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC	David Wilson	Wheeling	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020
STC&FCo	David Enriquez	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Summit Building & Design (AOC Calton, Ltd., dba Summit	David Acevedo	Laredo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
TanChes Global Management Inc	Tanaz Choudhury	Sugar Land	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
TCI Roofing & Construction	Arturo Escobedo	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
TDIndustries, Inc.	Lorraine Vuong	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC)	JOSH BOX	BIRMINGHAM	AL	Automatic	12/08/2020
Texas Political Subdivisions		Dallas	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Texas State Environmental Cosnulting, LLC	Jose S Juarez	Austin	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
The Lincoln Electric Company		Euclid	OH	Automatic	12/08/2020
the valley windshields llc	ricardo rojas	PHARR	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Tint-On-Wheels (David Padilla)	David Padilla	Mcallen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Trane Company	Joe Rivera	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Turbo Images	Steve Payne	Saint-Georges,	QC	Automatic	12/08/2020
Twin City Hardware, Inc. (TCH Southwest, Tri-City Hardw:	Joe Gandara	Oakdale	MN	Automatic	12/08/2020
Twin Construction (Noel Cavazos)	Noe Cavazos	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Unifirst Holdings	Jose Alvarado	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
UNITED CHEMISTRY	Iram Lopez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Univar Solutions	Joey Alvarez	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
V Prints	Antonio or Marisol Villalo	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Valley Striping Corp		Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Valley Trimming Tree Experts	Jose Snell	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
ValTex (Figuroa & Sons, Inc.)	Felipe Lopez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
VCI Builders, Inc.	Joe Arredondo	MISSION	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Vertex Marketing	Dr. Sue Bayer	Stafford	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Virtual Builders Exchange	Jeannette Olguin	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Visceral Illumination Code LLC (VISCERAL ILLUMINATION	VISCERAL ILLUMINATION	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Walmart Inc		Bentonville	AR	Automatic	12/08/2020
WasteZero Inc.	Ian Noble	RALEIGH	ND	Automatic	12/08/2020
Whitmeyers Distillery Co., LLC		Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CARLOS ISASI)	JUAN CARLOS ISASI	PHARR	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Wittek Golf Supply Co., Inc	Tony Clay	elk grove village	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TRASH CAN LINERS FOR USE DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 20-21-033
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 3:30 P.M.

www.gs-jj.com (EnamelPins Inc.)
Ygriega Environmental Services LLC
Zitro Electric
Zones,LLC

Elaine Qi	Walnut	CA	Automatic	12/08/2020
Arnold A. Maldonado	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Mike Pena	Palmview	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Steve Morberg	Auburn	WA	Automatic	12/08/2020