PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL BID # 20-21-034
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Event Number # 20-21-034 Addendum 1 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Event Title Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type Bid Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Issue Date 12/8/2020 10:28:33 AM (CT) Phone

Close Date 1/14/2021 04:00:00 PM (CT) Fax

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education award the Gasoline and Diesel Fuel Bid # 20-21-034

to the lowest bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

|Responding Supplier City State Lines Awarded Award Total
Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd  Laredo X 2 $702,030.00
Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing Efren Araiza, Operations Logistics Coordinator

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 199-131301

Fifty eight (58) invitations were emailed to vendors
Eleven (11) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications
Three (3) Submitted Bid

One (1) Unsubmitted Bid

Three (3) No Bid
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.

GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL BID # 20-21-034
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Award Award
Line Qty UOM Description Response | Quantity Awarded Supplier Award Reason
1 93000 Gal  Regular Unleaded Gasoline/Min 89 Octane/Mid GradeFG X $1.51 93000 Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd  LOW BID
API- Edinburg Depot
2 351000 Gal  Ultra Low Sulphur Diesel/15 PPM or less- Edinburg Depot $1.60 351000 Arguindegui Oil Co. Il, Ltd  LOW BID
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL BID # 20-21-034
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

| 1 |Regu|ar Unleaded Gasoline/Min 89 Octane/Mid GradeFG X API- Edinburg Depot Margin of Profit- | Margin of Profit -
Harlingen Depot | Corpus Christi Depot
Supplier Qry uom Price Extended Supplier Notes
AWARD Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd 93,000 Gal $1.51 $140,430.00 0.0025
OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY, INC 93,000 Gal $1.52 $141,360.00 0.01
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc 93,000 Gal $1.57 $146,010.00 SPLIT FEE CHARGE = $50 IN THE EVENT A SINGLE FUEL 0.09 0.19

ORDER IS SPLIT BETWEEN 2 SEPARATE SITES

[ 1.1 [oPIS - MIDGRADE - UBD Rack Avg.

Supplier Qry uom Price Extended Supplier Notes
Arguindegui Oil Co. Il, Ltd 1 EA $1.51 $1.51
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc 1 EA $1.51 $1.51
OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY, INC 1 EA $1.51 $1.51

| 1.2 |Margin of Profit

Supplier Qry uom Price Extended Supplier Notes
Arguindegui Oil Co. I, Ltd 1 EA $0.00 $0.00
OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY, INC 1 EA $0.01 $0.01
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc 1 EA $0.06 $0.06
| 2 |Ultra Low Sulphur Diesel/15 PPM or less- Edinburg Depot Margin of Profit- | Margin of Profit -
Harlingen Depot | Corpus Christi Depot

Supplier Qry uom Price Extended Supplier Notes

AWARD  Arguindegui Oil Co. Il, Ltd 351,000 Gal $1.60 $561,600.00 0.0025
OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY, INC 351,000 Gal $1.61 $565,110.00 0.009
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc 351,000 Gal $1.66 $582,660.00 SPLIT FEE CHARGE = $50 IN THE EVENT A SINGLE FUEL 0.09 0.19

ORDER IS SPLIT BETWEEN 2 SEPARATE SITES

[ 2.1 [oPIS - MIDGRADE - ULSD - UBD Rack Avg.

Supplier Qry uom Price Extended Supplier Notes

Gold Star Petroleum, Inc 1 EA $1.60 $1.60

Arguindegui Oil Co. Il, Ltd 1 EA $1.60 $1.60

OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY, INC 1 EA $1.60 $1.60 this price is for ULSD and not for midgrade.

| 2.2 |Margin of Profit

Supplier Qry uom Price Extended Supplier Notes

Arguindegui Oil Co. Il, Ltd 1 EA $0.00 $0.00

OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY, INC 1 EA $o_01 $o_01 PLEASE NOTE...Petroleum delivery fee of $5.45 will be
added to all invoices.

Gold Star Petroleum, Inc 1 EA $0.06 $0.06

**OPIS pricing will fluctuate throughout the year.
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL BID # 20-21-034
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Att# Attribute Name Arguindegui Oil Co. II, Ltd Gold Star Petroleum, Inc OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY,
INC
93 Business/Company Owner Name Alfonso Arguindegui GOLD STAR PETROLEUM INC/ JJ Qil Patch Fuel and Supply, Inc
RODRIGUEZ, PRESIDENT
94 Date of Establishment 1942 10/01/1981 1985
95 Wil the bid/proposal deviate from No No No
specifications?
96 If no please state "No deviation", if yes, N/A NO DEVIATIONS NO DEVIATION
please specify deviations:
1.1 Margin of Profit - Harlingen Depot 0.0025 0.09 0.01
1.2 Margin of Profit - Corpus Christi Depot 0.19
2.1 Margin of Profit - Harlingen Depot 0.0025 0.09 0.009
2.2 Margin of Profit - Corpus Christi Depot 0.19
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.S.D.
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL BID # 20-21-034
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes
Arguindegui Oil Co. Il, Ltd Jose H Lopez beto.lopez@argpetro.com
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc JJ RODRIGUEZ, PRESIDENT GOLDSTARPETRO@COMCAST.NET GOLD STAR PETROLEUM HAS PROUDLY SERVED THE RIO GRANDE

VALLEY AREA SINCE 1981. OUR SAN JUAN BULK TERMINAL WILL BE
READY TO SERVE PSJA ISD. THANK YOU FOR THE OPPORTUNITY!

OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY, INC Gloria Grez gloria@oilpatchfuelandsupply.com
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Participation Summary - As of 04/16/2021

Participant Name

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO 1.5.D.

GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL BID # 20-21-034
BID OPENING: JANUARY 14, 2021 @ 4:00 P.M.

Response Date Response Status

Contact

Arguindegui Oil Co. Il, Ltd 01/13/2021
Gold Star Petroleum, Inc 01/14/2021
OIL PATCH FUEL AND SUPPLY, INC 01/05/2021

Colonial Oil Industries, Inc.

GONZALEZ AUTO PARTS (Laredo Gonzalez 12/09/2020
Petroleum Traders Corporation 01/14/2021
South Texas Moulding dba Texas Wood Suj 12/29/2020
Aliron International Inc

gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)
Indigo Energy Partners, LLC

johnstone supply

Magneto & Diesel Injector Service, Inc. (M
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc.
SC Fuels (Southern Counties Oil Co.)

The Habits Group, LLC

United Sales usa corp.

wilglass lic

World Energy Downstream LLC

Accu Aire Mechanical LLC

AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV

Alamo Iron Works (Vallen Distribution)

All American Poly

ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS

Applied Industrial Technologies

BOXX Modular (Nortex Modular Leasing &
BuckHorn Construction LLC

Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC
C&H Distributors, LLC

Catalyst PR INC

Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greer
Construction Journal LLC

Dannenbaum Engineering Co

Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.

Dixie Flag and Banner Company

DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS
Elsa Auto & Truck Parts

Encino Construction

G&G Contractors (RG Enterprises, LLC)
Global Industrial (Global Equipment Comp:
GRANDE VALLEY BUILDERS,INC
Hi-LoContractor LLC

Huntington Sky Production DBA FASTSIGN!
IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc

Kolkhorst Petroleum Company

Leija Welding

Little Giants Learning Center

Lykins Energy Solutions

Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation)
MB Services LLC

Morning Star Industries Inc

OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC

Petroleum Solutions inc.

PRECISION SAW & TOOL, INC

R REYES TRUCKING & TRACTOR SERVICES
RCA Building Materials Inc.

RGV GUARDIAN ENTERPRISES LLC DBA DEf
Romo Contractors, LLC

royal media network inc.

Schaeffer Manufacturing Co.

The Lincoln Electric Company

The PlanIT Room

Vertex Marketing

VF Corporation

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Unsubmitted
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed

Beto Lopez

JJ Rodriguez
gloria grez
Adam Barnett
Joe Gage Jr.

Daniel Ortiz
Manisha Fnu
Juan Garcia

willie gonzalez
Carlos Briones
MOC Bid Team
Marisa Charette
Raynor McKinnon
Pinny Ziegler

Bill Glass

Julie Tittle
Monica M Harris
Javier Olmos
Robert Garcia

Harold Weatherly
Chad Bishop
Scott Vaughan
William Rose
Holly Arbuckle
D'Ann Ivers
Pamela Exton
Mirna Santana
Sandra Salinas

Isabella Van de Putte

MICHAEL GUZMAN
Lupe Garza
Fred

William Rose
MANUEL PEREZ
Edmundo Carreon
Jessica Reyes
Donato Vera
Oscar Esquivel

Shane Deeds
Mike Zappia
George Selvera
Brittny Bonawitz
Lucia Valdez

Ed Bleibdrey
EDDIE HOMAN
JOHANA REYES
Gustavo Rea
Rick Romo

City

Laredo
SPRING
Pharr
Savannah
LAREDO
Fort Wayne
DONNA
South Plainfield
san juan
Gainesville
pharr
LAREDO
Gainesville
Orange
Austin
brooklyn
Smithville
Boston

SAN ANTONIO
McAllen
Pharr
Piscataway
edinburg
Pharr

Fort Worth
Harlingen
Weslaco
Chicago
Conroe

San Antonio
Stuart
McAllen
Palmhurst
SAN ANTONIO
PHARR

Elsa
mcallen
Edinb
Chicago
MCALLEN
Elsa
McAllen
Pharr
Harlingen
Pharr
Alamo
Milford
Stow

Pharr
Jensen Beach
HARLINGEN
Edinburg
CONVERSE
SAN BENITO
Pharr
PHARR

Romo Contractors LL( Laredo

irene diaz

WINDSOR MIL

Customer Service/ Sa St. Louis

Cecilia Hernandez
Dr. Sue Bayer
Mark Lewis
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Euclid

El Paso
Stafford
Nashville

State
X
X
X
GA
X
IN
X
NJ
X
GA
X
X
GA
CA
X
NY
X
MA
X
X
X
NJ
X
X
X
X
X
IL
X
X
FL
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
IL
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
OH
OH
X
FL
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
MD
MO
OH
X
X
TN
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Invitation Type Invitation Date
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Manual 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Manual 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Manual 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020
Automatic 12/08/2020

Owner
Alfonso Arguindegui

JJ Rodriguez, President

Carl "Joe" Gayman



