

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

Event Number # 20-21-027
Event Title Chain Link Fencing Materials, Equipment and Supplies
Event Description
Event Type Bid
Issue Date 12/8/2020 10:26:33 AM (CT)
Close Date 1/13/2021 03:00:00 PM (CT)

Organization PSJA ISD Ebids
Workgroup Purchasing
Event Owner Emily Garza
Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Phone
Fax

RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Education approve the Chain Link Fencing Materials, Equipment and Supplies Bid # 20-21-027 to the lowest bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name	City	State	Classifications	Lines Awarded	Award Total	Award Reason
Central Fence & Supply	Pharr	TX		22	\$35,122.50	
Construction Rent-A-Fence	Taylor	TX		4	\$60,690.00	
Hurricane Fence Co	Harlingen	TX		6	\$4,591.65	
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	PHARR	TX		4	\$3,065.50	
TOTAL:					\$103,469.65	

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Efren Araiza, Operations Logistics Coordinator

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 199-131301

One Hundred Seventeen (117) invitations were emailed to vendors
Six (6) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications
Four (4) Submitted Bid
Zero (0) Unsubmitted Bid
Two (2) No Bid

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

Line	Qty	UOM	Description	Award Response	Award Quantity	Awarded Supplier	Award Reason
1	400	EA	Top rail 1 5/8" SS20 21ft. Long (8,400 linear ft.).	\$24.18	400	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
2	600	EA	Line post 8 ft. high 2" diameter SS20 6 ft. fence	\$11.05	600	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
3	200	EA	Line post 6 ft. high 2" diameter SS20 4 ft. fence.	\$9.07	200	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
4	200	EA	Terminal Post 10 ft. 2 3/8" SS20	\$18.36	200	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
5	200	EA	Terminal Post 8 ft. 2 3/8" SS20	\$14.72	200	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
6	30	EA	50 ft. rolls fabric 4 ft. high 9 guage G.A.W.	\$125.00	30	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
7	300	EA	50 ft. rolls fabric 6 ft. high 9 guage G.A.W.	\$189.00	300	Construction Rent-A-Fence	TIE AWARDED*
8	150	EA	Tension bars 4 ft. high	\$1.54	150	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
9	500	EA	Tension bars 6 ft. high	\$2.44	500	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
10	500	EA	Tension bands 2 3/8"	\$0.42	500	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
11	500	EA	Tension bands 1 5/8"	\$0.39	500	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
12	600	EA	Steel loop cap 2" x 1 5/8"	\$0.88	600	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
13 Alt 1	300	EA	Corn caps 2 3/8" Steel	\$0.82	300	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID JUSTIFIED
14 Alt 1	200	EA	Corn cap 1 5/8" Steel	\$0.77	200	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID JUSTIFIED
15	500	EA	Rail end caps 2 3/8"	\$1.49	500	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	LOW BID JUSTIFIED
16	300	EA	Single wheel 1 5/8"	\$9.63	300	Hurricane Fence Co	LOW BID JUSTIFIED
17	5	EA	Barb wire 12 guage 4 points (1,200 ft/roll)	\$84.93	5	Hurricane Fence Co	LOW BID
18	100	EA	Barb wire arm 2" diameter	\$3.06	100	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
19	200	EA	Tie wire 9" (150 per package)	\$5.99	200	Construction Rent-A-Fence	TIE AWARDED*
20	200	EA	Brace Bands 1 5/8"	\$0.42	200	Hurricane Fence Co	LOW BID
21	300	EA	Galvanized Box hinges 2 3/8" x 1 5/8"	\$4.99	300	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	LOW BID
22	75	EA	Galvanized Rear track roller with pipe bracket and bolt	\$8.99	75	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	LOW BID
23	200	EA	Base Plates 6"x6" Galvanized	\$3.97	200	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
24	200	EA	Loop caps Steel 2 3/8 x 1 5/8"	\$1.05	200	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
25	50	EA	Top rail 1 3/8" x 21'	\$15.00	50	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
26	50	EA	Drop rod fork 1 3/8" x 1 5/8"	\$3.15	50	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
27	75	EA	Drop rod guide 1 3/8" x 1 5/8"	\$1.99	75	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	LOW BID
28	100	EA	Carridge bolt and nut 5/16"x 1 1/4" Gal. sets of 100/box	\$8.00	100	Hurricane Fence Co	LOW BID
29	100	EA	Terminal post 6' x 2 3/8" SS20	\$11.83	100	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
30	100	EA	Fork 3" x 1 5/8"	\$1.69	100	Hurricane Fence Co	LOW BID
31	100	EA	Collar 3" x 1 5/8"	\$1.43	100	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
32	500	EA	Brace bands 2 3/8"	\$0.45	500	Hurricane Fence Co	LOW BID
33 Alt 1	300	EA	Rail ends 1 5/8" Steel	\$0.75	300	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID JUSTIFIED
34	100	EA	Sleeve 1 5/8"	\$0.88	100	Central Fence & Supply	LOW BID
35	20	EA	Tension wire 12 gauge"	\$99.00	20	Construction Rent-A-Fence	TIE AWARDED*
36	50	EA	7" Press steel wheel	\$16.24	50	Construction Rent-A-Fence	LOW BID

JUSTIFICATION

- 13 Central Fence & Supply provided pricing for aluminum and steel. Alt 1 pricing is for commercial steel product that the District uses.
- 14 Central Fence & Supply provided pricing for aluminum and steel. Alt 1 pricing is for commercial steel product that the District uses.
- 15 Hurricane Fence Co. does not carry requested items and Central Fence & Supply materials do not meet specifications.
- 16 Matt's Building Materials made a typographical error in pricing.
- 33 Central Fence & Supply provided pricing for aluminum and steel. Alt 1 pricing is for commercial steel product that the District uses.

*Pursuant to Texas Local Government – Code Chapter 271 (Purchasing and Contracting Authority of Municipalities, counties and Certain Local Government) Sub - Chapter (A)(B)(C)(D)(E)(F)(G)(H) (I)(J)(K)(L)(M)(N)(O)(P)(Q)(R)(S)(T)(U)(V)(W)(X)(Y)(Z) Miscellaneous Provisions (a)(b)(c)(d)(e) "The municipality or district must select from the identical bids by the casting of lots. A coin-toss was executed by Finance Department Staff according to established procedures.

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
 BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

1 Top rail 1 5/8" SS20 21ft. Long (8,400 linear ft.).								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	400	EA	\$24.18	\$9,672.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	400	EA	\$27.93	\$11,172.00	PER RAIL		
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	400	EA	\$29.91	\$11,964.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	400	EA	\$33.99	\$13,596.00			
2 Line post 8 ft. high 2" diameter SS20 6 ft. fence								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	600	EA	\$11.05	\$6,630.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	600	EA	\$12.53	\$7,518.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	600	EA	\$12.91	\$7,746.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	600	EA	\$17.49	\$10,494.00			
3 Line post 6 ft. high 2" diameter SS20 4 ft. fence.								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$9.07	\$1,814.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	200	EA	\$9.40	\$1,880.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	200	EA	\$9.68	\$1,936.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	200	EA	\$13.99	\$2,798.00			
4 Terminal Post 10 ft. 2 3/8" SS20								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$18.36	\$3,672.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	200	EA	\$20.88	\$4,176.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	200	EA	\$21.45	\$4,290.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	200	EA	\$24.49	\$4,898.00			
5 Terminal Post 8 ft. 2 3/8" SS20								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$14.72	\$2,944.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	200	EA	\$16.71	\$3,342.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	200	EA	\$17.16	\$3,432.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	200	EA	\$19.49	\$3,898.00			
6 50 ft. rolls fabric 4 ft. high 9 guage G.A.W.								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	30	EA	\$125.00	\$3,750.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	30	EA	\$126.00	\$3,780.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	30	EA	\$137.00	\$4,110.00	PER ROLL		
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	30	EA	\$149.99	\$4,499.70			
7 50 ft. rolls fabric 6 ft. high 9 guage G.A.W.								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
	Central Fence & Supply	300	EA	\$189.00	\$56,700.00			
AWARD	Construction Rent-A-Fence	300	EA	\$189.00	\$56,700.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	300	EA	\$206.50	\$61,950.00	PER ROLL		
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	300	EA	\$229.99	\$68,997.00			
8 Tension bars 4 ft. high								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	150	EA	\$1.54	\$231.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	150	EA	\$1.92	\$288.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	150	EA	\$2.39	\$358.50			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	150	EA	\$2.55	\$382.50			
9 Tension bars 6 ft. high								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	500	EA	\$2.44	\$1,220.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	500	EA	\$2.76	\$1,380.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	500	EA	\$2.99	\$1,495.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	500	EA	\$3.51	\$1,755.00			
10 Tension bands 2 3/8"								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	500	EA	\$0.42	\$210.00	Bolts included		
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	500	EA	\$0.53	\$265.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	500	EA	\$0.59	\$295.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	500	EA	\$1.99	\$995.00			

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
 BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

11 Tension bands 1 5/8"								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	500	EA	\$0.39	\$195.00	Bolts included		
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	500	EA	\$0.43	\$215.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	500	EA	\$0.53	\$265.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	500	EA	\$1.19	\$595.00			

12 Steel loop cap 2" x 1 5/8"								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	600	EA	\$0.88	\$528.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	600	EA	\$1.89	\$1,134.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	600	EA	\$1.99	\$1,194.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	600	EA	\$2.94	\$1,764.00			

13 Corn cap 2 3/8"								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
	Central Fence & Supply	300	EA	\$0.77	\$231.00	No specification for Aluminum or steel giver		
AWARD	[ALT1] Central Fence & Supply	300	EA	\$0.82	\$246.00	Acorn caps 2 3/8" Steel		
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	300	EA	\$1.75	\$525.00			
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	300	EA	\$2.06	\$618.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	300	EA	\$2.99	\$897.00			

14 Corn cap 1 5/8"								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
	Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$0.70	\$140.00	No specification for Aluminum or steel giver		
AWARD	[ALT1] Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$0.77	\$154.00	Acorn cap 1 5/8" Steel		
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	200	EA	\$0.84	\$168.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	200	EA	\$1.23	\$246.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	200	EA	\$1.49	\$298.00			

15 Rail end caps 2 3/8"								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	500	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	WE DON NOT CARRY THIS ITEM		
	Central Fence & Supply	500	EA	\$0.75	\$375.00	There are no rail ends in 2 3/8" and no speci		
	[ALT1] Central Fence & Supply	500	EA	\$0.82	\$410.00	Rail ends 1 3/8" Steel		
AWARD	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	500	EA	\$1.49	\$745.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	500	EA	\$2.50	\$1,250.00			

16 Single wheel 1 5/8"								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	300	EA	\$1.99	\$597.00			
AWARD	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	300	EA	\$9.63	\$2,889.00			
	Central Fence & Supply	300	EA	\$12.78	\$3,834.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	300	EA	\$17.57	\$5,271.00			

17 Barb wire 12 guage 4 points (1,200 ft/roll)								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	5	EA	\$84.93	\$424.65	A ROLL WITH (1,320')IN EACH ROLL		
	Central Fence & Supply	5	EA	\$88.00	\$440.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	5	EA	\$89.99	\$449.95			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	5	EA	\$98.80	\$494.00			

18 Barb wire arm 2" diameter								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD	Central Fence & Supply	100	EA	\$3.06	\$306.00	No specification for Aluminum, steel given c		
	[ALT1] Central Fence & Supply	100	EA	\$3.58	\$358.00	Barbwire Arm 2" 45 degree heavy		
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	100	EA	\$3.93	\$393.00			
	Construction Rent-A-Fence	100	EA	\$4.79	\$479.00			
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	100	EA	\$8.99	\$899.00			

19 Tie wire 9" (150 per package)								
	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	200	EA	\$5.99	\$1,198.00			
AWARD	Construction Rent-A-Fence	200	EA	\$5.99	\$1,198.00			
	Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$8.47	\$1,694.00	Price given for packages of 100		
	Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	200	EA	\$11.25	\$2,250.00	8 1/4" AND 100 PER PACKAGE		

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
 BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

Item #	Description	Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
20	Brace Bands 1 5/8"	AWARD Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	200	EA	\$0.42	\$84.00			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	200	EA	\$0.47	\$94.00			
		Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$0.61	\$122.00	Bolts included		
		MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	200	EA	\$1.99	\$398.00			
21	Galvanized Box hinges 2 3/8" x 1 5/8"	AWARD MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	300	EA	\$4.99	\$1,497.00			
		Central Fence & Supply	300	EA	\$6.83	\$2,049.00			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	300	EA	\$9.32	\$2,796.00			
		Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	300	EA	\$9.52	\$2,856.00			
22	Galvanized Rear track roller with pipe bracket and bolt	AWARD MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	75	EA	\$8.99	\$674.25			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	75	EA	\$9.81	\$735.75			
		Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	75	EA	\$13.31	\$998.25			
		Central Fence & Supply	75	EA	\$17.54	\$1,315.50			
23	Base Plates 6"x6" Galvanized	AWARD Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$3.97	\$794.00			
		Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	200	EA	\$4.91	\$982.00			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	200	EA	\$7.20	\$1,440.00			
		MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	200	EA	No Bid				
24	Loop caps Steel 2 3/8 x 1 5/8	AWARD Central Fence & Supply	200	EA	\$1.05	\$210.00			
		Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	200	EA	\$1.41	\$282.00			
		MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	200	EA	\$1.99	\$398.00			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	200	EA	\$2.94	\$588.00			
25	Top rail 1 3/8" x 21'	AWARD Central Fence & Supply	50	EA	\$15.00	\$750.00	Tubing wall thickness not specified. Price gi		
		Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	50	EA	\$15.54	\$777.00	PER RAIL		
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	50	EA	\$16.44	\$822.00	This is 065 gauge pipe, which is heavier thar		
		[ALT1] Central Fence & Supply	50	EA	\$16.50	\$825.00	Toprail 1 3/8" x 21 .065		
		MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	50	EA	\$19.99	\$999.50			
26	Drop rod fork 1 3/8" x 1 5/8"	AWARD Central Fence & Supply	50	EA	\$3.15	\$157.50			
		Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	50	EA	\$3.77	\$188.50			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	50	EA	\$3.95	\$197.50			
		MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	50	EA	\$4.99	\$249.50			
27	Drop rod guide 1 3/8" x 1 5/8"	AWARD MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	75	EA	\$1.99	\$149.25			
		Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	75	EA	\$2.46	\$184.50			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	75	EA	\$2.73	\$204.75			
		Central Fence & Supply	75	EA	\$2.97	\$222.75			
28	Carriage bolt and nut 5/16"x 1 1/4" Gal. sets of 100/box	AWARD Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	100	EA	\$8.00	\$800.00	PER BOX		
		Central Fence & Supply	100	EA	\$12.10	\$1,210.00			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	100	EA	\$14.00	\$1,400.00			
		MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	100	EA	\$26.99	\$2,699.00			
29	Terminal post 6' x 2 3/8" SS20	AWARD Central Fence & Supply	100	EA	\$11.83	\$1,183.00			
		Construction Rent-A-Fence	100	EA	\$12.53	\$1,253.00			
		Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	100	EA	\$15.44	\$1,544.00			
		MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	100	EA	\$15.99	\$1,599.00			

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
 BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

30	Fork 3" x 1 5/8"		Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD			Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	100	EA	\$1.69	\$169.00			
			Construction Rent-A-Fence	100	EA	\$2.12	\$212.00			
			Central Fence & Supply	100	EA	\$2.28	\$228.00	Price given is for 3" Fork		
			MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	100	EA	\$4.99	\$499.00			

31	Collar 3" x 1 5/8"		Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD			Central Fence & Supply	100	EA	\$1.43	\$143.00	Price given is for 1 5/8" collar		
			Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	100	EA	\$1.63	\$163.00			
			Construction Rent-A-Fence	100	EA	\$2.18	\$218.00			
			MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	100	EA	\$3.99	\$399.00			

32	Brace bands 2 3/8		Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD			Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	500	EA	\$0.45	\$225.00			
			Central Fence & Supply	500	EA	\$0.47	\$235.00	Bolts included		
			Construction Rent-A-Fence	500	EA	\$0.57	\$285.00			
			MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	500	EA	\$1.49	\$745.00			

33	Rail end cap 1 5/8"		Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes / Alternate Description	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
			Central Fence & Supply	300	EA	\$0.71	\$213.00	No specification for Aluminum or steel giver		
AWARD			[ALT1] Central Fence & Supply	300	EA	\$0.75	\$225.00	Rail ends 1 5/8" Steel		
			Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	300	EA	\$0.87	\$261.00			
			Construction Rent-A-Fence	300	EA	\$1.75	\$525.00			
			MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	300	EA	\$1.99	\$597.00			

34	Sleeve 1 5/8"		Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD			Central Fence & Supply	100	EA	\$0.88	\$88.00			
			Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	100	EA	\$1.53	\$153.00			
			Construction Rent-A-Fence	100	EA	\$2.00	\$200.00			
			MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	100	EA	\$2.99	\$299.00			

35	Tension wire 12 gauge"		Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
			Central Fence & Supply	20	EA	\$99.00	\$1,980.00			
AWARD			Construction Rent-A-Fence	20	EA	\$99.00	\$1,980.00	100 pound roll.		
			MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	20	EA	\$99.99	\$1,999.80			
			Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	20	EA	\$119.00	\$2,380.00	A ROLL		

36	7" Press steel wheel		Supplier	QTY	UOM	Price	Extended	Supplier Notes	Manufacturer	Manufacturer #
AWARD			Construction Rent-A-Fence	50	EA	\$16.24	\$812.00			
			Central Fence & Supply	50	EA	\$16.25	\$812.50			
			Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	50	EA	\$23.34	\$1,167.00			
			MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	50	EA	No Bid				

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
 BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

Att #	Attribute Name	Central Fence & Supply	Construction Rent-A-Fence	Hurricane Fence Co (HurfcO Ind.)	MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS
93	Business/Company Owner Name	Central Fence & Supply, Ltd. / Celia S. Gregory	Tom Ford	Roy Garrison III	DANNY SMITH
94	Date of Establishment	08/01/1988	1988	2-2-1983	1969
95	Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications?	No	No	No	Yes
96	If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please specify deviations:	No Deviation	none	*not all material is domestically produced per the buy american act	AFTER 90 DAYS BID PRICES MAY CHANGE

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

Responding Supplier	Signature Full Name	Signature Email	Supplier Notes
Central Fence & Supply	Celia Sandoval Gregory	celia@centralfenceltd.com	
Construction Rent-A-Fence	Melissa Huisman	melissa@crainc.com	All prices are subject to market changes and availability.
Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	Roy E. Garrison, III	roy3@hurricanefencebx.com	*steel prices are volatile, quoting as per today's prices. Cannot guarantee price for more than 10 days.
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	danny smith	mattscorp@aol.com	BID PRICES MAY CHANGE AFTER 90 DAYS OF BID BEIGN SUBMITTED

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 04/15/2021

Participant Name	Response Date	Response Status	Contact	City	State	Invitation Type	Invitation Date	Owner
Central Fence & Supply	01/13/2021	Submitted	Celia Gregory	Pharr	TX	Manual	12/08/2020	Celia S. Gregory
Construction Rent-A-Fence	01/12/2021	Submitted	Melissa Ford Huisman	Taylor	TX	Manual	12/08/2020	Tom Ford
Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)	01/13/2021	Submitted	Roy Garrison III	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	Roy Garrison
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	01/11/2021	Submitted	DAVID CASTILLO	PHARR	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	Danny Smith
Alamo Iron Works (Valen Distribution)		Unsubmitted	Robert Garcia	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Circle Saw Builders Supply, Inc		Viewed	Juan R Ruiz	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Construction Journal LLC		Viewed	Pamela Exton	Stuart	FL	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Dodge Data & Analytics		Viewed		Hamilton	NJ			
kautsch lumber co inc		Viewed	kookii crerar	alamo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Rio Grande Valley Chapter Associated General Contr:		Viewed	Perry A. Vaughn	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
The PlanIT Room		Viewed	Cecilia Hernandez	El Paso	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
South Texas Moulding dba Texas Wood Supply	12/29/2020	No Bid	Daniel Ortiz	DONNA	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Trinity3 Technology	12/08/2020	No Bid	Kendell Rickman	Saint Paul	MN	Automatic	12/08/2020	
365 Paving & Construction LLC			Gilberto Maldonado	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LMH, LLC)			Larry Helgeson	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Accu Aire Mechanical LLC			Monica M Harris	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.				Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp			Celeste Cantu	Alamo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV			Javier Olmos	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Alamo Iron Works (Alamo Distribution, LLC)			Stacey B Sims	Alpharetta	GA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
All American Poly				Piscataway	NJ	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS				edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
AM Utilities and Construction LLC			Roberto Morales	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Arga development				Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Blue Sky Enterprises			Alonzo Acosta	La Blanca	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
BM Benchmark Construction, LLC				McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION, LLC			TONY RODRIGUEZ	San Juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Bon Tool Co			Paul Bender	Gibsonia	PA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
BOXX Modular (Nortex Modular Leasing & Construct			Harold Weatherly	Fort Worth	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Bros Pressure Washing and Striping			John Ramirez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
BuckHorn Construction LLC			Chad Bishop	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Buffalo Construction LLC.			FRED GUERRA	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC)			Scott Vaughan	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
C&H Distributors, LLC			William Rose	Chicago	IL	Automatic	12/08/2020	
C&V SUPPLY INC.			JESSIE RAYA	MISSION	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
CAPA Texas			junior ocampo	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Caprice Electronics, Inc.			Michael Kluger	Brooklyn	NY	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Castcon Construction Co., LLC			Robert Castaneda, Jr.	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Celso Gonzalez Construction			Celso Gonzalez	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Center Stone Services				Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Central Plumbing & Electric Supply (CENCO, INC)				Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Cintas Corporation #538			Roger Rodriguez	Mercedes	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, Inc.			D'Ann Ivers	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Compostology LLC			Kash Nathan	Waco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ConstructConnect				Cincinnati	OH	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Construction Bid Source (Plan Room)				Felton	CA	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Curbell Plastics, Inc.			Bill Heckert	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Delta Specialties Supply (Martin Pena)			MARTIN PENA	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Demo Con, Inc.				La Feria	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.			Sandra Salinas	Palmhurst	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Doggett Heavy Machinery Services			Andy Ramos	San Juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
ECOEFFECT			Alejandro Alanis	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Econ Group, LLC			Gilbert Enriquez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Elite Disinfecting Services (Elite Oil Field and Constru			Juan Suarez	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Elsa Auto & Truck Parts			Lupe Garza	Elsa	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Encino Construction			Fred	mcallen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Fairway Supply, Inc.			Kathy Millican	Austin	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Fourtify Construction			Sam De la Garza	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
GALVAN BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			GALVAN BUILDERS CONST	CORPUS CHRISTI	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)			Juan Garcia	san juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
General contractor/Construction (Davila Constructio			Tommy Canul	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Go UnderGround				harlingen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Gulf Coast Paper			Jessica Cavazos	Brownsville	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Hi-LoContractor LLC			Edmundo Carreon	Elsa	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Holchemont, Ltd.			Annette Carmona	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Home Design Center (V&L ENTERPRISES, LLC)			Victor Cantu	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC			Keith F. Hunt	Laguna Vista	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
JCO "the door people"			Joe Perez	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE PROTECTION			Heather Foster	ROUND ROCK	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Leija Welding				Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Lewis Electric Motors, Inc.			Enrique Mendez	HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Little Giants Learning Center				Alamo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Lowe's Of Pharr (lowe's home center. llc)				Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Lumatec Lighting Service			Victor T Rios	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
LUNA GLASS LLC			JOSE LUNA	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
MARK HOSKINS ENTERPRISES LLC			Mark Hoskins	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020	
Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation)			Mike Zappia	Stow	OH	Automatic	12/08/2020	

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES BID # 20-21-027
BID OPENING: JANUARY 13, 2021 @ 3:00 P.M.

MB Services LLC	George Selvera	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
McCoy's Building Supply (McCoy Corporation)	Tina McArthur	San Marcos	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
MEGA RACKS LLC (GERARDO DAVALOS)	GERARDO DAVALOS	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
MH ENTERPRISES (MH ENTERPRISES 888)	Miyoung Hong	McKinney	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Noble Texas Builders		La Feria	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC	Lucia Valdez	HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Performing Arts Supply Co.	Stacey Ambrose	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Pinturas & Lacas (PPG Paints)	Rudy Garza	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
PRECISION SAW & TOOL, INC	EDDIE HOMAN	CONVERSE	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
R REYES TRUCKING & TRACTOR SERVICES	JOHANA REYES	SAN BENITO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RB Doors & Hardware Inc	Ruby Melgoza	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RCA Building Materials Inc.	Gustavo Rea	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
REFCO (R E Friedrichs Company)	Vicki Delgado	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Rio Grande CAS		McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
RISICA & SONS, INC.	RON RISICA	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Romo Contractors, LLC	Romo Contractors LLC	Laredo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
royal media network inc.	irene diaz	WINDSOR MIL	MD	Automatic	12/08/2020
rudys upholstery		pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
San Juan Bolt & Supply		san juan	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Sanchez Building Supplies, Inc.	Juan Sanchez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Second Chance Treasures		McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA GROUP, INC)		SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Sherwin Williams	karissa Carrizales	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Six Shooter Softwawsh (Sixto Garza Jr Enterprizes LLC)	Sixto Garza	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Southern Stone, LLC.	Sylvia Webber	Donna	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Summit Building & Design (AOC Calton, Ltd., dba Sur	David Acevedo	Laredo	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
TCI Roofing & Construction	Arturo Escobedo	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
TDIndustries, Inc.	Lorraine Vuong	Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Tenzo McAllen, LLC.	Christian Diaz	Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Twin City Hardware, Inc. (TCH Southwest, Tri-City Ha	Joe Gandara	Oakdale	MN	Automatic	12/08/2020
Twin Construction (Noel Cavazos)	Noe Cavazos	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Valley Striping Corp		Mission	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
ValTex (Figuroa & Sons, Inc.)	Felipe Lopez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
VCI Builders, Inc.	Joe Arredondo	MISSION	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Vertex Marketing	Dr. Sue Bayer	Stafford	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Virtual Builders Exchange	Jeannette Olguin	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Visceral Illumination Code LLC (VISCERAL ILLUMINAT	VISCERAL ILLUMINATION	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)	Cindy Leander	Dallas	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Whitmeyers Distillery Co., LLC		Houston	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CARLOS ISASI)	JUAN CARLOS ISASI	PHARR	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC	Carlos Manuel Franco	Pharr	TX	Automatic	12/08/2020