PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034
BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Event Number #19-20-034 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Event Title PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type Bid Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Issue Date 11/1/2019 04:58:23 PM (CT) Phone 956-354-2000

Close Date 11/18/2019 02:30:00 PM (CT) Fax 956-354-3019

Recommendation: That the Board of Education award the Portable Radios and Equipment for PSJA ISD Police Department Bid # 19-20-034 to the
lowest bidder listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Responding Supplier City State Response Submitted Lines Responded Response Total
MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC CHICAGO IL 11/18/2019 02:10:35 PM (CT) 39 $78,096.79
Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing Rolando Garcia, Chief of Police

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 199-529-44-099000-6398-00

One hundred twenty three (123) invitations were emailed to vendors
Nine (9) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Three (3) Submitted Bid

Four (4) No Bid
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034
BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line Qty UOM Description Manufacturer Manuf. Number Award Response | Award Awarded Supplier Award Reason
Quantity
1 1 EA PORTABLE RADIOS MOTOROLA OR EQUAL  APX 900 700/800 MHZ MODEL 2 $64,847.50 1 MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC LOW BID JUSTIFIED

PORTABLE OR EQUAL
$8,907.50 1 MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC LOW BID JUSTIFIED

2 1 EA  ACCESSORIES FORAPX900  MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
LOW BID JUSTIFIED

3 1 EA  MOBILE RADIO MOTOROLA OR EQUAL  APX 4500 P25 OR EQUAL $4,341.79 1 MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC

*BK Technologies submitted a Li-ion 2300mAh Intelligent battery, at their own admission the vedor submitted the wrong battery and requested to change the battery specs aft the bidding process had
ended. The features outlined in the BK Technologies would not perform and would be of no use to the district.

**Tri-County Communications submitted an alternate brand of radios, the Harris brand radio does not integrate with Motorola products. The features outlined in the Harris radios would not perform and

would be of no use to the district.
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.

PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034

BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

BK Technologies, Inc.

hdc video and
communications dba
(Maria del Castillo LLC)

Total Price

$66,157.34

Total Price $0.00

Line #

Description

Mfgr

Mfgno

QTY UOM

Unit

Extended

Unit Extended

1ALTS
1ALT4
1ALT3
1ALT6
1ALT2
1ALT1

1ALT1

11

1.2
13
14
1.5
1.6
1.7
1.8
1.9
1.10

PORTABLE RADIOS

MOTOROLA OR EQUAL

APX 900 700/800 MHZ
MODEL 2 PORTABLE OR
EQUAL

KNG Programming Cable USB

Bk Technologies

KAA0710

Software, Editor W/Advance Security key KNG

Bk Technologies

KAA0735

Field Install Option OTAP, Trunking "Must have KZA0579”

BK Technologies

KAA0582

25 EA

Factory Install, DES & AES FIPS 140-2 Level 2 Encryption KNG2 only

Bk Technologies

KZA0574

25 EA

Factory Install P25 9600 Baud Trunking.

BK Technologies

KZA0579

25 EA

763-870 MHZ, 5000 channels, 3 watt P25 Digital/Analog Portable Bluetooh/GPS Capable

BK Technologies

KNG2-P800

25 EA

1.1- 1.10 EQUAL-  TP9400 Portable, 700/800 MHz, P25 Trunking, Phase II, AES/DES ENCRYPTION, Scan-
INCLUDES, BATTERY, ANTENNA, BELT CLIP AND CHARGER, STANDARD 2 YR WARRANTY WITH AN
ADDITIONAL YEAR. TOTAL OF 3 YR WARRANTY*RUGGEDIZED, RELIABLEPERFORMANCE> Exceeds MIL-
STD-810G> IP68 sealing protects to a depth of twometers for 30 minutes and a depth ofone meter for 2
hours> Water-shedding grille assists voiceclarity and volume in wet environments> Shock-absorbing,
impact-protectedcornersENHANCED WORKFORCE SAFETY> Highly visible and easily
accessibleprogrammable emergency key> Man Down and Lone Workercome standard> Embedded GPS
transmits location*> Radio inhibit and uninhibited managemisplaced or stolen radios> Supports end-to-
end encryption,including AES> Trunked failsoft reverts to conventionaloperation during network
failureDESIGNED FOR EASE OF USE> Large four-line LCD with icons to displaykey parameters> Full and
partial keypad options> Four programmable function keys andthree-way zone (ABC) selectorDELIVERS
ON P25 STANDARDS> TIA-102 P25 CAP tested and certifiedfor multi-vendor interoperability> 12.5 kHz
P25 Phase 1 FDMA and6.25 kHz equivalent P25 Phase 2TDMA capable> Product compliances satisfyFCC
2015 and 2017 ultranarrowbanding mandates> FCC and IC compliances includeP25 Phase 2 emission
designator(8K10F1W)RELIABLE MISSION-CRITICALCOMMUNICATIONS> Analog, P25 Phase 1
conventional/trunked and P25 Phase 2 trunked> Automatic dual mode between analogand P25 Phase 1
conventional> Unique microphone design, coupledwith AMBE+2™ enhanced vocoder,reduce
background noise indemanding environments> Voting ensures priority selection of thechannel with
optimum receive quality> Dynamic regrouping and super-groupoperation for mission-critical
workforcemanagement> Increased capacity with up t02,000 channels> Bluetooth> Scanning modes
include priority,dual priority, editable, zone andbackground scan> Range of analog signaling
functionality,i.e., MDC1200 encode and decode,2-tone decode, PL (CTCSS), DPL (DCS)ENHANCED VOICE
AND DATA> Simulcast mode support includesLSM and C4FM> Pre-set status messages> P25 emergency
data> GPS location> Conventional and trunked IP data> Location services*EFFICIENT, SECURITY-
FOCUSEDFLEET M T> Over-the-Air- ying iliti pled with L3Harris EnableProtect
KeyFill Device simplify encryption process> Over-the-Air-Programming supportedby L3Harris EnableFleet
deliverssoftware and firmware changes over aP25 trunked network for faster, easier,more affordable
optimization of fleetradio performance> L3Harris EnableProtect AdvancedSystem Key allows
administrators toauthorize and restrict subscriber unitson their networkTP9400 ACCESSORIES> Audio:
speaker-microphones, earpiecesand surveillance kits> Chargers: in-vehicle, single fast andsix-way multi-
chargers> Range of Li-lon battery capacities to match operational needs

FEATURES AND BENEFITS * Dual-knob solution * 7/800 MHz Model 2 Portable * Modes of operation *
Clear or digital-encrypted ASTRO(r) 25 Trunked Operation * Analog MDC-1200 Digital P25 *
Conventional system configurations * Narrow and wide bandwidth digital receiver (6.25kHz
equivalent/12.5kHz/25kHz)1 * Embedded digital signaling (ASTRO AND ASTRO25) * Intelligent priority
scan * Radio profiles * Unified call list * User-programmable voice announcement * Instant recall *
Meets applicable MIL-STD-810C, D, E, F G * Full portfolio of accessories, including IMPRES batteries *
Chargers and audio devices2 STANDARD FEATURES * Operational-Critical Wireless Bluetooth(r)4.0
(LE)3 * Emergency find me * ASTRO 25 Integrated Voice Data * Integrated GPS/GLONASS for outdoor
location-tracking * Single-Key ADP Encryption * IP68 submersion (2 meters, 2 hours) * IMPRES Battery
(PMNN4491B) * Embedded digital signaling (ASTRO ASTRO 25) * Text Messaging * Software key
PROGRAMMING * Utilizes Windows 7, 8 10 Customer Programming Software (CPS) with Radio
Management OPTIONAL FEATURES * AES 256-bit Software Encryption (AES-256) * Enhanced data *
Enhanced noise suppressor * Multi-key * Programming over project 25 (OTAP) * RFID Volume Knob
(accessory only) * Mission critical geofence * P25 Authentication * Digital tone signaling * UL-certified

P25 TRUNKING

ADVANCED SYSTEM KEY - HARDWARE KEY

PROGRAMMING OVER P25 (OTAP)

MULTIKEY

ENHANCED DATA

AES 256 SW ENCRYPTION

BATTERY: IMPRESS LI-ION 3000MAH DIMENSIONS 113w x 52w X 23d mm.
3 YEAR SERVICE FROM THE START LITE

TEST RESULTS / RATED AUTIO PRI

HARRIS-TAIT

MOTOROLA OR EQUAL

MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
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TP9405K5BB

H92UCF9PW6 N OR EQUAL

QA04096 OR EQUAL
QA01648 OR EQUAL
G996 OR EQUAL
H869 OR EQUAL
QA03399 OR EQUAL
QA06653 OR EQUAL
QA06765 OR EQUAL
H885BK OR EQUAL
H799 OR EQUAL
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25 EA

25 EA

25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA

$82.50
$197.34
$131.34
$306.90
$435.60
$1,199.00

$ 82.50
$  197.34
$  3,283.50
$  7,672.50
$ 10,890.00
$ 29,975.00




PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.

PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034

BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

BK Technologies, Inc.

hdc video and
communications dba
(Maria del Castillo LLC)

Total Price $66,157.34| Total Price $0.00
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended
2 ACCESSORIES FOR APX 900 MOTOROLA OR EQUAL 1 EA
2 ALTS i2.5- RECEIVE ONLY EAR-TUBE IN-EAR 2.5MM HARRIS-TAIT T03-00120-AAAD 1 EA
2 ALT3 i2.3- CASE HEAVY DUTY LEATHER 4KEY DSTUD B/LOOP HARRIS-TAIT T03-00038-0004 1 EA
2 ALT2 i2:2- CHARGER, SINGLE BAY, LI-ION W/ PLUG PACK****Charger is included with purchase of radio- this HARRIS-TAIT T03-00012-AEFA 1 EA
would be for an additional battery*****
2 ALT1 i2.1- BATTERY, LI-ION 2400MAH, W/ BELT CLIP****Battery is included with purchase of radio- this HARRIS-TAIT T03-00011-CBAA 1 EA
would be for an additional battery*****
2 ALT4 24 SPEAKER MICROPHONE, EVOLUTION, E-BUTTON, 2.5MM HARRIS-TAIT T03-00045-JFAC 1 EA
2 ALT3 ;Earphone, Listen Only 3.5mm Ear Hugger BK Technologies KAA0222EH 25 EA $26_40 $ 660.00
2 ALT7 :760-870 Mhz, 1/4 Wave Stubby Antenna KNG-P800 Bk Technologies KAA0833 25 EA $26.86 S 671.50
2 ALTS ileather Case with Belt Loop & D Swivel KIT BK Technologies KAA0421 25 EA $49_50 $ 1,237.50
2 ALT4 iCharger, Desktop Single KNG-Pxxx BK Technologies KAA0300P 25 EA $66.00 $ 1,650.00
2 ALT2 :Microphone, Speaker, Emergency Button, w/3.5mm jack, KNG-P BK Technologies KAA0204-E35 25 EA 5105_50 $ 2,640.00
2 ALT1 iBattery Pack, Li-ion,2300mAh, Intelligent Battery BK Technologies KAA0103 25 EA $108.90 $ 2,722.50
2 ALT6 iExtend Warranty to 3 years (Radio Only) BK Technologies LFW0012 25 EA $179_00 $ 4,475.00
2.1 BATTERY IMPRES LIION P68 3000MAH MOTOROLA OR EQUAL PMNN4493A OR EQUAL 25 EA
2.2 CHARGER DESKTOP SINGLE UNIT IMPRES, US/NA MOTOROLA OR EQUAL PMPN4174A OR EQUAL 25 EA
2.3 HARD LEATHER CARYY CASE WITH 2.5IN SWIVEL BELT LOOP-FKP MOTOROLA OR EQUAL PMLN5842A OR EQUAL 25 EA
2.4 IMPRES RSM, 3.5MM AUDIO JACK MOTOROLA OR EQUAL PMMN4069A OR EQUAL 25 EA
2.5 RECEIVE ONLY EARPIECE WITH TRANSLUCENT TUBE MOTOROLA OR EQUAL RLN4941A OR EQUAL 25 EA
3 MOBILE RADIO MOTOROLA OR EQUAL APX 4500 P25 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3 ALT10 iFixed Antenna Mount NMOw/Type N Connector BK Technologies NMO-NTYPE 1 EA 533_00
3 ALT9 iAntenna OMNI, NMO 698-960 Mhz/100-2700 MHz, Stubby 3.5 debi, 100 watts BK Technologies MWV800STB 1 EA $6930
3 ALT3 iField Installed, OTAP, Trunking, KNG-MXXX "Mush have KZA 0569” BK Technologies KAA0592 1 EA $131.34
3 ALT8 :Extend Warranty to 3 years (Radio Only) BK Technologies LFW0012 1 EA 3179_00
3 ALTS Microphone desktop BK Technologies KAA0258 1 EA $188.10
3 ALT7 :Factory Install DES/AES Encryption BK Technologies KZA0576 1 EA $190.08
3 ALT4 iField Install 9600 Baud Trunking BK Technologies KAA0569 1 EA $435.60
3 ALT6 :iHood w/Power Supply (KAAO158)KNG-M BK Technologies KAA0617 1 EA $446.82
3 ALT2 :Remote Control head plug & play KNG-Mxx (comes with KAA0638 install kit) BK Technologies KAA0660 1 EA $730.00
3 ALT1 i763-870 Mhz Digital/Analog P25, 5000 channels, 30/35 Watts Remote Mount BK Technologies KNG-M800R 1 EA $1,500_00
3 ALT1 3.1-3.13  TM9400 Mobile, 700/800 MHZ, P25 Trunking, Phase I, Scan, AES/DES ENCRYPTION- HARRIS-TAIT TM9400K5DA 1 EA

INCLUDES, POWER CABLE, DESK MICROPHONE, POWER SUPPLY, BRACKET AND STANDARD 2 YEAR
WARRANTY WITH AN ADDITIONAL YEAR FOR A TOTAL OF 3 YEAR WARRANTY.*DELIVERS ON P25
STANDARDSBenefit from the spectral efficiency, multivendor interoperability, security, migrationand
data capability demanded by P25standards.> TIA-102 P25 CAP tested and certified,providing multi-
vendor interoperability> 12.5 kHz P25 Phase 1 FDMA and6.25 kHz equivalent P25 Phase 2TDMA
capable> Product compliances satisfyFCC 2015 and 2017 ultranarrowbanding mandates> FCC and IC
compliances includeP25 Phase 2 emission designator(8K10F1W)DESIGNED FOR
DEMANDINGENVIRONMENTSDesigned with users to ensure effectiveeveryday operations.> IP54 rated:
protected against dustand splashing water> Exceeds MIL-STD-810G> Large four-line LCD with icons
todisplay key parameters> Configurable to suit your needs:dual head and remote mount (6 mand 12 m
options)> Four programmable function keyson the standard mobile head> Programmable orange
emergency keyHIGH-PERFORMING VOICECOMMUNICATIONSRobust design delivers clear,mission-
critical voice communications.> Analog, P25 Phase 1 conventional/trunked and P25 Phase 2 trunked>
Automatic dual mode between analogand P25 Phase 1 conventional> Programmable power level
options> Option to operate with dual-bandfunctionality> AMBE+2™ enhanced vocoder
reducesbackground noise in demandingenvironments> Voting ensures priority selection of thechannel
with optimum receive quality> Dynamic regrouping and super-groupoperation for mission-critical
workforcemanagement> Increased channel capacity withup to 2,000 channels> Scanning modes
include: priority, dualpriority, editable, zone, background scanKEEPING YOUR PEOPLE SAFE> Supports
end-to end encryption,including AES> Lone worker, covert microphone andstealth emergency mode as
standard> Radio inhibit and uninhibit to allowmanagement of radios duringvehicle servicing> Trunked
failsoft reverts to conventionaloperation during trunked network failureEFFECTIVE OPERATIONS
WITHVOICE AND DATA> Support for a variety of simulcastmodes such as LSM and C4FM> Pre-set status
messages> P25 data such as GPS location> Cor i | and trunked IP data> Location
services over aconventional network> Software configurable, including featureupgrades through
software licensesEFFICIENT, SECURITY-FOCUSEDMANAGEMENT> The TM9400 management
facilitiesand applications allow you to efficientlymanage your radio fleet.> OTAR (Over-the-Air-
Rekeying)> EnableProtect Key Fill Device for quick,reliable encryption key programming> Programming
application for efficientfleet programming> EnableProtect’s Advanced SystemKey (ASK) allows
administrators toauthorize and restrict subscriberunitson their networkTM9400 ACCESSORIES> Digital
and analog interfaces allowa range of accessory options forthe TM9400
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.

PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034

BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

BK Technologies, Inc.

hdc video and
communications dba
(Maria del Castillo LLC)

Total Price $66,157.34| Total Price $0.00
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended

31 APX(tm) 4500 P25 MOBILE RADIO * 7/800 MHZ MID POWER 1V/D TRUNKING STANDARDS SUPPORTE ~ MOTOROLA OR EQUAL M22URS9PW1 N OR EQUAL 1 EA

* Clear or digital encrypted ASTRO(r)25 Trunked operation capable of SmartZone(r), Smartzone

Omnlink, SmartNet(r) Analog MDC-1200 digital APCO P25 conventional system configurations narrow

and wide bandwidth digital receiver (6.25 kHz equivalent/12.5 kHz/20kHz/25kHz) Embedded digital

signaling (ASTRO ASTRO 25) Available in 2 models integrated GPS capable lightbar with intelligent

lighting radio profiles unified call list user programmable voice announcement meets applicable MIL-

STD-810C, D, E, F, G IP67 standard (submersible 1 meter, 30 minutes). SUPERIOR AUDIO FEATURES *

0.5 W high audio speaker 2-mic noise canceling technology Utilizes Windows XP, Vista and Windows 7

Customer programming software
3.2 3600 OR 9600 TRUNKING BAUD SINGLE SYSTEM MOTOROLA OR EQUAL QA02756 OR EQUAL 1 EA
33 ADVANCED SYSTEM KEY - HARDWARE KEY MOTOROLA OR EQUAL QA01648 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.4 APX 02 CONTROL HEAD (GREY) MOTOROLA OR EQUAL GA00804 OR EQUAL 1 EA
35 CONTROL HEAD SOFTWARE MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G444 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.6  DASHMOUNT MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G66 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.7 CONTROL STATION DESK GCAI MIC MOTOROLA OR EQUAL W382 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.8 3 YEAR SERVICE FROM THE START LITE MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G24 OR EQUAL 1 EA
39 CONTROL STATION POWER SUPPLY MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G91 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.10 CONTROL STATION OPERATION MOTOROLA OR EQUAL W665 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.11 OVER THE AIR PROVISIONING MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G996 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.12 MULTIPLE KEY ENCRYPTION OPERATION MOTOROLA OR EQUAL W969 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.13 AES ENCRYPTION APX MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G843 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.14 WIDEBAND FIBERGLASS OMNI ANTENNA 74 MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSMFBW?7463 OR EQUAL 1 EA
3.15 ANTENNA MOUNTING BRACKET MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSMMK12 OR EQUAL 1 EA No Bid
3.16 LATNM-PSA TYPE N MALE PS FOR 1/2 IN-TOP MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DDN1088 OR EQUAL 1 EA No Bid
3,17  LDF4-50A CABLE: 1/2" LDF HELIAX POL MOTOROLA OR EQUAL L1705 OR EQUAL 1 EA |NoBid
318 221213 CABLE WRAP WEATHERPROOFING MOTOROLA OR EQUAL TDN9289 OR EQUAL 1 EA |NoBid
3.19  S$G12-06B2A 1/2" SURE GROUND MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSSG1206B2AOREQUAL 1 EA  |No Bid
3.20 LATNF-PSA TYPE N FEMALE PS FOR 1/2-BOTTOM MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DDN1089 OR EQUAL 1 EA No Bid
3.21 RF SPD, 125-1000MHZ DC BLOCK FLANGE MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSISS0NXC2MA OR EQUAL 1 EA No Bid
322  FITNM-HC 1/4" TYPE N MALE CONNECTOR MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DDN9769B OR EQUAL 1 EA |NoBid
3.23  FSI1-50A CABLE: 1/4" SUPERFLEX POLY MOTOROLA OR EQUAL L1700 OR EQUAL 1 EA |NoBid
3.24  FIMU 1/4" MINI UHF MALE S FLEX CONN MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSFIMU OR EQUAL 1 EA |NoBid
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.

PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034

BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

AWARDED

MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS

INC

TRI-COUNTY
COMMUNICATIONS

Total Price

$78,096.79

Total Price

$13,720.70

Line #

Description

Mfgr

Mfgno

QTY UOM

Unit

Extended

Unit

Extended

1ALTS
1ALT4
1ALT3
1ALT6
1ALT2
1ALT1

1ALT1

11

1.2
13
14
1.5
1.6
1.7
1.8
1.9
1.10

PORTABLE RADIOS

MOTOROLA OR EQUAL

APX 900 700/800 MHZ
MODEL 2 PORTABLE OR
EQUAL

KNG Programming Cable USB

Bk Technologies

KAA0710

1 EA

Software, Editor W/Advance Security key KNG

Bk Technologies

KAA0735

Field Install Option OTAP, Trunking "Must have KZA0579”

BK Technologies

KAA0582

25 EA

Factory Install, DES & AES FIPS 140-2 Level 2 Encryption KNG2 only

Bk Technologies

KZA0574

25 EA

Factory Install P25 9600 Baud Trunking.

BK Technologies

KZA0579

25 EA

763-870 MHZ, 5000 channels, 3 watt P25 Digital/Analog Portable Bluetooh/GPS Capable

BK Technologies

KNG2-P800

25 EA

1.1- 1.10 EQUAL-  TP9400 Portable, 700/800 MHz, P25 Trunking, Phase II, AES/DES ENCRYPTION, Scan-
INCLUDES, BATTERY, ANTENNA, BELT CLIP AND CHARGER, STANDARD 2 YR WARRANTY WITH AN
ADDITIONAL YEAR. TOTAL OF 3 YR WARRANTY*RUGGEDIZED, RELIABLEPERFORMANCE> Exceeds MIL-
STD-810G> IP68 sealing protects to a depth of twometers for 30 minutes and a depth ofone meter for 2
hours> Water-shedding grille assists voiceclarity and volume in wet environments> Shock-absorbing,
impact-protectedcornersENHANCED WORKFORCE SAFETY> Highly visible and easily
accessibleprogrammable emergency key> Man Down and Lone Workercome standard> Embedded GPS
transmits location*> Radio inhibit and uninhibited managemisplaced or stolen radios> Supports end-to-
end encryption,including AES> Trunked failsoft reverts to conventionaloperation during network
failureDESIGNED FOR EASE OF USE> Large four-line LCD with icons to displaykey parameters> Full and
partial keypad options> Four programmable function keys andthree-way zone (ABC) selectorDELIVERS
ON P25 STANDARDS> TIA-102 P25 CAP tested and certifiedfor multi-vendor interoperability> 12.5 kHz
P25 Phase 1 FDMA and6.25 kHz equivalent P25 Phase 2TDMA capable> Product compliances satisfyFCC
2015 and 2017 ultranarrowbanding mandates> FCC and IC compliances includeP25 Phase 2 emission
designator(8K10F1W)RELIABLE MISSION-CRITICALCOMMUNICATIONS> Analog, P25 Phase 1
conventional/trunked and P25 Phase 2 trunked> Automatic dual mode between analogand P25 Phase 1
conventional> Unique microphone design, coupledwith AMBE+2™ enhanced vocoder,reduce
background noise indemanding environments> Voting ensures priority selection of thechannel with
optimum receive quality> Dynamic regrouping and super-groupoperation for mission-critical
workforcemanagement> Increased capacity with up t02,000 channels> Bluetooth> Scanning modes
include priority,dual priority, editable, zone andbackground scan> Range of analog signaling
functionality,i.e., MDC1200 encode and decode,2-tone decode, PL (CTCSS), DPL (DCS)ENHANCED VOICE
AND DATA> Simulcast mode support includesLSM and C4FM> Pre-set status messages> P25 emergency
data> GPS location> Conventional and trunked IP data> Location services*EFFICIENT, SECURITY-
FOCUSEDFLEET M T> Over-the-Air- ying iliti pled with L3Harris EnableProtect
KeyFill Device simplify encryption process> Over-the-Air-Programming supportedby L3Harris EnableFleet
deliverssoftware and firmware changes over aP25 trunked network for faster, easier,more affordable
optimization of fleetradio performance> L3Harris EnableProtect AdvancedSystem Key allows
administrators toauthorize and restrict subscriber unitson their networkTP9400 ACCESSORIES> Audio:
speaker-microphones, earpiecesand surveillance kits> Chargers: in-vehicle, single fast andsix-way multi-
chargers> Range of Li-lon battery capacities to match operational needs

FEATURES AND BENEFITS * Dual-knob solution * 7/800 MHz Model 2 Portable * Modes of operation *
Clear or digital-encrypted ASTRO(r) 25 Trunked Operation * Analog MDC-1200 Digital P25 *
Conventional system configurations * Narrow and wide bandwidth digital receiver (6.25kHz
equivalent/12.5kHz/25kHz)1 * Embedded digital signaling (ASTRO AND ASTRO25) * Intelligent priority
scan * Radio profiles * Unified call list * User-programmable voice announcement * Instant recall *
Meets applicable MIL-STD-810C, D, E, F G * Full portfolio of accessories, including IMPRES batteries *
Chargers and audio devices2 STANDARD FEATURES * Operational-Critical Wireless Bluetooth(r)4.0
(LE)3 * Emergency find me * ASTRO 25 Integrated Voice Data * Integrated GPS/GLONASS for outdoor
location-tracking * Single-Key ADP Encryption * IP68 submersion (2 meters, 2 hours) * IMPRES Battery
(PMNN4491B) * Embedded digital signaling (ASTRO ASTRO 25) * Text Messaging * Software key
PROGRAMMING * Utilizes Windows 7, 8 10 Customer Programming Software (CPS) with Radio
Management OPTIONAL FEATURES * AES 256-bit Software Encryption (AES-256) * Enhanced data *
Enhanced noise suppressor * Multi-key * Programming over project 25 (OTAP) * RFID Volume Knob
(accessory only) * Mission critical geofence * P25 Authentication * Digital tone signaling * UL-certified

P25 TRUNKING

ADVANCED SYSTEM KEY - HARDWARE KEY

PROGRAMMING OVER P25 (OTAP)

MULTIKEY

ENHANCED DATA

AES 256 SW ENCRYPTION

BATTERY: IMPRESS LI-ION 3000MAH DIMENSIONS 113w x 52w X 23d mm.
3 YEAR SERVICE FROM THE START LITE

TEST RESULTS / RATED AUTIO PRI

HARRIS-TAIT

MOTOROLA OR EQUAL

MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
MOTOROLA OR EQUAL
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TP9405K5BB

H92UCF9PW6 N OR EQUAL

QA04096 OR EQUAL
QA01648 OR EQUAL
G996 OR EQUAL
H869 OR EQUAL
QA03399 OR EQUAL
QA06653 OR EQUAL
QA06765 OR EQUAL
H885BK OR EQUAL
H799 OR EQUAL
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25 EA

25 EA

25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA
25 EA

$64,847.50

$1,165.81
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.

PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034

BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

AWARDED
MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS TRI-COUNTY
INC COMMUNICATIONS
Total Price| $78,096.79| Total Price| $13,720.70
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended
2 ACCESSORIES FOR APX 900 MOTOROLA OR EQUAL 1 EA $8,907.50  $8,907.50
2 ALTS i2.5- RECEIVE ONLY EAR-TUBE IN-EAR 2.5MM HARRIS-TAIT T03-00120-AAAD 1 EA $20.00 $500.00
2 ALT3 i2.3- CASE HEAVY DUTY LEATHER 4KEY DSTUD B/LOOP HARRIS-TAIT T03-00038-0004 1 EA $60.00  $1,500.00
2 ALT2 i2.2- CHARGER, SINGLE BAY, LI-ION W/ PLUG PACK****Charger is included with purchase of radio- this HARRIS-TAIT T03-00012-AEFA 1 EA $75.00  $1,875.00
would be for an additional battery*****
2 ALT1 i2.1- BATTERY, LI-ION 2400MAH, W/ BELT CLIP****Battery is included with purchase of radio- this HARRIS-TAIT T03-00011-CBAA 1 EA $112.50  $2,812.50
would be for an additional battery*****
2 ALT4 i24-  SPEAKER MICROPHONE, EVOLUTION, E-BUTTON, 2.5MM HARRIS-TAIT T03-00045-JFAC 1 EA $165.00  $4,125.00
2 ALT3 ;Earphone, Listen Only 3.5mm Ear Hugger BK Technologies KAA0222EH 25 EA
2 ALT7 i760-870 Mhz, 1/4 Wave Stubby Antenna KNG-P800 Bk Technologies KAA0833 25 EA
2 ALT5S iLeather Case with Belt Loop & D Swivel KIT BK Technologies KAA0421 25 EA
2 ALT4 iCharger, Desktop Single KNG-Pxxx BK Technologies KAA0300P 25 EA
2 ALT2 :Microphone, Speaker, Emergency Button, w/3.5mm jack, KNG-P BK Technologies KAA0204-E35 25 EA
2 ALT1 iBattery Pack, Li-ion,2300mAh, Intelligent Battery BK Technologies KAA0103 25 EA
2 ALT6 iExtend Warranty to 3 years (Radio Only) BK Technologies LFW0012 25 EA
2.1 BATTERY IMPRES LIION P68 3000MAH MOTOROLA OR EQUAL PMNN4493AOREQUAL 25  EA 101.25 $ 2,531.25
2.2 CHARGER DESKTOP SINGLE UNIT IMPRES, US/NA MOTOROLA OR EQUAL PMPN4174A OR EQUAL 25  EA $57.00 $ 1,425.00
2.3 HARD LEATHER CARYY CASE WITH 2.5IN SWIVEL BELT LOOP-FKP MOTOROLA OR EQUAL PMLN5842A OR EQUAL 25 EA $45.00 $ 1,125.00
2.4  IMPRESRSM, 3.5MM AUDIO JACK MOTOROLA OR EQUAL PMMN4069A OREQUAL 25 EA $99.75 $ 2,493.75
2.5  RECEIVE ONLY EARPIECE WITH TRANSLUCENT TUBE MOTOROLA OR EQUAL RLN4941A OR EQUAL 25 EA 53.30 $ 1,332.50
3 MOBILE RADIO MOTOROLA OR EQUAL APX 4500 P25 OREQUAL 1 EA $4,341.79  $4,341.79 $508.20 $508.20
3 ALT10 :Fixed Antenna Mount NMOw/Type N Connector BK Technologies NMO-NTYPE 1 EA
3 ALT9 iAntenna OMNI, NMO 698-960 Mhz/100-2700 MHz, Stubby 3.5 debi, 100 watts BK Technologies MWV800STB 1 EA
3 ALT3 iField Installed, OTAP, Trunking, KNG-MXXX ”Mush have KZA 0569” BK Technologies KAA0592 1 EA
3 ALT8 :Extend Warranty to 3 years (Radio Only) BK Technologies LFW0012 1 EA
3 ALTS iMicrophone desktop BK Technologies KAA0258 1 EA
3 ALT7 iFactory Install DES/AES Encryption BK Technologies KZA0576 1 EA
3 ALT4 iField Install 9600 Baud Trunking BK Technologies KAA0569 1 EA
3 ALT6 iHood w/Power Supply (KAAO158)KNG-M BK Technologies KAA0617 1 EA
3 ALT2 :Remote Control head plug & play KNG-Mxx (comes with KAA0638 install kit) BK Technologies KAA0660 1 EA
3 ALT1 i763-870 Mhz Digital/Analog P25, 5000 channels, 30/35 Watts Remote Mount BK Technologies KNG-M800R 1 EA
3 ALT1 3.1-3.13  TM9400 Mobile, 700/800 MHZ, P25 Trunking, Phase I, Scan, AES/DES ENCRYPTION- HARRIS-TAIT TM9400K5DA 1 EA $2,830.00

INCLUDES, POWER CABLE, DESK MICROPHONE, POWER SUPPLY, BRACKET AND STANDARD 2 YEAR
WARRANTY WITH AN ADDITIONAL YEAR FOR A TOTAL OF 3 YEAR WARRANTY.*DELIVERS ON P25
STANDARDSBenefit from the spectral efficiency, multivendor interoperability, security, migrationand
data capability demanded by P25standards.> TIA-102 P25 CAP tested and certified,providing multi-
vendor interoperability> 12.5 kHz P25 Phase 1 FDMA and6.25 kHz equivalent P25 Phase 2TDMA
capable> Product compliances satisfyFCC 2015 and 2017 ultranarrowbanding mandates> FCC and IC
compliances includeP25 Phase 2 emission designator(8K10F1W)DESIGNED FOR
DEMANDINGENVIRONMENTSDesigned with users to ensure effectiveeveryday operations.> IP54 rated:
protected against dustand splashing water> Exceeds MIL-STD-810G> Large four-line LCD with icons
todisplay key parameters> Configurable to suit your needs:dual head and remote mount (6 mand 12 m
options)> Four programmable function keyson the standard mobile head> Programmable orange
emergency keyHIGH-PERFORMING VOICECOMMUNICATIONSRobust design delivers clear,mission-
critical voice communications.> Analog, P25 Phase 1 conventional/trunked and P25 Phase 2 trunked>
Automatic dual mode between analogand P25 Phase 1 conventional> Programmable power level
options> Option to operate with dual-bandfunctionality> AMBE+2™ enhanced vocoder
reducesbackground noise in demandingenvironments> Voting ensures priority selection of thechannel
with optimum receive quality> Dynamic regrouping and super-groupoperation for mission-critical
workforcemanagement> Increased channel capacity withup to 2,000 channels> Scanning modes
include: priority, dualpriority, editable, zone, background scanKEEPING YOUR PEOPLE SAFE> Supports
end-to end encryption,including AES> Lone worker, covert microphone andstealth emergency mode as
standard> Radio inhibit and uninhibit to allowmanagement of radios duringvehicle servicing> Trunked
failsoft reverts to conventionaloperation during trunked network failureEFFECTIVE OPERATIONS
WITHVOICE AND DATA> Support for a variety of simulcastmodes such as LSM and C4FM> Pre-set status
messages> P25 data such as GPS location> Cor i | and trunked IP data> Location
services over aconventional network> Software configurable, including featureupgrades through
software licensesEFFICIENT, SECURITY-FOCUSEDMANAGEMENT> The TM9400 management
facilitiesand applications allow you to efficientlymanage your radio fleet.> OTAR (Over-the-Air-
Rekeying)> EnableProtect Key Fill Device for quick,reliable encryption key programming> Programming
application for efficientfleet programming> EnableProtect’s Advanced SystemKey (ASK) allows
administrators toauthorize and restrict subscriberunitson their networkTM9400 ACCESSORIES> Digital
and analog interfaces allowa range of accessory options forthe TM9400
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034
BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

AWARDED
MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS TRI-COUNTY
INC COMMUNICATIONS
Total Price| $78,096.79| Total Price| $13,720.70
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended

31 APX(tm) 4500 P25 MOBILE RADIO * 7/800 MHZ MID POWER 1V/D TRUNKING STANDARDS SUPPORTE ~ MOTOROLA OR EQUAL M22URS9PW1 N OR EQUAL 1 EA §1 141.72

* Clear or digital encrypted ASTRO(r)25 Trunked operation capable of SmartZone(r), Smartzone

Omnlink, SmartNet(r) Analog MDC-1200 digital APCO P25 conventional system configurations narrow

and wide bandwidth digital receiver (6.25 kHz equivalent/12.5 kHz/20kHz/25kHz) Embedded digital

signaling (ASTRO ASTRO 25) Available in 2 models integrated GPS capable lightbar with intelligent

lighting radio profiles unified call list user programmable voice announcement meets applicable MIL-

STD-810C, D, E, F, G IP67 standard (submersible 1 meter, 30 minutes). SUPERIOR AUDIO FEATURES *

0.5 W high audio speaker 2-mic noise canceling technology Utilizes Windows XP, Vista and Windows 7

Customer programming software
3.2 3600 OR 9600 TRUNKING BAUD SINGLE SYSTEM MOTOROLA OR EQUAL QA02756 OR EQUAL 1 EA 51 146.10
33 ADVANCED SYSTEM KEY - HARDWARE KEY MOTOROLA OR EQUAL QA01648 OR EQUAL 1 EA 3.65
3.4 APX 02 CONTROL HEAD (GREY) MOTOROLA OR EQUAL GA00804 OR EQUAL 1 EA 359.16
35 CONTROL HEAD SOFTWARE MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G444 OR EQUAL 1 EA sooo $000
3.6 DASH MOUNT MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G66 OR EQUAL 1 EA 591‘25
3.7 CONTROL STATION DESK GCAI MIC MOTOROLA OR EQUAL W382 OR EQUAL 1 EA §123_37
3.8 3 YEAR SERVICE FROM THE START LITE MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G24 OR EQUAL 1 EA 5131‘00
3.9  CONTROLSTATION POWER SUPPLY MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G91 OR EQUAL 1 EA $196.37
3.10 CONTROL STATION OPERATION MOTOROLA OR EQUAL W665 OR EQUAL 1 EA 551‘10
3.11 OVER THE AIR PROVISIONING MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G996 OR EQUAL 1 EA 73.00
3.12  MULTIPLE KEY ENCRYPTION OPERATION MOTOROLA OR EQUAL W969 OR EQUAL 1 EA 240.90
313  AESENCRYPTION APX MOTOROLA OR EQUAL G843 OR EQUAL 1 EA 346.75
3.14  WIDEBAND FIBERGLASS OMNI ANTENNA 74 MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSMFBW7463 OREQUAL 1 EA $254.04 $305.00
3.15 ANTENNA MOUNTING BRACKET MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSMMK12 OR EQUAL 1 EA 523‘36 SZSOO
3.16 LATNM-PSA TYPE N MALE PS FOR 1/2 IN-TOP MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DDN1088 OR EQUAL 1 EA §14.73 $1600
3.17 LDF4-50A CABLE: 1/2" LDF HELIAX POL MOTOROLA OR EQUAL L1705 OR EQUAL 1 EA SOOO sOOO $220
3.18 221213 CABLE WRAP WEATHERPROOFING MOTOROLA OR EQUAL TDN9289 OR EQUAL 1 EA §15.20 $1700
3.19 SG12-06B2A 1/2" SURE GROUND MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSSG1206B2A OR EQUAL 1 EA 16.75 $1800
3.20 L4TNF-PSATYPE N FEMALE PS FOR 1/2-BOTTOM MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DDN1089 OR EQUAL 1 EA 14.75 $18.00
3.21 RF SPD, 125-1000MHZ DC BLOCK FLANGE MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSISS0NXC2MA OR EQUAL 1 EA §60_59 56500
3.22 FITNM-HC 1/4" TYPE N MALE CONNECTOR MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DDN97698B OR EQUAL 1 EA §20.00 §20.00
3.23 FSJ1-50A CABLE: 1/4" SUPERFLEX POLY MOTOROLA OR EQUAL L1700 OR EQUAL 1 EA SOOO sOOO SZOO
3.24 FIMU 1/4" MINI UHF MALE S FLEX CONN MOTOROLA OR EQUAL DSF1MU OR EQUAL 1 EA $1800 §17.00
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034
BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line Responding Supplier Supplier Notes
3.17 TRI-COUNTY COMMUNICATIONS $2.20 PER FOOT
3.23 TRI-COUNTY COMMUNICATIONS $2.00 PER FOOT

Page 9
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PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034
BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Att #

Attribute Name

BK Technologies, Inc.

hdc video and
communications dba (Maria
del Castillo LLC)

MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC

TRI-COUNTY
COMMUNICATIONS

66

67
68

69

Business/Company Owner Name
Please provide the complete name of the business/company owner
responding to the bid/proposal.

Date of Establishment
Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications?

If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please

specify deviations:
(Please also complete and attach Form B - Deviations from
SpecificationsCompliance Signature Form to this bid response.)

BK Technologies, Inc.

1947
Yes

Please see Attachment 1-
Deviations under
attachments

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / MARCH 9, 2020

Maria Del Castillo LLC

05/01/2018
No

no deviations

Page 10

MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS, INC

10/17/2011
Yes

FOR PROPER OPERATIONS

Robert McALLEN

1982
No

No deviation




PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034
BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

Per conversation with Jesus Cavazos-OK to submit with $0 response
total showing. We bid alternative items and they system does not

BK Technologies, Inc. Stacey Dee sdee@bktechnologies.com calculate totals on alternative items.
hdc video and communications maria del castillo mariadelcastillo.llc@gmail.com
MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC James L. Ewing JLEWING1@stcradios.com
THIS BID DOES NOT INCLUDE ANY LABOR - NO LINE ITEMS
TRI-COUNTY COMMUNICATION! JADA LYNN VALDEZ jvaldez@tri-countycom.com REQUESTING LABOR.
Page 11
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Participation Summary - As of 02/27/2020

Participant Name

Response Date Response Status

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034

BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Contact

BK Technologies, Inc. 11/14/2019
hdc video and communications dba 11/18/2019

MOTOROLA SOLUTIONS INC 11/18/2019
TRI-COUNTY COMMUNICATIONS  11/18/2019
Mobile Relays LLC (Ledesma)

SOUTH TEXAS COMMUNICATIONS,

AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV 11/15/2019

Audio Visual Aids (Audio Visual Aid« 11/05/2019
Full Compass (Full Compass System 11/04/2019
M&A Technology (M&A Technolog' 11/04/2019
BuckHorn Construction LLC

CJIS GROUP

Communications ETC (Valeric, LLC)
ConstructConnect

Deltek

Discount Two-Way Radio Corporati
Global Industrial (Global Equipment
Holzberg Communications, INc.
Howard Technology Solutions (How
LTR Construction

Mercer Technologies Firm

Patina Fire & Safety

royal media network inc.

RUSH TRUCK CENTER, PHARR (Rust
School Specialty, Inc.

The Don Hume Company, LLC

The PlanIT Room

Wolverine Sports, Schoolmasters (¢
1.50 Cleaners lic Dba fat cat signs
9TO 5 COMPUTER

AV Pro, Inc.

ABC Custom Advertising (Marketing
Advanced Communications & Cabli
Aeries Software

AITA CONSULTING SERVICES,INC
All American Poly

AllPlayers Network Inc. (Rank One ¢
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS

AM Utilities and Construction LLC
AMSYS Innovative Solutions LLC
Applied Industrial Technologies
Artcom Communications (Artcom A
AssetGenie, Inc. DBA AGiRepair anc
AT&T Corp

AUDIO RESOURCE GROUP, INC (AU
aves audio visual systems, inc.
Beneftifocus

Best Buy For Business (Best Buy Stc
Blue Sky Enterprises

Butler Business Products

C&H Distributors, LLC

CDW Government LLC

CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS

Circle Industries Inc.

Clary Business Machines (Sufian Mt
Compostology LLC

Connections Education Pearson On
Construction Bid Source (Plan Roor
Construction Journal LLC

Copy Graphics Inc.

Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Con
Cytek Media Systems, Inc.

Decisin Tree Inc.

Dell EMC

Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.
DocuNav Solutions (VP Imaging, Inc
DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTF
ECOEFFECT

Econ Group, LLC

Flaghouse Inc

Floral Park Consulting LLC
Greenwood Office Outfitters

HP Financial Services (Hewlett Pack
Indeco

INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNOVA
Insight

Insight Public Sector (Sawyers)

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Unsubmitted
Unsubmitted
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed

Stacey Dee
Maria del Castillo
JAMES L. EWING

Isaac Ledesma
JAMES L. EWING
Javier Olmos
Ron George
Brian Kaphingst
Donna Shepard
Chad Bishop
Mariah Elliott

Source Management
Stoyan Varbanov
William Rose

Andy Holzberg
Rebecca Dearman
Roy Perez

Garrett Mercer

irene diaz

Mario M. Trevino
Accounts Receivable
Gail Wiford

Cecilia Hernandez

samuel avila
RICHARD RAAB
Heather Winkelman
Martha J Miller
Kent Taylor

KEVIN KUMAR
Brian Mann

Roberto Morales
Chuck Williams

Tina Covalesky
Hector Orellana
Melonie Olson
ANGIE GOMEZ

Alonzo Acosta
Stacy Duke
William Rose
Mike Smith
DAVID BARRERA
Joel Hilliard

Kash Nathan

Pamela Exton
David Valdez
Baldomero Gonzalez
Steve Patton
Brent Lawson

Sandra Salinas
Shannon Fellows
MICHAEL GUZMAN
Alejandro Alanis
Gilbert Enriquez
John Holt

Robert Rosalez
Paul Hermann

Martin Pena

Darak Weaver

City
MELBOURNE
mcallen
CHICAGO
WESLACO
MCALLEN
MCALLEN
McAllen

San Antonio
Madison
Carrolton
Harlingen
Tallahassee
McAllen
Cincinnati
Herndon
Compton
Chicago
Totowa
Birmingham
Pharr

Gary
MCALLEN
WINDSOR MIL
Pharr
Greenville
Miami

El Paso

Ann Arbor
mcallen
Jacksonville Beach
DeSoto
McAllen
Georgetown
Plano
NORTH BRUNSWICK
Piscataway
Sanger
edinburg
Mission
Houston
Pharr

San Antonio
Greensburg
McAllen
WEST FARGO
SUGAR LAND
Charleston
Richfield

La Blanca
Houston
Chicago
Vernon Hills
MCALLEN
Houston

San Diego
Waco
Columbia
Felton
Stuart
McAllen
Pharr
Topeka

El Paso
Round Rock
Palmhurst
Frisco
PHARR
McAllen
Edinburg
Hasbrouck Heights
Floral Park
Fort Worth
Berkeley Heights
Belton
McAllen
McAllen,
Tempe
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State Invitation Type

FL
X
IL
X
X
X
X
X
Wi
X
X
FL
X
OH
VA
CA
IL
NJ
AL
X
IN
X
MD
X
Wi
OK
X
MI
X
FL
X
X
X
X
NJ
NJ
X
X
X
X
X
X
PA
X
ND
X
SC
MN
X
X
IL
IL
X
X
CA
X
MD
CA
FL
X
X
KS
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
NJ
NY
X
NJ
X
X
X
AZ

Invitation Date

Manual
Manual
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic

Automatic

Automatic
Automatic

Automatic

Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

TAKEN TO BOARD OF EDUCATION / MARCH 9, 2020

11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019

11/01/2019
11/01/2019

11/01/2019

11/01/2019
11/01/2019

11/01/2019

11/01/2019

11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019
11/01/2019

Owner

Timothy A. Vitou / President
Maria Del Castillo / Owner
Greg Borwn / CEO

Robert A. McAllen / Owner



Participation Summary - As of 02/27/2020

Participant Name

Intech Southwest Services

Istation (Imagination Station, Inc.)
IT RECYCLING GROUP

JANGA Technology LLC

Jostens, Inc.

Learning Services International Inc
Lesson Planet (Education Planet Inc
Lexine Inc

Library Video Company d/b/a SAFA
Lightspeed Technologies, Inc.

Little Giants Learning Center
Logical Front

Manning Navcomp Inc

maxi aids

MJR EDUCATIONAL SUPPLIES
Netsync Network Solutions

Office Depot, Inc

OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC

PCMG, Inc.

PCPC Direct

Pemica Inc

Perez Technologies

Prime Systems

Promo Solutions

Public Consulting Group Inc

Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Compu
Romo Contractors, LLC

Safeguard Fire & Security

School Outfitters

SHI international

Skyward, Inc

Smartcom Telephone, LLC.
SmartSchool Sytems

Solid IT Networks, Inc

Southern Computer Warehouse, In
Strongline Security & Fire (Luis Alfo
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder Enterg
TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC)
Technology Integration Group

The Library Store, Inc.

Total Seminars, LLC.

Triggers Media

Trinity3 Technology

Troxell Communications, Inc.
Universal Adaptive Consulting Servi
UNIVERSAL FIRE SYSTEMS

Urban TV's

Vanguard IT Solutions LLC
VCRNOW (Visual Candy Resources
Vertex Marketing

Vets Securing America

Videotex Systems, Inc.

Virtucom, Inc.

Visceral lllumination Code LLC (VIS(
VTX1 Companies (VTX Communicat
WalkerCom, Inc.

Walmart Inc

Zonar Systems

Zones,LLC

Response Date Response Status

PHARR-SAN JUAN-ALAMO 1.S.D.
PORTABLE RADIOS AND EQUIPMENT FOR PSJA ISD POLICE DEPARTMENT BID # 19-20-034

BID OPENING: NOVEMBER 18, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Contact City
san antonio
Monika Flood Dallas
Kay Ramon GEORGETOWN
Andrea Anguiano Pharr
Carlos Trejo Chicago
Donna Villena Springfield
Lori O'Connell Santa Barbara
Frank Martinez McAllen
West Conshohocken
Melissa Williams Tualatin
Alamo
Adrian villalba Villalba SANDY
Michael Wells Austin
angela giglio farmingdfale
Houston
Xavier Trevino McAllen
Nadia Garza La Feria
Lucia Valdez HARLINGEN
Elanie Bungay Los Angeles
Frank Parent Houston
Elvis Jimenez Miami
Mario Perez Mission
HOUSTON
Frisco
Maureen Farrell Boston
McAllen
Romo Contractors LLC Laredo
Daniel Backhaus Mission
Cincinnati
Austin
Darcy Grabski Stevens Point
Robert Sanchez McAllen
David Walling Kingwood
Staci Giddings Dallas
Julia Stewart Marietta
San Juan
McAllen
JOSH BOX BIRMINGHAM
San Antonio
Shayla Hill TREMONT
Kathy Yale Houston
Bobby Villarreal McAllen
Kendell Rickman Saint Paul
Trenton Brackley Phoenix
Valencia S. Hicks Henrico
HENRY CHAVES JR WESLACO
Gilberto Rocha Palmview
Pedro Sandoval brownsville
Jeff Andersen Red Oak
Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford
San Antonio
Dika Causevic Dallas
Tim Prince Peachtree Corners
VISCERAL ILLUMINATI Edinburg
Linda Garza Raymondville
Ray Saldivar Pearland
Bentonvile
Christian Jacobsen Seattle
Asad ljaz Auburn
Page 13

State
X
X
X
X
IL
OR
CA
X
PA
OR
X
uTt
X
NY
X
X
X
X
CA
X
FL
X
X
X
MA
X
X
X
OH
X
Wi
X
X
X
GA
X
X
AL
X
IL
X
X
MN
AZ
VA
X
X
X
X
X
X
X
GA
X
X
X
AR
WA
WA

Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
Automatic 11/01/2019
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