
PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Event Number # 19-20-039 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Event Title Request for Proposals (RFP's) for Industry Based Certification Programs for Workgroup Purchasing

Event Description the Career & Technical Education (CATE) Department Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type RFP Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us

Issue Date 12/20/2019 04:19:59 PM (CT) Phone

Close Date 1/7/2020 03:00:00 PM (CT) Fax

Recommendation:    That the Board of Education award the Industry Based Certification Programs for the Career & Technical Education (CATE) Department 

# 19-20-039 to the highest ranked proposer  listed below:

Name City State Classifications Lines Awarded Award Total Award Reason

Rio Grande Valley College Pharr TX 3 $3,200.00

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing Linda Uribe, Executive Officer for College Readiness

Four Hundred Nine (409) invitations were emailed to vendors

Ten (10) Vendors viewed Proposal Specifications

Three (3) Submitted Proposal

Two (2) Unsubmitted Proposal

Fourteen (14) No Proposal
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Line Qty UOM Description Award Response Award Qty Awarded Supplier Award Reason
1 1 EA Services Requested for Phlebotomy Technician: 

The number of students to be trained is currently unavailable. This will be 

determined on student interest. Your proposal must include max capacity for our 

students. 

 

Proposals are expected to detail how their proposed student training services will 

result in the attainment of the Phlebotomy Technician Certification. 

 

Proposals will be responsible for the plan and design of the classes, but must be in 

compliance with the certifying entity laws and regulations. Design should include 

the following: 

  

	* Fees for background checks 

	* Insurance 

	* Tuition 

	* Books and/or other required instructional materials 

	* Equipment and supplies 

	* Uniforms for students 

	* Any and all fees for certification test, licenses and permits 

	* Job placement assistance  

 

In addition, the facilitator will be responsible for classroom set up, registration, 

printing and office supplies, instructional resources, class evaluation and tracking 

students attendance. 

 

PSJA ISD will provide transportation for students to and from the proposal's training 

location.

$1,200.00 1 Rio Grande Valley College HIGHEST RANKED 

PROPOSER

2 1 EA Services Requested for Certified Nurses Aide/Assistant: 

The number of students to be trained is currently unavailable. This will be 

determined on student interest. Your proposal must include max capacity for our 

students. 

 

Proposals are expected to detail how their proposed student trainingservices will 

result in the attainment of the Certified Nurses Aide/Assistant (CNA). 

 

Proposals will be responsible for the plan and design of the classes, but must be in 

compliance with the certifying entity laws and regulations. Design should include 

the following: 

  

	* Fees for background checks 

	* Insurance 

	* Tuition 

	* Books and/or other required instructional materials 

	* Equipment and supplies 

	* Uniforms for students 

	* Any and all fees for certification test, licenses and permits 

	* Job placement assistance  

 

In addition, the facilitator will be responsible for classroom set up, registration, 

printing and office supplies, instructional resources, class evaluation and tracking 

students attendance. 

 

PSJA ISD will provide transportation for students to and from the proposal's training 

location.

$800.00 1 Rio Grande Valley College HIGHEST RANKED 

PROPOSER

3 1 EA Services Requested for Certified EKG/ECG Technician: 

The number of students to be trained is currently unavailable. This will be 

determined on student interest. Your proposal must include max capacity for our 

students. 

 

Proposals are expected to detail how their proposed studenttrainingservices will 

result in the attainment of the Certified EKG/ECG Technician Certification. 

 

Proposals will be responsible for the plan and design of the classes, but must be in 

compliance with the certifying entity laws and regulations. Design should include 

the following: 

  

	* Fees for background checks 

	* Insurance 

	* Tuition 

	* Books and/or other required instructional materials 

	* Equipment and supplies 

	* Uniforms for students 

	* Any and all fees for certification test, licenses and permits 

	* Job placement assistance  

 

In addition, the facilitator will be responsible for classroom set up, registration, 

printing and office supplies, instructional resources, class evaluation and tracking 

students attendance. 

 

PSJA ISD will provide transportation for students to and from the proposal's training 

location.

$1,200.00 1 Rio Grande Valley College HIGHEST RANKED 

PROPOSER
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Total Price $3,438.00 Total Price $3,200.00 Total Price $0.00

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Services Requested for Phlebotomy Technician: The number 

of students to be trained is currently unavailable. This will 

be determined on student interest. Your proposal must 

include max capacity for our students.  Proposals are 

expected to detail how their proposed student training 

services will result in the attainment of the Phlebotomy 

Technician Certification.  Proposals will be responsible for 

the plan and design of the classes, but must be in 

compliance with the certifying entity laws and regulations. 

Design should include the following:   * Fees for background 

checks * Insurance * Tuition * Books and/or other required 

instructional materials * Equipment and supplies * Uniforms 

for students * Any and all fees for certification test, licenses 

and permits * Job placement assistance   In addition, the 

facilitator will be responsible for classroom set up, 

registration, printing and office supplies, instructional 

resources, class evaluation and tracking students 

attendance.  PSJA ISD will provide transportation for 

students to and from the proposal's training location.

1 EA $1,229.00 $1,229.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

2 Services Requested for Certified Nurses Aide/Assistant: The 

number of students to be trained is currently unavailable. 

This will be determined on student interest. Your proposal 

must include max capacity for our students.  Proposals are 

expected to detail how their proposed student 

trainingservices will result in the attainment of the Certified 

Nurses Aide/Assistant (CNA).  Proposals will be responsible 

for the plan and design of the classes, but must be in 

compliance with the certifying entity laws and regulations. 

Design should include the following:   * Fees for background 

checks * Insurance * Tuition * Books and/or other required 

instructional materials * Equipment and supplies * Uniforms 

for students * Any and all fees for certification test, licenses 

and permits * Job placement assistance   In addition, the 

facilitator will be responsible for classroom set up, 

registration, printing and office supplies, instructional 

resources, class evaluation and tracking students 

attendance.  PSJA ISD will provide transportation for 

students to and from the proposal's training location.

1 EA $1,020.00 $1,020.00 $800.00 $800.00

3 Services Requested for Certified EKG/ECG Technician: The 

number of students to be trained is currently unavailable. 

This will be determined on student interest. Your proposal 

must include max capacity for our students.  Proposals are 

expected to detail how their proposed 

studenttrainingservices will result in the attainment of the 

Certified EKG/ECG Technician Certification.  Proposals will 

be responsible for the plan and design of the classes, but 

must be in compliance with the certifying entity laws and 

regulations. Design should include the following:   * Fees for 

background checks * Insurance * Tuition * Books and/or 

other required instructional materials * Equipment and 

supplies * Uniforms for students * Any and all fees for 

certification test, licenses and permits * Job placement 

assistance   In addition, the facilitator will be responsible for 

classroom set up, registration, printing and office supplies, 

instructional resources, class evaluation and tracking 

students attendance.  PSJA ISD will provide transportation 

for students to and from the proposal's training location.

1 EA $1,189.00 $1,189.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

UNITED CHEMISTRYRio Grande Valley 

College 
(Lan-Rod Investments, LLC)

New Start School

AWARDED
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Line Responding Supplier Supplier Notes

1 New Start School This bid includes course of $999, exam for $160 and Books at $70.00

2 New Start School This price includes course at $825.00, State Exam $125.00 and Books $70.00

3 New Start School Includes course for $959.00, state exam $160.00 and Books are $70.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Att # Attribute Name UNITED CHEMISTRY Rio Grande Valley College 
(Lan-Rod Investments, LLC)

New Start School

66 Business/Company Owner Name
Please provide the complete name of the business/company 

owner responding to the bid/proposal.

Iram Alejandro Lopez Dr. Annabelle Palomo 

Rodriguez

New Start School Enedelia 

Sobrevilla and Jose Ricardo 

Sobrevilla

67 Date of Establishment 03/25/2019 June 2008 09-1996

68 Will the bid/proposal deviate from 

specifications?

No No No

69 If no please state "No deviation", if yes, 

please specify deviations:
(Please also complete and attach Form B - Deviations from 

SpecificationsCompliance Signature Form to this bid 

response.)

NO Deviation No deviation No deviation
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

New Start School J. Ricardo Sobrevilla s1575director@newstartschool.org

Rio Grande Valley College (Lan-Rod Investments, LLC)Annabelle Palomo Rodriguezbibarra@rgvcollege.edu

UNITED CHEMISTRY Iram A.Lopez unitedchemistry1@gmail.com To whom it may concern,

My name is Iram Lopez Owner and Instructor of United Chemistry. I 

am sending this email in regards to offer a 90 hr Phlebotomy training 

program here locally in Pharr, Texas which will give an opportunity 

for the student to sit for a test through NHA.This 90-hour 

Phlebotomy Technician Program prepares professionals to collect 

blood specimens from clients for the purpose of laboratory analysis. 

Students will become familiar with all aspects related to blood 

collection and develop comprehensive skills to perform 

venipunctures completely and safely. Classroom and lab work 

includes terminology, anatomy and physiology; blood collection 

procedures; specimen hands-on practice; and training in skills and 

techniques to perform puncture methods.
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 01/10/2020

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner

New Start School 01/07/2020 Submitted J. Ricardo Sobrevilla McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019 Enedelia Sobrevilla and 

Jose Ricardo Sobrevilla
Rio Grande Valley College (Lan-

Rod Investments, LLC)

01/06/2020 Submitted Belinda Ibarra Pharr TX Dr. Annabelle Palomo Rodriguez

UNITED CHEMISTRY 01/06/2020 Submitted Iram Lopez Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019 Irma Alejandro Lopez
Meraki Institute of Beauty and Wellness, LLC Unsubmitted Belinda Ibarra Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Nylynn Cosmetics Unsubmitted Gregg Gochneaur Lewisville TX
AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV 01/03/2020 No Bid Javier Olmos McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Audio Visual Aids (Audio Visual Aids Co)12/20/2019 No Bid Ron George San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Bedford, Freeman & Worth Publishing Group, LLC12/23/2019 No Bid Atlanta GA Automatic 12/20/2019
Bio Corpration (Bio Company Inc) 12/23/2019 No Bid Rebecca Hedstrom Alexandria MN Automatic 12/20/2019
Blick Art Materials (Blick Art Materials LLC)12/26/2019 No Bid Greg Fordyce Chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Gumdrop Books (Central Programs Inc.)12/23/2019 No Bid Nancy Crovetti Bethany MO Automatic 12/20/2019
Lakeshore Learning Materials (Lakeshore Equipment Company)12/23/2019 No Bid Rafael Muro CARSON CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Mentoring Minds, L.P. 01/06/2020 No Bid Sarah Lindsey Tyler TX Automatic 12/20/2019
MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY PRODUCTS (MIDWEST SHOP SUPPLIES INC)12/23/2019 No Bid ARLENE KENNEDY SIOUX CITY IA Automatic 12/20/2019
PRESTWICK HOUSE, INC. 12/23/2019 No Bid Sue Thomas CLAYTON DE Automatic 12/20/2019
Superior Text 12/23/2019 No Bid Rick Scott Ypsilanti MI Automatic 12/20/2019
Textbook Warehouse (Textbook Warehouse, LLC)01/02/2020 No Bid Patricia Walters Alpharetta GA Automatic 12/20/2019
Tobii Dynavox LLC 12/23/2019 No Bid Pittsburgh PA Automatic 12/20/2019
Youthlight, Inc. 01/02/2020 No Bid Sandra C. McCarthy Chapin SC Automatic 12/20/2019
Certiport, a business of NCS Pearson, Inc. (NCS Pearson, Inc.)Viewed American Fork UT Automatic 12/20/2019
CEV Multimedia, Ltd. Viewed Karen Crowell, ControllerLubbock TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ConstructConnect Viewed Cincinnati OH
C-Tech Associates Inc. Viewed Sparta NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Deltek Viewed Source Management Herndon VA Automatic 12/20/2019
Franklin Covey Client Sales Inc. Viewed Tom Osborn Salt Lake City UT Automatic 12/20/2019
Mercer Technologies Firm Viewed Garrett Mercer Gary IN
Pearson K12 Learning LLC Viewed Beverly Miller Hoboken NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Scantron Corporation Viewed Michelle Nira Eagan MN Automatic 12/20/2019
Total Seminars, LLC. Viewed Kathy Yale Houston TX Automatic 12/20/2019
A Pass Educational Group, LLC Nicole Quigley Union Lake MI Automatic 12/20/2019
A+ Enterprises Nora Resendez Weslaco TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ABDO Publishing Company Minneapolis MN Automatic 12/20/2019
Abecedarian ABC, LLC Andrie Cantu Austin TX Automatic 12/20/2019
AbleNet Jen Thalhuber Roseville MN Automatic 12/20/2019
Academic Therapy Pub/High Noon Books (Ward) Nichelle Ward Novato CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Accelerate Learning Inc. LaMonique' Johnson Houston TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ACCO Brands USA LLC (ACCO Brands Corporation) Customer Care Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
AccuCut, LLC Bobi Jensen Omaha NE Automatic 12/20/2019
ACE Educational Supplies Inc Vicki Szabo Davie FL Automatic 12/20/2019
Ace Promotions Pat Garcia San Benito TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Achieve3000, Inc. Erin Rush Red Bank NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Acorn Naturalists (The Acorn Group, Inc.) Mika Stonehawk Tustin CA Automatic 12/20/2019
ACP Direct (Affordable Computer Products, Inc.) Vanessa Morris Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Agile Mind Educational Holdings, Inc. Laurie Mayhan Grapevine TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Alamo A+ Academy Oralia Castaneda Donna TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Alamo Iron Works (Alamo Distribution, LLC) Stacey B Sims Alpharetta GA Automatic 12/20/2019
Alamo Music Center Brian Parks San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ALGY COSTUMES & UNIFORMS Melissa Blackwood Hallandale FL Automatic 12/20/2019
All American Poly Piscataway NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
All Valley Victory Sports Apparel, Inc. (Graciela Vela) Gracy Vela La Blanca TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
America Team Sports Matt Smith Richardson TX Automatic 12/20/2019
American Band Accessories LLC Michael Rodden Nixa MO Automatic 12/20/2019
American Ceramic Supply Company Ginger Famigletti Fort Worth TX Automatic 12/20/2019
American Reading Company Shana Holmes King of Prussia PA Automatic 12/20/2019
Amplify Education, Inc. Brooklyn NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Amy Hermansen dba Sign Language Services Amy Hermansen McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Apex Learning Inc. Amy Baird Seattle WA Automatic 12/20/2019
ASAP Printing Solutions (O'Conn LLC) Sean O' Connor McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Asel Art Supply Thomas Cicherski Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
AssetGenie, Inc. DBA AGiRepair and AGParts Education (AssetGenie, Inc.)Tina Covalesky Greensburg PA Automatic 12/20/2019
AT&T Corp Hector Orellana McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Attainment Company, Inc. Bid Specialist Verona WI Automatic 12/20/2019
AUDIO RESOURCE GROUP, INC (AUDIO RESOURCE GROUP) Melonie Olson WEST FARGO ND Automatic 12/20/2019
Augmentative Communication Consultants Inc. Millie Telega Moon Township, PAPA Automatic 12/20/2019
B.E. Publishing (Mainville) Erin Mainville Warwick RI Automatic 12/20/2019
Ballard & Tighe, Publishers (Educational IDEAS, Inc.) Nancie Lafferty Brea CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Barnes & Noble Booksellers, Inc. Cari Cangialosi Atlanta GA Automatic 12/20/2019
Batts Audio, Video & Lighting AJ Meadows Denison TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Bearport Publishing Kathryn Camisa New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Becker's School Supplies (Charles J. Becker & Bro., Inc.) Pennsauken NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Benchmark Education Company LLC Nolen S Harris NEW ROCHELLE NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Best Buy For Business (Best Buy Stores, L.P.) Richfield MN Automatic 12/20/2019
Bilingual Planet Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Blue Sky Enterprises Alonzo Acosta La Blanca TX Automatic 12/20/2019
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 01/10/2020

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner
BOUND TO STAY BOUND BOOKS, INC. LORI SMITH JACKSONVILLE IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Breakout EDU Old Bethpage NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Brewster's Guacamaya Enterprises Frank Brewster III Mission TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Brilliant Education (Nancy Barocio) Nancy Barocio San Juan TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Brook Mays Music (Universal Melody Services LLC) Mickey Hartzog DALLAS TX Automatic 12/20/2019
BSN Sports, LLC (Varsity Brands Holding Co., Inc.) AR Department Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
bulb, Inc. David Hughey Lafayette CO Automatic 12/20/2019
Burning Light Designs, LLC (Felipe Guerra) Felipe Guerra Alamo TX Automatic 12/20/2019
C&H Distributors, LLC William Rose Chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Capstone (Coughlan Companies LLC) Cathy Carlson Chcago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
CARNEGIE LEARNING, INC. Proposal Manager Pittsburgh PA Automatic 12/20/2019
Carolina Biological Supply Co. Burlington NC Automatic 12/20/2019
Cascade School Supples Todd Shafer North Adams MA Automatic 12/20/2019
Cavendish Square OR Cavendish Square Digital (Cavendish Square Publishing, LLC)Jenny Speed New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Cengage Learning, Inc Customer Service RepresentativeChicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Children's Plus Inc. Beecher IL Automatic 12/20/2019
CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS DAVID BARRERA MCALLEN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Cindy Sandoval Picture Perfect Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Classic Images Photos and AWARDSS (garcia) Jesse Garcia Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019
CLASSROOM LIBRARY COMPANY ben conn St Louis MO Automatic 12/20/2019
Clint and Sons (Freeman Bros. Inc.) Alisa Scalise White Deer TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Cobb Pediatric Therapy Services April Fox Kennesaw GA Automatic 12/20/2019
Cognia Alpharetta GA Automatic 12/20/2019
Cognitive Development and Communication LLC Consulting Services San Juan TX Automatic 12/20/2019
COMPLETE BOOK AND MEDIA SUPPLY, LLC Bill Forrester CEDAR PARK TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Construction Journal LLC Pamela Exton Stuart FL Automatic 12/20/2019
CONSTRUCTIVE PLAYTHINGS (U.S. TOY COMPANY, INC.) Customer Service GRANDVIEW MO Automatic 12/20/2019
Copy Graphics Inc. David Valdez McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Copy Plus LLC Lorissa Pecina MC ALLEN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Cosenza & Associates, LLC Paul Gray Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Cox Subscriptions, Inc. (W.T. Cox Information services) Debra M Knox Shallotte NC Automatic 12/20/2019
Crabtree Publishing Greg Escue New Yoirk NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Crisis Prevention Institute, Inc. Heather Walters Milwaukee WI Automatic 12/20/2019
Curriculum Associates, LLC Jackie Sullivan North Billerica MA Automatic 12/20/2019
Custom Sportswear, Inc. Ron Duzenski Sewell NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Cyrgus Co. LLC Mickey Kinney Omaha NE Automatic 12/20/2019
Dance Sophisticates lee Gibson Indianapolis IN Automatic 12/20/2019
DBA Cherry Lake Publishing/DBA Sleeping Bear Press (CBM LLC) Mary Randall North Mankato MN Automatic 12/20/2019
dba Stenhouse Publishers and dba Staff Development for Educators (SDE, Inc.)Jennifer J. Selby Portsmouth NH Automatic 12/20/2019
Del Alma Publications, LLC Maricia Rodriguez Zapata TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Delaney Educational Enterprises Beecher IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Delgado Guitars (Delgado Guitars, LLC) Tyler Wells Nashville TN Automatic 12/20/2019
Demco, Inc. Kim Satterlee Madison WI Automatic 12/20/2019
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc. Sandra Salinas Palmhurst TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Dinah Might Adventures, LP Brenda Schultz San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Discount School Supply (Earlychildhood LLC) Michelle Leeman Carol Stream CA Automatic 12/20/2019
DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS, PHARR MICHAEL GUZMAN PHARR TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Don Johnston Incorporated Baylee Royal Volo IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Doylene & Associates,Inc (Doylene & Associates, Inc) Doylene Escue BROOKSHIRE, TEXASTX Automatic 12/20/2019
Dr. Isaias C. Rodriguez Mission TX Automatic 12/20/2019
DreamBox Learning, Inc. Lori Hahn Bellevue WA Automatic 12/20/2019
Dual Language Training Institute (Leo Gomez and Consultants, LLC) Dr. Leo Gomez Edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
DynaStudy, Inc. Ellen Harris Marble Falls TX Automatic 12/20/2019
EAI EDUCATION (Eric Armin Inc.) Mary Payne BOSTON NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Early Spanish Reading (49R Ventures) Robert Ramirez McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Economy Award Co. Delmita TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ECS Learning Systems (Asteria Education, Inc.) Shawndell Byers Bulverde TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Education Plus Mark Jarrett Lafayette CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Educational Innovations, Inc Jennifer Zambello / BookkeeperBETHEL CT Automatic 12/20/2019
Educational Testing Service Princeton NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
ELITE PROMOTIONS Rossy Galarza Brownsville TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Emma Saenz (Emma Leona Saenz) Emma L Saenz MCALLEN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Encore Data Products, Inc. (Burgess) Jeff Burgess Lafayette CO Automatic 12/20/2019
ENFANT JORDI DAYCARE AND LEARNING CENTER LLC ANGELA MARIA CORTEZ RODRIGUEZSAN JUAN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
engage2learn (Engage! Learning, Inc.) Jaime Cooper Portland TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Enslow Publishing, LLC Jenny Speed New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
ePrep, Inc. Princeton NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Escue & Associates (Lektro, Inc.) Greg Escue Robstown TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ExploreLearning, LLC Accounts Receivable Boston MA Automatic 12/20/2019
Express Booksellers (Express Booksellers, LLC) Jule Maxwell Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Express Readers (Express Readers Inc.) Elise M Lovejoy Pasadena CA Automatic 12/20/2019
FISHER SCIENCE EDUCATION (Fisher Scientific Co LLC (Fisher Science Education Business Unit)) Atlanta GA Automatic 12/20/2019
Fitness Finders Inc Ann Brown JACKSON MI Automatic 12/20/2019
Flinn Scientific Inc Jim Nesbit Batavia IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Follett School Solutions, Inc. Sarah Eisenhauer McHenry IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Forde-Ferrier, LLC Hector Rivera San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Foundations In Teaching (Rogelio Gomez Jr.) Rogelio Gomez Jr. Mission TX Automatic 12/20/2019
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR INDUSTRY BASED CERTIFICATION PROGRAMS FOR THE CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION (CATE) DEPARTMENT # 19-20-039

RFP OPENING: JANUARY 7, 2020 @ 3:00 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 01/10/2020

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner
Frog Publications, Inc Wendy Alli San Antonio FL Automatic 12/20/2019
Frog Street Press, LLC Robin Rosen Southlake TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Gareth Stevens Publishing OR Gareth Stevens Classroom OR Gareth Stevens Digital (Gareth Stevens Publishing, LLLP)Jenny Speed New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Garrett Book Company (Garrett Operating Company LLC) Cheryl York Ada OK Automatic 12/20/2019
Goodheart-Willcox Publisher (The Goodheart-Willcox Company, Inc.) Tinley Park IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Great Beginnings Childcare (Garza) Gracie Garza San Juan TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Greenhaven Press, Lucent Books, Kidhaven Press (Greenhaven Publishing LLC)Jenny Speed New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Greenwood Office Outfitters Robert Rosalez Fort Worth TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Hameray Publishing Group, Inc. Kevin Yuen Los Angeles TX Automatic 12/20/2019
hand2mind, Inc. Rashonda Carroll Vernon Hills IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Harcourt Outlines, Inc. (Harcourt Industries, Inc.) Darlene R. Marlow Milroy IN Automatic 12/20/2019
Hasty Awards Thad O'Connor Ottawa KS Automatic 12/20/2019
Hatch, Inc Sales Operations Winston-Salem NC Automatic 12/20/2019
Heinemann (Greenwood Publishing LLC) Lori Lampert Portsmouth NH Automatic 12/20/2019
HERFF JONES Luis J. Garza McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Hermes Trading Co., Inc. dba Hermes Music Eduardo Zamorano Jr. Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Hexagramm Books (Hexagramm US LLC) Robert Celic Decatur GA Automatic 12/20/2019
Hodges Badge Company, Inc Allison Abgrab Portsmouth RI Automatic 12/20/2019
Hoonuit, LLC Carrie Hannigan Little Falls MN Automatic 12/20/2019
Houghton Mifflin Harcourt Publishing Company Shawn Weirather Geneva IL Automatic 12/20/2019
HP Financial Services (Hewlett Packard Financial Services Company, Inc.)Paul Hermann Berkeley Heights NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
HumanWare USA Inc Sarah-Janes Thomas CHICAGO IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Imagery Graphic Systems Matt Tumelson San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Imprint Resources Lisa Schlensker Richardson TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Independent Living Aids LLC Karin Danza Buffalo NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Ingram Library Services LLC (Ingram Industries Inc.) Christi Cunnigham La Vergne TN Automatic 12/20/2019
Insight Darak Weaver McAllen, TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Integral Mathematics, Inc. Kelli Mallory Frisco TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Istation (Imagination Station, Inc.) Monika Flood Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ITSLEARNING INC Newton MA Automatic 12/20/2019
IXL Learning, Inc. Nektaria Klouvidakis San Mateo CA Automatic 12/20/2019
J. Appleseed (The Creative Company) Jason Johnson Mankato MN Automatic 12/20/2019
J.W. Pepper & Son, Inc. Luana Marler Richland Hills TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Jane Schaffer Academic Writing Program (Louis Educational Concepts, LLC)Dr. Deborah E. Louis Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Jarrett Publishing Company Ronkonkoma NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Jostens, Inc. Carlos Trejo Chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Junior Library Guild (MT LIBRARY SERVICES, INC.) Joni Anderson Carol Stream IL Automatic 12/20/2019
K.C. AD SPECIALTIES, INC. Leroy Cadena McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Kagan Professional Development (Armstrong) Lori Allnutt SAN CLEMENTE NV Automatic 12/20/2019
Kagan Publishing (Harman) Hannah Harman San Clemente CA Automatic 12/20/2019
KAMICO Instructional Media (KAMICO Instructional Media, Inc.) Kathy Michael Salado TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Kaplan Early Learning Compnay Terry Floyd Lewisville NC Automatic 12/20/2019
Kelly Reider dba English Learner Portal Kelly Reider Pasadena MD Automatic 12/20/2019
Kent Adhesive Products Company (KAPCO) Shawn Smith Kent OH Automatic 12/20/2019
Keystone Books and Media Beecher IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Kids Immersion, LLC Mt. Hood OR Automatic 12/20/2019
La Hacienda Musica Efrain Munguia Edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Lamac (Trey Gonzalez) TREY GONZALEZ MCALLEN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
lead4ward, LLC Kim Lehman PLANO TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Learning A-Z, LLC Accounts Receivable Boston MA Automatic 12/20/2019
Learning Without Tears Scott Stewart Gaithersburg MD Automatic 12/20/2019
Learning Zone (Kimco Educational Products Inc.) Michael Rendon San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Lectorum Publications, Inc. Hilda Viskovic Lyndhurst NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Lectura Books, DBA The Latino Family Literacy Project (Lectura, Inc.) Katherine Del Monte South Pasadena CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Lerner Publishing Group Minneapolis MN Automatic 12/20/2019
Lesson Planet (Education Planet Inc.) Lori O'Connell Santa Barbara CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Lexia Learning Systems LLC Carol Keller Concord MA Automatic 12/20/2019
Liberty Source Susan Skaggs AUSTIN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Library Video Company d/b/a SAFARI Montage West ConshohockenPA Automatic 12/20/2019
Limitless Office Products Mita Guha RICHARDSON TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Lincoln Learning Solutions Rochester PA Automatic 12/20/2019
Lisa Torres, Mary Kay Edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Little Giants Learning Center Alamo TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Little Green Apples Designs Inc. Alfredo McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Little Medical School RGV Cinthia Esquivel Mcallen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Lone Star Learning (Lone Star Learning Sales & Marketing, Inc) Lee Ann Evans Lubbock TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Lone Star Percussion (ZNK Partners LLC) Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Lowman Consulting LLC John Lowman Sachse TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Luck's Music Library Sales Department Madison Heights MI Automatic 12/20/2019
Macie Publishing Company Mendham NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Mackin Educational Resources (Mackin Book Company) Grace Mundt Burnsville MN Automatic 12/20/2019
Marie Bou K12 Inc Linda Lulic Plattsburg NY Automatic 12/20/2019
MARK HOSKINS ENTERPRISES LLC Mark Hoskins MCALLEN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Mark My Words LLC (Walker Bookstore) (Mark My Words LLC) Susan Walker Tempe AZ Automatic 12/20/2019
Martha Gomez Martha Gomez McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
MatlScience Inc. Barbara S. Brown Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
maxi aids angela giglio farmingdfale NY Automatic 12/20/2019
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McGraw-Hill School Education, LLC Kimberly Harvey, Sr. Director, RFP, Bids & ContractsColumbus OH Automatic 12/20/2019
Medicaid Finance & Consulting Services (Houston Independent School District)Michael Gonzalez Houston TX Automatic 12/20/2019
MIND Research Institute Irvine CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Mitinet, Inc. Kelly Jo Mouzakis Bethany MO Automatic 12/20/2019
MobyMax John Jennings PITTSBURGH PA Automatic 12/20/2019
Mometrix Media LLC Jason R. (Jay) Willis Beaumont TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Montessori Services Thea Perrone Santa Rosa CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Morris Printing Group, Inc (School Mate) Cari Greenough Kearney NE Automatic 12/20/2019
MRC Jr. UIL Study Materials Jamie Pennington Paradise TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Mrs. Dominga A. Vela Edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
MTM Recognition d/b/a Jostens Awards Darrin Hobaugh Oklahoma City OK Automatic 12/20/2019
Music & Arts (Guitar Center Stores Inc) Lorri Thomas Frederick MD Automatic 12/20/2019
Music in Motion Kristi Graham Plano TX Automatic 12/20/2019
MUSICTIME, INC. Christine Iacovone HADDONFIELD NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
MYVRSPOT (MYVRSPOT, LLC) LISA HARMISON FORT COLLINS CO Automatic 12/20/2019
n2y LLC Jennifer Stout Huron OH Automatic 12/20/2019
Nasco Education LLC (Nasco) Fort Atkinson WI Automatic 12/20/2019
National Art & School Supplies Inc. Rahway NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
National Educational Music Company Mountainside NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
National Educational Systems Sylvia Cantu San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
National Highlights, Inc., dba Mason Crest Publishing Greg Escue Broomall PA Automatic 12/20/2019
NATIONAL SCHOOL PRODUCTS (JOHN C NOWELL) AMY EAKINS MARYVILLE TN Automatic 12/20/2019
Netsync Network Solutions Xavier Trevino McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
New Beginnings Learning Academy #1 Angela Perez Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019
New Leaders Karen Skalitzky New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Newmark Learning, LLC New Rochelle NY Automatic 12/20/2019
NewPath Learning Linda Johanneman Victor NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Newsela, Inc. New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Nick Rail Music David Harms (a.k.a. Lucky)Santa Barbara CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Northwest Evaluation Association Rachelle Moore Portland OR Automatic 12/20/2019
NRSI, Inc. (National Reading Styles Institute) Bob Foley Syosset NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Nystrom Education; The Center for Learning; MindSparks; The Writing Company; Interact; Good Year Books; School Counselor Resources (Social Studies School Service)Culver City CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Olivas Music (Bob Farley Music Inc.) Jaime Olivas El Paso TX Automatic 12/20/2019
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC Lucia Valdez HARLINGEN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
ONE WAY EDUCATION, LLC Carlos Salazar HOUSTON TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Oriental Trading Co/Mindware (OTC Brands, Inc) Des Moines IA Automatic 12/20/2019
ORIGO Education Paulette Dorsey Earth City MO Automatic 12/20/2019
Oticon Inc Cathleen Van Evra Somerset NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Otter Graphics Inc. Robert Vincent Oxnard CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Overlooked Books Killeen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Oxford University Press (THE CHANCELLOR MASTERS AND SCHOLARS OF THE UNIVERSITY OF OXFORD)Susan Goodgion Cary NC Automatic 12/20/2019
Pacific Learning Customer Service Cypress CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Paxton/Patterson LLC Kitty Sivak Chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Pencil Ladies, LLC Joan Tolle Colorado City TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Pender's Music Company (Betrold Enterprises Inc.) Richard Gore Denton TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Perfection Learning Corporation Kristin Hipwell Logan IA Automatic 12/20/2019
Performance Scoring Michael Terneus Farmers Branch TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Performing Arts Supply Co. Stacey Ambrose Houston TX Automatic 12/20/2019
PERIPOLE, INC Carol Lund Salem OR Automatic 12/20/2019
Perma-Bound Books (Hertzberg-New Method, Inc.) Heather Cook JACKSONVILLE IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Phoenix embroidery and screen printing (RELY Enterprises) lupe salinas edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Picnic Education (MT LIBRARY SERVICES, INC.) Angela Christianson Carol Stream IL Automatic 12/20/2019
PIECES OF LEARNING Peggy Hord MARION IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Pioneer Valley Books (Pioneer Valley Educational Press) Lauri Yanis Northampton MA Automatic 12/20/2019
Pitsco Education (Pitsco Inc) Mendi Brazil Pittsburg KS Automatic 12/20/2019
Prentke Romich Company dba PRC-Saltillo Tammy Roberts Wooster OH Automatic 12/20/2019
Promo Masters Edna J. Pena Palmhurst TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Promo Solutions Frisco TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Prufrock Press Inc Elizabeth Trout Waco TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Public Consulting Group Inc Maureen Farrell Boston MA Automatic 12/20/2019
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) PATRICIA OLIVAS TAMPA FL Automatic 12/20/2019
QEP, Inc. Professional Books Catherine McGough PLANO TX Automatic 12/20/2019
QuaverMusic.com (QuaverMusic.com, LLC) Nashville TN Automatic 12/20/2019
Rainbow Book Company Beecher IL Automatic 12/20/2019
RALLY! Education Fran Mure Glen Head NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Ray's Business Products Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Read It Once Again Dean Schaper Inman SC Automatic 12/20/2019
Really Good Stuff, LLC Claudia Fellini Shelton CT Automatic 12/20/2019
Renaissance Learning Wisconsin RapidsWI Automatic 12/20/2019
Reynolds Manufacturing Corporation Vicki Reynolds Abilene TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Risas y Sonrisas Spanish for Kids (Risas y Sonrisas L.L.C) Leticia Smith Austin TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Riverside Insights (Riverside Assessments, LLC) Accounts Receivable Chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
RM Acquisition LLC DBA Rand McNally Chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Romo Contractors, LLC Romo Contractors LLC Laredo TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Rosen Classroom OR Rosen Digital OR Jackdaw Publications (The Rosen Publishing Group. Inc)Jenny Speed New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Rosetta Stone Ltd. Krista Northcut Harrisonburg VA Automatic 12/20/2019
ROURKE EDUCATIONAL MEDIA (Carson Dellosa Publishing) Scott Owings Vero Beach FL Automatic 12/20/2019
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royal media network inc. irene diaz WINDSOR MIL MD Automatic 12/20/2019
RTI International (Research Triangle Institute) Linda Eubanks Research Triangle ParkNC Automatic 12/20/2019
RYE Consuling (RYE Consulting of Illinois Inc.) rayna yaker chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
S/P2 (U, Inc.) Sami Johnson Overland Park KS Automatic 12/20/2019
s3strategies, LLC Steve Beasley Lubbock TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Saddleback Educational, Inc. Brittany Gomez Costa Mesa CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Safal Partners Shivani Chatterjee Houston TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Samsclub 8250 Carlos Garcia mcallen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Scholastic Inc. Representative Jefferson City MO Automatic 12/20/2019
SCHOLASTIC LIBRARY PUBLISHING INC Credit & Collections Boston MA Automatic 12/20/2019
School Datebooks (SDI Innovations) Cole Cooper Lafayette IN Automatic 12/20/2019
School Life, a dvi. imagestuff Juli DellaLibera Spring TX Automatic 12/20/2019
School Outfitters Cincinnati OH Automatic 12/20/2019
School Specialty, Inc. Accounts Receivable Greenville WI Automatic 12/20/2019
School Tee Factory (Custom Sportswear, Inc.) Ron Duzenski Sewell NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
School-it!, Inc. Mission TX Automatic 12/20/2019
School's In, LLC Cincinnati OH Automatic 12/20/2019
SchoolSpire, Inc. Clayton Alexander Plano TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Sebco Books (Library Sales, Inc.) Jamie Comer Pembroke Park FL Automatic 12/20/2019
Sharon Wells Mathematics Curriculum Inc. Vanessa Hamel Edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Sirius Education Solutions (Sirius Education Solutions LLC) Susan Bernal Austin TX Automatic 12/20/2019
SIXRNS FILIPINIANA TX LLC Ted Ray Llasos San Juan TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Smartbook Media Inc. Warren Rylands New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
SmartSchool Sytems David Walling Kingwood TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Solice Technologies (Echo Eight Inc.) Alfredo Rubalcaba Brownsville TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Sonova USA Inc. Credit Department Chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Sonrisas Spanish (Lindner) Brooks Lindner Pagosa Springs CO Automatic 12/20/2019
Southern Science SUpply (Southern Science Supply, LLC) Carol Espensen San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Southwest Binding & Laminating (Southwest Plastic Binding Co.) Rosemary Brumage Maryland HeightsMO Automatic 12/20/2019
SPD Consulting (Marianella Franklin) Marianella Franklin Mission TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Spirit Monkey, LLC Luis deBonoPaula San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Square Panda Inc. Melissa Johnson Sunnyvale CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC David Wilson Wheeling IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Starr Music Academy (Corine Garcia) Corine Garcia Rio Grande City TX Automatic 12/20/2019
STEM Revolution LLC Lorna Finman HENDERSON NV Automatic 12/20/2019
Summit K12 Holdings Inc John P Kresky Austin TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Summit Speech Therapy, PLLC Amanda Ahmed Frisco TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Supporting Science, Inc. Rosemary Martin SMITHVILLE TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Sweetwater Sound Procurement Office Fort Wayne IN Automatic 12/20/2019
Sylvan Learning Center Yuko Garcia McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Taymark (Andersons It's Elementary) Kara Schneider Minneapolis MN Automatic 12/20/2019
TCG Group Holdings (TCG Group Holdings, LLP) AUSTIN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
TCI . (Teachers' Curriculum Institute) Jodi Forrest Rancho Cordova CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Teacher Created Materials, Inc. Huntington BeachCA Automatic 12/20/2019
Teacher Heaven, Inc. Susan Savoie Austin TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Teachers Discovery Inc. (American Eagle Company Inc.) Cynthia Kettlewell Auburn Hills MI Automatic 12/20/2019
Teaching Strategies, LLC Sayra Hughes Bethesda MD Automatic 12/20/2019
Teaching Systems, Inc. Kim Savage Arlington TX Automatic 12/20/2019
TeachTransform, Inc Cindy Hamilton AUSTIN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Technical Laboratory Systems Inc. (Technical Laboratory Systems, Inc.) Lisa Stewart Houston TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Teen Success Messaging (Teen Success Messaging LLC) Lucy Long RICHARDSON TX Automatic 12/20/2019
TestOut Corporation Aubrey Barnett Pleasant Grove UT Automatic 12/20/2019
Texas Band and Orchestra Daniel Rivera MCALLEN TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Texas State Billing Services Inc Stasia Viator Kyle TX Automatic 12/20/2019
TFH (USA) Ltd. MARIAN NATALI GIBSONIA PA Automatic 12/20/2019
The Child's World, Inc. Mankato MN Automatic 12/20/2019
The Class Ring Company McAllen TX Automatic 12/20/2019
The College Board Austin TX Automatic 12/20/2019
The Flippen Group Michael Holt College Station TX Automatic 12/20/2019
The Library Store, Inc. Shayla Hill TREMONT IL Automatic 12/20/2019
The Lincoln Electric Company Euclid OH Automatic 12/20/2019
The Literacy Architects, LLC Seema Tejura Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
The Master Teacher Angelika Patterson Manhattan KS Automatic 12/20/2019
The Reading Warehouse Todd Hohensee North Charleston SC Automatic 12/20/2019
The Supply Room Inc Crystal Valachi Oxford AL Automatic 12/20/2019
The Trophy House Isaac Serna Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019
The Writing Academy, LLC Kelley Kratky Kemah TX Automatic 12/20/2019
THEATRE HOUSE (Fourth Wall LLC) Marty Boyer COVINGTON KY Automatic 12/20/2019
THERAPRO, INC. KAREN CONRAD WeihrauchFRAMINGHAM MA Automatic 12/20/2019
Tin Man Press (Matthew R. Rasmussen) Eugene OR Automatic 12/20/2019
TouchMath Acquisition LLC Nancy Lawrence Colorado Springs CO Automatic 12/20/2019
TripleNterprises Educational Publishing (TripleNterprises Inc.) Nino Tarantino San Antonio TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Tuxedo Connect (Tuxedo Connect LLC) Wylie Branch Fort Worth TX Automatic 12/20/2019
USA Fundraisers LLC Terence Kitchens Mont Belvieu TX Automatic 12/20/2019
UWorld Dale Fleury Dallas TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Valley Custom Prints Danny Garza Edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Valley Sports Normalinda Ortiz Mission TX Automatic 12/20/2019
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Velazquez Press (Academic Learning Company) El Monte CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Vernier Software & Technology, LLC Beaverton OR Automatic 12/20/2019
Vertex Marketing Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Virtucom, Inc. Tim Prince Peachtree CornersGA Automatic 12/20/2019
VIS Enterprises (Velma I. Sandell) Milton S. Sandell III Plano TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Vision Associates (Kristen Knoll DBA Vision Associates) Kristen Knoll Wonder Lake IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Voyager Sopris Learning, Inc. Accounts Receivable Boston MA Automatic 12/20/2019
VWR International LLC, Sargent Welch (VWR Funding Inc.) Mark Tringali Rochester NY Automatic 12/20/2019
VWR International, LLC dba Ward's Science Customer Service Pittsburgh PA Automatic 12/20/2019
WalkerCom, Inc. Ray Saldivar Pearland TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Walmart Inc Bentonvile AR Automatic 12/20/2019
Waterford Research Institute Jackie Alldredge Sandy UT Automatic 12/20/2019
Weigl Publishers Inc. Warren Rylands New York NY Automatic 12/20/2019
Wenger Corporation Jodi Tuthill Owatonna MN Automatic 12/20/2019
West Music Company Beth Villhauer Coralville IA Automatic 12/20/2019
WestEd Virgilio F. Tinio, Jr. San Francisco CA Automatic 12/20/2019
Western Psychological Services - WPS (Manson Western, LLC) torrance CA Automatic 12/20/2019
WILLIAM H. SADLIER, INC. Valerie Tucker Newark NJ Automatic 12/20/2019
Winner's World (RGV Awards LLC) Roel Nava Pharr TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Wolverine Sports, Schoolmasters (School-Tech, Inc) Ann Arbor MI Automatic 12/20/2019
Wood Etc. Co. Wolfgang Walther Irving TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc Westlake Village CA Automatic 12/20/2019
World Book, Inc. Chicago IL Automatic 12/20/2019
Worldgate (Worldgate, LLC) Reston VA Automatic 12/20/2019
Writer David Rice Austin TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Xpress Printing and Embroidery LLC Dayanne Villegas Edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Yearbooklife (Plattsco.Inc) Trudy Williamson Hollywood FL Automatic 12/20/2019
Zaner-Bloser, Inc. Leslie Shawver Columbus OH Automatic 12/20/2019
Zeki Learning (Child's Cup Full) Janette Habashi Denton TX Automatic 12/20/2019
Zulmaris Diaz Edinburg TX Automatic 12/20/2019
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