Bid Request Number
Title

Description

Bid Type

Issue Date

Close Date

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.

TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 19-20-027

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 14, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.

# 19-20-027 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids
Toilet Tissue and Dispensers for Central Supply Warehouse Bid Creator  Emily Garza
Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Bid Phone
9/25/2019 01:13:33 PM (CT) Fax

10/14/2019 03:30:00 PM (CT)

Recommendation: That the Board of Education award the Toilet Tissue and Dispensers for Central Supply Warehouse Bid # 19-20-027
to the lowest bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

[Name [City [ state[Classifications  Lines Awarded Award Total Award Reason
CC Distributors, Inc. Corpus Christi ~ TX 1 $9,291.00 Low Bid Justified
Groupo GTE, LLC Las Vegas NV 1 $4,872.50 Low Bid Justified
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC  Pharr TX 1 $108,900.00 Low Bid
Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing Jim L. Bewster, Property Control Coordinator

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 131100

One hundred nine (109) invitations were emailed to vendors
Nineteen (19) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Eight (8) Submitted Bid
One (1) Unsubmitted Bid

Five (5) No Bid
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 19-20-027
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 14, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.

Line Qty UOM Description Manufacturer Manuf. Number Award | Award |Awarded Supplier Award Reason
Response Qty

1Alt2 300 EA CASCADES PRO B189 LATTE 2-PLY STANDARD ROLL Cascades B189 Latte $30.97 300 CC Distributors, Inc. LOW BID JUSTIFIED -

TOILET TISSUE 96-500/CASE low bidder Air Gas
bid per roll and not
per case.

2 6050 EA 2-Ply Jumbo Roll Tissue. 2-Ply embossed paper, COMFORT 9305-2 OR EQUAL $18.00 6050 Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC LOW BID JUSTIFIED -
1000 ft./roll, 3.5 width, 12 rolls/case. 55 INSTITUCIONALES OR low bidder Air Gas
cases/pallet. Case weight: 22.86 Ibs. EQUAL bid per roll and not

per case.

3 250 EA Twin 9" Toilet Tissue Dispenser. Dimensions 12" (H) SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL $19.49 250 Groupo GTE, LLC LOW BID

*Indicates alternate bid.

x 19" (W) x 5.25". Capacity (2) 9" jumbo rolls, core
diameter 3.25", wall mount, break resistant plastic.
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.

BID OPENING: OCTOBER 14, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.

TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 19-20-027

1 |2-Ply Toilet Tissue. Heavenly Choice Double Layer, single roll, toilet tissue. 500 sheets per roll. Sheet size: 4.5 x 3.5". 96 rolls per case. 25 cases/pallet, case
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYF 300 EA  No Bid STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC 300 EA NoBid STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV 300 EA  $0.65 $195.00 STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
AWARDED :[ALT2] CC Distributors, Inc. 300 EA $30.97 $9,291.00 CASCADES PRO B189 LATTE 2-PLYSTANDARD ROLL TOILET Cascades B189 Latte
JUSTIFIED TISSUE96-500/CASE
[ALT1] CC Distributors, Inc. 300 EA $34.03 $10,209.00 CASC/ADES PRO B040 2-PLY BATH TISSUE4”X3.2” 500SHT/RL Cascades B040
96RL/cs
Groupo GTE, LLC 300 EA $34.94 $10,482.00 STEFCO OR EQUAL 11641 OR EQUAL
[ALT1] Groupo GTE, LLC 300 EA $34.94  $10,482.00 2-Ply Toilet Tissue. 500 sheets per roll. Sheet size:4.5”x3.5”. 96  TG/Forza/Royalty STP 2500-96
rolls per case.
[ALT1] PREMIER & COMPANIES 300 CT $39.89 $11,967.00 Balh/Tissue, Septic Safe, 2-Ply, White, 500 Sheets/Roll, 96 Genn GEN500
Rolls/Carton
[ALT1] CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP. 300 CASES $40.00  $12,000.0Q Toilet tissue, 2 ply, 4.4°x3.5”, 96/cs, 25/pallet ATLAS 235
[ALT1] Full Stop Equipment LLC 300 EA $40.70  $12,210.00 Bathroom Tissue, Standard, Septic Safe, 2-Ply, White, 4x 3,500  BWK6145 Boardwalk
Sheets/Roll, 96/Carton
2 |2-PIyJumbo Roll Tissue. 2-Ply embossed paper, 1000 ft./roll, 3.5 width, 12 rolls/case. 55 cases/pallet. Case weight: 22.86 Ibs
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYF 6050 EA  No Bid Comfort Institucionales or equal 9305-2 OR EQUAL
AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV 6050 EA $6.75 $40,837.50 Comfort Institucionales or equal 9305-2 OR EQUAL
AWARDED Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC 6050 EA  $18.00 $108,900.00 WE ARE OFFERING:2-Ply Jumbo Roll Tissue. 2-Ply embossed paper, Comfort Institucionales or equal 9305-2 OR EQUAL
JUSTIFIED 1000 ft./roll, 3.5” width, 12 rolls/case. 55 cases/pallet. Case
weight: 22.86 Ibs.Manufacturer: COMFORT INSTITUCIONALES
Manufacturer #: 9305-2
E[ALTZ] CC Distributors, Inc. 6050 EA  $20.17 $122,028.50 CASCADES PRO B249 LATTE 2-PLYJUMBO JR ROLL TOILET TISSUE12- Cascades B249 Latte
1000'/CASE
Groupo GTE, LLC 6050 EA $21.84 $132,132.00 Comfort Institucionales or equal 9305-2 OR EQUAL
[ALT1] Groupo GTE, LLC 6050 EA  $21.84 $132,132.00 2-Ply Jumbo Roll Tissue. 2-Ply embossed paper, 1000 ft./roll, 3.3”  Sellars/Mayfair 1832161
width, 12 rolls/case. 54 cases/pallet
[ALT1] CC Distributors, Inc. 6050 EA $22.67 $137,153.50 CASC‘/\DES PRO B140 WHITE 2-PLY JRIUMBO ROLL TISSUE 12- Cascades B140
1000'/cs
[ALT1] CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP. 6050 CASES $24.00 $145,200.00 Toilet tissue, 2 ply, 3.4"x1000', 12/cs, 60/pallet ATLAS 700
[ALT1] PREMIER & COMPANIES 6050 CT $26.89 $162,684.50 JR';JumbO Bath Tissue, Septic Safe, 2-Ply, White, 3.3”x1000ft, ~ Genn GENJRT1000
12/Carton
[ALT1] Full Stop Equipment LLC 6050 EA  $28.89 $174,784.50 Jumbo Roll Tissue, Septic Safe, 2-Ply, Natural, 3.3” x 1000 ft, 12 BWKJRT1000 Boardwalk
Roll/Carton
3 |Twin 9" Toilet Tissue Dispenser. Dimensions 12" (H) x 19" (W) x 5.25". Capacity (2) 9" jumbo rolls, core diameter 3.25", wall mount, break resistant plastic
Supplier QTY UOM Price Extended Supplier Notes / Alternate Description Manufacturer Manufacturer #
CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP. 250 EA NoBid SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL
AWARDED Groupo GTE, LLC 250 EA  $19.49 $4,872.50 SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC 250 EA  $20.13 $5,032.50 WE ARE OFFERING:Twin 9” Toilet Tissue Dispenser. Dimensions  SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL
12” (H) x 19” (W) x 5.25”. Capacity (2) 9” jumbo rolls, core
diameter 3.25”, wall mount, break resistant plastic.Manufacturer:
SAN JAMAR Manufacturer #: R4000TBK
[ALT1] PREMIER & COMPANIES 250 EA  $21.39 $5,347.50 Twin Tissue Dispenser, 19.5” x 5.5” x 11.25”, Transparent. if Genn GEN1602
awarded, the school will hang the dispensers we do not have a
source for installation
[ALT1] CC Distributors, Inc. 250 EA  $24.06 $6,015.00 CASCADES PRO DB12 SMOKE UNIVERSALDUAL ROLL JR JUMBO Cascades DB12
TISSUE DISPENSER
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYF 250 EA  $27.55 $6,887.50 BID AS SPECIFIED. MINIMUM ORDER IS 250 EACH. SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL
AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV 250 EA $32.89 $8,222.50 SAN JAMAR OR EQUAL R4000TBK OR EQUAL
i[ALT1] Full Stop Equipment LLC 250 EA $33.39 $8,347.50 Jumbo Twin Toilet Tissue Dispenser, 20 1/4 x 12 1/4, Black BWK1529 Boardwalk :
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSERS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 19-20-027
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 14, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.

Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

CC Distributors, Inc. Michael Hill mhill@ccdistributors.com

AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV Javier Olmos javier.olmos@airgas.com

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP. Andrew Hoffer bids@centralpoly.com DELIVERY WITHIN 30 DAYS ARO.

SAMPLES SENT VIA UPS NEXT DAY AIR SAVER ON 10/11/19,
TRACKING # 179756W91319381262

Full Stop Equipment LLC Elias Macias Jr fse1997@yahoo.com
Groupo GTE, LLC Gregg Taylor admin@ThinkGTE.com
PREMIER & COMPANIES Henry Melendez hmelendez@premierandco.com if awarded, the school will hang the dispensers we do not have a

source for installation \ This pricing is available only for this bid and
can only be used in its entirety. Shipping is included

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS ( KENNETH D MILLER biddept@pyramidsp.com
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC CARLOS MANUEL FRANC( pharr@yanitor.com We are bidding on items #2 and #3 with the products and models
you requested. Thank you for inviting us to participate!
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Participation Summary - As of 11/05/2019

Participant Name

AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV

CC Distributors, Inc.

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.

Full Stop Equipment LLC

Groupo GTE, LLC

PREMIER & COMPANIES

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER C
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC

Gateway Printing

Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)

PRECISION SAW & TOOL, INC

South Texas Moulding dba Texas Wood Supply
Trinity3 Technology

Unipak Corp.

365 Paving & Construction LLC
bkdsignsandgraphicslic

C&H Distributors, LLC

Compostology LLC

ConstructConnect

Deltek

gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)
Gulf Coast Paper

Hillyard, Texas

JCO "the door people"

Jeans Restaurant Supply (Tari Inc.)

JJ's Party House

L & M Food Service Inc.

McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solution:
Medicaleshop Inc.

Promo Solutions

School Specialty, Inc.

ValTex (Figuroa & Sons, Inc.)

Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (JP Gould)
1,2,3 Screen Printing, LLC

ABC Custom Advertising (Marketing Concepts Unl
ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LMH, LLC)
Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.

Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LAst Group Enterpr
Alamo Iron Works (Vallen Distribution)

All American Poly

All-Valley Screenprinting

Alpha and Omega Cleaning Services,LLC
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS

Blue Sky Enterprises

BM Benchmark Construction, LLC

BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION, LLC

Bon Tool Co

Buffalo Construction LLC.

Burton Companies (Burton Companies, LLC)
C&V SUPPLY INC.

CAPA Texas

Caprice Electronics, Inc.

Center Stone Services

Cintas Corporation #538

Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, |
Construction Bid Source (Plan Room)
Construction Journal LLC

Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.
ECOEFFECT

Econ Group, LLC

ELITE PROMOTIONS

Elsa Auto & Truck Parts

Embroidery Express

Fairway Supply, Inc.

Gandy Ink (G&G Investments)

General contractor/Construction (Davila Construc
Go UnderGround

GRANDE VALLE APPAREL (Adan MArtinez)
GRANDE VALLEY BUILDERS,INC

Hasty Awards

HDL ENTERPRISES

High End Advertising

High Point (Western BRW Paper Co., Inc)
Hi-LoContractor LLC

Holchemont, Ltd.

Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.

TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSER FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 19-20-027
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 14, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.

Response Date Response Status

10/14/2019
10/11/2019
10/11/2019
10/11/2019
10/13/2019
10/03/2019
10/14/2019
10/11/2019

10/03/2019
09/29/2019
09/26/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019

Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Submitted
Unsubmitted
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
Viewed
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Contact
Javier Olmos

Andrew Hoffer
Elias Macias
Gregg Taylor
Henry Melendez
PATRICIA OLIVAS
Carlos Manuel Franco
Chris Diaz
Johnny Hunte
EDDIE HOMAN
Daniel Ortiz
Kendell Rickman

Gilberto Maldonado
Brenda Henderson
William Rose

Kash Nathan

Source Management
Juan Garcia

Jessica Cavazos
Mario Gonzales

Joe Perez

ALBERT CHAVEZ
Homer Martinez
Joshua Flanders
Thomas Bryant
Asrar Ahmed

Accounts Receivable
Felipe Lopez

Cindy Leander
Hiram

Martha J Miller
Larry Helgeson

Marguerite Burton
Velma Quintanilla

Rod Zamora
Ismael De Leon

Alonzo Acosta

TONY RODRIGUEZ
Paul Bender
FRED GUERRA
Scott Vaughan
JESSIE RAYA
junior ocampo
Michael Kluger

Roger Rodriguez
D'Ann Ivers

Pamela Exton
Sandra Salinas
Alejandro Alanis
Gilbert Enriquez
Rossy Galarza
Lupe Garza

Kathy Millican
John Gandy
Tommy Canul

Adan Martinez
MANUEL PEREZ
Thad O'Connor
HERIBERTO LOPEZ
Mariano Nunez
Jane Lopez
Edmundo Carreon
Annette Carmona
Keith F. Hunt
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City
McAllen
Corpus Christi
Linden

La Joya

Las Vegas
NEW YORK
TAMPA
Pharr
Edinburg
San Antonio
CONVERSE
DONNA
Saint Paul
BROOKLYN
Mission
Edinburg
Chicago
Waco
Cincinnati
Herndon
san juan
Brownsville
San Antonio
EDINBURG
McAllen
McAllen
Henderson
Atlanta
New Milford
Frisco
Greenville
McAllen
Dallas
Mission
McAllen
McAllen
Harlingen
Forest Hill
Pharr
Piscataway
McAllen
Edinburg
edinburg
La Blanca
McAllen
SanJuan
Gibsonia
WESLACO
Weslaco
MISSION
Mission
Brooklyn
Weslaco
Mercedes
San Antonio
Felton
Stuart
Palmhurst
McAllen
Edinburg
Brownsville
Elsa
Weslaco
Austin

San Angelo
Pharr
harlingen
SAN BENITO
MCALLEN
Ottawa
WESLACO
Mission
Dallas

Elsa
McAllen
Laguna Vista

State Invitation Type

X
X
NJ
X
NV
NY
FL
X
X
LS
LS
1S
MN
NY
X
X
IL
>
OH
VA
X
X
X
X
LS
LS
NV
GA
CcT
X
Wi
LS
X
X
LS
LS
LS
IS
X
NJ
LS
LS
X
X
LS
1S
PA
LS
X
LS
X
NY
X
1S
X
CA
FL
X
X
X
X
IS
X
X
LS
LS
LS
X
LS
KS
1S
X
X
LS
X
X

Automatic

Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Manual

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Automatic

Automatic

Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic
Automatic

Invitation Date Owner

09/25/2019

09/25/2019
09/25/2019

09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/26/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019

09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019

09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019

09/25/2019
09/25/2019

09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019
09/25/2019

Jason Farve
John Grey, COO

Andrew Hoffer, President

Elias Macias Jr.

Gregg Taylor

Sheldon Lebman, CEO
Kenneth D. Miller
Jorge Garza



PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO |.S.D.
TOILET TISSUE AND DISPENSER FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 19-20-027
BID OPENING: OCTOBER 14, 2019 @ 3:30 P.M.

JC Sports Con-Action, Inc. Alex Rios EDINBURG TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
kautsch lumber co inc kookii crerar alamo TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Lewis Electric Motors, Inc. Enrique Mendez HARLINGEN X Automatic 09/25/2019
Little Giants Learning Center Alamo TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Lowes Of Pharr (lowe's home center. lic) Pharr X Automatic 09/25/2019
Lumatec Lighting Service Victor T Rios McAllen TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation) Mike Zappia Stow OH  Automatic 09/25/2019
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS DAVID CASTILLO PHARR X Automatic 09/25/2019
McAllen Sports Inc. Joe Escamilla McAllen TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
McCoys Building Supply (McCoy Corporation) Tina McArthur San Marcos TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
MH ENTERPRISES (MH ENTERPRISES 888) Miyoung Hong McKinney X Automatic 09/25/2019
Morning Star Industries Inc Brittny Bonawitz Jensen Beach  FL Automatic 09/25/2019
National Chemical Laboratories Inc Tom Lesher Philadelphia PA  Automatic 09/25/2019
NFCS, LLC Rudy Ramirez Wylie TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Noble Texas Builders La Feria TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC Lucia Valdez HARLINGEN X Automatic 09/25/2019
Performance Safety Group |, LP Drew Allrich St. Louis MO  Automatic 09/25/2019
Pinturas & Lacas (PPG Paints) Rudy Garza Weslaco X Automatic 09/25/2019
Platinum Fleet Wash (Angela Salinas) Angela Salinas Alamo X Automatic 09/25/2019
PortionPac Chemical Corporation Chicago IL Automatic 09/25/2019
PROFESSIONAL POLISH, INC. VANESA GONZALEZ FORT WORTH  TX Automatic 09/25/2019
Promo Universal LLC Anthony Anzaldua Corpus Christi  TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
RCA Building Materials Inc. Gustavo Rea Pharr TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
REFCO (R E Friedrichs Company) Vicki Delgado McAllen TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
RGV GUARDIAN ENTERPRISES LLC DBA DERTY SPC Rick Romo PHARR > Automatic 09/25/2019
Rio Grande Valley Chapter Associated General Co Perry A. Vaughn Harlingen TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
RODRIGUEZ SCREEN PRINTING RODRIGUEZ SCREEN PRINTING San Juan X Automatic 09/25/2019
Romo Contractors, LLC Romo Contractors LLC Laredo X Automatic 09/25/2019
rudys upholstery pharr TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Sanitech Belinda Wolovich Lakeland FL  Automatic 09/25/2019
Schaeffer Manufacturing Co. Customer Service/ Sales Rep St. Louis MO  Automatic 09/25/2019
SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA GROUP, INC) SAN ANTONIO TX Automatic 09/25/2019
Sherwin Williams karissa Carrizales Mcallen TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Surplus Supply Co Philip Leonard Harlingen TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Tuxedo Connect (Tuxedo Connect LLC) Wylie Branch Fort Worth X Automatic 09/25/2019
VCI Builders, Inc. Joe Arredondo MISSION TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Vertex Marketing Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Virtual Builders Exchange Jeannette Olguin SAN ANTONIO TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
Visceral lllumination Code LLC (VISCERAL ILLUMIN VISCERAL ILLUMINATION CODE LLC  Edinburg X Automatic 09/25/2019
WasteZero Inc. lan Noble RALEIGH ND  Automatic 09/25/2019
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CARLOS ISASI) JUAN CARLOS ISASI PHARR > Automatic 09/25/2019
Xpress Printing and Embroidery LLC Dayanne Villegas Edinburg TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
xtremetees embroidery saldivar san juan TX  Automatic 09/25/2019
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