

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO I.S.D.
HVAC REFRIGERANTS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 18-19-086
BID OPENING: AUGUST 26, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

Bid Request Number	# 18-19-086	Organization	PSJA ISD Ebids
Title	HVAC REFRIGERANTS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE	Bid Creator	Emily Garza
Description		Email	emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Bid Type	Bid	Phone	
Issue Date	8/8/2019 02:49:34 PM (CT)	Fax	
Close Date	8/26/2019 04:00:00 PM (CT)		

Recommendation: That the Board of Education award the HVAC Refrigerants for Central Supply Warehouse Bid # 18-19-086 to the lowest bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name	City	State	Classifications	Lines Awarded	Award Total	Award Reason
ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.	Long Island City	NY		2	\$19,037.15	
Johnstone Supply	Pharr	TX		5	\$30,660.00	

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

Jim L. Brewster, Property Control Coordinator

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 131100

Sixty seven (67) invitations were emailed to vendors
 Seven (7) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications
 Three (3) Submitted Bid
 Two (2) No Bid

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO I.S.D.
 HVAC REFRIGERANTS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 18-19-086
 BID OPENING: AUGUST 26, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

Line	Qty	UOM	Description	Manuf.	Manuf. #	Award Response	Award Qty	Awarded Supplier	Award Reason
1	80	Cylinders	Refrigerant, 25 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-410A	\$83.00	80	Johnstone Supply	Low Bid
2	80	Cyclinder	Refrigerant. 30 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-134	\$93.00	80	Johnstone Supply	Low Bid
3	80	Cyclinder	Refrigerant. 30 lb. Cylinder with automotive fill valve or equal.	Cool Gas	R-134	\$134.89	80	ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.	Low Bid
4	15	Cyclinder	Refrigerant.125 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-134	\$549.73	15	ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.	Low Bid
5	20	Cyclinder	Refrigerant.24 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-404A	\$95.00	20	Johnstone Supply	Low Bid
6	80	Cyclinder	Refrigerant.25 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-427A	\$176.00	80	Johnstone Supply	Low Bid
7	100	Each	Odor Neutralizer, 1/2 lb. Tube or equal.	Cool Gas	Clen/Air	\$6.00	100	Johnstone Supply	Low Bid

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO I.S.D.
 HVAC REFRIGERANTS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 18-19-086
 BID OPENING: AUGUST 26, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	QTY	UOM	Johnson Supply (Johnson Supply & Equipment Corporation)		Johnstone Supply		ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.	
						Total Price	\$30,946.50	Total Price	\$50,385.00	Total Price	\$63,481.55
						Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Refrigerant, 25 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-410A	80	Cylinders	\$103.67	\$8,293.60	<u>\$83.00</u>	\$6,640.00	\$139.74	\$11,179.20
2	Refrigerant. 30 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-134	80	Cyclinder	\$138.25	\$11,060.00	<u>\$93.00</u>	\$7,440.00	\$134.89	\$10,791.20
3	Refrigerant. 30 lb. Cylinder with automotive fill valve or equal.	Cool Gas	R-134	80	Cyclinder	No Bid		\$135.00	\$10,800.00	<u>\$134.89</u>	\$10,791.20
4	Refrigerant.125 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-134	15	Cyclinder	\$574.86	\$8,622.90	\$595.00	\$8,925.00	<u>\$549.73</u>	\$8,245.95
5	Refrigerant.24 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-404A	20	Cyclinder	\$110.95	\$2,219.00	<u>\$95.00</u>	\$1,900.00	\$164.74	\$3,294.80
6	Refrigerant.25 lb. Cylinder or equal.	Cool Gas	R-427A	80	Cyclinder	No Bid		<u>\$176.00</u>	\$14,080.00	\$239.74	\$19,179.20
7	Odor Neutralizer, 1/2 lb. Tube or equal.	Cool Gas	Clen/Air	100	Each	\$7.51	\$751.00	<u>\$6.00</u>	\$600.00	No Bid	

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO I.S.D.
 HVAC REFRIGERANTS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 18-19-086
 BID OPENING: AUGUST 26, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

Line	Responding Supplier	Supplier Notes
1	Johnson Supply (Johnson Supply & Equipment Corporation)	Prices fluctuate on a monthly basis can hold pricing for 2 weeks
1	Johnstone Supply	refrigerant prices are subject to change at any time according to the market
2	Johnson Supply (Johnson Supply & Equipment Corporation)	Prices fluctuate on a monthly basis can hold pricing for 2 weeks
2	Johnstone Supply	refrigerant prices are subject to change at any time according to the market
3	Johnstone Supply	refrigerant prices are subject to change at any time according to the market
4	ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.	Please be advised that an additional 100% refundable deposit of \$200 will be charged for every cylinder size of 125 lbs., which will be credited back when you return the empties freight-free upon our instructions.
4	Johnson Supply (Johnson Supply & Equipment Corporation)	Prices fluctuate on a monthly basis can hold pricing for 2 weeks
4	Johnstone Supply	THERE IS ALSO A \$200.00 CORE DEPOSIT FOR EVERY #125LB CYLINDER PURCHASED
5	Johnson Supply (Johnson Supply & Equipment Corporation)	Prices fluctuate on a monthly basis can hold pricing for 2 weeks
5	Johnstone Supply	refrigerant prices are subject to change at any time according to the market
6	Johnstone Supply	refrigerant prices are subject to change at any time according to the market

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO I.S.D.
 HVAC REFRIGERANTS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 18-19-086
 BID OPENING: AUGUST 26, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

Responding Supplier	Signature Full Name	Signature Email	Supplier Notes
Johnson Supply (Johnson Suppl	Robert Salinas	rsalinas@johnsonsupply.com	
Johnstone Supply	RICK GARCIA	RICK.GARCIA@JOHNSTONESUPPLY.CC	Johnstone Supply OF PHARR TX
ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.	Jay Kestenbaum	Contracts.department@aspensupply.com	Please note that we offer free 1-3 day delivery A.R.O.(emergencies only). Please be advised that an additional 100% refundable deposit of \$200 will be charged for every cylinder size of 125 lbs., which will be credited back when you return the empties freight-free upon our instructions.

PHARR - SAN JUAN -ALAMO I.S.D.
HVAC REFRIGERANTS FOR CENTRAL SUPPLY WAREHOUSE BID # 18-19-086
BID OPENING: AUGUST 26, 2019 @ 4:00 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 10/14/2019

<u>Participant Name</u>	<u>Response Date</u>	<u>Response Status</u>	<u>Contact</u>	<u>City</u>	<u>State</u>	<u>Invitation Type</u>	<u>Invitation Date</u>	<u>Owner</u>
Johnson Supply (Johnson Supply & Equipment)	08/26/2019	Submitted	Tawnya Hewitt	Houston	TX	Manual	08/08/2019	Robert Salinas
ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.	08/26/2019	Submitted	Vashti Maraj	Long Island City	NY	Automatic	08/08/2019	Jay Kestenbaum
Johnstone Supply	08/21/2019	Submitted	willie gonzalez	pharr	TX			Rick Garcia
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	08/26/2019	No Bid	DAVID CASTILLO	PHARR	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Trinity3 Technology	08/08/2019	No Bid	Kendell Rickman	Saint Paul	MN	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Alamo Iron Works (Valle Distributors)		Viewed	Velma Quintanilla	Pharr	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Central Plumbing & Electric Supply (ConstructConnect)		Viewed		Weslaco	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Construction Journal LLC		Viewed	Pamela Exton	Cincinnati	OH	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Deltek		Viewed	Source Management	Stuart	FL	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Forde-Ferrier, LLC		Viewed	Hector Rivera	Herndon	VA			
gargon power services llc (Juan Garcia)		Viewed	Juan Garcia	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LMH, LLC)			Larry Helgeson	san juan	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.				McAllen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp			Celeste Cantu	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
All American Poly				Alamo	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS				Piscataway	NJ	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Blue Sky Enterprises			Alonzo Acosta	edinburg	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION, LLC			TONY RODRIGUEZ	La Blanca	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Bon Tool Co			Paul Bender	San Juan	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Buffalo Construction LLC.			FRED GUERRA	Gibsonia	PA	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Burton Companies (Burton Companies)			Scott Vaughan	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
C&H Distributors, LLC			William Rose	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
CAPA Texas			junior ocampo	Chicago	IL	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Caprice Electronics, Inc.			Michael Kluger	Mission	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Celso Gonzalez Construction			Celso Gonzalez	Brooklyn	NY	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Center Stone Services				Mission	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service			D'Ann Ivers	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Construction Bid Source (Plan Room)				San Antonio	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Daikin Applied (Daikin Applied America)			Joanne Lawson	Felton	CA	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc.			Sandra Salinas	Chicago	IL	Automatic	08/08/2019	
ECOEFFECT			Alejandro Alanis	Palmhurst	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Econ Group, LLC			Gilbert Enriquez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Elsa Auto & Truck Parts			Lupe Garza	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Fairway Supply, Inc.			Kathy Millican	Elsa	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
General contractor/Construction (D)			Tommy Canul	Austin	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Go UnderGround				Pharr	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Gulf Coast Paper			Jessica Cavazos	harlingen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Hi-LoContractor LLC			Edmundo Carreon	Brownsville	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Holchemont, Ltd.			Annette Carmona	Elsa	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Home Design Center (V&L ENTERPRISES)			Victor Cantu	McAllen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Hunt & Woodruff Construction Co LLC			Keith F. Hunt	McAllen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
JCO "the door people"			Joe Perez	Laguna Vista	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE PROTECTANTS			Heather Foster	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
kautsch lumber co inc			kookii crerar	ROUND ROCK	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
LARRY WUNSCH AND ASSOCIATES			JOHN FREEMAN	alamo	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Lewis Electric Motors, Inc.			Enrique Mendez	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Little Giants Learning Center				HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Lumatec Lighting Service			Victor T Rios	Alamo	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corporation)			Mike Zappia	McAllen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
McCoy's Building Supply (McCoy Corporation)			Tina McArthur	Stow	OH	Automatic	08/08/2019	
MH ENTERPRISES (MH ENTERPRISES)			Miyoung Hong	San Marcos	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Noble Texas Builders				McKinney	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC			Lucia Valdez	La Feria	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Pinturas & Lacas (PPG Paints)			Rudy Garza	HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Pro Tech Mechanical, Inc.			Jeremy Fojtik	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
RCA Building Materials Inc.			Gustavo Rea	Corpus Christi	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Region 1 Repair, LLC			John E Yeupell	Pharr	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Rio Air, LLC			Antonio Lerma	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Rio Grande Valley Chapter Association			Perry A. Vaughn	pharr	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus Romo)			Jesus Ramirez	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Romo Contractors, LLC			Romo Contractors LLC	Mission	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA GROUP)				Laredo	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Trane Company			Rigoberto Garza	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
ValTex (Figuroa & Sons, Inc.)			Felipe Lopez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
VCI Builders, Inc.			Joe Arredondo	McAllen	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Vertex Marketing			Dr. Sue Bayer	MISSION	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Virtual Builders Exchange			Jeannette Olguin	Stafford	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
Visceral Illumination Code LLC (VISCERAL ILLUMINATION)			VISCERAL ILLUMINATION	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CARLOS ISASI)			JUAN CARLOS ISASI	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	08/08/2019	