

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Event Number	# 18-19-078	Organization	PSJA ISD Ebids
Event Title	Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Installation and Repair Services District-Wide	Workgroup	Purchasing
Event Description		Event Owner	Emily Garza
Event Type	Bid	Email	emily.garza@psjaisd.us
Issue Date	7/31/2019 06:09:15 PM (CT)	Phone	
Close Date	8/27/2019 02:30:00 PM (CT)	Fax	

Recommendation: That the Board of Education award the Fire Sprinkler Inspection, Installation and Repair Services District-Wide Bid # 18-19-078 to the lowest bidders listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name	City	State	Classifications	Lines Awarded	Award Total	Award Reason
Alliance Specialized Systems	Pharr	TX		2	\$50.00	
ALLIED FIRE PROTECTION	MCALLEN	TX		1	\$63,440.00	

 Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

 Fernando Lopez, Maintenance Director

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: 199-51-936-0990MO-6299-00

One Hundred Ninety (190) invitations were emailed to vendors
 Fifteen (15) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications
 Five (5) Submitted Bid
 Six (6) No Bid

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
 BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line	Qty	UOM	Description	Award Response	Award Quantity	Awarded Supplier	Award Reason
1	4	EA	Fire Sprinkler Inspections, all current and future locations District-Wide with Fire Sprinkler Systems.	\$15,860.00	4	ALLIED FIRE PROTECTION	LOW BID
2	1	EA	Installation and Repair Services (As Needed)	\$50.00	1	Alliance Specialized Systems	LOW BID "AS NEEDED"
3	1	EA	Parts: (if any)	\$0.00	1	Alliance Specialized Systems	LOW BID "AS NEEDED"

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
 FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
 BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Alliance Specialized Systems		ALLIED FIRE PROTECTION		RENOWORKS, LLC		Texas Fireguard, LLC		DVR Mechanical, Inc.	
				Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$63,440.00	Total Price	\$152,000.00	Total Price	\$180,000.00	Total Price	\$192,000.00
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Fire Sprinkler Inspections, all current and future locations District-Wide with Fire Sprinkler Systems. Supplier Notes:	4	EA	No Response		\$15,860.00	\$63,440.00	\$38,000.00	\$152,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$180,000.00	\$48,000.00	\$192,000.00
						Each quarterly inspection is \$130.00 per riser; \$520.00 per annum per riser; Qty 122 risers per equipment list. An inspection report will be provided upon completion of each campus inspection. A proposal to correct any deficiencies noted during the inspection will follow. No work will be performed until a purchase order and authorization to proceed is received per special instructions.							
2	Installation and Repair Services (As Needed)	1	EA										
	Hourly Labor Charge-Straight Time			\$50.00		\$65.00		\$55.00		93.75		\$50.00	
	Hourly Labor Charge-Overtime			\$90.00		\$97.50		\$75.00		140.65		\$100.00	
	Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Straight Time			\$40.00		\$65.00		\$55.00		46.9		\$50.00	
	Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Overtime			\$85.00		\$97.50		\$75.00		70.35		\$100.00	
	Service Call			\$75.00		\$0.00		\$300.00		\$0.00		\$200.00	
3	Parts: (if any)	1	EA							No Bid			
	Current Mfg. Jobber Price			\$0.00				\$25.00					
	Current Mfg. Jobber Price Less			\$0.00				\$20.00					
	Shelf Price (Discount % or 0%)			\$25.00				\$20.00					
	Catalog Price Discount (%)			\$25.00		\$10.00		\$10.00					
	Cost Plus (%)			\$15.00				\$20.00					

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line	Responding Supplier	Supplier Notes
1	ALLIED FIRE PROTECTION	Each quarterly inspection is \$130.00 per riser; \$520.00 per annum per riser; Qty 122 risers per equipment list. An inspection report will be provided upon completion of each campus inspection. A proposal to correct any deficiencies noted during the inspection will follow. No work will be performed until a purchase order and authorization to proceed is received per special instructions.

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Att #	Attribute Name	Alliance Specialized Systems	ALLIED FIRE PROTECTION	RENOWORKS, LLC	Texas Fireguard, LLC	DVR Mechanical, Inc.
58	Business/Company Owner Name Please provide complete name of the business/company owner responding to the bid/proposal.	Alliance Specialized Systems - Eulogio (Ed) De Rueda	ALLIED FIRE PROTECTION/ RUBEN DELACRUZ, BRANCH MANAGER/ SHANNON PAYNE, OWNER	RENOWORKS Rene Olivarez	Leonardo Munoz	Dwight Reeves
59	Date of Establishment	October 2004	01/01/1998	2009	January 1, 2009	8/20/2015
60	Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications?	No	No	No	Yes	No
61	If yes, please specify: (Form B - Deviations from Specifications of General Terms Conditions Compliance Signature Form, MUST BE COMPLETED.)	n/a	NONE	N/A	Texas Fireguard is submitting to do the fire inspection portion of the bid only. We are not submitting bid for service work and/or providing fire sprinkler material.	none
62	Discount off price to the Pharr-San Juan-Alamo Independent School District shall be:					
1	Hourly Labor Charge-Straight Time	\$50.00	\$65.00	\$55.00	\$93.75	\$50.00
2	Hourly Labor Charge-Overtime	\$90.00	\$97.50	\$75.00	\$140.65	\$100.00
3	Houly Labor Charge-Extra Man Straight Time	\$40.00	\$65.00	\$55.00	\$46.90	\$50.00
4	Hourly Labor Charge-Extra Man Overtime	\$85.00	\$97.50	\$75.00	\$70.35	\$100.00
5	Service Call	\$75.00	\$0.00	\$300.00		\$200.00
1	Current Mfg. Jobber Price	\$0.00		\$25.00		
2	Current Mfg. Jobber Price Less	\$0.00		\$20.00		
3	Shelf Price (Discount % or 0%)	\$25.00		\$20.00		
4	Catalog Price Discount (%)	\$25.00	\$10.00	\$10.00		
5	Cost Plus (%)	\$15.00		\$20.00		

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Responding Supplier	Signature Full Name	Signature Email	Supplier Notes
Alliance Specialized Systems	Ed De Rueda	ederueda@alliance-fire.com	
ALLIED FIRE PROTECTION	RUBEN DELACRUZ	RUBEN@ALLIEDFIREPROTECTION.COI	
RENOWORKS, LLC	Rene Olivarez	rene@renoworksfs.com	
Texas Fireguard, LLC	Nadia Perez	nadia@tfgfire.com	
DVR Mechanical, Inc.	Dwight Reeves	dwright.reeves@dvrmechanical.com	

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 10/03/2019

Participant Name	Response Date	Response Status	Contact	City	State	Invitation Type	Invitation Date	Owner
RENOWORKS, LLC	08/27/2019	Submitted		Edinburg	TX			Rene Olivarez
Alliance Specialized Systems	08/27/2019	Submitted	Yadira Velasco	Pharr	TX	Manual	07/31/2019	Eulogio (Ed) De Rueda
Texas Fireguard, LLC	08/27/2019	Submitted	Nadia Perez	Weslaco	TX			Leonardo Munoz
ALLIED FIRE PROTECTION	08/23/2019	Submitted	RUBEN DELACRUZ	MCALLEN	TX			Shannon Payne
DVR Mechanical, Inc.	08/16/2019	Submitted	Dwight Reeves	Santa Rosa	TX			Dwight Reeves
Nightlock RGV Distributor LLC.	08/22/2019	No Bid	Michael Perez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
MATTS BUILDING MATERIALS	08/05/2019	No Bid	DAVID CASTILLO	PHARR	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Trinity3 Technology	08/02/2019	No Bid	Kendell Rickman	Saint Paul	MN	Automatic	07/31/2019	
C.E.D. / Valmac Electric Supply	08/01/2019	No Bid	Ricardo Casarez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
MIDWEST TECHNOLOGY PRODUC	08/01/2019	No Bid	ARLENE KENNEDY	SIOUX CITY	IA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Unipak Corp.	08/01/2019	No Bid		BROOKLYN	NY	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Bros Pressure Washing and Stripir		Viewed	John Ramirez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
ConstructConnect		Viewed		Cincinnati	OH	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Construction Bid Source (Plan Roc		Viewed		Felton	CA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Construction Journal LLC		Viewed	Pamela Exton	Stuart	FL	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Deltek		Viewed	Source Management	Herndon	VA			
Diamond G Services, LLC		Viewed	Carlos A. Garcia	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Dodge Data & Analytics		Viewed		Hamilton	NJ			
First Line Fire Protection		Viewed	Daniel Huerta	San Juan	TX			
Forde-Ferrier, LLC		Viewed	Hector Rivera	San Antonio	TX			
Frontline Smart Security LLC dba T		Viewed	Juan Curling	Donna	TX			
Holchemont, Ltd.		Viewed	Annette Carmona	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Mercer Technologies Firm		Viewed	Garrett Mercer	Gary	IN			
Protech Security Systems (Protect		Viewed	Larry Rodriguez	Mercedes	TX			
Security International Inc		Viewed	Tanya Wychopen	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Virtual Builders Exchange		Viewed	Jeannette Olguin	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
1st FP McAllen, LLC			Becca Davis	San Antonio	TX	Manual	07/31/2019	
2M Lighting RGV			Pete Ostrowski	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
4 Signs Digital Print			Edgar Rodriguez	San Juan	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
ABSOLUTE Services (LMH & LMH,			Larry Helgeson	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Accredited Lock Supply Co (Accred				Secaucus	NJ	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Adept Facilities & Design, Inc.				Harlingen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Advanced Blending, Inc. DBA: LA:			Marguerite Burton	Forest Hill	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Advanced Communications & Cab			Kent Taylor	Georgetown	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp			Celeste Cantu	Alamo	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Alamo Iron Works (Vallen Distrib			Velma Quintanilla	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
All American Poly				Piscataway	NJ	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Allstates Coatings Company (LBS I				Gladewater	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Alpha and Omega Cleaning Servic			Ismael De Leon	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS				edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Altex Electronic's Ltd.				San Antonio	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Alvarez Roofing LLC			Marco Alvarez	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
American Industrial Supplies & To			Ruben Diaz	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Artcom Communications (Artcom				San Antonio	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
ASAP Printing Solutions (O'Conn L			Sean O' Connor	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
ASPEN Refrigerants, Inc.			Vashti Maraj	Long Island City	NY	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Battery Systems Inc			Suzanne Cruz	Garden Grove	CA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Bell's Security Sales Inc			Rick Middleton	BLOOMFIELD	NJ	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Blue Sky Enterprises			Alonzo Acosta	La Blanca	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
BM Benchmark Construction, LLC				McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
BOB RODRIGUEZ CONSTRUCTION			TONY RODRIGUEZ	San Juan	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Bon Tool Co			Paul Bender	Gibsonia	PA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Boost Metal			Sully Villarreal	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Buffalo Construction LLC.			FRED GUERRA	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Burton Companies (Burton Comp:			Scott Vaughan	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
C&H Distributors, LLC			William Rose	Chicago	IL	Automatic	07/31/2019	
CAPA Texas			junior ocampo	Mission	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Caprice Electronics, Inc.			Michael Kluger	Brooklyn	NY	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Castcon Construction Co., LLC			Robert Castaneda, Jr.	Mission	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Celso Gonzalez Construction			Celso Gonzalez	Mission	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Center Stone Services				Weslaco	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Central Plumbing & Electric Suppl				Weslaco	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.			Andrew Hoffer	Linden	NJ	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Champion Flooring LLC			Carol Werket	Pittsburg	KS	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Cintas Corporation #538			Roger Rodriguez	Mercedes	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Circle Industries Inc.			Joel Hilliard	Houston	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Commercial Kitchen Parts & Servi			D'Ann Ivers	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Continental Flooring Company			Tracy Johnson	Scottsdale	AZ	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Cc			Baldomero Gonzalez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
D & R Commercial Glass LLC			Robert Gomez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Daikin Applied (Daikin Applied Arr			Joanne Lawson	Chicago	IL	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Dealers Electrical Supply Co.			Orlando Cruz	Waco, Texas	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Decisin Tree Inc.			Brent Lawson	El Paso	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Delegard Tool of Texas			Paul C. Nave	Houston	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc			Sandra Salinas	Palmhurst	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 10/03/2019

<u>Participant Name</u>	<u>Response Date</u>	<u>Response Status</u>	<u>Contact</u>	<u>City</u>	<u>State</u>	<u>Invitation Type</u>	<u>Invitation Date</u>	<u>Owner</u>
Diaz Floors & Interiors, Inc.			Andres Diaz, Sr.	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Discount Two-Way Radio Corpora			Stoyan Varbanov	Compton	CA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Doggett Heavy Machinery Service			Andy Ramos	San Juan	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
ECOEFFECT			Alejandro Alanis	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Econ Group, LLC			Gilbert Enriquez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Elsa Auto & Truck Parts			Lupe Garza	Elsa	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Fairway Supply, Inc.			Kathy Millican	Austin	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
FISHER SCIENCE EDUCATION (Fish				Atlanta	GA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Flux Media LLC			Carlos Bernaldez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Full Stop Equipment LLC			Elias Macias	La Joya	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
GALLS, LLC				Chicago	IL	Automatic	07/31/2019	
gargon power services llc (Juan G			Juan Garcia	san juan	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
General contractor/Construction			Tommy Canul	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
General Garage Door Service, INC			Manuel chapa	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Go UnderGround				harlingen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Gonzalez Enterprises, LLC			Eli Gonzalez	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Grupo Telco LLC			Medardo Perez	Mission	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
GTL LIGHTING (CLAY BRANCH, INC			Michael Lee	Houston	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Gulf Coast Paper			Jessica Cavazos	Brownsville	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
HDL ENTERPRISES			HERIBERTO LOPEZ	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
HIDALGO ALL STARS SCREEN PRIN			JOSE LOPEZ	HIDALGO	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
High Point (Western BRW Paper C			Jane Lopez	Dallas	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Hillyard, Texas			Mario Gonzales	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Hi-LoContractor LLC			Edmundo Carreon	Elsa	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Holzberg Communications, INC.			Andy Holzberg	Totowa	NJ	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Home Design Center (V&L ENTERI			Victor Cantu	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Hunt & Woodruff Construction C			Keith F. Hunt	Laguna Vista	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Hurricane Fence Co (Hurfco Ind.)			Roy Garrison III	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc			Donato Vera	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNOVA				McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Insight			Darak Weaver	McAllen,	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
International Carpet One (Yeshua			Francisco Galvan	Brownsville	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
INTERNATIONAL ROADWAY RESE			LINDA TRAHAN	HUMBLE	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
JANGA Technology LLC			Andrea Anguiano	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
JCO "the door people"			Joe Perez	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
JGA ROOFING SYSTEMS, LLC				Waco	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE PROTEI			Heather Foster	ROUND ROCK	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Jolvaz LLC dba RIO-TECH			Connie Garza	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
JR RAMON & SONS INC (JR(Joe)R			Joe R Ramon III	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Justin Seed Co.				Justin	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
kautsch lumber co inc			kookii crerar	alamo	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Kimball Midwest (Midwest Motor			Katelyn Pankuch	Columbus	OH	Automatic	07/31/2019	
LARRY WUNSCH AND ASSOCIATES			JOHN FREEMAN	SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Lawson Products Inc				Chicago	IL	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Lewis Electric Motors, Inc.			Enrique Mendez	HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Lexine Inc			Frank Martinez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Little Giants Learning Center				Alamo	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Lumatec Lighting Service			Victor T Rios	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
LUNA GLASS LLC			JOSE LUNA	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
MARK HOSKINS ENTERPRISES LLC			Mark Hoskins	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
MARKS PLUMBING PARTS (JOHN			LEE HICKEY	FORT WORTH	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Matco Tools (Matco Tools Corpor			Mike Zappia	Stow	OH	Automatic	07/31/2019	
McCoys Building Supply (McCoy C			Tina McArthur	San Marcos	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
McKesson Medical-Surgical Gover			Thomas Bryant	Atlanta	GA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
McLemore Building Maintenance,			Dave Prewitt	Houston	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
MEGA RACKS LLC (GERARDO DAV			GERARDO DAVALOS	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
MH ENTERPRISES (MH ENTERPRIS			Miyoung Hong	McKinney	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Morning Star Industries Inc			Brittney Bonawitz	Jensen Beach	FL	Automatic	07/31/2019	
National Chemical Laboratories In			Tom Leshar	Philadelphia	PA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Netsync Network Solutions			Xavier Trevino	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Noble Texas Builders				La Feria	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC			Lucia Valdez	HARLINGEN	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
OVERHEAD DOOR OF SOUTH TEX			KARLA ARREOLA	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Patina Fire & Safety				MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Performance Safety Group I, LP			Drew Allrich	St. Louis	MO	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Petrogas Group of McAllen, LLC				McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Phynyx Fire & Security			ROY OLIVAREZ	San Juan	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Pinturas & Lacas (PPG Paints)			Rudy Garza	Weslaco	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
PLUMBMASTER INC			RICHARD PLACE	ATLANTA	GA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
PPG Architectural Finishes, Inc			Ernie Garcia	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Pro Tech Mechanical, Inc.			Jeremy Fojtik	Corpus Christi	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
ProActive Roof Systems and Cons			David Gordon	Las Cruces	NM	Automatic	07/31/2019	
PROFESSIONAL POLISH, INC.			VANESA GONZALEZ	FORT WORTH	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Promo Solutions				Frisco	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Pro-Tech Exterminating (Raul Mar			Raul Martinez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.
FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTION, INSTALLATION AND REPAIR SERVICES DISTRICT-WIDE BID # 18-19-078
BID OPENING: AUGUST 27, 2019 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 10/03/2019

<u>Participant Name</u>	<u>Response Date</u>	<u>Response Status</u>	<u>Contact</u>	<u>City</u>	<u>State</u>	<u>Invitation Type</u>	<u>Invitation Date</u>	<u>Owner</u>
Protegis Fire & Safety LLC (Proteg			Naticia Porche	LOUISVILLE	KY	Automatic	07/31/2019	
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PY			PATRICIA OLIVAS	TAMPA	FL	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Radio Engineering Industries, Inc.				Omaha	NE	Automatic	07/31/2019	
RCA Building Materials Inc.			Gustavo Rea	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
REFCO (R E Friedrichs Company)			Vicki Delgado	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Region 1 Repair, LLC			John E Yeupell	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Rex Widle Plbg				San Juan	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
RGV Glass Inc				Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Rio Air, LLC			Antonio Lerma	pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Rio Grande Valley Chapter Associ			Perry A. Vaughn	Harlingen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
RISICA & SONS, INC.			RON RISICA	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus			Jesus Ramirez	Mission	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Romo Contractors, LLC			Romo Contractors LLC	Laredo	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Safeguard Fire & Security			Daniel Backhaus	Mission	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Safeway Supply Inc (Hunte)			Johnny Hunte	San Antonio	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Sanchez Building Supplies, Inc.			Juan Sanchez	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Schaeffer Manufacturing Co.			Customer Service/ Sales	St. Louis	MO	Automatic	07/31/2019	
School Specialty, Inc.			Accounts Receivable	Greenville	WI	Automatic	07/31/2019	
SCOTT ELECTRIC			MARK TROUTMAN	GREENSBURG	PA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
SERVICE SHADE SHOP (YBARRA G				SAN ANTONIO	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
SHI international				Austin	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Six Shooter Softwawsh (Sixto Gar			Sixto Garza	MCALLEN	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Smartcom Telephone, LLC.			Robert Sanchez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Southen Stone, LLC.				Donna	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
STC&FCo			David Enriquez	EDINBURG	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Strongline Security & Fire (Luis Alf				San Juan	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder Ente				McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
TCR- The Best Alarm INC				Laredo	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
TDIndustries, Inc.			Lorraine Vuong	Houston	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
THE SIGN DEPOT (LOZZ QUATEZZ			ANDY LONG	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Tint-On-Wheels (David Padilla)			David Padilla	Mcallen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Trane Company			Rigoberto Garza	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Twin City Hardware, Inc. (TCH Sou			Joe Gandara	Oakdale	MN	Automatic	07/31/2019	
UNIVERSAL FIRE SYSTEMS			HENRY CHAVES JR	WESLACO	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Valley Striping Corp				Mission	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
ValTex (Figuroa & Sons, Inc.)			Felipe Lopez	McAllen	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Vanguard IT Solutions LLC			Pedro Sandoval	brownsville	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
VCI Builders, Inc.			Joe Arredondo	MISSION	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Vertex Marketing			Dr. Sue Bayer	Stafford	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Vets Securing America				San Antonio	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Virtucom, Inc.			Tim Prince	Peachtree Corners	GA	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Visceral Illumination Code LLC (VI			VISCERAL ILLUMINATIO	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
VTX1 Companies (VTX Communic			Linda Garza	Raymondville	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
WasteZero Inc.			Ian Noble	RALEIGH	ND	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Western BRW -Bosworth Papers (Cindy Leander	Dallas	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
WINDSHIELDS XPRESS (JUAN CAR			JUAN CARLOS ISASI	PHARR	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Wolverine Sports, Schoolmasters				Ann Arbor	MI	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Xtreme Security & Alarm			Galiguer Manjarrez	Brownsville	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Yanitor Paper and Supplies, LLC			Carlos Franco	Pharr	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Ygriega Environmental Services LL			Arnold A. Maldonado	Edinburg	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	
Zitro Electric			Mike Pena	Palmview	TX	Automatic	07/31/2019	